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'WORLD AUTO PTELTD

47 Jalan Pemimpin #01-02/03

Halcyon 2, S'pore 577200

Tel No. : 6451 3833 Fax No. : 6455 7576

E-Mail : worldaut@singnel.com.sg

Website : www.worldaulo.com.sg

Tax Reg. No. : 200006765-H Buss. Reg. No. : 200006765H

AMERICAN INTERNATIONAL GROUP, INC Estimate : ES000992
22 MARTIN RD AIG Building
S'PORE 230058 ey ; , Date : 14/01/2017
ﬁr’é""“ﬂ’ Vehicle Mum, : SLH 760E ;
ANsoton : Mover ik Dapariment fi’, A w:mmm
Contact : 8415 1030 Fax No. : 6835 7418(00)" ** 7%, :ﬁ’#ﬁ._._,, Accident Date : 100012017
Cilaim Mo, :
Aslareancs :
Palicy Ma. *
SN Ouantity  Particular Unit Price  Amount 5§
LIST ITEMS : o s
.1 REAR BOOTLID Ar ss000 — 1143 5¢
2 12 REAR BOOT LID INNER TRIM COVER CLIP 2. 80 11780 =~
i 1 REAR BUMPER LS P 135000 — \LLDQ
4o REAR BUMPER CLIP 980 T~ 98.00 —
£ 1 AEAR END PANEL T 95000
6 1 REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH fev 26000 ¢
7.1 REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIPS . 980 ¢
Bt REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS MOULDING e, 19500 ——
List TotalS$ : 4,830.40
20.00% Discount S5 966,08
2.864.32
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS e
Lo WINDSCREEN SEALANT t 6000 “. .
Special Nett Total 5§ : 60,00
LABOUR :
REMOVE & REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS fﬂ'r,“ ey
TRANSFER REAR BOOTLID MECHANISM AND ACCESSORIES £l Eor
REMOVE ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS IN ORDER TO FACILITATE 1.500.00 &,—...,
REPAIRS INCLUDING PANEL BEAT, CUT/'WELD, STRAIGHTEN
CHASSIS WHERE NECESSARY AND REPLACE ABOVE PARTS
PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINT ALL AFFECTED AREAS 1,200.00 _'ﬁr((
Latour Tolnl 5§ : 2.700.00
E&AOE. Total 5% : 6,624.32
e
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Bevan Lim !LKK A.uln!

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 3 May 2018 10:22 AM

To: ‘daniel@worldauto.com.sq’

Cc Vic (LKKAuto), Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SLH760E and SGL2311T on 10/01/2017

Without Prejudice
Dear Daniel,

We propose settlement as follows.

COST OF REPAIR $3,498.04
LOSS OF USE (6 days x 560) {1496CC) S 360.00
GIA SEARCH S 200
TOTAL $3,860.04

Kindly revert acceptance

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole Intention of resolving the
matter amicably without partles resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of llability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

in the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/inlluence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party i not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,
Bevan Lim | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: BevanLim® kkawto.com) fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
T T

e Save the Earth Print only when necessary

From: daniel@worldauto.com.sg [mailto:daniel@worldauto.com.sg)

Sent: Wednesday, 2 May 2018 5:38 PM

To: Bevan Lim [LKK Auto) <bevanlim@Ikkauto.com>

Ce: Vie [LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Accident Involving SLH760E and SGL2311T on 10/01/2017

Dear Bevan,
Attached as requested for.



Thks & Rgds,
Daniel

World Auto Pte Ltd
Tel: 63621776

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) <bevanli Ikkauto, >
Sent: Wednesday, 2 May 2018 4:53 PM

To: daniel@worldauto.com.sg
Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Accident Involving SLH760E and 5GL2311T on 10/01/2017

Without Prejudice

Dear Daniel,

As per our tele-conversation earlier,

Kindly let us have your Authorisation to Act and LTA search for our necessary action.

Thank you.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter Is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole Intention of resolving the
matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of llability, whatsoever, should be deemed / Inferred from this
negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues of
liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Best Regards,

Bevan Lim | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: BevanLim@|kkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

y SRS .
SLERER S Sove the Earth Print only when necessary

From: daniel@worldauto.com.sg [mailto:daniel @worldauto.com.sgl
Sent: Wednesday, 2 May 2018 3:34 PM

To: Bevan Lim [LKK Auto) <bevanlim@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Accident Involving SLH760E and 5GL2311T on 10/01/2017

Dear Bevan,
Attached is our Letter of Demand for your reference and necessary follow up.



Thks & Rgds,
Daniel

World Auto Pte Ltd
Tel: 63621776



Motor Claims Discharge Voucher

insured / Owner + LEON CIT REWTRLS PTE L TD  vehicle No S nE
Palicy No : NRIC SO B
Adress

Tel - H/P

| am / We are the registered owners(s) of the above motor vehicle involved in the above captioned
accident.

My / Our authorized repairs WORLD AUTO PTE LTD of 47 Jalan Pemimpin #01 - 02/03,
Halcyon 2 S'pore 577200 Will be forwarding to you all the relevant documents. | / We
undertake to pay all the legal costs incurred thereof.

| / We have authorizied WORLD AUTO PTE LTD to represent me / us In all aspects of my
claim against the driver of the other vehicle and you may take full instructions from them.

In the event. | am / We are successful in my / our claim againts the other driver who was
involved in the above accident. | / We hereby irrevocable instruct and authorize you to
deduct from the proceeds recovered your legal costs and incidentals and thereafter to
forward the balance to M/S WORLD AUTO PTE LTD.

| / We authorize M/S WORLD AUTO PTE LTD to sign all discharge voucher / indemnity forms
and all necessary documents in connection with and arising out of the above claim

| / We undertake to idemnity you and keep you indemnified in respect of any claim or action that
may rise as a result of your complying with my / our request.

| confirm that | have taken delivery of vehicle registration no. =L+« W€ from
the requires, M/S WORLD AUTO PTE LTD of 47 Jalan Pemimpin #01 - 02/03, Halcyon 2
s'pore 577200 and that all repairs necessary as a result of an accident in which the said
vehicle was involves on or about the '3\ 2 [ 201 % have been complsted to my
satisfaction and that i have no further claims whatsoaver against the said repairs in respect
hereof,

| hereby assign all monies arising from my claims, due under insurrance policy to M/S
WORLD AUTO PTE LTD of 47 Jalan Pemimpin #01 - 02/03, Halcyon 2 S'pore 577200,

Kindly effect payment of all monies to M/S WORLD AUTO PTE LTD and only payment to
them will constitute a good effective discharge of the debt.

Date |+ Signature of insured [ Owner




AL WORLD AUTO PTE LTD

47 JALAN PEMIMPIN #01-02/03
HALCYON 2
SINGAPORE 577200

(

310172018

Your Ref :
Our Ref : TP/935/2017

ALG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PL
78 SHENTON WAY #07-16

S'PORE 079120

Attn : Motor Claim Dept — Third Party

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHLNO. SLHT760E / SGL2311T ON 10/01/2017

Reference is made to the aforesaid matter (on behalf of our client M/S LION CITY
RENTALS PL)

Enclosed herewith are the following documents for your information and necessary
actions only :-

a) Our Final Repair Bill

Please assist in our claims of :

Final Bill § 3269.20 (already surveved & finalised with
your surveyor)

GST 7% § 22884

Search Fee S 2.00

Pre-repair Inspection ($60x 1 days) $ 60,00

Loss of Use{ $80 x 5days) §  400.00

Amount $ 3960.04

Kindly let us have vour reply and payment as soon as possible.

Thank vou for your kind attention and much appreciated assistance.

Yqurs faithfully.

e



Jas khlm Iml

From: Jas Khine (LKXAuto)

Sent: Friday, 27 January, 2017 942 AM

To: ‘GARYNGCHIHUNGEYAHOO.COM SG'

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGL 2311T & SLH 760E ALONG/AT BOON TAT STREET ON
10/01/2017

Attachments: P1180028.PG; P1180029.JPG; P1180030JPG; P1180031JPG; P1180032JPG:
P11B80033JPG

Our Refl: CCYAIGITOO09T8/Kyad

27 JANUARY 2017

GARY NG CHI HUNG

92 PUNGGOL DRIVE

816-06

SINGAPORE 828795

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SGL 23117 & SLH 760€ ALONG/AT BOON TAT STREET ON 10/01/2017

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asla Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against
you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party,

This also refers to our tele-conversation yesterday,

Enclosed herewith the damage photos of Third Party’s vehicle taken by our surveyor at the time of physical inspection
for your record purpose.

Kindly provide us the accident scene photos taken by your good self at the time of accident for our further review.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settiement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter/emall.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)[if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial
vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim, However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will
be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be pratected,

Please call us If you have further queries.

Thank you.

“Wishing you a Happiness and Prosperity New Year”

liest Regards,
Jus Khine | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid
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PE  TRAFFIC ACCIDENT MIVOLVING VEHICLE 1) SLH340F and  SGL 23T ua fﬂf.nlfhi?‘

I 'We hereby authorize you to el for me / us in respect of the above mntier
|/ We also authorize M/S WORLD AUTO PTE LTD 10 give you msiruciions periaining fo the above matier in all
aspects including agreement &g {o your costs and disbursements

I/ We also irevocably and uncondionslly insiruct you 1o pay ali monies claimed or abmingd from any party as & resull

of the above matter to M/S WORLD AUTO PTE LTD,

Your faithfully.




RELEASE VOUCHER

AIG cific - Ex Third P Claim
“We/l, WORLD AUTO PTE LTD("the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have reached an

agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple Ltd LEKK AUTO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for $$3498.04
(Repair Cost), $8360.00 (Loss of Use/Reweai), S8 _2.00(Disbursement) for vehicle no. SLH 760E
that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 10/01/2017 (date) along

COMMERCE ST /SHENTON WAY (location) involving vehicle no/s  SGL 2311T. This is
pursuant to the inspection conducted on 18/01/2017 (date) at “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/I are/am authorized by the owner LION CITY RENTALS PTE LTD (“the
third party claimant”) of vehicle no. SLH 760E make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and
we/l have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l
enclose herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimam™.

We/l further confirm that we/T will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pie Lid for all damages.
loss andfor expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant™
after the ubove said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to SLH
760E (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this (day) of ' (month) 20_ 4 (year)

Signed by appointed surveyor



WORLD AUTO PTELTD

47 JALAN PEMIMPIN #01-02/03 HALCYON 2 BLDG

S'PORE 577200

Tel No. : 64513933 Fax No. : B4557576

E-Mail : worldaut@singnet.com.sg
Website : www.worldauto.com.sg

Tax Reg. No. : 200006765H Buss. Reg. No. : 200006765H

AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD

78 SHENTON WAY #07-16
S'PORE 078120

Atlention | Mator Claim Department
Contact © 54183000

Tax Invoice . F180035

Date : 311272017
Vehicle Num. . SLH 760E

Make/Model : HONDA SHUTTLE HYBRID

Chassis/Eng#
Accident Date = 10/01,2017
Claim No_ : TP/835/17

Reference
Palicy MNo.
SN Quantity Particular Unit Price Amount S§
LISTITEMS
1 1 BOOTLID 1.183.50
2 1 REAR BUMPER 1.200.00
3 10 REAR BUMPER CLIPS 980 88.00
4 1 REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS MOULDING 185.00
List TotalS$ 2 6BE6.50
20.00% Discount S§ : 537.30
2,148 20
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS :
1 1 WINDSCREEN SEALANT 40.00
Special Nelt Total 5% 40.00
LABOUR
REMOVE & REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS 120.00
TRANSFER REAR BOOTLID MECHANISM AND ACCESSORIES 60.00
REMOVE RR ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS INORDER TO FACILITATE 400.00
REPAIRS INCLUDING PANEL BEAT CUTMWELD STRAIGHTEN
CHASSIS WHERE NECESSARY AND REPLACE PARTS
PUTTY & RESPRAY ALL AFFECTED AREAS 500.00
Labour Total 5§ : 1,080.00
Total S5 3.269.20
GST 7% S% . 228.84
Amount Due 53 3,498 .04

LJ.\._

WORLD AUTO PTE LTD
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GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF

SINGAPORE

GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
INSURANCE 6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

RECORDS MhNﬂGEMENT CENTRE Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5pm

GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-17-006464

Date of Request:  14/01/2017 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

World Auto Pte Ltd

47 Jin Pemimpin

#01-02/03 Halcyon 2

Singapore 577200

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enquiry Date 14/01/2017

Enguiry By FOO MEI LING

TP Vehicle Nao. SGL2311T

Accident Date 10/0172017

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No.  |Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SGL2Z3NT AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid. 26/02/2016-25/02/2017 65-6419-3000
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the orginal reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the
General Insurance Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall
be under no liability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their

images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.




| -I.E_;.ELGENERAL
~ INSURANCE

RECORDS MAN#GEMENT CENTRE

Our Ref No: GR-17-006464
Date of Request:  14/01/2017

World Auto Ple Lid
47 JIn Pemimpin
#01-02/03 Halcyon 2
Singapore 577200

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enquiry Date 14/01/2017
Enquiry By FOO MEI LING
TP Vehicle No. SGL23N1T
Accident Date 10/01/2017

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF
SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone:; +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to S5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref No: Online Purchase

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S%)

TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

“his is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date.
[X] GIRO [ ] Cash[ ] Chegue




Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastlane
'CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING B - - S !
Case  [Notifiea  |Est Submitted | Ad) Assigned Adj Rot Ad| Submitted | Ins Autted | Status |
10 Jan 2017 ;gl;" a7 5$3,269.20  $$3,269.20 m" for Survey
Edit Reg I Bt Ady Bt I Edltiu:ml View Rpl Cancel Cass I

Main Reference

(CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS ) o
Insured Gary Ng Chi Hung, 1D 526725100

'Ma
.u.":nm: LION CITY RENTALS PTELTD, Co. Reg. No.: 201504621k

Vehicle Reg, ] [ 10/01/2017 08:00 - 59
[No.: | SLH760E |Date of Lass: | 5 wonens and 17 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man v0)]
|Claim Type: | TP / 448455829856 4$ﬂ?“ | 2100453323 (Comprehenaive)
- . — 4 ==
| Vehicke Reg, |
No SGLIINLT |";‘:"’ *":{ | DMPF16S001858
(Insured): | Smiment):
e Ewcess: | I
Repairer: | World Auto Pte Ltd - Halcyon 2 (HQ) 47 JALAN PEMIMIEIN #01-02/07 HALCYON 2 BLDG, 577200 Bshan - Tel: 5451 1533
Handling AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: 65-6415-3000 ... [Handled by Ler, Barnard-3Q ]
Insurer: | BernardliQian.Ler@aig.com
F:UTE ERGO Insurance Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: 5829 0108
Adster; | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel. 6256-3561 . [Handied by KENNETH KONG] _ [Final Rpt due 04,/05/2018]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al | Compose Case i ]|

| [Created by adjuster]

» AlG_SG_EXPRESS [02/05/2018); Report Send Back Alerts - SLH7GOE (TP)

| ALL ASSDCIATED TASKS™

View All | Search Tasks | Croate Mew Task | r.nmpl:u_l‘
Subject  Handler  Assigned By Completed On Created On  Done?

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_c... 9/5/2018



Merimen e-Claims

Claim Documents

*SLH760E (44845582985G)
[SGL2311T]
TP
LION CITY RENTALS PTE LTD
Jan 10 2017 B:00AM
[Gary Ng Chi Hung]
World Auto Pte Ltd - Halcyon 2
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Shaw Remarks Tor L] Handiing Insurer
Note! Remait are powale Uk vou §Pow T B 00 Derties.
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Preview
NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
|’b"lhh:ll No: SGL2311T (Insd veh) Model: HONDA SHUTTLE 1.5 (A)
SLHTEOE (TP veh)
|Date of Accident: | 10/01/2017
Global Sum Setfiement | | | ] Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimate -] 7.409.02
Final Repair Cost s 3.498.04
Loss of Use H - 360,00 6.00 days at $60.00 per day
Rental (if any) 5 0.00 days
LTA / GIA Search Fee '8 2.00
Others H 0.00
]
Final Settlement Sum - 3.860.04
Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X ] NO {Kindly indicate
below)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability 100 (%)

BOLA licable: Yes/ N BOLA Sce N
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: Applica o nario No

BOLA Liability: (%) Assessed Liability (") (%)
* Assaessed Liability 1o be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does nol apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee’s Breakdown

1) | World Auto Pte Ltd 5 3,860.04
2) -
3) -
08 May
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2018
LKK Aute Consultants Pte Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report/ Bill (if any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno 1ssso71ser;
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6B44-BB05 Email: sur@kkauto.com assignments{@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CC4/AIG17000878/KMA30Z1
Date: 08/052018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid Policy No: 2100453323
Civimant Vehicle s 1760E Insured Vehicle No: SGL2311T
Date of Loss 10/01/2017 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No. 4484558208350
I FICAT F I
Reg No; SLHTG0E
Make & Mode!: HONDA SHUTTLE, 1.5 (A) Engine No: LEB4262717
Reg Date: 24102018 (Man. Year 2016) Chassis No: GP7T1043108
Caolour Metallic Silver Odometer. 15693 km
Engine Capacity: 1456 cc
Market Value/New Car Price:  N/A
Sum Insured (SS); Market Valua/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition; Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake {Serviceable) Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable); Yes Engine Modification No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 185/60 R15 Rear Tyre Size: 185/60 R15
Front Left Side: Yokohama 8 mm Rear Lefi Side: Yokohama 8 mm
Front Right Side: Yokohama 8 mm Rear Right Side: Yokohama B mm
The above values represent [he remarung lyre reads depth
COST OF CLAIMS ~ Repairer's  Adjuster's Difference  Diff %)
Pars 3824 32 21B88.20 1, 73512 a4
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 3,000.00 1,080.00 1,920.00 654.00
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (S5) 6,924.32 3,269.20 3,655.12 52,719
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (5§) 48470 228,84 255 86 52.79
Matt Amount (S§) 7.409.02 3,498.04 3,910.98 52.719
+ Loss of Use (6.0 x S$60.00/day) (S§) 360.00
+ Doc/Search Fee (S§) 2.00
Nett Liability (S$) 3,B60.04
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 18012017
Date Inspected: 18/012017 Inspecled At World Auto Pte Lid - Haleyon 2 (HO)

Estimated Period of Repair 4.0 days

47 JALAN PEMIMPIN #01-02/03
HALCYON 2 BLDG
Singapore 577200
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Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: Lim Chin Siong Bevan

NOTE: This repont rapresents our fingings al the fime and place of ngpection stated hersn Such ngpechon has been camed oul o the best of aur
irowkedge and abllity bt any other kabllity undér any oiher creumsiances i herehy exprassly sxciuded
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REPAIR DETAILS
Recommended Parts
No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *REAR BOOT LID Bani 1.B50.00FL *1.193.50FL
2 12 *REAR BOOT LID INNER TRIM COVER CLIP *Check 117.60FL *-FL
3 1 *REAR BUMPER Buckied / Dented 1,350.00FL *1,200.00FL
4 10 *REAR BUMPER CLIP Necessary 98,00 FL 88 00FL
5 1 *REAR END PAMNEL Repair 950,00 FL *-FL
B 1 *REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH Serviceable 260.00FL “.FL
T 1 *REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIPS Mot Necassary 8.80FL *~FL
8 1 *REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS MOULDING Necessary 195,00 FL *195.00FL
2] 1 "WINDSCREEN SEALANT Necessary 60.00FS *40.00Fs
FeFranchise porl. S=SpoMel! |=LsiamDnsc
Sub Total (85) 4,890.40 2,726.50
- List Item Discount on L ltems 20.00/20.00% [S$] 966.08 537.30
Total Parts (S$§) 3.824.32 2,169.20

Repor was unsubmitied during this print-out.
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Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous Items
There are no new misceilanecus items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 4 of 4

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltams
1 REMOVE & REFIT REAR WINDSCREEN GLASS New 180.00 120.00
2 TRANSFER REAR BOOTLID MECHANISM AND MNew 120.00 60.00
ACCESSORIES
3 REMOVE ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS IN ORDER TO New 1.500.00 400.00
FACILITATE REPAIRS INCLUDING PANEL
BEAT ,CUT/WELD ,STRAIGHTEN CHASSIS WHERE
NECESSAEY AND REPLACE ABOVE PARTS
4 PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINT ALL AFFECTED AREAS New 1,200.00 500.00
Gross Labour Cost [55) 3,000.00 1,080.00

{ Repaor was unsubmitted during this print-out

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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