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. ComtortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd
COMFORIDELGRO et e B v
. ENGINEERING wasage S ik -
o O L T Sy
A member of COMFORIDELGRD Date/Time: 28 0¥ 20T8"08:52 Page : 1
leam:  ARC Repair TP(CLSO)1 JOB CARD sales Order: 6 N0305154218
STOMER ""“"'ﬁamau MRLEAGE
s COMPORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD VACS o Ui
s 7010045 HYUNDAI e
omss §83 SIN MING DRIVE gy
a:numru SINGAPORE 575717 :EELI-JH'.' 27.04. 4:25
65508755
L : i mwm’-m’.ﬁ TARGET DATE
COMPLETION DATETIME
KOUNT GARD NO. .@ RS B4 Mcu093236
)
408 DESCRIPTION
Agcident Date: 27.04.2018
: 3P 27.04.2018
LABOR CODE DESCRIPTION
PG, — demat RRev ey
et/
BOMED & PASSED OUT BY
SEAVICE ADVISOH CUSTOMER'S SIGNATURE
1
7% Wgorment Sig Eaft Pass
whe.  EHD3409U LARRY e’ sEn3soau
V0 Al
+ of Sarvice Adviscry SigratureDate Name of Service Advisar T Dae
+ reluring) 10 Servios Rscepiion upon coliection To be Wt by Securtty Guard




COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
REPAIR ESTIMATE®
YEHICLE 80 @ SHD 34090

aalA

DATE 28/4/2018 10:08

MAKE .
MODEL __: HYUNDAIL 40 Dobr. 377 9tk (X
IJI__—M%_""“ bowr | Type [ usivrice [ Amoust |
Rear Bumper S 603,601
Rear Bumper Reinforcement 5™ § 504335
Rear Bumper Remforcement Bracket (LH/RHE A~ 5 180.00 | § 360,00
Rear Bumper Side Bracket ¥5** s 4900|Ss 9800
Rear Bumper Clips — $ nm{
Rear B o s 14340
umper Sponge 4
Rear Bumper Under Cover £ 25004
License Lamp Holder — ¢ 5 100.00 4 ==
W] pr Pruy  LENY w il AR, ﬁ ‘E:.
Wy | e By RNER » 33 A0 SUBTOTAL $ 205635
LESS 20% $ 41127
DISCOUNTED TOTAL S 164508
Rear No Plate  ~ -4 s 25.00 [New -
Rear Bumper Reverse Sensor )¢ 47 § 13570 |Nen
Rear Bumper Advenisemeni Logn — _ e s 50,00 |Nen
Rear Fender Advertisement Logo (LH/RH) £ 10000 | S 200,00 [Nett
5 41070
Labour Charge 2en
Panel Beating s .
Spray Painting Charge 5 M deos.
Wiring Charge S SkO[X A
Remove/Refix Reverse Sensor S 12080 s
TOTAL LABOUR s T70.00
ESTIMATE TOTAL S 182578

s
vt

Ke I~ (U

/}, 5:/1 ,ra_,)..é

Z-F-;;
j’;‘ff /‘*’{f#

This is an initial estimate based on a visual inspection of the

be prepared afier the vehicle 15 surveyed by a mator Surveyor appointed by the insurance company.




Hsiao TaE (LKKAuto)

From: Chew Motor Pte, Ltd. <claims@chewmotor.com>

Sent: Saturday, 22 June 2019 11:18 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAUto)

Cc Admin A

Subject: Re: Your ref: SGQ B8767X *Our ref: CC4/ASM19001695/Apb3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING

YN 6679H(AXA) & SGQ 8767X ON 23/01/2019]

Without Prejudice

Hi Hsiao Tong

Thanks for your offer.

Your insured collided onto rear portion of our client vehicle.

For amicable settlement, we are counter propose to 80% instead of 50%.
We are asking:-

Cost of Repair : $5,520.00 ( 56,900 x BO%)

Loss of Use : § 720.00 ( $90 x 10days x BD%)
Lta Search - & 745
Total - $ 6,247.45

Please kindly consider and revert for close case, thanks.

*Please kindly take note that CHEW MOTOR PTE LTD is GST-registered.®
Regards,
Sukyi Chong

Chew Motor Pte Lid

(G5T Registration Mo.: ZD1T1EIM9R)
1 Kaki Bukit Ave &

Blk A #01-11 Autobay
Singapore 417883

T: 6747 9241

F:8741 72786

On Sat, Jun 22, 2019 at 10:05 AM Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs/Mdm.,



COMFORIDELGRO

OurRef : T 0418 / SHD3408U /CL(st) ENGINEERING
Your Ref
Date r 30-May-18 ComlontDelGro Enginsering Pte Lid
CDGE Taxl Claims Dept 205 Broddell Road Singapore STRT01
AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD 59 Loyang Drive 4th Floor F".;Zf.lﬂﬁi vgggggggg
CHARTIS Buliding Singapare 508959 ek
78 Shenton Way Cansnss i M SR
#07-16 Workshops
Singapore 079120 Braddell
205 Braddell Road
Attn : Motor Claims Department  WITHOUT PREJUDICE Singopare 578701
Dear Sir LaBm
868
ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR TAXI SHD3409U YOUR INSURED SLR1892Z Sﬂm Sin Ming
AND OTHER SKN1229Y ON 27.04.18 Sinoancs Sran13
We are the authorised repair workshop for Comforl Transportation Pte Ltd, the owner of motor " Pandan
Vehicle No: SHD3408U which was involved in the captioned accident with your insured vehiclgagamorn Boa200
The vehicle owner and the taxi driver concerned have requested and authorized us to assist them Ubi
in presenting their claims against the party responsible for all applicable matters arising from sinfpiffuﬁg
the damage to the vehicle. Sitohs
As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving SLR1892Z Singarare TERI50
we are submitting these claim for your consideration on behalf of the claimants. Sungel Kadut
TAXI OWNER'S CLAIM 7 gar.lnnnal Hmru;gg
1 cﬂit of R&pﬂlr s 1&!5&34 Gapoia
2 days Loss of Rental @ $ 117.00 per day $ 70200 501 vishun Industrisl Cak &
3 Suwﬂy Report Fees (Surveyed by M/s LKK) 5 - Singapom 785732
4 GIA/LTA Search Fees 3 7.49
§ GIA/Police Report Fees 3 -
6 Towing / Medical / Transporation S -
SubTotal: § 2,489.13
HIRER'S CLAIM
[ 6 dayslosscofincome@ $ B80.00 perdays S 480.00

Total Clalms : § 2949813
We enclose herewith the following documents to support the claims: -

a)  Original repair bill and photocopies of photographs - 4 pes.
b)  LTA search slip/s of : SLR1882Z
¢c) GIA/Police report/s of : SHD34090
d)  Letter of authority from owner / hirer / operator
{ X ) Pholograph/s of Accident Scene ( ) Cedificate of Insurance
( ) Witness statement/s ( x ) Downtime/Mileage record

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settiement of the said claims as
soon as possible.

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice
to any personal injury claim (if any) of the taxi driver.

Yours faithfully

Cecifia Lee

Executive

CDGE Claims Department

Tel : 6214 8354 Fax: 6214 1843 Email : cecilialee@sparkcarcare.com

This is a computer generated letter. No signature is required.

A memiar of g
COMFORIDELGRO G @ =
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51 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA URT INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563561 FAX @ 1065) 67414108

Our Ref: CCIAIGIB007971/K1eb3

27 JUN 2019

HONG SEH MOTORS PTE LTD
10 FOURTH LOK YANG ROAD
SINGAPORE 629707

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLR 18927 / SHD 34090 / OTHERS ON 27/04/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte
Lid to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had
amongst other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as
the appointed agent of your insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement
with third party claimani.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

You are aware that your No-Claim Discount (NCD - if applicable) will be with held for
the time being. Pending for final allocation of liability in settlement by our principal AIG
Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler
DID: 6841 6051
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: ashersng @ |kkauto.com

c.c.  AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)
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LETTER OF AUTHORISATION

(NAF / PAF)
ACCIDENT INVOLVING | 40 SHD3409U , SLR1892Z y SKN1229Y ON 27-Apr-18 13:35
ALONG ALEXANDRA RD TWDS TANGLIN RD BEFORE STRATHMORE RD
1/ We YEUNG CHUN FAI (Hirer) NRIC No.: S2577613E
and/or (Rellef) NRIC No.:

Taxl Number SHD3409U
hereby authorise ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd{CDGE):

1. To submit my/our claims for damages, costs and expense, Including loss of Income, loss of rental,
medical fee and legal costs,

2. To have absolute discretion to agree to any settiement or compensation amount In respect of my/four claim
against third party (except personal injuries and medical claims).

3. To sign Discharge Voucher en my/our behalf,
4. To accept any payment (clalm proceeds) In respect of the claim against third party and payment by cheque

shall be forward directly to CDGE in accordance with COGE's instruction and made In favour of
"ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd",

Date 27-Apr-2018

Name of Hirer YEUNG CHUN FAI

Hirer NRIC S2577613E Signature ;

Address 205A PUNGGOL FIELD #13-360
821205

Contact No. 97346998

http://edgek2srv:82/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/Runtime/View/CDG.VARS. V. Lettof...

27/04/2018



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

#
*We/l, E ERING LTD (“the workshop”) hereby confirm

that we/l have reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance
Pte Lud LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the
amount claimed for §§2.680.00 (Global Sum) for vehicle no. SHD 3409U that was damaged
pursuant to the accident which occurred on 27/04/2018 (date) along ALEXANDRA RD TWDS
TANGLIN RD BEFORE STRATHMORE RD (location) involving vehicle no/s SLR 18927, -

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 30/04/2018 (date) at “the workshop™,

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner COMFORT TRANSPORTATION
PTE LTD (“the third party claimant™) of vehicle no. SHD 3409U make the claim as set out in
the above paragraph and we/l have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a
manner that we/I deem fit. We/l enclose herein the letter of authority given by "the third party
claimant™,

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Prte Lid for all
damages, loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third
party claimant™ after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any
loss and expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant
to the damage to SHD 3409U (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident,

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of
“the third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the sam;m . —— je payable to:

COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD
Dated this ___ 0% (day)of ___J Wl 1 mont) 204 (vean

.-' "LII{«_‘I""'_ H‘I AILEEN TAH
LT vy, - M 1 “™anager, Claims

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by “the workshop™ (with chop)
CLAIMS DEPARTMENT
COMFORTDELGRD ENGIMEERING FTE (1D
59 LOYANG DRIVE
SINGAPORE 508861

*The contents of this document apply to vehicle damages ony.
Al persona ifuries &nd damages arising Merefrom are excluded
from e ambit and application of this document”



‘'OMFORIDELGRO ' “ComfortDelGro Enginesring Pte Ltd
ENIGINEERING Wi 5 303 580 P 0280075

%mﬁ:‘" - 35 ;s!.".,.” Ko v e 728781
Member of COMFORDELGRQ 350 ot Poad 3 Singacors ¢0848.
: o 0604
ST REG. N0, M2-8921817-3 TAX INVOICE sy o 199%£';:3§
801000 VEHCLE NO INV. NO
AIG BSIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD SHD3409U 91374366 25,05.2018
#08-15 78 CHARTIS BUILD Mmum ' Riei%ia
SINGAMRE minzg;gugu. :
rﬂgz:. ODGHETER READING
CONTACT NO: 64193000 3225094 1

28.07.2006°  27.04.3018 14:25
Description : 3P 27.04.2018 m&%ﬂﬂﬁ

LY

g/No Part No. Qty Unit Price $Disc Net

> PART REQUISITION
0001 04-01-0103-0576 I40VC COVER ASSY-RR BUMPE 1 603.60 20.00 482.88
0002 04-01-0101-0111 HYUNDAI BUMPER COVER CLIP 10 2.20  20.00 17.60
0003 04-01-0103-0738 I40VC COVER-RR BUMPER LWR 1 225.00 20.00 180.00
0004 FNPS MO PLATE(S) 1 25.00 0,00 25.00
0005 04-01-0103-0739 T40VC ABSORBER-RR BUMPER 1 143.40 20.00 114,72
0006 09-01-0103-0104 I40VC LAMP ASSY-LICENSE P 1 33.95 20.00 27.16
0007 09-01-0103-0104 I40VC LAMP ASSY-LICENSE P 1 33.95  20.00 27.16

SUB-TOTAL  : 874.52

-

- JOB NATURE
0001 L PANEL BEATING 200.00 200.00

HILST TAKING ALL REASONARLE PRECAUTIDNEG AQAIMNET FIRE THEFT O ACOIDEMNTAL DAMAGRE, THE COMPARY ACOEZTD kK
ESPOMNBIBILITY FOR GARS OR OTHER PROPERTIES BELOMGING TO CUSTOMERS AND YEH|OLES ASE DULIVEI: ANG TELIED
UNERS' RISH

ISTOMERS SHALL INBPECT THEIR VEHICLES IMMEDATELY UPON DELIVESY AND Sall witTiin 7 DS PRy Sl ‘: Vet G
ITICE IH WHRITING TO THE COMPANY OF ANY COMPLANTES OTHERAWISE THE VEMIOLESS WILL BE DESAED 1O HAVE ﬂru A EETE
GOOD ORDER

TEREST OF i FER MONTH WILL BE CHARGED ON A DAY Ty TLAY SASIE IN MESPECT OF ANT ATuDuNT DWUE &80 DAENS T v
MARPANY BY THE CUBTOMER AND NOT PAID id THE DUE DATE OF DayMIIMNT (L8 AFTER 50 O4YH SHOA SIHD [eRsnE) B
LD O DEFALILY

EABE EXAMINE THIS INVOICE IMMEDIATELY UPON RECEPT AND ADVIESE THE CORAPLSNY 1OF aAsY DAHORSE 004 JISame= ey
ITHIM 14 CAYS OF HECEIPT. P THE COMBANY OS5 NOY HEAR FEOMW THE CUSTDIAEM, 1S GOMTArY WiLL TREAT TS My ST »

|||||

FAFRST AND 2DINDG

miortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid
amiber of COMFORDECRO

1l Office.
i Braddell Road

Eapore 5T9701 L ‘:*':;'E"f,*‘n;v' Sk

diy note inat no receipt shall be issued uniess requested.
FICE COPY




ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid
05 Bradcladl Rood Bingapom STRTT
Hll'llhl « 0 B3] 6290 Foosimile « 65 &80 TS5

Silbnageree, seossom

mmmam

COMPANY REG. NO.

“OMFORIDELGRO
ENGINEERING

\ member o CoMFORDELGRO

TeET
T

iST REG. N0, M2-8921817-3 i 1990000608

TAX INVOICE

8010004
AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PIE LTD

;%ﬂ.g Eg W.ME BUILD

CONTACLT NO: 64193000

SHD34030

MAKE
HYUNDAI

e
07 2008
D) ST BATURI0693236

9%?43%2’%5 2018
e

ODOMETER READING

20704 2018 14:25

3225094

8/No Part No. Qty Unit Price 8Disc et
0002 23-502 SPRAYPAINT ON AFFECTED AREA 200.00 200.00
0003 L REMOVE/EREFIX REVERSE SENSOR 20.00 20,00
0004 L ADVERTISEMENT - Rear Bumper 50.00 50,00
0005 L ADVERTISEMENT — Rsar Fanders REH/LH 200.00 200.00
0006 L Licence Lamp Holder 100.00 100.00
SUB-TOTAL 770,00
Items total 1,644,52
Add GST @ 7.000 % 115,12
__‘} Invoice amount 1,759.64

Rgﬁ % Sammﬂﬁﬂﬁzﬂlﬂlﬂoumi

AILST 'IEHING Al BLE PRECAUTIONS AGAINST FIHE, THEFT OR ACTIDEMNTAL DaMip2E
IBPONSIBILITY FORA CARS OR OTHERA PROPENTIES BELOWGING
VMERS' [RIEX

IETOMERS SHALL INSPECT THEIA VEHICLES IMMEDHATELY UPON DEUVERY ALD SHALL WITHIN & GAYYS Fala
ITICE I WRITING TO THE COMPANRY OF ANY COMELAINTE, OYAERWIRE. THIE YEHILES Wikl BE TeEss

Q00D ORDSER

THE COMPaMY
TO CUSTOMERE aML: VEHIOLES ARE MQAIVERM ANL VEETE . |,

ADCEPIZ o

BUC=] DR 'ENY sl

0 TD HMNE as<M ASNSF T

TEREST OF 1% PER MOMNTH WILL BE CRHAED _,1.. B DAY O DAY EASKS P A ;.".

HiEPANY 8Y THE TUSTOWAER ~MD r-lf"l" Ppm CHd THE DoorE [DATE OF PAYTIENT (L8 AR 20 DAS % BEROAT TRT INUOWTES

RIOD OF DEFSLULT.

EASE ERAMINE THIS INVOICE IMMEDIATELY LUTFON RECEIRST n AVIEE THE TOMSLN ¢ OF any [EEROHDS O Dl dsmin Do
[THIr 14 DANES OF RECEIPT. IF THE COMPANTY DOZE 1O 4*_1.-- FEOM THE CUSTOLIER. THS OO AL VST T -

YAHEQT AND RINDING

ofortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid
embor of COMPORDELGRD

id Office:
Braddell Road
gapore 579701

ACCOUNT No. INVOICE No.

;@ tFHL?T!:‘_' I ‘:n I- 2 3 - SIF 4 . i I:_?": 3 :'.1:'?‘:17'._'_._-:

T e ATy T

T
..... .‘m Rl T -I"‘H ¥ X,

fiy note that no recedpt shall be lssusd unless requestad.
FICE COPY




Our Ref: CT18040764

somrort

Date: 04 May 2018 ——
TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN
Dear SirfMadam
ACCIDENT ON 27/04/2018 @ 13:35hrs
ALONG ALEXANDRA RD TWDS TANGLIN RD BEFORE

STRATHMORE RD
INVOLVING SLR1882Z, SKN1229Y

We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Comfort
Transportation Pte Ltd is the registered owner of the tax! bearing vehicle registration
number SHD3409U (the *Taxi"). The Taxi was hired to YEUNG CHUN FAIl IC NO
$2577613E a registered hirer-operator of Comfort Transportation Pte Ltd at the time
of occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $117.00 per day
(inclusive of GST),

Please be advised that the Taxl was insured with MS First Capltal Insurance Ltd on
a third party basis at the material time of the accident.

We wish to confirm that the aforesaid hirer-operator had obtained our permission to
undertake repairs for damage on the Taxi arising from the said accident with a motor
workshop of his choice.

Please liaise with the said hirer-operator or his authorized workshop directly for

seltlement of claims with third party's insurance company in respect of the said
accident.

Yours faithfully
Christine Tay

Assistant Manager, Fieet Safety

This is a computer generated letter. No signature Is required.

383 Sin Ming Drive Singapore 575717 Mainline +B65 8555 1188 Facsimile +85 6453 3183
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Merimen e-Claims Page | of |

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Expreas
CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING - )
Case | Notfied  |Est Submittec | Ad) Assigned | Ad) Kpt | ) Submittea [Ins Auth'ed | Starug
oy, | 18 May 2018 RAGrIOIE se1eeas2 58164452 o
Edit Keg | sar ady et | mmM-L Wiew Rt Condtis ]

Reference

Clalm Detalls

CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAL [Created by adjuster]

lInsured: | HONG SEH MOTORS PTE LTD, Co. Reg, No.: 1982033200

Main .

Clamant: COMFORT TRANSPORTATION PTE LTD. Co Reg. No.: 199303811R 1
Wehigie fag 409 . |27/04/2018 13:00 - :59

L SHD3 v e LA |20 Months and 30 Days From LTA Reg Date {Man ¥rj]
[Claim Type: | TP / 019639556056 POREVIEOVE! | 099994856

| Wahicle Rag

[No. SLR1B92IZ :E{H:?n'r::ﬂ | D~ 1B088936MF5H

{(insured). = '

L Excess:

|Repairer: ComfortDelGro Engineering Pie Ltd (Loyang) 5% Loyang Drive, 508969 Loyang - Tel: G214 8300

| Handling AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Ltd, (Express) - Tel: 55-6412-3000 ... [Mandied by Syed-Yusol¥, Saliha] Salina Syed-
| Ingurer; | Yusoffaig.com

I
[Clammant’s | g rirst Capitsl Insurance Lid (HQ) - Tel! 62222311

{1 msucers SR Sy st — -
LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 62563561 ... [Handled by KALVIN ANG WEI KUN | .. [Final Rpt due
(11/05/2018] . S

|ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED view Al |  Compose Case mait | |
[There are no mail for this case. h - h

l Agdjuster

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS= B view All |  Search Tasks |_n-m_=m| Campleln |'
Due Date  Priority Type TaskGroup  Subject Handler  Assigned By Completed On Created On  Dane?

| Mo resuits.

|
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM
THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT
(PAYMENT BREAKDOWN)
| Vehicle No: SLR1892Z (Insd veh) Model: YUNDAI 140 1.7 D (A)
SHD3409U (TP veh)
|Date of Accident: |27/04/2018
Global Sum Settlement | | [X] Yes | [ ] No
Repair Estimale ] 3,103.11
Final Rapair Cost s 2.680.00
Loss of Use * 5.50 days at $50.00 per day
Rantal (if any) -] 5.50 days
LTA [ GIA Search Fee 5
Othars: ‘S
-
Final Settlement Sum (Global Sum) 5 2,680.00
Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [X] YES [ ] NO (Kindly indicale
below)
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability (%)
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: EI;}ELA Applicable: Yes/ Me- BOLA Scenario No:
BOLA Liability 100___ (%) Assessed Liability (*). O (%)
* Assessed Liability fo be filed only for chain colisions and for cases where BOLA does nof apply,
Remarks
Paymaent Instruction: Payee's Breakdown
1) | ComforiDelGro Engineering Pie Lid s 2,680.00
2 -
3) 5
4] -
5) -5
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN vty
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid Daie

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authaorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical

Report! Bill {if any)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd co regnotsssa71sar)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubl Industrial Park
Singapore 408833
Tel: 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Emall: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our Flla No: CC3AIG18007TST1K1EB3IG2

Date: 23/07/2018
REFEREN
Handling Insurer- AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Ple. Lid.  Paolicy No: 0999994856
Flalmant Vehicle sipasoau Insured Vehicle No : SLR1892Z
Date of Loss: 2704/2018 Nature of Claim: Lz Claim No: 0186349558056
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SHD3408U
Make & Model HYUNDAI 140, 1.7 D (A) Engine No: HIDDEN
Reg. Date 28/07/2016 (Man. Year: 2018) Chassis No: KMHLB41UMGUO083236
Colour: Blue Odometer 152147 km
Engine Capacity: 1685 cc
Market Value/New Car Prica: N/A
Sum Insured (5%) Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY
General Condition; Steering (Serviceable): Yes Foolbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No Pre-accident Condifion:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/80 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/60 R16
Fromt Left Side Hankook 7 mm Rear Lefl Side: Hankook T mm
Front Right Side Hankook 7 mm Rear Right Side: Hankook 7 mm
The above valles represend ihe remraiming tyre reads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's  Difference  Diff %)
Parts 2,130.10 1,224 .52 805.58 42 51
Miscellaneous llems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 770,00 420,00 350.00 4545
Paintwark Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 000 0.00
Gross Total (S§) 2,900.10 1,644 52 1,255.58 4329
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 203.01 116.12 B7.89 4320
Nett Amount (S5) 310311 1,759.64 1,343.47 43.29
+ Loss of Use (5.5 x $550.00/day) (S5) 275.00
+ Car Rental (5.5 x 5§117.00/day) (S5) 643.50
+ Doc/Search Fee (S3) 7.49
Nett Liability (55) 2,685.63
Global Sum Settlement (55) 2,680.00
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment; 30/04/2018
Date Inspected:; A0/04/2018 Inspected At ComforiDelGro Engineering Pte Lid
{Loyang)
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§89 Loyang Drive
Singapore 508969
Estimated Period of Repair: 2.0 days
Adjuster: KALVIN ANG WEI KUN Manager; Asher Sng Rong ¥i

NOTE: This report repregents our findngs af ta fima and place of mapection srmied herin. Such ingpection hes been camied ouf fo the best of our
inowiedge and abillty buf any olfer Babiity under any ofher ciroumstances iy heraby sxpressly arcluded.
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Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts
No., Qty Part Ne. Particulars

Page 3 of 4

Condition Repairer's Amount

—

*REAR BUMPER

*REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT
*REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BRACKET [LH/RH)
*REAR BUMPER SIDE BRACKET

*REAR BUMPER CLIPS

*REAR BUMPER SPONGE

*REAR BUMPER UNDER COVER
*LICENSE LAMP HOLDER

‘LAMP ASSY LICENSE

*LAMP ASSY LICENSE

*REAR NO.PLATE

"REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR
*REAR BUMPER ADVERTISEMENT LOGO

14 2 *REAR FENDER ADVERTISEMENT LOGO (LH/RH)
FeFranchise part S=SpcMeil LsListiismDisc

0 = O & W M —
e i i e e Ty L I . g s

Deformed B03.60FL *603.B0FL
Serviceable 504 35FL *-FL
Serviceabls 360.00FL ~FL
Serviceable 88.00FL " FL
MNecassary 2200FL *22.00FL
Tomn 143 40FL *143.40FL
Cut 22500FL *22500FL
Cracked 100.00FS *100.00FS
Cracked 33.85FL “33.85FL
Cracked 33.895FL *33.95FL
Cracked 2500FS *25.00F5
Serviceabla 136.T0FS =FS
Necessary 50.00FS *5000FS
MNecessary 200.00Fs “200.00FS

Sub Total (S5) 2,534.95  1,436.90

« List Item Discount on L ltems 20.00/20.00% (S$) 404 85 212.38

Total Parts (S5) 2,130.10  1,224.52

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
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Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellaneous items selected,

Recommended Labour

Mo Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour ltems

1 PANEL BEATING New 35000 200.00

2 SPRAY PAINTING CHARGE New 250.00 200.00

3 WIRING CHARGE New §0.00 0.00

4 REMOVE/REFIX REVERSE SENSOR New 120.00 20.00
Gross Labour Cost (S5§) T70.00 420.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out, I

< END OF ESTIMATES >
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