Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Woui, Shawnkaijye <Shawnkaijye.Wui@aig.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 12 June 2018 9:35 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Case Assignment TP - SLM7987X - 27/04/2018 -

Dear Asher,

Last vehicle, SJQ 5828M hit onto Ol.

Ol was in the braking position and he was pushed to the right and hit onto the road kerb.
Left front side of Ol vehicle hit onto ambulance.

Liability is not in our favour. Please settle at best.

Thanks and Regards,

Shawn Wui

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way, #08-16, Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1959 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Shawnkaijye.Wui@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any
copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer
system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AlG
for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, May 10, 2018 2:12 PM

To: Wui, Shawnkaijye

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: Case Assignment TP - SLM7987X - 27/04/2018 -

Hi Shawn,
We refer to the email dated 03.05.2018.

Insured mention that there was no video footage capture at the time of the accident, however he would not able to
recall if he did collided into third party as the vehicle ending position of his vehicle was at the kerb.
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Third party do not have any capture at the time of accident, however they mention that there was a patient and nurse
in the vehicle at the time of accident.

Therefore we are of the opinion that the liability is not in our insured favour.
Please kindly advise.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 3 May 2018 7:02 PM

To: Wui, Shawnkaijye <Shawnkaijye.Wui@aig.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: Case Assignment TP - SLM7987X - 27/04/2018 -

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CC6/A1G18007966/Ueb3 Asher

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Wui, Shawnkaijye [mailto:Shawnkaijye.Wui@aig.com]

Sent: Thursday, 3 May 2018 11:28 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@|kkauto.com>
Subject: FW: Case Assignment TP - SLM7987X - 27/04/2018 -

Dear Sirs,

OID reported that SJQ 5828M hit onto his rear portion but Ol did not hit onto SLM 7987X.
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Based on OIV damages, the front portion sustained damages.

Please assist to retrieve a copy of Ol accident footage in order for us to establish the liability.

Thanks and Regards,

Shawn Wui

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AlIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.

78 Shenton Way, #08-16, Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1959 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Shawnkaijye.Wui@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the
information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any
copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer
system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AlG
for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.

From: Do-Not-Reply [mailto:do-not-reply@merimen.com]
Sent: Wednesday, May 02, 2018 2:40 PM

To: Wui, Shawnkaijye

Subject: Case Assignment TP - SLM7987X - 27/04/2018 -

This mail is associated with :
*SLM7987X (9171256377SG)
[SLA799G]

TP
CAREWELL AMBULANCE SERVICES PTE LTD
Apr 27 2018 4:00PM

Jin Auto Services Pte Ltd
Dear Wui, Shawn-KJ,

Please note that a claim has been assigned to you for handling in Merimen. For your action and follow up
please.

This is an auto-generated email. Do not reply to this email.

Sent by : Wui, Shawn-KJ (AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.)



