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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

-4 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 189607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY Ref :  CS/GAI18007959/Usb
N
#16-01 CENTENNIAL TOWER Date: 02-05-2018
SINGAPORE 039190
Code: GAI
1, Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YM 4332B Veh. Inspected GY 5885R
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From RACHEL TAN Assign Date 02/05/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4. Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  23/04/2018 Inspection Date 07/08/2018
Survey held at AUTOLUTION INDUSTRIAL PTE LTD
19 UBI ROAD 4
SINGAPORE 408623
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
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> Back to OneMotoring

PARFICOF Rahata Fnaniry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:
Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

Business
0881L

GY5885R
No

07 Aug 2018
NISSAN

CABSTAR 3.0 5M/T ABS 2DR 2WD EURO
5

Silver
2017

ZD30026311N
JN1SC2F24Z0860329
$27,176.00

310ct 2017

310ct 2017

0

$1,359.00

No

$0.00

30 Oct 2027

C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
10

$46,890.00

$43,272.00
$43,272.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 07 Aug 2018

hnps.'le.Ila.gov,sg!Ilafvrlfact|0nfanqmraRebate ByPublicBetoreDereginput ZFUNC | ION_ID=F0304009T 1



. Shirley Hiew_ (LKK Auto)

== —
From: Shirley Hiew (LKK Auto) <ShirleyHiew@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 17 September 2018 3:26 PM
To: ‘Tan, Rachel'
Cc: ‘assignments’; 'Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)’; 'SUR'’
Subject: RE: RE: CLMOMVC000003197 - GY5885R and YM4332B (GA) on 23.4.2018

Hi Rachel,
As spoken, vehicle has been inspected by us on dated 07/08/2018.

We are still pending finalization from repairer.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shirley Hiew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 17 September 2018 1:16 PM

To: 'Tan, Rachel' <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>; 'SUR' <sur@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: RE: CLMOMVC000003197 - GY5885R and YM4332B (GA) on 23.4.2018

Dear Rachel,
Thank you for your email.
Dear Shirley,

FYNA. Our Ref: CS/GAI18007959/Usb

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Tan, Rachel [mailto:Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com]

Sent: Monday, 17 September, 2018 12:29 PM

To: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: RE: CLMOMVC000003197 - GY5885R and YM4332B (GA) on 23.4.2018

Hi Nivitha



May | know what is the latest regarding this claim?

Regards
Rachel Tan
Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tel: 6804 7846

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, August 3, 2018 5:03 PM

To: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>

Subject: [External] RE: CLMOMVCO000003197 - GY5885R and YM4332B (GA) on 23.4.2018

Dear Rachel,
Please be informed vehicle is not in the workshop, I've called Hamzah and he says

He will call back on Monday to arrange for survey.

BEST REGARDS,

G.Nivitha | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-1972 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tan, Rachel [mailto:Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com]
Sent: Friday, 3 August 2018 4:59 PM

To: LKK Assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>; 'Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: FW: CLMOMVC000003197 - GY5885R and YM4332B (GA) on 23.4.2018

Hi LKK
Survey done?

Regards

Rachel Tan

Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tel: 6804 7846

From: Hamzah <hamzah saad@tanchong.com>
Sent: Friday, August 3, 2018 4:37 PM

To: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-

d@lkkauto.com>
Subject: [External] Re: CLMOMVC000003197 - GY5885R and YM4332B (GA) on 23.4.2018

Dear Rachel,

Kindly arrange for survey.

Regards

Hamzah Sa'ad
Service Supervisor



Autolution Industrial Pte Ltd

.~ 19 Ubi Road 4

5408623

TEL: +65 67038680 DID: +65 67038690 FAX: +65 68467483
Hp: +65 96450079 Email: hamzah saad@tanchong.com

From: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>

Sent: Monday, July 23, 2018 2:20:14 PM

To: Hamzah

Subject: CLMOMVCO000003197 - GY5885R and YM4332B (GA) on 23.4.2018

Without Prejudice
Dear Hamzah

Liability is against the driver of YM4332B.
You may send your LOD to us for review. We are still pending for LKK’s report.

Regards

Rachel Tan

Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tel: 6804 7846

From: Hamzah <hamzah saad@tanchong.com>

Sent: Monday, July 23, 2018 1:08 PM

To: General Claims <GeneralClaims@sg.gaig.com>; Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>
Subject: [External] Re: Accident involving GY5885R and your insured YM4332B on 23.4.2018

Hi,
Kindly refer to my e-mail dated 13-07-2018 and Fax on 28-04-2018.
A reminder your good office claim handler to revert.

At mean times, legal document will be on hold.

Regards

Hamzah Sa'ad

Service Supervisor

Autolution Industrial Pte Ltd

19 Ubi Road 4

5408623

TEL: +65 67038680 DID: +65 67038690 FAX: +65 68467483

Hp: +65 96450079 Email: hamzah saad@tanchong.com

From: Hamzah
Sent: Friday, July 13, 2018 3:39:05 PM

To: generalclaims@sg.gaig.com; Tan, Rachel
Subject: Accident involving GY5885R and your insured YM4332B on 23.4.2018

Hi,



Prior to the above, my client wish to made third party claim against your insured, direct settlement with
claiming for loss of use.

Kindly check your insured liability and revert.
Attachment are my client accident report and workshop estimate.

I've send request for survey by Fax on 28-04-2018.

Regards

Hamzah Sa'ad

Service Supervisor

Autolution Industrial Pte Ltd

19 Ubi Road 4

5408623

TEL: +65 67038680 DID: +65 67038690 FAX: +65 68467483
Hp: +65 96450079 Email: hamzah saad@tanchong.com

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments

This email has been checked for viruses by AVG antivirus software.
WWW.avg.com

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments



1
_Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Tan, Rachel <Rachel.Tan@sg.gaig.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 2 May, 2018 11:37 AM

To: LKK Assignments

Subject: GY5885R v YM43328B (GA) on 23 Apr 18
Attachments: 02052018113127-0001.pdf

Dear LKK

Please accept assignment for TP PRI request.
Contact Hamzah, Tel: 96450079.

Regards

Rachel Tan

Executive, Motor Claims, Great American Insurance Company
Tel: 6804 7846

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended
solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution,
or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.



4. The issue and acce ance af this Form by Insurang moanias is not an admission of liability on the part of the insurance companies

>. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

Il be forwarded by the insurers of the GIA Racords | C bl by General lns r f Singa GlA) T
archiving 1al copies of this report will, for a fee, be made avall ted parties
." By “.“_.“ dgement of this report to the insurers, you hersby conseant to the archiving of this report at the centre and to coples of the report belng made available
aforesaid
Date Of Report 24/04/2018 10:52
Date Of Accident 23/04/2018 14:55
Exact Location Of Accident 9 DEFU LANE 3
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE
Vehicle Registration Number GY5885R
Insured/Policyholder
Name Of Registered Owner S.T.P.L FURNITURE
Work Permit No B52880881L
Email Address STPL@HOTMAIL.SG
Mobile Phone No (LOCAL) +65-96636857
Alternative Phone No OFFICE-85958455
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer NISSAN
Model CABSTAR-3.0 5M/T ABS 2DR 2WD EURO 5 (A)

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used at
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy NO
for repair to your vehicle?

If No, Please state action to be taken THIRD PARTY

Vehicle Category COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.
Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE

Fleet Policy NO

Policy Number 1700072953

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name of Driver KABIR HOSSAIN JAMAL HOSSAIN
Work Permit No 0 63235288

Date Of Birth 04/02/1984

Occupation INDOCR

Date Of Driving Pass 30/12/2014

Driving Experience 3 YEARS AND 3 MONTHS

Gender MALE

Mobile Number (LOCAL) +65-85458455

Fax Number

Contact Number
EMail Address STPL@HOTMAIL.SG

Page 1 of 25



Nas drivar an amployae of the Insured's Company

If No, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured

Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident?
Number of vehicles involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown person(s)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver)
Passenger 1

Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police?

If Yes,Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given?

If Yes,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

SEE ATTACHED SKETCHED PLAN
Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camera?
Was there any audio recorded?

b

m
o

SIDE SWIPE
CLEAR
DRY

NO

NO
NO
YES
NO
2

NAME: : TAR HAI SOON
GENDER: : MALE

NO

NO

YES
NO
NO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properties
Vehicle Category

Name of Driver
NRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name
Nature Of Damage

No. Of Passenger (Including Driver)

YM43328

COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
KHO HENG HUAT
F1395665X

Page 2 of 25



Sketch Plan Pg. 1

e b O LA T N [T

1o Pl report carrectly e dueraibs of the ace s t CA BT VUL IS o
2o bl bormn must be completed by the Policybolder and/or the Autharised Drivar
1. Intormation provided must be &s truthful and accurate as possible Any wiiful qusiepresentation o withhoid ng 6l materis

facts may allew insurance comparies to repudiate policy liahility.
diate policy lialility

4. Tneissue and acceplance of this Form By insurance companies is not an admissien of poiicy haoility on the parn of tha nsurance
companies

5. Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

6. The report will e forwarced by the insuress of the GIA Records Management Centro established by the General Insurance
Association of Singapora IGIA] for archiving and that copies of this renort will for a fee be made avallable upon agplication by
Interested parties.

7. By the lodgment of this regort to the insurers, you hareby consent 1o the archiving of this report at the cantie and to copies of
the report being made available aforesaid

8 Consent under the Personal Data Protection Act (PDPA)
| understand, acknowledge, agree and consent that:

(a) My insurer, my warkshop and the General Insurance Association of Singapore {“GIA”) may/are permitted to collect, use,
disclose and/or process my personal data/personal information set out in this [farm] and any other persanal infarmatior
provided by me or pessessed by my Insurer (collectively the “Personal Information™) and disclose and transfer such
Personal Information to all insurer(s) who have insured vehicle(s} invalved in this accident (all insurer(s) who have insured
vehicle(s) involved in this accident shall be collectively referred to as the “Insurers”), the Insurers’ lawyers/law firms, the
Monetary Authority of Singapare and any relevant gavernment agency/authority {such as the police), for the purpose(s)
of :

(i) processing, handling and/or dealing with my claims including the settlement of the claims and any necassary
investigations relating to the claims;

(it} investigating the acadent and/or my claims;
(iii) carrying out and/or dealing with my instructions or respoandirg ta any enquiries by me;

{iv) administering my ciaims (including the mailing of correspondence, statements, invoices, reports or notices to me,
which could involve disclosure of certain personal data about me to bring about delivery of the same as well as on the
external cover of envelopes/mail packages). and/or

(v) complying with applicable law in administering, processing. handling and/or dealing with my claims.(coliectively the
“Purposes”)

{b) allinsurer(s} who have insured vehicle{s) involved in this accident and the Insurers’ lawyers/law fiems, may/are permitted
10 collect, use, disclose and/or process my Personal Information for cne or more of the abave Purposes; and

{c}  my Personal Information may/can be disciosed by any of the Insurers and/ar GIA to their third party service providers or
agents(including their lawyers/law firms), which may be sited outside of Singapore, for one or more of the sbove Purposas.

{d) my Personal Infarmation will also be collected and used to compile claims history for the purpese of fraud detection,
investigation and management in present and all future ¢laims.

(e) the information so collected under (d) above may be shared / disclpsed.

{i) toall insurers and/or any other third parties that assist in evaluating, investigating, controlling or managing fraud,
regulators, law enforcement and government agencies as reasonably required for the purpases stated, or

(i) for complying with requirements under any regulations, laws or court orders.

frt
N .o""\% 7§ '
: i
Policyhelder’s Signature Driver's Signature Reparting Centre Personnel's Signature
Date & Time: I driver is not the policyholder) ANIGLUTION INDUSTRIAL PTE LTD
Date & Time: 1 NAUBE INIGAD 4

SINGAPORE 408623
TEL $490 9666 FAX: AR4R T4A3

Page 30f 25



Sketch Plan #2 Pg. 1 -
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DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

L. B oiES e _ " -
3 W ’\} Qleﬂ} 4\‘. rm..li “ &rf_t} s..J;f.-g-l? ,4; g :a mj i |;J1-r
Side  cf m} loﬂ"} whyl  Cesult in £y :jhr el r clm..},.

DECLARATION
I/we declare the foregoing particulars are true in every respect
\F- sl
L L}
oY
| . 'ML\ JIOLUTION INOUSTRIAL PTE LTD
Palicyholder's Signature Driver's Signature ﬁ’ AN ggg&% P&Eﬂrgoznar’leh Signature
Time: f i

Date & Time ga::;e;ii;:ol the policyhalder) z -‘t;;mig‘g:gﬁﬁﬁ FAX. BRAR T4B2

Page 4 of 25




AUTOLUTION INDUSTRIAL PTE. LTO,

ESTIMATE

REFZRENCE
ATE

AUTOLUTION INDUSTRIAL PTE LTU
19 UBI ROAD 4

: ACCIDENT/BODY REPAIRS SINGAPORE 408623

TEL: 6490 9666 FAX: 6846 7483
: INS/IC/H/0256/18
: 24-APR-2018

GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY

3 TEMASEK AVENUE

#16-01 CENTENNIAL TOWER

5(038190)
TEL : 68046059
FAX @ 62353334

ATTN: MOTCR CLAIM MANAGER

OWNER'S NAME
ADDRESS

TELEPHONE NO

TYPE OF CLAIM
BOLICY NO
VEHICLE NO
MOCEL CODE
MOUEL/YEAR
ENGINE NO
CHASSIS NO
MILEAGE

DATE IN
LIASILITY
EXCESS CLAUSE
ESTIMATE BY
ACCIDENT DATE

: THIRD PARTY CLAIM

o mersuf

: GY5BEsR

: SWS2REFF2AMHV-A-A 7 / 00

: CABSTAR 3.0 3MT ABS AIRBAG U5

: 10300263110 M

: JHISC2FP4720860329 fM 4&4/-(‘;4 -

. 9427 g 7 -
+ 24/04/2018
s .00
L]
3 0.00
: HAMZAH

: 23108/2018 A 6 alle Qﬁ

+ M/S S.T.P.L. FURNITURE
+ 476 ANG MO KIO AVENUE 10

#12-822 TECK GHEE HORIZON
S(560476)

% 4:«:{49:@«/{
Lo Tef:6uBr0g

LKK Auto Consultants hence notify

the Repairer of the following:

= To resurvey beloreafter spray painting

= To display damaged partls) during resurvey

« Pans pnces are sutyect (o confirmation

* Thira party Survey is on a “Withoul Prejudice” basis
*» No iliegal modification(s) is allowed

= Supplementary lem(s) must be resurveyed and
is subject to final approval from Insurance Company

Acknowledged by Repairer
Signaiure:
Date:




ALTOLUTION INDUSTRIAL FTE. LTD.

.
)

ESTIMATED LABOUR CHARGES FUR ACCIDENT VEHICLE REGN NO GY58858

ESTIMATED SURVEYOR'S
S/NO JOB CODE  NATURE OF JOB CHARGES ~ RECOMMENDATION

1 7z/001 LABOUR CHARGES TO REPAIR R/F PILLAR, RENEW RH FRT 850,00 3?0
CORNER PANEL ANO RH FRONT DOOR.

272/002  CHARGES TD SPRAY PAINTING SAME. £00.00 J’Do .
322/003  SUPPLY PH DOOR LTA LABEL. 15.00 &
4 22/004  REMOVE AND INSTALL RH DOCR MECHANISM. 80.00 L~

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES 1545.00



AUTOLUTION INDUSTRIAL PTE. LTO

.

MATERIAL LIST FOR ACCIDENT VEHICLE REGN NO GYSRASR

DAMAGED PARTS & PRICES
S/ND PARTS DESCRIPTION PARTS NUMBER NETT LIST S/NETT REMARKS
1 SUNDRTES NN AN .00 b[

2 FRT CORNER PANEL 7H Ao .[ 559 FIZ62-MADAA e W0

3 R/F DOOR CHECK LINK A BO430-MAD00 R 1.5 A
4 RH DOCR HINGE @ $56.10 EACH A w00 e X

5 DOOR-FRONT k4 D;s/(-N HOLOO- MO # 130650 _~"

SUB TOTAL 1938.10 0.00 50.00
LESS DISCOUNT (NETT-20.00%, LI1S7-30.00%, S/NETT-.00%) 387.62 0.00 0.00
GRAND TOTAL 1550.48 0.00 30.0C
OVERALL TOTAL 1600.48

LEGEND: REMARKS( QK )} = APPROVED. REMARKS( X ) = NOT ARPROVED

\U—\ //"/ (‘/M/ Micror 9/,( cur



AUTOLUTION INDUSTRIAL PTE, LTU,

.

SUMMARY OF ESTIMATE FOR VEHICLE REGN NO GYS885R

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES 1545.00
TOTAL SPARE OARTS CHARGES 1600.48

___________ 7440
GRAND TOTAL 314548 * Z

* A1 charges do2 nut inciude GST.

SURVEYOR'S PARTICULARS

SURVEYED DATZ

AUTHORIZED DATE

tACESS CLAUSE g C.00
LIABILITY H G.00
REMARKS

PLS NOTE : This estimste i3 based on wisual inspection of the
affected vehicle. Should we require further labour
charges L spare parts in the process of repairs, we
shall inform you accordingly.
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Autolution Industrial Pte Lt

15-October-2018 INS/SC/H/0609/18

Great American Insurance Company
3 Temasek Avenue, #16-01
Centennial Tower

Singapore 038180

Attn :  Motor Claim Manager
Claim Dept
Dear Sir
SUPPLEMENTARY CLAIM
REGN. NO. : GY5885R
CLAIM NO : CLMOMVCO000003197

Further to our claim INS/IC/HI0256/18  we are submitting a supplementary claim for the below
mentioned part for the above mentioned case

Replacement of Damaged Items
1. Front door outer mirror RH Q,OO (u ‘? $ 171.80 Nﬁ/-

We trust the above supplementary claim will meet with your kind approval and we will forward to
you the final repair bill together with the satisfaction note on completion repairs.

Yours faithfully
AUTOLUTION INDUSTRIAL PTE LTD

mzah Sa'ad
zAnsurance Claim Dept

Cc: Surveryor- LKK Auto Consultant

TANCHONG

INTEANATIONAL
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ALTOLUTION INDUSTRIAL PTE. LTD.

FINALIZED

REFTRENCE
DAt

: ACCIDENT/BODY REPAIRS

: INS/IC/H/0256/18
1 24-APR-2018

GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY

3 TEMASEK AVENUE

#16-01 CERTENNTAL TOWER

$(038190)

TEL : 68046059
AX ;62353384

ATTH: MOTOR CLAIM MANAGER

OWNER'S NAME
ADDRESS

TELEPHOME NO

TYPE OF CLAIN
POLICY KO
VEHICLE NO
MODEL COCE
MOOEL/YEAR
ENGINE NO
CHASSIS MO
MILEAGE

OATE IN
LIABILITY
EXCESS CLAUSE
ESTIMATE BY
ACCIDENT DATE

3 ?3!0“ 2018

1 WS S.T.P.L. FURNITURE
: 476 ANG MO RID AVERUE 10

#12-822 TECK GHEL HORIZON
5(560476)

: DIRECT SETTLEMENT / THIRD PARTY CLAIM
: GYSBESR

:+ SWSZROFF24MHV-AA-A

: CABSTAR 3.0 SMT ABS AIRBAG EUS

: 1030026311N

: JN1SC2F 2420860329

9427 KM

+ 2870472018

nm

cl(:\‘fxooﬁel

TEL: 6490 og

GL ;J.;jt,'UJth- HVD ISTRIAL PTE (v

\)"‘I‘L}Anol?r ,4093\?3
06 kX 6846 7483

WY W= W
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AUTOLUTION 1RDUSTRIAL PTE. LTD.

LABOUR CHARGES FOR ACCIDENT VEMICLE REGN NO GYSEB3SR

S/K0 JOB CODE

1 Z2/001

2 12/002

3 121003

4 22/004

KATURE OF JOB

LABCUR CHARGES YO REPAIR R/F PILLAR, REWEW RN FRT
CORNER PANCL AND RH FRONT DOOR.
CHARGES TO SPRAY PAINTING SAMC.

SUPPLY RH DOOR LTA LABEL.

REMOVE AND INSTALL RH DODR MECHANISH.

TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES

CHARGES

#450.00

600.00

15.00

ESTIMATED SURVEYOR'S
RECOMMENDAT 1M

390.00

500.00

uu£/uud
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AJTOLUTION LROUSTRIAL PTE. LTD

MATERIAL LIST FOR ACCIDENT VEHICLE REGN KO GYSBESR

DAMAGED PARTS & PRICES

S/ND PARTS DESCRIPTION PARTS KUMBER IET‘-I- 'LIST Sﬁ;;‘-F;REI‘MS
TR e wm &
2 SURCRIES HPN 50.00 X
3 FRT CORNER PANEL RH F1262 - MAQAA 389.90 Ok
4 R/F DOOR CHECK LINK 80430-MAD00 39.50 x
5 RH DOOR HINGE @ $56.10 EACH 80400-MAGCO 1z.20 x
G DOOR-FRONT RA HO100- MAGYM 1396.50 Ok

SuUB T0TAL 1‘;53:20 l;t;.'l - l-).l;ﬂ
LESS DISCOUNT (NETT-20.00%, LIST-30.00%, S/NETT-.00%) 391.64 0.00 0.00
son 1014 T 0w o
—_— s

LEGEND: REMARKS{ OX ) = APPROVED, REMARKSL X ) = NOT APPROVED
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AUTOLUTION MDUSTRIAL PTE. LTC.

SUMMARY OF OVERALL CHARGES FOR VEHICLE REGN RO GYSB85R

RETT JTEM 1958.20
LESS 20.00%) -391.64
RETT AMOURT 1566.56
LisT 1TEM 6.00
LESS 30.00%) 0.00
LIST AMOUNT 0.00
SPLCIAL METD LIEM u.ou
LESS .00%) 0.00
SPECIAL NETT AMOUNT 0.00
TOTAL LABOUR CHARGES 985.00
TOTAL SPARE PARTS CHARGES 1566.56
TUTAL CHARGES 2b51.56
ADD 7 % GS1 178.61

GRAND TOTAL 2130.17
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Bl B B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

GREAT AMERICAN INSURANCE COMPANY Ref : CS/GAI18007959/Usbe2

ANEA

#16-01 CENTENNIAL TOWER Date: 07-11-2018

SINGAPORE 039190

Code: GAI

1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YM 4332B Veh. Inspected GY 5885R
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CLMOMVCO000003197 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From RACHEL TAN Assign Date 02/05/2018

2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model NISSAN CABSTAR (M) c.c 2953
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2017
Chassis No. JN1SC2F2420860329 Colour SILVER
Odometer 15663 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD

3. Conditions of Tyres

Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |195R15 BRIDGESTONE 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195R15 BRIDGESTONE 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |155R13(D) DUNLOP 6/6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 155 R13 (D) DUNLOP 6/6 mm

4. Description of Damages .
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S FRONT PORTION.

DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.

5. General Information :
Accident Date  23/04/2018 ]Inspection Date 07/08/2018
Survey held at AUTOLUTION INDUSTRIAL PTE LTD

19 UBI ROAD 4
SINGAFPORE 408623
5a. Remarks . _
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

IESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 3 Working Days




’ V V LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

BdE BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 19960719BR GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 1

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GY 5885R

Description of Parts Condition | Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty pti - Workshop (8))]  ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRT CORNER PANEL RH (N) BADLY DENTED 389.90 389.90
1|R/F DOOR CHECK LINK (N) NOT NECESSARY 39.50 -
2|RH DOOR HINGE @%$56.10 (N) NOT NECESSARY 112.20 -
1|DOOR-FRONT RH (N) DISTORTED / 1,396.50 1,396.50
CRACKED
1|FRONT DOOR OUTER MIRROR RH (N) (ADDITIONAL) CuT 171.80 171.80
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -421.98 -391.64
1,687.92 1,566.56
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SUNDRIES (SN) NOT NECESSARY 50.00 -
50.00 -
LABOUR
LABOUR CHARGES TO REPAIR R/F PILLAR, RENEW RH 850.00 390.00
FRT CORNER PANEL AND RH FRONT DOOR.
CHARGES TO SPRAY PAINTING SAME. 600.00 500.00
SUPPLY RH DOOR LTA LABEL. 15.00 15.00
REMOVE AND INSTALL RH DOOR MECHANISM. 80.00 80.00
1,545.00 985.00
GRAND TOTAL 3,282.92 2,551.56
I RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS B ey | | 2,551.56|
Report Ref No. CS/GAI18007959/Usbe2
CHUA KANG SENG
Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report s made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Report.

i [ ity Nl (&L, I nlact i ccepled 1o any third party Wno m reply on the Report wholly or in part. Any third party acting or replyin




