Asher SnE (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CT| <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Friday, 11 May 2018 3:23 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAute), Admin A; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: Irene Tay, Hsiao Tong (LKKAUto); Alfred Toh

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKD5656Z (SMNM16D01220C02/6) AND

SHCB1938B (TP ; LKK REF - CC3/CTI16005286/H1ja3) on 19.03.2016

LKK REF - CC3/CTI16005286/H1ja3
CTI REF — SNMI16D01220C02/6 (SKD56562)

Dear Asher
We are in receipt of your email and contents duly noted.
Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: +65 6389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sqg.cntaiping.com
www.sg.cntaiping.com

fu Sevigapare seviee JTIE

Diselaimer

This message is confidential! ity contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapove) Pre. Lid except
where provided for in a written agreement berween vou and Ching Taiping lnsurance (Singapore) Pre. Led Anv unauthorized discloswre,
use or dissemination, either in whaole or partial, is prohibited. If vou are not the intended recipient of the message, please notific the
sender immediately

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, May 11, 2018 2:25 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept @sg.cntaiping.comz

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com=; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
<chewht@lkkauto.com=; Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <loylrene@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKD5656Z (SNM16D01220C02/6) AND SHCA1938 (TP : LKK REF -
CCE‘-IﬂTIlGD{]EEEﬁlejaE} on 19.03.2016



Hi lrene,
We refer further to our below email.

Please be informed that TP had further agreed and accepted to do our offer dated 08/08/2016.

Therefor we will process with the direct settlement with third party and submit our final report and payment package in
due course.

Thank You,

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Cose Hondler

LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone; d6841-6051 | ermail: gshersna@lkkagto.com | fox 6741-4 108
Ble 51, Poyo Ubi indusirial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S[408933)

From: Jas Khine (LKKAuta)

Sent: Monday, 29 May 2017 7:41 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Hwang Shiang Yi (shiangyi.hwang@sg.cntaiping.com)
<shiangyi.hwang@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Joy Irene (LKKAuto)
<Joylrene@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKD5656Z (SNM16D01220C02/6) AND SHCE193B (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI16005286/H1ja3) on 19.03.2016

Dear Sir,
Further to the below matter,

We maintained our offer @ 50% of liahility as instructed. TP repairer did not accept our offer up to date, (Please see the
attached email correspondence with TP repairer)

Since there is no further development, we will temporary close the case and submit wp report ta vour good office as the
matter being long protected.

it any further development we will inform you for our further handling,
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jas Khine | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Bik 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{q08u33)

From: Hwang Shiang Yi [mailto:shiangyi.hwang@sg.cntaiping.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 17 May, 2016 3:51 PM




To: Joy Irene (LKK Auto) <loyirene@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; C5 A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKD5656Z (SNM16D01220C02/6) AND SHC6193B (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTIIE005286/H1ja3) on 19.03.2016

Dear loy,

Refer to the video footage; both vehicles side swipe each other.
We are maintaining liability 50%.

Thanks & Regards,

Hwang Shiang ¥i

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00

Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No 200208384

DID 16389 6541

Fax 16224 7175/ 6224 7478

Email  : claimsdept{E@sg.cntaiping.com

Email  ; shiangyi.hwang{@sg.cntaiping.com
Website : www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer

This message is confidential. its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Ltd. except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Lid. Any unauthonzed
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please
notify the sender immediately,

From: loy Irene (LKK Auto) [mailto:Joyirene@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 17 May, 2016 3:20 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI; Admin A; CS A Team

Cc: KKLau; Disk Yao; Chee So Chow; Hwang Shiang Yi; Alfred Toh

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKD5656Z (SNM16001220C02/6) AND SHC6193B (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI16005286/H1ja3) on 19.03.2016

LKK REF - CC3/CTI16005286/H1ja3
CTI REF - SNM16D01220C02/6

Dear Sirs,

We refer to our e-mail below dated 12.05.2016.

TP is chasing for our counter offer.



Kindly advise mandate please.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: jovirene@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | 3(408633)

This email may contain confidential and/er privileged informatian. If you are not the intended recipient [or have received this email in error} please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unautherized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this emall is strictly forbidden.

From: Joy Irene (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 12 May, 2016 2:41 PM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-
a@lkkauto.com=

Cc: KKLau <kklau@lkkauto.com>; Disk Yao <disk.yao@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow
<sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Hwang Shiang Yi <shiangyi.hwang@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh
<alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKD5656Z (SNM16001220C02/6) AND SHC81938B (TP @ LKK REF -
CC3/CTI16005286/H1ja3) on 19.03.2016

LKK REF - CC3/CTI16005286/H1ja3
CTI REF - SNM16D01220C02/6

Dear Sirs,

We refer to your mandate below dated 13.04.2016.

TP rejected our offer of 50% and countered for 100% liability.

Kindly advice if we may proceed to settle at best since video is not in or insured’s favour.
Quantum at 100% is at $ 2,384.19.

Thank you.

Best Regands,
Joy Irene | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: jovirened@lkkanto.com| fax: 6741-4108




Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industeial Park, Uhi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

This email may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error} please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email is strictly forbidden.

From: Claims Dept of CTI [mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 13 April, 2016 4:20 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKK Auto) <loylrene@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; C5 A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>
Cc: KKLau <kklau@lkkauto.com>; Disk Yao <disk.yao@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee 50 Chow

<sochow.chee @sg.cntaiping.com>; Hwang Shiang Yi <shiangyi.hwang@sg.cntaiping.com=>; Alfred Toh
<alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKD56562 (SNM16D01220C02/6) AND SHCE193B (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI16005286/H1ja3) on 19.03.2016

Without Prejudice

LKK REF - CC3/CTI16005286/H1ja3
CTI REF - SNM16D01220C02/6

Dear Joy Irene

We thank you for your email of even date pertaining to the above matter.

Please proceed to negotiate the property claim at 50% liability basis in the first instance.
Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd

3 Anson Road

#15-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID : +65 6389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 T175/6224 7478

Email: claimsdeptifsg.cntaiping.com
alfred toh@sg.cntaiping.com

Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclalmer

This message is confidential; s conrents do nor canstitute a commitment by China Tatping Tnsurance (Singapores Pie. Lid excepr where provided for
in g owriiten agreement between vor and Chiva Tadping fsurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid, Any unauthorized disclosure, wse or dissemination, either in
whale or partial, i probibited. If vou are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately

From: Joy Irene (LKK Auto) [mailto:Joyirene@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, April 13, 2016 3:51 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI; Alfred Toh; Hwang Shiang Yi

Cc: KKLau; Disk Yao; Chee So Chow; Admin A; CS A Team




Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKD5656Z (SNM16D01220C02/6) AND SHC6193B (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTIL6005286/H1ja3) on 19.03.2016

LKK REF - CC3/CTI16005286/H1ja3
CTI REF - SNM16D01220C02/6

Dear Sirs,
We refer to your e-mail dated 22.03.2016.

We had conversed with insured and the authorized driver where we informed them of the claim and that we cannot
be absolved from liability based on the video given. They understood and informed us that there is no evidence from
their side and no action taken against TP.

Attached CCTV from third-party repairer for your reference. Video showed that third-party taxi did not cut lane from
behind as what the insured driver has reported.

Third-party adjusted repair cost is at $1,739.20 (before G5T) and we intend to negotiate at 50% liability for an amicable
settlement.

Kindly advise if we may proceed.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Joy Irene | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 67409-4274 | email: jovirene@lkkanto.com| fax; 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{(408033)

This email may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error} please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email is strictly forbidden.

From: Claims Dept of CTl [mailto:claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 22 March, 2016 1:40 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKK Auto) <Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com>; loy Irene (LKK Auto) <Joyirene @lkkauto.com; Thin Thin
<thinthin@Ilkkauto.com=>; Admin & <admin-a@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Hwang Shiang Yi <shiangyi.hwang@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; KKLau
<kklau@lkkauto.com>; Disk Yao <disk.yao@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKD56567 (SNM16D01220C02/6) AND SHC6193B (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI16005286/H1ja3) on 19.03.2016

Without Prejudice

LKK REF - CC3/CTI16005286/H1ja3
CTI REF - SNM16D01220C02/6

Dear Mei Kuan/loy lrene

We thank you for your email of even date pertaining to the above matter.
6



Attach herewith our Insured’s SAS repart for your attention and necessary action,

Please note that liability is in dispute for this accident.

Our Mr Hwang shall be in-charge for this claim.
Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road

#15-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DD : +65 6389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 T175/6224 7478
Email: claimsdeptisg.cntaiping.com

alfre hi@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer

Fhis message i confidential; ity comtents do not constitute a commitment by Ching Taiping Inswrance (Singapore) Pre, Lid. except where provided for
it a written agreement hetween vou and Ching Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid. Amy unanihorized disclusure, wse or dissemination, either in
witole e partial, is prohibited, If vou are mor the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immecdiately

From: Mei Kwan [LKK Auto) [mailto:Meikwan@|kkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, March 22, 2016 11:53 AM

To: Jason Tea

Cc: Alfred Toh; Hwang Shiang Yi; Claims Dept of CTI; KKLau; Joy Irene (LKK Auto); Thin Thin; Admin A

Subject; Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKD56562 (SNM16D01220C02/6) AND SHC6193B (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CTI16005286/H1ja3) on 19.03.2016

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Jason,
We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SHC 6193B at M/s Premier Automotive Services
Pte Ltd - Changi.

Enclosed herewith a copy of TP's GIA report, estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice for your perusal.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Joy and she can be contacted at DID: 6749 4274.

Thank you.



Best Regards,
Mei Kwan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

This email has been scanned b}'_t_l'ie Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com




PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 486443
TEL:65446671 FAX:62141511
CO. REG2200707743D GST REG:200707743D

Qur Ref: SHC6193B/GS
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

7% April 2016
(By Email Only)
Attn: The Motor Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance(Singapore) Pte Lid
3 Anson Road #16-00
Springleaf Tower
Singapore 079909

Dear SirfMadam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC6193B & SKD3656Z ALONG HOUGANG AVE 4
ON 19.03.16

We have been authorized by Premier Taxis Pte Ltd. the owner of Taxi vehicle number:
SHC6193B. to claim against the party/parties responsible for the damages arising from
the above-mentioned accident.

Our records show that you are the insurers of vehicle number: SKD56356Z at the material
time of the accident with the driver of our client’s vehicle, Mr See Sing Ting

As a result of the accident caused by vour Insured Driver’s negligent driving and/or
management of your insured’s Vehicle Number: SKD3656Z. our client’s vehicle was
damaged and we have been put to loss and damage as follows:

(1) Cost of repair % 1860.94 (Incl. GST)
(2) Loss of Rental - 3Days @$133.75per day $ 401.25
(3) Loss of Income — 3Days @$100.00per day 5 300.00
(4) GIA Search fee $ 2.00
$ 2564.19

A copy of each of the following supporting documents is enclosed:
(1) Final Repair Bill, GIA report & sketch plan of SHC6193B

(2) Driver's I/C and Driving Licence

(3) Vehicle Registration card, Certificate of Insurance

(4) Check In/Out Voucher, GIA search



PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVE 2 #01-02
SINGAPORE 4864453
TEL:65446671 FAX:62141511
CO. REG:200707743D GST REG200707743D

Our Ref: SHC6H193B/GS

We would appreciate if vou could look into the subject matter and let us have your
favorable offer within 14 days. If you are agreeable to the settlement of the above said
claims, please forward us vour discharge voucher as for our client’s signature and
pavment made to “Premier Automotive Services Pre Lid™.

Please note that if we do not hear from you within the stipulated 14 days. we will have no

alternative but to appoint our solicitor to act on our behalf to commence proceedings
against you without further notice to you.

Yours faithfully.

Claims Department — Gary Shi

Email: earvshi@premieriaxi.com

NB: We encourage all parties to liaise with us via email to expedite all matters

PS: Please quote our reference no when replving

¢.c. Client = Premier Taxis Pte Lid



Juz Irene !LI{K Autai ==

From:; Joy Irene (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 13 April, 2016 313 PM

To: ‘mike_lawsw@yahoo.com sg'; ‘bayja@min gmail.com’

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKD 56562 AND SHC 61938 ON 19/03/2016 ALONG

HOUGANG AVE 4 TURNING INTOAVE 9

Qur Ref: CC3/CTI16005286/H1ja3

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKD 56562 AND SHC 61938 ON 15/03/2016 ALONG HOUGANG AVE 4 TURNING INTOAVE 9

We refer to the above subject matter, We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by your motor
insurer China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against your policy.

Pursuant ta the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst other information given
us your version of how the accident had occurred (side swiped scenario), we, as the appointed agent of your insurers
shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with third party claimant.

should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6749 4274 or email us at - kkaut orat

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more effectively.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: jovirene@ lkkawto.com| fax: B741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

This email may contain confidential and/er privileged information. If you are not the intended recipsent {or have received this emai in arror) please notify the
sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized CoPYIng, disciosure or distrnibution of the material in this email is strictly forbidden



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

. PREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD (the third party claimant™) of 23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2
#03-02_ SINGAPORE 486443 (address). owner of SHC6193B (vehicle no.) hereby authorize
PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD (“the workshop™) to act for me with respect

to my claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle no SHC6193B

that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 19/03/2016 (date) along HOUGANG
AVR 4 BEFORE AVE 9 & ST (location) involving vehicle no/s SKD 5656Z (“the accident™).

| further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit
and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to settlement of my claim with

payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis insofar as the driver/owner/insurers of the other

vehicle/s is concerned.

=

( 7 /
Dated this / (day) of / /"K/'ifj (month) EU_Jt (year)

W

Signed by “the third party claimant™ bigne{ﬂ’?m
(with chop if applicable) & (with chop)

he workshop™



AV ITUrES AnsIing oUt G Gk

|+

ident and pertain

Policy Mo: DMPCSN3ID4G571501 Claim Mo: SNMLGDO1220C02/6
Claimant: PREMIER TAXIS BTE LTD

Amount 1 55%1,15¢.00
Singapore Dollars One Thousand one Hundred and Ninety Only

I/We agree to accept the sbove menticned amount to be paid to mefus in full &
final settlement of all elaims, coats & disbursements fer injuries / damages
sustained by mefus through an accident involwving

Claimant Vehicle Neo. : SHCE193B
Insured Vehicle MNo. : SEDSESEE

Date of Loss : 18/03/2016
Place of Accident : HOUGANG RVE 4 BEFOQRE AVE 9 & 5Tel

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to mefus of the aforémenticned sum by
CHINA TAIPING IMSURANCE (SINGRPOBRE) FPTE. LTD., I/We agree absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPCRE) PTE. LTD. andfor

Inzured Hame : LEK LEE KIAN
Driver Nams : BAY EIM SENG

from all claims; present or future in respect of all loss, injury or damage
sustained by me/us arising out of the said accident.

I acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability oo the
part of CHINA TATPING INSURARNCE (SINGARPORE) PTE. LTD.

(1} Global Sum 55 1,180.00
PEEAT: . v e B e S R R R R IIEE RGBS 1,180.00
g S
7
._I'. /.l'
LR LA A h =
Claimant Hame : 3 {{.F-'J NRIC Mo : a;_,.LJjU[f'q}bH

Signature 4 Data % “ -'? ]8




PREMIER

PREMIER AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
OFFICE; 23 Changi South Avenue 2 #01.02 5{485443)
TEL 65438876 /65435689 FAX 62141511

AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES GO REG NO. 2007077430 GST. REG. NO.. 2007077430
TAX INVOICE
FREMIER TAXIS PTE LTD DATE 7-Apr-2018
23 CHANGI SOUTH AVENUE 2 #01-03 PAGE 10F 1
SINGAPORE 486443
ATTMN: LEE CHENG LANG
ITEM Description QTyY U.PRICE AMOUNT
FINAL REPAIR BILL FOR KIA OPTIMA ] 1,739.20
REGN NO: SHC 6183 B
et
TOTAL REPAIR COSTS AS RECOMMENDED BY SURVEYOR % 1,739.20
GST@ 7% $ 121.74
GRAND TOTAL| § 1,860.94
—
e
s
i

T
far Premier Automotive Services Pte Ltd

(ALL THE REPAIR COSTS ARE SUBJECTED TO GST)




REPLACEMENT VEH GIVEN YES /NO
QPREMIER s
: CHECK IN / OUT VOUCHER : o Y

DRIVER'S NAVE %g.;‘fé_f_g JIAN O, TN [ INDICATE AREA OF DAMAGE HERE:

W 51 127 LA B e (745435
TAXI REGN ND. g “C-'éf‘qgﬁ MAKE | MODEL Fﬁj""

s, ot0 8505 1b Tsus
7C4UR el doorein

TAXI METER DOWNLOADED

DATE / TIME TCWED & T0 WORKSHCP

YES . NO e s

l BLATE § TIME CALL TO DEIVER FCA VEHCLE COLLECTON

=4

g oL e T

| ACKNOWELDGE AND CONFIRM THAT [ HAVE EXAMINED THE ABOVE SAID VEHICLE AND
THAT THE SAME |5 IN BOCD CONDITION AND TO MY SATISFACTION IN EVERY RESPECT
TOGETHER WITH THE ACCEBSORIES / ITEMS LIST ABOVE. THIS VOUCHER 18 USED M
COMJUNCTION WITH THE TERM RENTAL AGREEMENT

CHECK IN CHECK OUT

Sik SnIaTole | P Lk e

DRIVER'S NAME oA MAME &
W E% :

DRIVERS SIGNATURE / DATE / TIME ORIVER'S SIGNATURE / DATE | TIME

fponhm ||t

CHECKED N BY
(PREM:ER'S AUTHORISED WORKSHOP) (PREMIER'S AUTHDRISED WORKSHOPR)

SERVICE | REPAIRS DONE DRIVER'S REMARKS |

3 SERVICING O OTHERS:

O T/BELT

o MRCON BYSTEM O ACCIOENT: DATE / TIME of AGCIDENT:
L TURBD BETH MY Y HOH LY
) BRAKE SYSTEM

O CLUTCH SYETEM

0 BULS

O UNDER CARRIAGE TP l Lo
Q cPF

O BATTERY




Invoice i’ﬂgﬁ lotl

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSQCIATION QF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

10 Anson Rogd, #08-16 Intemational Plaza, Singapare 076903

Phane: +65 6224 0010 Fax; +65 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday 1o Friday gam to 5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref Mo (3R-16-0306T1
Date of Request: 211032016 Your Ref No. Online Purchasa

Premier Aulomotive Services Ple Lud
23 Changl South Ave 2

#01-02

Singapore 486443

Dear SinMadam,

Enquiry Date 21/03/2016

Enquiry By GOH WEE DEK

T Vehicle No. SKD56858Z

Accident Date 19403/2018

Enquiry Result

TP Vahicle No.  |Insurer Paried of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SHDEBR5EF Chira Taiping Insurance (Singapare} Pte. Lid. 12/10/2015-1110/2018 ‘EJBE 6111
Thank You.

Thl|mupmmuhmlnmm+mnnrhhﬂmpwufmn:dﬂhhmmbrhmuﬁnuﬂhﬁmuﬂim
mﬂmﬂsmmw“uhumrupnmulny!nrmmmwarHMm-tmnhnwﬂarmhﬂhmbrw
hunr&mﬁmmﬂnrhmm}mmwmamhimﬂ.

This is a compuiter genarated document and requires no signature.
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Invoice Fage 20T <

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

( RECORDS MANAGEMENT GENTRE
GE"ERAL 10 Anson Road, #06-16 Intemational Plaza, Singapore 078803

INSUWCE Brone +65 6224 0010 Fax: +85 5224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to S5pm
GST Registration No: M400017733

§ .:: 1

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

TAX INVOICE
Our Ref No: GR-18-030871
Date of Regues!: 21/03/2016 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
Premier Automotive Services Pte Lid
23 Changi South Ave 2
#01-02
Singapore 485443
Dear Sir/Madam,
Enquiry Date 21/032016
Enquiry By GOH WEE DEK
TP Vehicle Mo, SKD5656Z
Accident Date 19/0372016
[DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (55)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1,87
GST Amount 013
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
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