Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Lin Shu Juan <shujuan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 8 May, 2019 5:12 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Cc: Admin A; raymond@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg

Subject: RE: SLJ6230T - TP Claim against SLF400E ***LKK REF:CC6/EQI18007923/wb3

Dear Vivian,
We refer to your email.

Above vehicle has proceeded with Own Damage claim.
Therefore kindly assist for closure.

Thank you.

Regards,
Lin Shu Juan

Automotive Repair Centre Pte Ltd
38 Woodlands Industrial Park E1
#05-18

Singapore 757700

Tel: +65 6468 8834

Fax: +65 6462 2278

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 8 May 2019 4:50 PM

To: raymond@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg

Cc: 'Lin Shu Juan' <shujuan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SLJ6230T - TP Claim against SLF400E ***LKK REF:CC6/EQI18007923/wb3

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Your Ref: SLJ 6230T
Our Ref: CC6/EQI18007923/wb3

Dear Sir/Madam,
Accident involving Vehicle SLJ 6230T & SLF 400E on 27/04/2018
We refer to the above matter

Kindly check and advise if your client is still interested to pursue with his third-party claim against our principal M/s
EQ Insurance Company Ltd.

Please respond and let us know within 10 days from the date of this e-mail. Otherwise, we shall have no other option
but to submit our report to our principal for closure.



Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 2 May, 2018 12:34 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@Ikkauto.com>; raymond@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg

Cc: 'Lin Shu Juan' <shujuan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: SLJ6230T - TP Claim against SLF400E ***LKK REF:CC6/EQI18007923/wb3

WTHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: SLJ 6230T
Our Ref: CC6/EQI18007923/wb3

Dear Sir/Madam,
Accident involving Vehicle SLJ 6230T & SLF 400E on 27/04/2018
We refer to the above matter

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is unclear for the
above mentioned case. Enclosed herewith is a copy of our insured's accident report for your perusal.

Meanwhile, kindly forward to us with any evidence (if any) to support your claim

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at her DID 6841 8625

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of
resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be
deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the
issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.



Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 30 April, 2018 5:26 PM

To: raymond@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg

Cc: 'Lin Shu Juan' <shujuan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau
(LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SLJ6230T - TP Claim against SLF400E ***LKK REF:CC6/EQI18007923/wb3

Dear Raymond,

We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we are currently pending for our insured’s report.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Vivian at 6841 8625.
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Thank you

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 30 April 2018 2:01 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: SLJI6230T - TP Claim against SLF400E

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: raymond@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg [mailto:raymond@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 30 April, 2018 1:43 PM

To: 'assignments' <assignments@|kkauto.com>

Cc: 'Lin Shu Juan' <shujuan@automotiverepaircentre.com.sg>

Subject: SLJ6230T - TP Claim against SLF400E

Dear claim officer in charge,

My client of vehicle SLJ6230T wants to make a third party claim against SLF400E insured by EQ Insurance Company
Ltd.

Based on our client SLI6230T ‘s statement claimed that 3rd party SLF400E did a lane change from lane 1 to 2, hit
onto her left doors after she (SLJ6230T) turned out to Ubi Rd 1 at lane 2.

Attached are the accident report and estimate of repair, kindly let us know the liability detail and e.g. validity of the
policy holder before arrange survey.

Appreciated. Thank you!

Best Regards,

Raymond Tan

Automotive Repair Centre Pte Ltd
38 Woodlands Industrial Park E1
#05-18, Singapore 757700

Tel: +65 64688834

Fax: +65 64622278



