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Khanchna (LKK Auto)

From: Khanchna (LKK Auto)
Sent: Thursday, 20 February 2020 9:28 AM
To: 'Foo, Chityan'
Cc: Admin A
Subject: RE: 6756240084SG003 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG18007891/Gkb3 [Accident between SLM 

4085T & SLG 7888E [AIG] on 26/04/2018]

Dear Mr. Jimmy, 
 
Kindly be informed that we are pending for amended tax invoice and amended LOD from the Third party workshop and 
we are unable to get in touch with the Third party workshop repairer. 
 
In view of the above, we will proceed to temporary close the file and submit  WP to your office. 
  
If there is any new development in future, we will keep you informed for an update and follow up the matter 
accordingly. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Khanchna| Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
DID: 6841 2360| email: Khanchna@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 
  

From: Foo, Chityan <Chityan.Foo@aig.com>  
Sent: Friday, 24 January, 2020 11:11 AM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: 6756240084SG003 
  
Dear LKK,  
  
We refer to the above matter 
  
Kindly let us have your status update. 
  
Kind regards, 
  
Jimmy Foo 
AIG 
Complex Claims Examiner 
AIG Building, 78 Shenton Way, #08-16, Singapore 079120 
Tel +(65) 6419 1945|Fax +(65) 6835 7416 
 
Chityan.foo@aig.com | www.aig.sg 
  


