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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: ECICS Claims <claims@ecics.com.5g>

Sent: Monday, 7 May 2018 2:12 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); ECICS Claims

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SKT9058P &

SKQ7304H ON 14.4.18

Dear Veran

Qur claim no DMPC1800140H.
Thank you!

Regards,

Janice Goh

Claims Division
DID: +65 6303 0182
FAX. +65 6338 9267

ECICS Limited
7 Temasek Boulevard, #10-01 Suntec Tower One, Singapore 038887

WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT FOR ALL PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION/SURVEY, please email to motorsurvey@ecics,.com.sq
directly.

*+plagse bear with us should we take longer to response as we are currently experiencing a high volume of
claims. Thank you for your kind patience and understanding. i

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [maiIto:vemnchen@lkkautn.cc-m]

Sent: Monday, 7 May, 2018 2:02 PM

To: ECICS Claims

Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SKT9058P & SKQ7304H ON 14.4.18

Dear Janice,

Please provides us the claim number.

Best Hegards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)
sent: Monday, 30 April 2018 10:08 AM
To: 'ECICS Claims' <claims@ecics.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SKT9058P & SKQ7304H ON 14.4.18

1



Dear Janice,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8474 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fas: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408032)

From: ECICS Claims [mailto:claims@ecics.com.sg]
Sent: Friday, 27 April, 2018 5:51 PM

To: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore) <charmaine.kong@vw.com.sg>; 'assignments’ <assignments lkkauto.com>
Cc: Wong, Meiy (VWG Singapore) <meiy.wong@vw.com.sg>; Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore)
<Pearlyn.cheong@vw.com.sg>; Goh, Edmund (VWG Singapore) <edmund.goh@vw.com.sg>; ECICS Claims

<claims@ecics.com.sg=
Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR DI RECT SETTLEMENT FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SKT9058F & SKQ7304H ON 14.4.18

Dear Charmaine

Thank you for your email.
We will appoint LKK for the survey.

Aside to LKK
Please assist to arrange for the above TP vehicle.

Thank you.

Regards,

Janice Goh

Claims Division
DID: +65 6303 0182
FAX: +85 8338 0267

ECICS Limited
7 Temasek Boulevard, #10-01 Suntec Tower One, Singapore 038987

WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT FOR ALL PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION/SURVEY, please email to moforsurvey@ecics.com.sg
directly.

+#please bear with us should we take longer to response as we are currently experiencing a high volume of
claims. Thank you for your kind patience and understanding.**

From: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore) [W]

Sent: Friday, 27 April, 2018 3:15 PM

To: Janice Goh Siew Geok (ECICS, Claims); ECICS Claims

Cc: Wong, Meiy (VWG Singapore); Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore); Goh, Edmund (VWG Singapore)

Subject: FW: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SKT9058P & SKQ7304H ON 14.4.18

Dear lanice,

Please help to assign Surveyor....



Thanks.

Best Regards,

Charmaine Kong
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales

Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 158934

Direct line: +65 63057176
Main Ling +65 6305 72
Main Fax: +65 6474 364
charmaine. kong@vw.com.sq
hitp:/fwww. v COIm.SQ

(in]
g 0

New Arteon.

This is high performance art.

From: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore)

Sent: Thursday, 26 April, 2018 5:26 PM

To: claims ics.com.

Cc: Wong, Meiy (VWG Singapore) (meiy.wong@vw.com.sg); Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore); Goh, Edmund (VWG
Singapore)

Subject: FW: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SKT9058P & SKQ7304H ON 14.4.18

RESEND... Please revert on liability & survey arrangements.

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Charmaine Kong
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales

Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 155934



Direct ine: +65 6305 7176
Main Line: +656305 7289
Main Fax:  +85 8474 3643
charmaine.kong@wvw.com.sg
hitp:www VW, COMm. sg

New Arteon.

This is high performance art.

From: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore)

Sent: Thursday, 26 April, 2018 10:09 AM

To: 'ECICS Claims’

Cc: Wong, Meiy (VWG Singapore) (meiy.wong@vw.com.sg); Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore); Goh, Edmund (VWG
Singapore)

Subject: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SKTS058P & SKQ7304H ON 14.4.18

Dear Claims,
Please revert on liability & survey arrangements.

Thanks

Best Regards,

Charmaine Kong
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales

Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 158934

Direct line: +65 6305 71786
Main Line +65 6305 7299
Main Fax +65 6474 3643
charmaine kong@wvw.com.sq
http:/Awww.vv,.com.sg




New Arteon.

This is high performance art.

From: charmaine.kong@vw.com.sg [mailto:charmaine. kong@vw.com,sq]
Sent; Thursday, 26 April, 2018 10:06 AM

To: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore)

Subject: Scan von MyMFP

Scan from MyMFP

g A

This message may contain privileged and confidential information and is only intended for use by the addressee. No representation, warranty, guarantee
or undertaking expressed or implied is made by ECIC3 Limited: as to the fairness, accuracy or completeness of any information, projections or apinions
contained In this message. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination gither in whole or In part is prehibited. If you are not the addressee
indicated in his message (or responsible for delivery of the message to such person), you may not copy ar deliver this message to anyone. In such case,
vou should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply email. Opinions contained herein are the personal opinions of the sender and do
not necessarily represent the views of ECICS Limited.



Catherine ChunE (LKK Auto)

From: ECICS Claims <claims@ecics.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 27 April, 2018 5:51 FM

To: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore); ‘assignments’

Cc: Wong, Meiy (VWG Singapore); Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore); Goh, Edmund
(VWG Singapore); ECICS Claims

Subject: RE: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SKT5058P &
SKQ7304H ON 14.4.18

Attachments: MyDocument_2018_04_26_10_05_20.pdf

Dear Charmaine

Thank you for your email.
We will appoint LKK for the survey.

Aside to LKK
Please assist to arrange for the above TP vehicle.

Thank you.

Regards,

Janice Goh

Claims Division
DID: +65 6303 0182
FAX: +65 6338 9267

ECICS Limited
7 Temasek Boulevard, #10-01 Suntec Tower One, Singapore 038387

WITH IMMEDIATE EFFECT FOR ALL PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION/SURVEY, please email to motorsurvey@ecics com.sg
directly.

*#plagse bear with us should we take longer to response as we are currently experiencing a high volume of
claims. Thank you for your kind patience and understanding. **

From: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore) [mailto:charmaine.kong@vw.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 27 April, 2018 3:15 PM

To: Janice Goh Siew Geok (ECICS, Claims); ECICS Claims

Cc: Wong, Meiy (VWG Singapore); Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore); Goh, Edmund (VWG Singapore)

Subject: FW: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SKT9058P & SKQ7304H ON 14.4.18

Dear Janice,

Please help to assign surveyor....

Thanks.

Best Regards,

Charmaine Kong
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales



Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd
247 Alexandra Reoad
Singapore 152834

Direct line: +65 86305 7176
Main Line:  +85 6305 7200
Main Fax: +65 6474 3643
charmaine kong@vw.com.sq
hitp:/hwww VW com.sq

New Arteon.
This is high performance art.

From: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore)
Sent: Thursday, 26 April, 2018 5:26 PM
iC5.COMm.5
Cc: Wong, Mely (VWG Singapore) (meiy.wong@vw,.com.sg); Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore); Goh, Edmund (VWG
Singapore)
Subject: FW; REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SKT9058P & SKQ7304H ON 14.4.18

RESEND... Please revert on liability & survey arrangements,

Thanks

Best Regards,

Charmaine Kong
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales

Volkswagen Group Singapare Pte Ltd
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 159834

Diract line: +85 6305 7176
Main Line: +65 6305 7298
Main Fax: +65 6474 3643
charmaine kong@wvw.com.sg
http:/fwww. vw.com.sg




New Arteon.
This is high performance art.

From: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore)

Sent: Thursday, 26 April, 2018 10:09 AM

To: 'ECICS Claims'

Cc: Wong, Meiy (VWG Singapore) (meiy.wong@vw,.com.sg); Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore); Goh, Edmund (VWG
Singapore)

Subject: REQUEST FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT FOR ACCDT INVOLVING SKT9058P & SKQ7304H ON 14.4.18

Dear Claims,
Please revert on liability & survey arrangements.

Thanks.

Best Regards

Charmaine Kong
Insurance Service Advisor
Aftersales

Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Lid
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 159934

Direct line: +B65 6305 7176
Main Line: +65 6305 7299
Main Fax: +B5 6474 2643
charmaine kong@vw.com.sg
hitp:/fwww. vw.com.sq




New Arteon.
This is high performance art.

From: charmaine.kong@vw.com.sg [mailto:charmaine. kong@vw.com.sq]
Sent: Thursday, 26 April, 2018 10:06 AM

To: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore)

Subject: Scan von MyMFP

Scan from MyMFP

A g——]g——

This message may contain privileged and eonfidential information and is only intended for use by the addressee, No representation, warranty, guaranteeg
or undertaking expressed or implied is made by ECICS Limited; as to the fairness, accuracy or completeness of any information, projections or opinions
contained in this message. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination either in whole or in part is prohibited. If you are not the addressee
indicated in his message (or responsible for delivery of the message to such person), you may not copy or deliver this message to anyone. In such case,
you should destroy this message and kindly notify the sender by reply email. Dpinions eontained herein are the personal cpinions of the sender and do
not necessarily represent the views of ECICS Limited.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

#

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 17 May 2018 11:23 AM

To: 'Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore)’; Rasul (LKKAuto); SUR; Admin A; Admin-D
(LKKAUtD)

Cc Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore); Wong, Meiy (VWG Singapore); Foo, John (VWG
Singapare)

Subject: RE: SKT9058P - FINALISE

Dear Pearlyn,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Confirmed COR $10,342.26 before GST
Total 8 working days repairs

Final invoice and all supporting documents sent over to ECICS

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore) [mailto:Pearlyn.cheong@vw.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 16 May 2018 1:58 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=; Admin-D
(LKKAuUto) <admin-d @lkkauto.com>

Cc: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore) <charmaine.kong@vw.com.sg>; Wong, Meiy (VWG Singapore)
<meiy.wong@vw.com.sg>; Foo, John (VWG Singapore) <John.Foo@vw.com.sg>

Subject: SKT9058P - FINALISE

Dear Rasul,
Please confirmed
COR S 10342.26 before GST

Total 8 working days repairs

Best regards,

Pearlyn Cheong
Service Advisor
Aftersales Body & Paint Department

Volkswagen Group Singapore (Alexandra)
247 Alexandra Road



Singapore 159934

Direct line: +B65 6305 7288

Mobile +65 0236 1336
Main line: +65 6305 7289
Main Fax: +65 6474 3643
pearlyn.cheong@vw.com.sg
http://www.vw.com.sg

New Arteon.

This is high performance art.




Veron Chen (LKKAuto) 2

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 10 May 2018 12:24 PM

To: 'Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore)’; Rasul (LKKAuto); SUR; Admin A; Admin A

Ce: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore); Wong, Meiy (VWG Singapore); Goh, Edmund
(VWG Singapore); Oh, Aik Seong (VWG Singapore)

Subject: RE: SKT9058P - SUPPLEMENTARY

Dear Pearlyn,

Surveyor agree 2 more days for the total repairs.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Fhone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Cheong, Pearlyn (VWG Singapore) [mailto:Pearlyn.cheong@vw.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 10 May 2018 10:06 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=>; Admin A
<admin-a@|kkauto.com:=

Cc: Kong, Charmaine (VWG Singapore) <charmaine kong@vw.com.sg>; Wong, Meiy (VWG Singapore)
<meiy.wong@vw.com.sg>; Goh, Edmund (VWG Singapore) <edmund.goh@vw.com.sg>; Oh, Aik Seong (VWG
Singapore) <Aikseong.Oh@vw.com.sg=>

Subject: SKT9058P - SUPPLEMENTARY

Dear Rasul,
We need additional 2 more days for the total repairs.

For your approval , thanks.

Eest regards,

Pearlyn Cheong
Service Advisor
Aftersales Body & Paint Department

Volkswagen Group Singapore (Alexandra)
247 Alexandra Road
Singapore 158934

Direct line: +65 6305 7288

Mobile +G55 9236 1336
Main line: +65 8305 7299
Main Fax: +65 6474 3643

pearlyn.cheong@vw.com.sg
http://www.vw.com.sg



New Arteon.

This is high performance art.
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TIME. 190472078 181

v ROSLI BIN ABDUL WAHAR Actual e-Filling Submission Date & Time: 19/04/2018 18:29
SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE
1. Please repori comrectly the detais of the acciden 1o speed up the claims process
2. This Feem must be complated by the Policyholder andlor the Authorised Driver

3. Infarmatian provided must be as truthful and accurale as possible Any wilful misrepreseniation of wilhokiding of maieral facts may allow iInsurance companies 10
repuciate policy abifity

4. Tha issue and accepiance of this Fasm by msurance companigs is mot an admission of palicy liabwility o the parl ol (he nsurance companes

5 Any false reporting may be referred to the Police for investigation.

&, This report will be forwarded by Ihe insurers of the GlA Records Managemant Cantre eslablished by the Ganaral Insurance Assocation ol Singapore (GIA) for
archiving Bng that eogies of this rapart will, for a fee, be made availabla upon applicaban by interesied panies

T By the lodgemant of this repart ta tha insurers, you hereby consent to the archiving of this report al the centre and to copies of the report being made avasabla
aforesged

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date Of Report 18/04/2018 18:07
Date Of Accident 14/04/2018 11:25
Exact Location Of Accident CLEMENTI AVENUE 2 EXIT TO AYE
Country/State of Loss SINGAPORE
DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
Vehicle Registration Mumber SKTa058P
Insured/Policyholder
Mame Of Registered Owner WONG PERCY MAN POK
MRIC Mo 57586088
Emall Address PERCYWONG@RGMAIL COM
Mobile Phone Mo (LOCAL) +65-85220416
Alternative Phone No OTHERS-BB093710
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer VOLKSWAGEN
Model GOLF A7 1.4 TSI AT 5G13GZ W/O HID

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was baing used at

P 1 PICKING UP SIBLING(PRIVATE USE)
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

far repair to your vehicle? WG

If Mo, Please state action to be taken THIRD PARTY

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company MSIG INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.
Type Of Coverage COMPREHENSIVE

Fieet Policy [

Policy Number A 28782058 AVW

Cover Mote Number

Driver

Mame of Driver MALAIT, KEVIN NEAL PERALTA
Passport No/FIM P42001 334

Data Of Birth 10/01/1991

Ccocupation INDOQOR

Date Of Driving Pass 25/04/2012

Driving Experience 5 YEARS AND 11 MONTHS
Gender MALE

Mobile Number (LOCAL) +65-85220416

Fax Mumbar

Contact Number OTHERS-88083710

EMail Address PERCYWONG@GMAIL.COM

Page 10of 19



P 15 WEST COAST LANE
LD WEST COAST GARDEN
Posteode 127745

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO

If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured CHILDREN

Vehicle Registration Mumber of Driver's Own

ahicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Weather Conditions CLEAR

Road Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO
Number of vehicles involved in the accident
Was any body injured in the Accident? NO

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other matenal or property damaged? YES

| have been approached by unknown personis)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance o
Mumber of Passengers {Including Driver) 1

Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported 1o the police? MO

If ¥es Please state which Police Station

Was notice of intended Prosecution given? NO

If ¥es,against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

PLEASE REFER T SKETCH PLAN

Attachment(s)

Are accident photos available for attachment? YES

Was there any video captured by Car Camera? NG

Was there any audio recorded? MO
Vehicle Registration Number SKOT3I04H
Vehicle Make/Model/Colour

Details Of Properties

Vehicle Category PRIVATE CAR
Mame of Driver CHIA SWEE LOON
MNRIC/Passport Mumber

Contact Number 91188752
Address

Postcode

nsurance Company Name

Mature Of Damage

Neo. Of Passenger (Including Driver) :

Page 2 of 19



Sketch Plan
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{v] cormphshg with applicabie law in sdminatering. processmy. handling ang/or dealng with my cama (iecwety 1he
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(B 88 imarer(sl who hawe imured vohcieis] mvohes o Dhis SCCident and the insurens’ awyersdlaw firma, may/are oo mitied
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(d) v Parwonsl nformation will Bho be collected snd used 10 comple laems Hatory far the Durplee of fracs Selectan
v aton and management (n proent end ol Fature charns

(@) the slormation w colecied wnded (d] sbowve may e vhered / disciowed

i to-all magrers andl/for any other third purtes that asss? » evaluating nvestigatng controling of managing fraud.
reguiatons. law enforcement and government agendied a3 réauonabily resured Tof the Dl podEs $T0T80, oF
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Sketch Plan #2

SKETCH PLAN
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Addendum Sheet

' GEMERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF INGASDR[ BECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTARE
- GEMERAL d Wiy Gy 11000 Smgamoe SANLES
INSURANCE TR ATIAG010 Tas @V EIMOCHD
Al e ating baourt Meeeas 1a Dedey 29 00- 1000
CTap R ER Ty L SR | LW MRAVEEGON F RN By NE MBI

IMPORTANTNOTE: Please submithe completed Addendum form tothe 1ame Authiorsed Reporting Centre
with whom you submitted the Criginal Report

ADDENDUM

[a] PARTICULARSOFPERSONMAKING THEAMENDMENTS:

Afumsmﬁ we KT 905k 7
e il AOCIRIN i gup

o —

wWen cie I:Ir.u_::}em-: Qwner! (%) Mleate osiets avapprooriate

e

Address - Singapcre

_M‘(s’?fﬂ

Contact Ml Nooie No

Email Address

Date of Accident 9{‘6} Time ot Accige=t I/ T
Place of Accident CLQI”W? m%uﬂ -2 f!."l 7( m
irgurance Company N‘JW

o T
(B) mnmumuumnmnmﬁmmnm_mi-_fg

| have made a report on The abave mentioned ace/dent and waoulg like toinciude additsgnal information o
make the following amendments

UDA) L CRWOY SthontD 6 CLembu | i 2 Ry() o BHE

Af"r
Poucyhoiger [ Driver's Sgnature jHaorag ‘rn- . |- slal !
Dat “Mame ;
Date
'/’ 1. =

f/w A
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PO TUAS

WONG PERCY MAN POK
15 WEST COAST LANE
Singapore, 127745

PDI TUAS

Phone Mo
Fax Mo.
E-Mail

YAT Registration No, M20098505-2
Tax Mo 1991014947

St Service Quote
Customer Mo CAVO34051
Cluote Nao. SER/QUOMBOOTIT
QuoteDate 26/04/18
Salesperson Reeve Hiah
Page 1
THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL TAX INVOICE
Make Model Description Mileage Service Advisor
Volkswagen Passeng GOLF AT 1.4 TSI (DSG)RECAT 21.481 Cheong Pearlyn
License No. VIN Initial Registration Sales Advisor
SKTO058P WVWZZZAUZFWDZ21882 25/06/15 Reeve Hiah
Engine Code Labor Type Engine No. Model Code
1T CHXS 214062 5G13GZ
MNo. Description Qty. UoM Unit Price _ Amount
2L 5 1680
P B&P ALEX LABOUR LABOUR 5 UNIT +i#° 420000
P B&P ALEX LABOUR RE+REINSTALLED WSCREEN 1 UNIT Y BADO0-
P B&P ALEX PAINT SPRAY PAINT 4 UNIT e fhow 36000
P B&F DIAG PROGRAMMING & CALIBRATION 1 Time Un 450.90,/
COMPULSORY TO DO AFTER AC
P B&P MECH CHECK WIRE HARNESS, ECU, S 1 Time Un V" 280 00~
Mett
Sum Laber 9.000.00
P 5G0807305B BUMPER REINFORCEMENT 1 Pieces BY 7, 72580
R R e e L e
P 5G0853675A JZQ NAME PLATE TSI 1 Pieces P~ G103
P 5G085IBTSAPCWE MAME PLATE BLUE MOTION 1 Pieces M"‘f.'./ﬁ'r' 75"
I4seFPredecessor- SSHR5ITSATCT
P 5G0B536GBT 227 MNAME PLATE GOLF 1 Pieces ptn £ g9.09 v
P 5GHAB0T7393 BUMPER BRACKET LHS 1 Pieces . 36,45 X
P 5G6807393A BUMPER RETAINER LHS 1 Pieces N 1. 3645 =
P S5GBR0TI04 BUMPER BRACKET RHS 1 Pieces 7. 3645 X
P 5G6807I04A BUMPER RETAINER RHS 1 Pieces = 3645%
P 5G6807417APGRU REAR BUMPER 1 Pieces DC” 114975 V'
Predecessor 5SEE80THTARGRU
P 5G63075680D 9BS REAR DIFFUSER SPOILER 1 Pieces ){"u L?- 322.86 X
Use Predecessor 5668675680 / _
P 5GBB0TBE3A REAR CENTER STRIP 1 Pieces L M 1. 67.06 v
Use Predecessor SOG807883
P 5G68270250 REAR LID 1 Pieces B4 ~1.35549
Lee-Predecesanr-DEoderor b
Sum carried forward 12,956.43

Payments to: -BBN: - Acc.-No..:



POl TUAS

WONG PERCY MAN POK
15 WEST COAST LANE
Singapore, 127745

Singapore .
e Service Quote
Customer No Cw034051
Quote No SER/QUOMB00TT
QuoteDate 26/04/18
Salesperson Reeve Hiah
Page 2
THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL TAX INVOICE
Make Model Description Mileage Service Advisor
Volkswagen Passeng GOLF A7 1.4 TSI (DSG)RECAT 21,481 Cheong Pearlyn
License No. VIN Initial Registration Sales Advisor
SKTO058P WAVWZZZAUZFW021882 25/06/M5 Reave Hiah
Engine Code Labor Type Engine No. Model Code
1T CXS 214062 5G13GZ
Continued 12,956.43
A
P D 007600A1 INOXSPRAY 1 Pieces “"); 7843 ¥
P D 180003M2 ZKADHESIV 1 Pieces pA T 330 24 7
P D 476KD1M2 SEALANT 1 Pieces AN st X 8929 %
P D 506KD1A3 2K FOAM 1 Pieces A b X182 26 X
Sum Item 4,636.65
& 6, 281k
LKK Auto Consultants hence notif /ﬂ e
U Y encea nodify ]
the Repairer of the followina: ' Bﬁ[‘%
Rty e it | by G0l Sum Labor 9,000.00
Sum Item | bl - 4,636.65
‘ 5-6 dwp
| Total SGD 13,636.65
2 T 13,636 .65 954 57
= Y 7% GS
g el bk 0% ] 9 {" FOIBI i sopinel. 6sT 14,591.22
EXplanetiontec1 by fepaier | (?a, 5‘6 PM'-*
F = Propostionately Charged | W’D
Diate:

Payment Terms ——ho-Gredit—

Payments to! - BBN: - Acc -No..

PDI TUAS

Phone No.
Fax Mo.
E-Mail

AT Registration No. M20098505-2
Tax Mo 19910149472



VEHICLE NUMBER:

Supplementary or Omitted List

SKT9058P

/)

MODEL GOLF A7 1.4 TSI (DSG)RECAT
CLAIMS DETAILS
LABOUR DESCRIPTION QUANITY |UNIT PRICE |  AMOUNT
;
2| LABOUR TO REPAIR END PANEL 1 ga0|  ssa0.00 77
3|SPRAY PAINT END PANEL 1 800 $800.00
4
Total $1,640.00
No. | Item No. cription Qty [Unit price | DISCOUNT Amount |
5608073058 BUMPER REINFORCEMENT 1 72580 0 72580 PPt
AGEGA0TEG3A REAR CENTRE STRIP 1 67.06 67.06 P-EF"
TOTAL: ~ $792.86
Total Labour & Parts 52.432.86
Survey By



SERVICE ORDER NO: 18IP1212

CUSTOMER MO

CVg3a081

CUSTOMER NAME: 'WONG FERCY MAN FOK

TELEPHONE MO.:

ADDRESS: 15 WEST COAST LANE
Singapore

VEH No.: SKT9058P
Order Date: o758
Reg Date: 250615 KM: 21,481
VIN MO, WYWZZZALZFW2 1 Ba2 ENGIME NO:
MODEL: GOLF AT 1.4 TSI [DSGIRECAT  WODEL NO.: 5G13GT

Ha, BESCRIPTION

Labor
1 B&P DIAG FROGRAMMNG & CALIBRATION- NETT

2 B&R MECH

3 B&F ALEX LABOUR
4 BEP ALEX PAINT
] BEF ALEX LABCOURA
] BEP NUMBER PLATE
7 EXTO0037
& EXTDO037

fem
a SGEADTATTAPGRL
10 SEERETO250
1 GGOBEIRET 277
12 SGEEEIETEAPCWE

13 GGEOAEIETSA JZO
14 O QDAEGDAMI
16 O 0030002
16 b ooEs002s
17 O 1B1802M1
18 D DOS40104
-] SGOBOTISE

20 SGABOTRERA

CHECK WIRE HARNESS, ECU, SEN20R, S0CKET

LASOUR +1 day o napair end pana
SPRAY PAINT + 1 panel
AE«REINSTALLED WSCREEN

BEP NUMBER PLATE -METT

Taw SVG- Qualty Recovery Sarvices

Taw SViC- Quakly Recovery Services

AEAR BUMPER

REAR LID

NAME PLATE GOLF

HAME PLATE BLUE MOTION
NAME FLATE TSI

2K GLUE

FRIMER

APPLICATOR

ACTIVATOR

GLEANER

BUMPER AEINFORCEMENT

REAR CENTRE STRIP

Ruemaks | ECICS DIRECT SETTLEMENT

DOA 14/04/2018
SURVEYOR LEKK AASLL

TP VEHICLE SKOTI0MH

Service Order Confirmation

T
TU
LNIT
UNIT
UNIT
3T
UNT

UtaT

PCE
PGS
PCS

PCS

PCS

WHIT PRIGE  RISGS

B40

B40

1,148.75
1,356.49
E3.95
57.75
61.93
12258
21.46
T.46
18.64
7589
72560
6706

S&: Cheong Peartyn

480

280
2400

840
Bl
e}
[t}

1.149.75
1,355.49
88,99
57.75
61.93
12258
2146
1432
1964
7588
T25.80
B7.08



Service Order Confirmation

SERVICE ORDER NOD:  1BIP1212

CUSTOMER NO.: G401

CUSTOMER NAME:  WOMNG PERCY MAN POK

TELEPHONE NO.:

ADDRESS: 15 WEST COAST LANE
Singapore

VEH No.: SKT9058P

Ordar Date: 07iNsME

Aeg Date: SR0RM R KM: 21481

VIN NO.: WNWIZZAUZFWOR 1882 ENGINE NO:

MODEL: GOLF A7 1.4 TSI {DSGWECAT  MODEL NO.: 561362
g RESCRIFTION

On Bahatl Of "COMPANY®

Authorized Signature

NOTE: THIS IS NOT AN OFFICIAL RECEIFT

QTY  uoM  UNITPRICE — DISC%

TOTAL
GST AMOUNT

TOTAL AMOLUNT

SA: Chaong Pearyr

10.342.26
T2396

1906622

Certified GoodeServics recelvad:

Customer



Adjuster Report Page 1 of 3

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (coregno1sssoriser)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Indusfrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel- 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 FEmail: sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@Ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CS/ICS18007874/R1VBN2

Date: 18/05/2018
REFERENCE
Handling ECICS Limited  Policy No:
Insurer:
Claimant ; )
Vehicle No : SKT9058P Insured Vehicle No : SKQT7304H
Date of Loss:  14/04/2018 Nature of Claim: TP Claim No:  DMPC1800140H
I VEH
Reg No: SKT9058P
Make & Model: VOLKSWAGEN GOLF, 1.4 A7 (A) Engine No:  CXS214062
Reg. Date: 25/06/2015 (Man. Year: 2014) Chassis No: WAWZZZAUZFWO21882
Colour: Black Odometer: 30819 kmn
Engine Capacity: 1395 ce
Market Value/New Car
: MIA
Price:
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
TIM
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Medification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 225/45R17 Rear Tyre Size: 225/45R17
Front Left Side: Pirelli 6 mm Rear Left Side: Pirelli 6 mm
Front Right Side: Pirelli & mm Rear Right Side: Firelli 6 mm
The gbove values represent e remaining e feeds depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Parts 5.641.42 382226 1.819.16 32.25
Miscellaneous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 9,000.00 6,520.00 2.480.00 27.56
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Gross Total (5§) 14,641.42 10,342.26 4,299.16 29.36
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%) 1,024 .80 T23.96 300.94 29.36
MNett Amount (S5) 15,666.32 11,066.22 4,600.10 29.36
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 27/04/2018
Date Inspected: 03/05/2018 Inspected At: Volkswagen Group Singapore Pte Ltd (-
)
247 ALEXANDRA ROAD
Singapore 159934
Estimated Period of Repair: 8.0 days
Adjuster: MOHD RASUL Manager: VERON CHEN

NOTE: This report represents our findings af the time and place of inspection stated herein. Such inspection has been carned out fo the best of owr
knowledge and ability but any ather labiity under any other circumslances is hereby axprassly exciuded.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm ?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 18/5/2018



Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-5G

Parts: 144
Labour;

Repairer's

Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 18 May 2018}

VOLKSWAGEMN GOLF 1.4 A7 (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)

{Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SKT9058P)

Validity:

Further Info: Items/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk *.

Recommended Parts

No. Qty PartNo.

EF 7
P2
ST UL X, N S R S Y R e T

23 1

F=Franchise parl. S=5pcNett

Particulars Condition
*BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Bent

*NAME PLATE TSI Necessary
*NAME PLATE BLUE MOTION Mecessary
‘NAME PLATE GOLF MNecessary
‘BUMPER BRACKET LHS Not Necessary
*BUMPER RETAINER LHS Mot Necessary
‘BUMPER RETAINER RHS Mot Mecessary
*‘BUMPER BRACKET RHS Mot Mecessary
*REAR BUMPER Deformed
"REAR DIFFUSER SPOILER Serviceable
*REAR CENTER STRIP Cracked
*REAR LID Bent
“INOXSPRAY Not Necessary
*ZKADHESIV Necessary
*SEALANT Mot Necessary
*2K FOAM Mot Mecessary
*PRIMER Mecessary
*APPLICATOR Mecessary
*ACTIVATOR Mecessary
*CLEANER MNecessary
*B&P NUMBER PLATE Bent
*BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Repeated
*REAR CENTRE STRIP Repeated

Total Parts (S%)

Repairer's
T25.80FS5
61.93FS
57.7T5F8
69.99FS
38.45F5S
36.45F5
3B6.45FS
3B.45FS
1,149.75FS
322.86FS
67.06FS
1,355.49FS
T843FS
330.24FS
89.29F3
182.26 FS
21.46F5
14.92F3
1964FS
T5.89FS
BO.OOFS
T25.80FS
67 06FS

5,641.42

Page 2 of 3

These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page
numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page

Amount

*725.80FS
*61.93FS
*57.75FS5
“69.99FS
*FS

*FS

“-F&

“FS
*1.149.75F5
*-FS
*67.06FS
*1,355 49FS
“FS
“122,58FS
“.FS

“FS
*21.46FS
“14.92FS
*19.84FS
“75.89FS
*80.00FS
*-F§
“.F§

3,822.26

—

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

hups:.-’fsingapﬂrf:,m::rimen,L:nmh:iaimsfindex.cfm‘?fusebox=MT Radjuster&fuseaction=g... 18/5/2018



Adjuster Report Page 3 of 3

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour
No  Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount

Labour Items

1 LABOUR New 4,200.00 2.520.00

2 RE-REINSTALLED WISCREEN MNew 840.00 840.00

3 SPRAY PAINT Mew 3,200.00 2.400.00

4 PROGRAMMING & CALIBRATION COMPULSORY TO DO New 480.00 480.00
AFTER AC

5 CHECK WIRE HARNESS ECU.S MNew 280.00 280.00

Gross Labour Cost (5%) 9,000.00 6,520.00

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out,

< END OF ESTIMATES >

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.ctfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 18/5/2018



