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SIN HO AUTO
Block 30204 Ubi Road 1 # 01-33 Singapore 408714
Tel: (65) 69664526 HP: 92712214 Fax: (65) 69664526
Email :ﬂljg_{mtjyim"ﬂ-htﬂltﬂgi_lﬁgjﬂ
TPAlg 03" MAY 2018

BLOCK 3020A UBI ROAD 1 ~

#0133 <P {‘»

Singapore 408714 N 27286,

 jig nuﬁf?lfiflghf}“?* 6

Accident date: 25" APRIL 2018
Estimated repair cost for vehicle no: EVE565Y VOLKSWAGEN

Sin _aty ltems Uiprice Amount

. 1 RearBootLid Vi~ : $1,251.00 ~
2 1 Rear Boot Lid Emblem Logo 2 $76.00
3 1 Rear Boot Lid Tourvan Logo | ' . S4a00t

4 1 . Rear Boot Lid TSI Logo 1 il $48,00

5 1 Rear Boot Lid Inner Lock ) \ $155.00 7
6 __1- Rear Boot Lid !nnar Rubber i e N - 00 ~

7 2 Rear Boot Lid Side Reflector Wi $39500 $790.00

B 1 Rear Boot Lid Inner Trim Board J _ _ $320.00~

9 10 Rear Boot Lid Inner Trim Board Clips.| $6.00  §50.00~
10 2 Rear Tail Lamp %‘w $489.00 $978.00 ~
11 4  Rear Tail Lamp cnpjr5 J NeT $8.00 $32.00
12 1 Rear Bumper ror— _ _$966.00 -
13 2 Rear Bumper Eide Bra-:ket o $52.00 $104.00 ~
14 B  Rear Bumper Clips 1+~ $5.00 $40.00" 1
15 2 Rear Bumper Reverse Sansor 4 $299.00 $5g 0
18 ° 1 Rear Bumper Reinforcement £J— . $503.00 -
17 2 Rear Bumper Side Reflector + /— $11200 §224.00 "
18 © 1 RearEndPanel ¢ . $446.00 "
19 1 Rear End Panel Top Garnish ] _ _ $201.00"
20 . 1 Rear Spare Tyre Panel Top Cover | L _ ~ $337.00+
21 1 Rear Spare Tyre Panel Sealant | ko i - $2680.00~

22 1 Rear Exhaust ‘ Ak $950.00

o R T Raar Exhaust Alummum Cover - ___§1jj,ﬂﬂ*
26 1 e G lowes Gacuish W ave. R
25 1 Fees i - Bouddat 10l 188, 7 Subtotal :- =3 SE 738.00
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To remove & refit cushion $150.00
To remove & refit reverse sensor !1}%){ bo
& reset computer
To remove & refit rear exhaust $280.00
To check wiring 5"?0 539.00 20
Tuff kote $12000 <.
Panel beating $1,000-00 29
Spray painting $1 ;r/mo.'an 200

Subtotal :- $2,750.00

Totai:- $11,488.00

total 3rRf0
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LK Auto Consultanis hence notify
the Repairer of the follpwing:
o To roturviny bataie/afar soray painting
o 19 daping amasad rasl(y) duting e Lregy
« Fartg pntes are subises b comlipmatng
* Thiss psirty suirvey (8 20 8 Wilralt Praiudics” bass
= Mo Megal mosfcaton|s) 4 sideed
= Suppigmentary MemiL] mis be toyutveyed gnd
B Subect 1o final appronal brom lsurance Company

Acknowiedged by Repager
Sigranune:
Date:
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Jnx Irene (LKKAuto)

From: chan pick yuen <chris_chanbebe@hotmail com>

Sent: Wednesday, 6 June 2018 10:23 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuUto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: Re: EVB565Y Doa 25/4/18 ***LKK REF:CCa/AIG18007860/]b3
Attachments: 50.pdf

Dear Joy,

Enclosed is our client's GIA report , LOA ,invoice .
As request following :

1. RC 52500 ( AS AGREED )
2. LOU 5500 ( 5100 X 5 DAYS -3 DAYS recommend + 1 days waiting PRS + 1 DAY weekend

@ 100%
TOTAL $3000/-.

Please let us have your offer soon . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, May 30, 2018 8:45 AM

To: chan pick yuen

Subject: RE: EV6565Y Doa 25/4/18 ***LKK REF:CC6/AIG18007860/jb3

Dear Chris,
Kindly resend a copy of clearly GIA report to us.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6IEE-005S | emall; shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)
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- Consulfanis
S_Jdm Ba =B Pfe Lid

31 U AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE K933 TEL : (065 62563561 FAX @ (065) 67414108

Our Ref: CC6/AIG18007860/Ajb3

16 July 2018

TAY PECK SENG
Blk 108 Mcnair Road
#06-307

Singapore 321108

Dear Sir,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJK 8419R AND EV 6565Y ON 251’04!%13 _

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte
Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 7 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Fa

( JoyIr
ECpsé Handler
DID: 6841 2409
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: joyirene@lkkauto.com

cc.  AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)
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RELEASE VOUCHER yEAsEa Sy
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim) o e

“We/l, SIN HO AUTO (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have reached an agreement with
the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lud LEK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE
LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for S$2.500.00 fRepair Cost). S5200.00
iLoss of Use/Rental |_5%_ (Disbursementfor vehicle no. EY 6565Y that was damaged pursuant o
the accident which occurred on 25/04/2018 (date) along PIE ALJUNIED FLYOVER (location)
involving vehicle no/s SKJ 8419R. This is pursuant (o the inspection conducted on 02/05/2018 (date)
at “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner HOO SEE SIANG (“the third party
claimant”) of vehicle no, EV 6565Y make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have
full authority 1o settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/I deem fit. We/l enclose herein
the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant™
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining 10 costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to EV
6565Y  (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in [ull and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that turther this settlement 1s reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of lability basis

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this \6 = (day)of a V6 . (month) 2018 (vear)

T,

| T‘F W)

"y

Signed by appointed survevor Signed by “the workshop™ (with chop)



SIN HO AUTO

Block 3020A Ubi Road 1 # 01-33 Singapore 408714
Tel : ( 65) 69664526 HP: 92712214

Email :chris_chanbebe/a hotmail.com

INVOICE

HOO SEE SIANG
Blk 3020A #01-33
Ubi Road 1
Singapore 408714

Accident date:25™ APRIL 2018

Fax: (65) 69664526

Date: 06" JUNE 18

Final Bill For Vehicle No: EV6565Y VOLKSWAGEN TOURAN

Descriptions

AMOUNT

jLump Sum repair cost as recommended by
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD
Surveyor : Mr Adrian Ling

$2,500.00

Tatﬂk $2,500.00

S/DLRS: TWO THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED

ONLY

Fage 249
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Fastiane
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Main

(CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS |[Created by adjuster]
Insured: | TAY PECK SENG, 1D: S0195189)
Main | )

Clalmant: 'Hm BEE SIANG, 101 51555425C

Vehicle Reg. | . l25/04/2018 D000 - 159
No.: |EVB565Y Date of LOSS: |1 g3 Months and 15 Days From LTA Reg Date (Man )] |

Claim Type: | TP/ 11441378915G m‘;‘g‘?"r inn:mnm (Comprehensive)

Vehicle Reg. | |
Palicy Mo, |

Ne. | SKIB419R Y A2901BA00GMX

[Insured)! o iSapleirsind e — — e -

- ———————— FRTPIRY s | Exﬂ‘
Repainer: Sin Ho Auto {Hq] A020A Ubl Road 1, #01-33, 408714 Ubs - Tel:
Handling AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. (Express) - Tel: 65-64159-3000 .., [Handled by Tan, Bennle-WZ - 6419 1718] Bannie- |
Imsurer: | W2 Tanimaig com e
Claimant's |

s MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. (HQ) - Tel: +565 6827 7EBA |

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 62563561 ... Handied by ADRIAN LING] . [Final Rpt due 10/05/2018]
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Preview Page 1 of 1

NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT EREAKDOWN)
]Vahlnln No: SKJB419R (Insd veh) Model: VOLKSWAGEN TOURAN 1.4
EVE565Y (TP veh) TSI (A)
[Date of Accident: |25/04/2018
Ve
Global Sum Settiement [:] [ ] Yes | [X] No
Repair Estimate '$ A2,143.00
Final Repair Cost - 2,500.00
Loss of Use % 200.00 4,00 days at $50.00 per day
Rental {if any) 5 0.60 “days
LTA [ GIA Search Fee 5 0.00
Others: ' 0.00
°§
Final Settlement Sum 3 270000

is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ 1 YES [X] NO (Kindly indicate
i) /
A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agreed Liability ____ 100__~ (%)

BOLA Applicable: Yes/ No  BOLA Scenario No:

B) For GIA Registered Workshop:

BOLA Liability: {%6) Assessed Liahbility (*): (%)
* Assessed Liability to be filled only for chain collisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.

Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown
1) |SIN HO AUTO ' $ 2,700.00
2) :$

23 Aug
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2018
LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid Date

Please attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Invoice; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report! Bill (if any)

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doclt... 23/8/2018



Adjuster Report Page | of 4

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coreano 1ssso713er)

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-3561 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: sur@lkkauto.com assignmenis@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No:  CCB/AIG1B007860/AJB302

Date: 23f08/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AlG Asia Pacific insurance Ple. Lid.  Policy No: 2100340443
Ciaimant Vehlcle evesesy Insured Vehicle No :  SKJ8419R
Date of Loss: 25/04/2018 MNature of Claim: TP . Claim No: 11441378915G

DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION I

Reg No EVE565Y
Make & Maodel VOLKSWAGEN TOURAN, 1.4 TSI (A) Engine No: CAV305608
Req. Date; 10/06/2011 (Man, Year: 2011) Chassis No: WNVGZZZ1TZBWOST7 396
Colour: Brown Odometer: 129564 km
Engine Capacity 1380 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price
CONDITION OF I IME OF SURVEY
General Condition: Steering (Serviceabls): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/55 R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/55 R16
Front Left Side: Pirelli B mm Rear Left Side: Pirelli & mm
Front Right Side: Pirelli 6 mm Rear Right Side: Pirelli 6 mm
The above vaives represent the remaining lyre ireads depth
COST OF CLAIMS _ Repairer's  Adjuster's Difference Diff %
Parts §,383.00 258210 6.810.90 T2.51
Miscellanecus ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 2,750:00 580.00 2,160.00 T8.55
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing D.00 0.00 0.00

Calculated Gross Total (S5) 12.‘Ia‘l:!,.l:}qr 3,172.10 8,970.90 73.88

Approved Total {Overridden) (S5) 2,500.00
Nett Amount (55%) 12,143.00 Z.SDD.'IJQK 9,643.00 79.41
+ Loss of Use (4.0 x 5550,00/day) (S§) 200.00
Nett Liability (S5%) 2,700.00
rd

INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 02/0672018
Date Inspected: 02/05/2018  Inspected Al: SIN HO AUTO BLOCK

30204 UBI ROAD 1 #01-33

‘ SINGAPORE 408714

Estimated Percd of Repair; 3.0 days
s

Z

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 23/8/2018



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 4

Adjuster: ADRIAN LING Manager: Joy Irene Bascao

NOTE: This report represenis our findings af the hme and place of inspechion stated herain. Such inspection has been camed oul Io the best of our
knpwisdge and atiity but any other latwity undér any othar circumstances is hersly exprassly oxcitded.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 23/8/2018



Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty Part No. Particulars Condition Repairer's  Amount
1 1 *REAR BOOT LID Repair 1,251.00F “FL
2 1 *REAR BOOT LID EMBLEM LOGO Mot Necessary 76.00F *~FL
2 1 *REAR BOOT LID TOURVAN LOGO Not Necessary 44 00F *FL
4 1 *REAR BOOT LID TSI LOGO Not Necessary 48.00F = FL
5 1 *REAR BOOT LID INNER LOCK Mot Mecessary 155.00F *-FL
6 1 *REAR BOOT LID INNER RUBBER Mot Necessary 224 00F *-FL
7 2 *REAR BOOT LID SIDE REFLECTOR Not Necessary T90.00F *-FL
8 1 *REAR BOOT LID INNER TRIM BOARD Not Necessary 320.00F *-FL
g 10 *REAR BOOT LID INNER TRIM BOARD CLIPS Not Necessary 50.00F *-FL
0 2 *REAR TAIL LAMP Mot Necessary 978.00F *FL
11 4 *REAR TAIL LAMP CLIPS Mot Necessary 32.00F *~FL
2 1 *REAR BUMPER Deformed B66.00F “966.00FL
13 2 “‘REAR BUMPER SIDE BRACKET Mecessary 104 00F *104.00FL
14 B8 *‘REAR BUMPER CLIPS MNecessary 40.00F *40.00FL
15 2 *REAR BUMPER REVERSE SENSOR Damaged 588.00F =450.00FL
16 1 *REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Bent 503.00F =503.00FL
17 2 *REAR BUMPER SIDE REFLECTOR Mot Necessary 224.00F *FL
18 1 *REAR END PANEL Repair 446 00F *-FL
19 1 *REAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH Mot Necessary 201.00F *-FL
20 1 *REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL TOP COVER Not Necessary 337.00F *-FL
21 1 ‘REAR SPARE TYRE PANEL SEALANT Not Necessary 260.00F *FL
22 1 ‘REAR EXHAUST Mot Necessary 950.00F *-FL
23 1 *REAR EXHAUST ALUMINIUM COVER Mot Necessary 141.00F *FL
249 1 *‘REAR BUMPER LOWER GARNISH Deformed 466.00F *46B.00FL
25 1 *REAR BUMPER INNER BRACKET Cracked 189.00F =189.00FL
F=Franchise parnt. L=LisihhamDisc
Sub Total (S$%) 9,393.00 2,718.00
- List Item Discount on L Items 0.00/5.00% (S5) 0.00 135.90

Total Parts (S§)  9,393.00  2,582.10

Report was unsubmitied during this print-out.
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Adjuster Report Page 4 of 4
Recommended Miscellaneous Items

There are no new miscellanecus items selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems

1 TO REMOVE & REFIT CUSHION Mew 150.00 0.00
2 TOREMOVE & REFIT REVERSE SENSOR & RESET New 120.00 60.00

COMPUTER
3 TO REMOVE & REFIT REAR EXHAUST New 2B0.00 .00
4 TO CHECK WIRING New BO.00 30.00
5 TUFF KOTE Mew 120.00 0.00
& PANEL BEATING New 1,000.00 200.00
7 SPRAY PAINTING Mew 1.000.00 300.00
Gross Labour Cost (5§) 2,750.00 590.00
Repont was unsubmitied during this print-oul.
< END OF ESTIMATES >
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Joz Irene iLKKAutnk

From: Joy Irene (LEKAUto)

Sent: Thursday, 23 August 2018 2:30 PM

To: ‘chan pick yuen'

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: EVE565Y Doa 25/4/18 ***LKK REF:CC6/AIG18007860/|b3

Without Prejudice

Dear Chris,

The cost of repair amount was audited and G5T was taken out.

As such, we will submit for payment at : COR at $2,500.00 + LOU $200 = $ 2,700.00
Please take nate.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6341-2409 | email; joyirene@lkkaute.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

All contents of this emall is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only. It may contain confidential and/or privileged
imformation:if you are not the intended recipient {or have received this email in error) please natify the sender
immediately and dastroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this emall

is strictly forbidden.

From: chan pick yuen [mailto:chris_chanbebe@hotmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, 16 August 2018 3:27 PM

To: loy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene@lkkauto.coms

Subject: Re: EVE565Y Doa 25/4/18 ***LKK REF:CC6/AIG1B007860/jb3

DV . Please let us have your payment soon . Thanks

Regards,
Chris Chan Pick Yuen

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <loylrene@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Thursday, August 16, 2018 1:54 PM

To: chan pick yuen

Subject: RE: EV6565Y Doa 25/4/18 ***LKK REF:CC6/AIG18007860/ (b3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



