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_Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

#

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 30 April 2018 8:12 AM

To: Kitty Teo Poh Guek

Cc: yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg; SUR

Subject: RE: Checking Market Value (MV) - SSMOOEQ8 / GZ5938S / DOA : Apr 20, 2018
Dear Kitty,

The market value for GZ 59388 is $20K-$22K (Est) as at April 2018

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Sharon Kho [mailto:sharon.kho@priorityservices.sg]

Sent: Sunday, 29 April 2018 12:55 PM

To: claims@ajaxinspection.com; motorsurvey @fta.com.sg; bokhari@jpknights.com; admin@Ibs-auto.com; LKK
Valuation <valuation@Ikkauto.com>; rta@rta.com.sg; collin.wong@a-pac.sg

Cc: 'Kitty Teo Poh Guek' <Kitty.Teo@axa.com.sg>; yvonne.ang@axa.com.sg

Subject: Checking Market Value (MV) - S8SMOOEQS / GZ5938S / DOA : Apr 20, 2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please check Market Value and email back to Kitty. Teo@axa.com.sg and cc to all OD case handler within
48 hours.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Sharon Kho

Priority Services

Block 779 Yishun Avenue 2
#01-1545 Singapore 760779

Tel: 62934822 Fax: 62963283



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry
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https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate ByPublicBeforeD...

Enqmre PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle S0hk : 7°M1§ o
Vehicle Owner Particulars o
Owner ID Type: - Busmess ' A
Owner ID: ' 2400W -
_ Vehicle Details . .
~ VehicleNo: | GZ59385
~ Vehicle to be Exported: 7 No
Intended De-registration Date:  27Apr2018
Vehicle Malce: - ~ PEUGEOT
Vehicle Model: - . PARTNERL.9D L
Primary Colour: - Grey
Manufacturing Year: 2006
~ EngineNo. ) ) 10DXFZ6045335
" ChassisNo. -  VF3GCWJYB96186199
Maximum Power Output: ’ -
 Open Market Value:  $1866900
Original Reglstratlon Date - 30 Jun 2006
First Regxstratlon Date: 30 Jun 2006 .
~ Transfer Count: - 1
Actual ARF Paid: © $934.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details i
~ PARF Eligibility: -  No .
PARF Ehglblhty Explry Date - o - ) i
PARF Rebate Amount: I $b.00
Intended COE Rebate Details .
COE Expiry Date: B " ) 29 Jun 2021
COE Category: - 7 'C Goods VehlcEe &Bus
“ “COE Perlod(Years i . 7' I 5 7
PQP Paid: ' -  $2232600
COE Rebate Amount: - B $14,16400
Total Rebate Amount; $14, 164.00
Message
' Please note that all future COE renewals for this vehicle can only befora 5- year perlod subject tothe
statutory In‘espan (|f apphcable) of the vehicle.

The information contained herein is correct as at 27 Apr 2018
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