Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 4 October, 2019 4:09 PM

To: Vie (LKKAuTD)

Subject: FW: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING MOTOR VEHICLES NO
SLNBB918 AND SLW 4422 B ON 22 APRIL 2018 *** LKK REF
CC4/A1G18007850/R1pad

Attachments: RENTAL INVOICE. pdf, TAX INVOICE.pdf

CC4/AIG1BOO7850/R1ha3

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lud

Phome: 6742-3197 | email: ghewht@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Uhi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: Ashley Tan <ashley@huahong.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 4 October 2019 3:08 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING MOTOR VEHICLES NO SLN88S1B AND 5LW 4422 B ON
22 APRIL 2018 *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG18007850/R1pa3

Dear all

Please refer to the LOD documents as attached.
Please note that we are claiming for the below:-
COR $1829.70

LOR S642.00
Total $2471.70

Thanks & Regards

Asthg Tawn
e HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
f-”" 250 SUNGE] KADUT STREET 1 SINGAPORE 729332
_5' T. 6661 9690 [ M. 9816 4151 | F. 6661 9699

Follow us @ huahong.com.sg

| fllinMEINO
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Our Ref: CC4/AIG18007850/pad
21 MAY 2018

RAY 330 SERVICES

205C COMPASSVALE LANE
#14-37

SINGAPORE 543203

ATTN: THE MANAGEMENT
Dear Sir'Madam.
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLN 8891B & SLW 4422B ON 22/04/2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third
party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from SLW 4422B against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is not in your favour. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature; it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected,

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

CHEW HSIAO TONG
Case Handler

DID: 6742 3197

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: chewhu@lkkauto.com

e AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pre Lid
(Motor Claims Depr)



“We/l, HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have
reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid LKK
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
§$1,829.70 (Repair Cost), $$513.60 (Loss of Rental/Use), 8§ — (Disbursement), for vehicle no.
SLW 4422B that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 22/04/2018 (date) along
FULLERTON ROAD (location) involving vehicle no/s SLN 8891B. This is pursuant to the
inspection conducted on 16/08/2018 (date) at “the workshop”.

We/l confirm that we/] are/am authorized by the owner HUA HONG PTE LTD (“the third party
claimant™) of vehicle no. SLW 4422B make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l
have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/I deem fit. We/l enclose
herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/I will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant”
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to SLW
4422B (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settiement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

2030
Dated this __4 __ (day) of _">"u~~] __ (month) 2819 (year)

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by “the workshop” (with chop)
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HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

250 SUNGE EADUT STREET |, SINGAPORE 729322
Tel (45) 6641 PoBE Fouc (45) 4641 F4FF Emolt info@huohong.comsg

78

JAX INVOICE

06 February 2020 WO201608-0020
HHTPCLAIMS 18-38

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD.

78 SHENTON WAY, #07-16

AIG BUILDING

SINGAPORE 079120

Afttn: Motor Claims Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLW4422B & SLN8891B ON 22/04/2018 ALONG FULLERTON ROAD
AT ABOUT 1505 HOURS

insured : HUA HONG PTE LTD

Vehicle Registration No. : SLw44228

Vehicie Make : TOYOTA

Vehicle Model : C-HR HYBRID 1.85 CVT

Vehicle Chassis No. - IYX10207TB42T

Policy No. : 5087272209-01

Date of Accident - 22/04/2018 Type of Claim: Third Party
S/N Quantity Description Unit Price 88  Amount 8%
Lump sum repair for the damaged portion $ 1.710.00

$ 1710.00

7% GST § 118.70
Total § 1,829.70
————

v

Authorised by Claims Dept

Co. Reg. No. 200900009Mm | huahong.comsg |  GIT Reg. Na. 200900309M
Page 101
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HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED

250 Sungel Codut Sheel | Bngapone F29332
Tt (65} odal 7488 Fox: (65) 6441 P4FF Emall info@huahong comig

VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT

b | k2L f
Vehlcle Rental Agreement made between ADrive Leasing Private Limited [MANAGING AGENT) and The Hirer and/or The Driver,

V.R.A Ne.:

Sl Uuys>P

under the terms and conditlons as set forth.
.,_-E_—' - e ._‘ - e - j i 4] = will
ST ’l:‘“-'f.- o ' .I:-.-»lﬁfwJ : f 5P R L "‘-F,:-";'rzz,-;‘}f:u.:;%-ﬂ iy -:J‘:m;':f £ '1.,
o CAI QIUIN, LOUIS $8637995C | Gender MALE
{“Mirer")
ADDRESS
(AS STATED 1N NRIC) BLE 665 YISHUN AVE 4 #02-193 SINGAPORE 760665
EMAIL ADDRESS M“::
DRIVING UCENCE No. SB637995C | DATEOF BIATH 2B.12.1986
SINGAPOREAN | A
VEHICLE REG No. SLW 6958 |
LEGEND: PETROL
F &£
0- DENT =
=
X - SCRATCH =
c-cHip B =
R = RUST ‘_‘_.:‘-;_'L"
E \'\""
DATE OUT e |®]aeig TIME OUT fopy  HRs ﬂmsn \
HIRER'S v
DATE IN u“l o d TIME IN |pog MRS H DL
TR ' B ARy T T
."."""'-.,."‘:{.f:j._ = :'.J'f-.[ﬂ';{i ii#l 1,41 {rﬂ’uL'I
Please View Terms & Conditions
SECURTY DEFOSIT ﬂuﬁ fl:rumm
NUMBER OF
RENTALCHARGES | 55 1';‘{:\- @ PER WEEK DAY i P L Aoy
GRAND TOTAL &5 bl;,ll..
REMARKLS)
PLEASE MAKE PAYMENT TO OUR DB3 BANK LTD. CURRENT ACCOUNT @ DI3-345456-0.

\,‘d\ﬂ ~J
v

AUTHORISED SIGRATURE

V

HIRER'S NAME, NWC & SIGN

Co. Reg. No. 20101 55848W | ADriveSG



Tob |45) &da] %488 Fox |45) 444) P4%F Emal nfoBhuahong com.ag

“'l-'
@ HUA HONG PRIVATE LIMITED
250 Sungei kadu! Stree! | Singopore 729312

TAX INVOICE
20 August 2018 HH18-SLW8958J-1
Cai Qilin, Louis
Blk 685 Yishun Ave 4
#02-193
Singapore 760665
Vehicle Registration No ! SLWease)
Vehicle Make : Toyota
Vihicle Model - C-HR Hybrid
Rental Charges from 16/08/2018 to 20/08/2018 $ 600.00
($150 per day x 4 days) 7% GST § 42.00

Total $ 64200
—_—

This Is a computer generated document and no signature is required.

Co. Reg. No. 200°00309M |  huohongcomag | GSTHeg Mo, 200900009M



