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Merimen e-Claims Page 1 of 1

...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(New Assignment)

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER TRACKING

Case | Mofied | EstSubmitted | AdjAssigned|  AdjRpt | Ad)Submitted ..}_r.-lwtrfd_ | stotus
27 hpr 2018 ! 27 Apr 2018 | | "
Main 15:04 | c‘nﬂ::;“ e

Raference Claim Details

|CLAIM SUBFOLDER DETAILS

Insured:
Main Claimant;
Wehicle Reg. No.:

|HJ TRANSPORT SERVICES, Co. Reg. No.: 53146257M

LEC MENG FOD, 10; 51305815F
SBEX8D - | Date of Loss:

i Claim Type:

217042018 09:00 - :59

TP/ SNM18D02066C02

| vehicle Reg. ho,

[Insured): — - | ':I-HSJ'U

Excess:

Repairer;

Handling Insurer:

(Aduster:

|Ady Asp. Remarks:

_i_TtI'.

Palicy/Cover Note No.:

DMB1SN1528871702 (TP, Fire &
!

|s30.00

Maotorway Car Care Centre Pte Ltd - Lower Delta (HQ) 1034 LOWER DELTA ROAD, 169205 Bukit Merah -

| China Talplng Insurance (Singapore) Pte. LM."{HQ} C

| 638985192]

Tel: 6369 6111 ... [Handled by Irene Tay Hui Ping -

|LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 6256-3561 ..

I EST $1616.99, ASSIGN KENNETH KONG AS SIE.

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED

|Tl1m #re no mall for this case,

| =

| ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS

Due Date

. [Final Rpt due 09,05/2018]

View Al | Compose Case Mait | |

wiew Al |

Search Tasks |  Create WewTask | Complete |

Priority  Type Task Graup Subject Handlar

Assigned By

Completed On Created On Done?

Mo results,

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=d... 27/4/2018



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

T ————————— e —————— e —

From: Veron Chen {LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 13 July 2018 1:46 PM

To: Lynn

Cc: "Steve"; 'Allan’; "Zambri'; SUR

Subject: RE: LIABILITY STATUS - SBXBD - DOA: 21/4/18
Dear Lynn,

Noted with thanks.

Final invoice and all supporting documents sent over to CHINA TAIPING

OIC- Irene Tay ., Ref No SNM18D02066C02

Email: irene.tay(@sg.cntaiping.com

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Lynn [mailto:lynn@motorway.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 13 July 2018 12:36 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Cc: "Steve” <steve @motorway.com.sg>; 'Allan’ <allan@motorway.com.sg>; 'Zambri' <zambri@motorway.com.sg>;
SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: LIABILITY STATUS - SBX8D - DOA: 21/4/18

Dear Veron
We confirm COR Lump Sum $1,100 @ 4days.
May I have the officer in-charge name and email address please.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Lynn Ahmad

Motor Claims Executive

Motorway Car Care Centre Pte Ltd
1094 Lower Delta Road

Motorway Building, Singapore 169205
DID : 6571 9635 | Fax : 6278 5531

*



= ] 1§

From: Vemﬁ-Ehg:{LKKAutu} [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com]

‘Sent: Friday, 13 July, 2018 10:42 AM

To: Lynn <lynn@motorway.com.sg>

Cc: "Steve" <steve@matorway.com.sg>; 'Allan’ <allan@motorway.com.sg>; 'Zambri' <zambri@motorway.com.sg>,; ]
SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: LIABILITY STATUS - SBX8D - DOA: 21/4/18

Dear Lynn,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Offer Lump Sum $1100 before GST @ 4 working days.

Kindly confirmed.

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Lynn [mailto:lynn@motorway.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 5 July 2018 9:11 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Cc: "Steve' <steve @maotorway.com.sg>; "Allan' <allan@motorway.com.sg>; "Zambri’ <zambri@motorway.com.sg=>
Subject: RE: LIABILITY STATUS - SBX8D - DOA: 21/4/18

Dear Veron
Kindly finalise COR.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Lynn Ahmad

Motor Claims Executive

Motorway Car Care Centre Pte Ltd
1094 Lower Delta Road

Motorway Building, Singapore 169205
DID : 6571 9635 | Fax : 6278 5531

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@lkkauto.com

Sent: Friday, 8 June, 2018 8:26 AM

To: Lynn <lynn@motorway.com.sg>

Cc: "Steve" <steve@motorway.com.sg>; 'Allan’ <allan@motorway.com.sg>; 'Zambri' <zambri@motorway.com.sg>
Subject: RE: LIABILITY STATUS - SBX8D - DOA: 21/4/18




Dear Lynn,

Kindly refer to CHINA TAIPING for liability.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Caze Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Fhone: 5256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Lynn [mailto:lynn@motorway.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 8 June 2018 8:12 AM

To: Veron Chen [LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>

Cc: "Steve" <steve@motorway.com.sg>; 'Allan' <allan@motorway.com.sg>; '‘Zambri' <zambri@motorway.com.sg>
Subject: LIABILITY STATUS - SBXED - DDA: 21/4/18

Dear Veron
We refer to the above matter, may we check on the liability status?

Thank You

Best Regards,
Lynn Ahmad

Motor Claims Executive

Motorway Car Care Centre Pte Ltd
1094 Lower Delta Road

Motorway Building, Singapore 169205
DID @ 6571 9635 | Fax : 6278 5531

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 5 June, 2018 12:18 PM

To: lynn@motorway.com.sg
Subject: RE: PENDING FINALIZE

Dear Lynn,
Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

1) SLJ3398M-DOA: 8/1/18
2) SLB 8629G-DOA: 17/2/18
3) SBX 8D-DOA: 21/4/18

Best Regards,
Veron Chen | Case Handler

EKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phane: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Veron Chen [LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 4 June 2018 5:19 PM

To: 'lynn@motorway.com.sg' <lynn@motorway.com.sg>
Subject: PENDING FINALIZE

Dear Lynn,
Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

1) SLI3398M-DOA: 8/1/18
2) SLB 8629G-DOA: 17/2/18

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



IMPORTANT NOTICE

1. Please repaort

corectly the

Your NCD will be affected due to late reporting
Actual e-Filling Submission Date & Time: 25/04/2018 17:08

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

1y -m| ul misrenresantaton ar witholding of material facts may allow insurance companies to

Date Of Report

Date Of Accident
Exact Location Of Accident

CountryiState of Loss

Vehicle Registration Number
Insured/Policyholder
WName Of Registersd Dwner
MREIC No

Email Address

Mobile Phone No

Alternative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Manufacturer

Model

Exact Purpasa far which vehicle was being used at

time of accident

Are you claiming under your own insurance policy

for repair 1o your vehicle?

[f Mo, Please state action (o be taken
Vehicle Category

insurance Company

Mame of Insurance Company
Type Of Coverage

Fleet Policy

Policy Number

Cover Nate Number

Driver

Mame of Driver

NRIC Mo

Dale Of Birth

Occupation

Date Of Driving Pass

Driving Experience

Gender

Maohile Number

Fax Numbaear

Contact Mumber

EMail Address

the pari of the Insurande Compamnes
Car - PR T e i s &l Snan s (=l for
& Genaral Insurance Assocmtian of Smgapos (G4
Artins
v consent 1o the archiving of this report at the cenire and 1o copees of ihe report baing made aval sl

ACCIDENT STATEMENT
25/04/2018 16:54
22/04/2018 09:23
HAIG ROAD HDB OPEN
SINGAPORE
DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE
SBXED

CAR PARK

LEC MENG FOC
S1305815F

NOEMAIL

(LOCAL) +65-B1333331
OTHERS-8133331

SSANGYONG

LIBERTY INSURANCE PTELTD
COMPREHENSIVE
YES

sSD17Y11281NPC/ROD

LEC MENG FOO
S1305815F

04/05/1958

INDOOR

17/07/1978

39 YEARS AND 8 MONTHS
MALE

{LOCAL) +65-81333331

OTHERS-81333331
MOEMAIL



Address

Positode

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company
If Mo, Relationship of the Driver with the Insured
Vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own
Vehicle

Insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Tvpe Of Accident

Weather Conditions

Road Surface

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident?
Numbar of vehicles involved in the accident

Was any body injured in the Accident?

Was any injured canveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged?

| have been approached by unknown personis)
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance.

Number of Passengers (Including Driver)
Details of Police Action

Was the accident reported to the police?
[f Yes Please state which Police Station

Police Station Name
Police Station Address

Police Station Contact
\Was notice of intended Prosecution given?
If Yes.against whom?

Circumstances of Accident

31 BROADRICK ROAD SINGAPORE 439494

WO
OWHNER

COLLIDED INTO PARKED VEHICLE
CLEAR

DRY

MND

YES

BEDOK POLICE DIVISIONAL HG (G DIVISION)

ROAD: 30 BEDOK NORTH ROAD , POSTCODE: 462676
SINGAPORE

TEL NO: 12800-2440000 - FAX NO: 64443008
NO

REFER TO THE POLICE REPORT AND STATEMENT

Attachment(s)
Are accident pholos available for attachment?
Was there any video captured by Car Camera?

Was there any audio recorded?

YES
NO
NO

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Registration Number
Vehicle Make/Model/Caolour
Details Of Properiies
Vehicle Categary

Mame of Driver
NRIC/Passport Number
Contact Number

Address

Postcode

Insurance Company Name

Mature Of Damage

CBE6STU

PRIVATE BUS

SIDE PORTION LH
BUS

AZMAN BIN ARSHAD
518227714
B3066560

. COUNTRY

Page 2 of 20
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+ Sketch Plan #2
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m MOTORWAY

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (5) PTE LTD
MOTOR CLAIMS DEPARTMENT

3 ANSON ROAD

#16-00 SPRINGLEAF TOWER

SINGAPORE 079909

ESTIMATES
VEHICLE NO. : SBX8D
CHASSIS NO : KPT30B1VSHP168444
MAKE / MODEL : SSANGYONG TIVOLI
DATE OF ACCIDENT : 22/04/2018 @ 09:25HRS
YOUR INSURED VEHICLE NUMBER : CB&657U

REAR WHEEL ARCH GARNISH LH
REAR WHEEL ARCH GARNISH CLIPS LH

PARTS DISCRIPTION ary
REAR TAILLAMP LH 1
REAR BUMPER 1
REAR BUMPER UPPER LH 1
1
8

LABOUR CHARGES
TO REMOVE, REPLACE & REPAIR ALL DAMAGES ITEMS
TO SPRAY PAINT OM THE AFFECTED AREAS DUE TO ACCIDENT
TUFF KOTE

Mr Kit

Motor Claims Department
Motorway Car Care Centre Pte Ltd
TEL: 6571 9635

FAX : 6278 5535

EMAIL: klkuan@motorway.com.sg
WEBISITE: www.motorway.com.sg

P

LXK Auto Consultants hence notify
ihe Repairer of the following:
» To resurvey before/after spray painting
» To display damaged part(s) dufing resurvey
» Parts prices ane subject 1o confrmation
» Third party survey is on & "Withoul Prajudice” basis
» Mo llegal modification(s) 5 aliowed
» Supplementary itemis) must be resurveyed and
i subject to final approval from Insurance Compafy

Acknowledgad by Repaier
Signature:

R

1094 Lower Delta Road Motorway Building Sirigapn're 169205
Main +65.6468 2200 | Fax +65.6273 5535

List Price Total List Price
5 380.22 o —
5 308.72
S 51.01 L .~
5 48.30 X ¥y
S 1.05 § 8.40 X 1
Total 5 796.65
LESS 10% 5 79.67
TOTAL PARTS 5 ~716.99
s 350.00
3 500.004 © ©
5 50.00 20
TOTAL LABOUR S 900.00
SUBTOTAL | § 1,616.99
T AT 7

so/ 1[5 @ /po5
ﬂmwj %’#w n-f!f?"l ;o
Suwv @ [ban o o un
4

Hed



Adjuster Report

Page 1 of 3

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd coreg no1sssoriser)
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Industrial Park

Singapore 408933
Tel B256-1561 Fax- 6844-8805 Email sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@ikkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Our File No: CS/CTHB007TE88/T1VEN2
Date: 17072018
REFERENCE
Handling China Taiping Insurance i ;
Gsias (Singapore) Pte. Lid. Policy No: DMB1SN1528871702
Claimant Insured Vehicle
VehiclaNg:  SPro0 No : e
" Nature of Claim
Date of Loss: 21/04/2018 Claim: TP No: SNM1BD02066C02
DESCRIPTION & IDENTIFICATION OF VEHICLE
Reg No: SBXED
Make & Model: SSANGYONG TIVOLL, 1.6 G BAT ABS 2WD (A) Engine No: 17391002092480
Reg. Date: 01/08/2017 (Man. Year; 2017) Chassis No: KPT30B1WVSHP 168444
Colour: Blue Odometer: 936 km
Engine Capacity: 1597 cc
Mall rket Value/Mew Car NIA
Price:

Sum Insured (S$): Market Value/New Car Price

CONDITION OF VEHICLE AT THE TIME OF SURVEY

General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Serviceable): Yes Engine Modification: Mo Pre-accident Condition:
COMNDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/60R16 Rear Tyre Size: 205/60R16
Front Left Side: Mexen & mm Rear Left Side: Nexen 6 mm
Front Right Side: Mexen & mm Rear Right Side: Nexen B mm
The above values mpresent the remaining tyre reads depth
COST OF CLAIMS Repairer's Adjuster’s Difference  Diff %
Parts 716.98 665.95 51.03 7.12
Miscellaneous ltems 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 900.00 730.00 170.00 18.89
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00

Calculated Gross Total (S§§) 1,616.98 1,395.95 221.03 13.67

Approved Total (Overridden) (S$) 1,100.00
MNett Amount (S$) 1,616.98 1,100.00 516.98 31.97

INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 27104/2018
Date Inspected: 30/04/2018 Inspected At: Motorway Car Care Centre Pte Lid -

Estimated Period of Repair: 4.0 days

Lower Delta (HQ)
1094 LOWER DELTA ROAD
Singapore 169205

Adjuster: MOHD TAUFIKH BIN HAMID

Manager: VERON CHEN

NEITE' This report represents owr Fndings al the fime and place of inspechon staled hersin. Such inspection has been camed out fo the best of our
knowledge and ability but any other Kabilty under any afher circumstances is hereby expressly excluded.

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?1i usebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=g... 17/7/2018



Adjuster Report Page 2 of 3

REPAIR DETAILS

Reference

Part Source: MRM-5G Version: 1.0 (Last Synchronised: 16 Jul 2018)

Parts: M1-5UV SSANGYONG TIVOLI 1.6 G BAT ABS 2WD (A) (Catalogue:Merimen Singapore 1.0)
Labour: Repairer's (Price-denominated Standard List)

Print Code: (Unsubmitted, no print-code for SBX8D)

Validity: These estimates are valid only if they contain the print code (above) on all estimate pages, running page

numbers with the END OF ESTIMATES marker on the last estimate page
Further Info: ltems/values not in reference catalogue are prefixed with an asterisk ™,

Recommended Parts

Mo. Qty PartMNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount

1 1 “REAR TAILLAMP LH Cracked 380.22FL *380.22FL
2 1 *REAR BUMPER Cut 308.72FL *308.72FL
3 1 *REAR BUMPER UPPER LH Deformed 51.01FL *51.01FL
4 1 *REAR WHEEL ARCH GARNISH LH Mot Mecessary 48.30FL *-FL
5

& ‘REAR WHEEL ARCH GARNISH CLIPS LH Mot Necessary 8.40FL *FL
F=Franchise par. L=ListitemDisc. - PR —
Sub Total (S%) 796.65 739,95
- List Item Discount on L Items 10.00/10.00% (S§) 79.67 74.00

Total Parts (S%) 716.98 665.95

Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 17/7/2018



Adjuster Report

Recommended Miscellaneous ltems
There are no new miscellaneous items selected.

Recommended Labour

Page 3 of 3

No  Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems

1 TO REMOVE,REPLACE & REPAIR ALL DAMAGED ITEMS  New 350.00 300.00

vl TO SPRAY PAINT ON THE AFFECTED AREAS DUE TO MNew 500.00 400.00

ACCIDENT
3 TUFF KOTE MNew 50.00 30.00
Gross Labour Cost (S§) 900.00 730.00
Report was unsubmitted during this print-out.
< END OF ESTIMATES =
https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=g... 17/7/2018



