Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 8 June 2018 8:26 AM

To: ‘Lynn’

Cc: "Steve"; 'Allan’; 'Zambri'

Subject: RE: LIABILITY STATUS - SBX8D - DOA: 21/4/18
Dear Lynn,

Kindly refer to CHINA TAIPING for liability.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Lynn [mailto:lynn@motorway.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 8 June 2018 8:12 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: ''Steve" <steve@motorway.com.sg>; 'Allan' <allan@motorway.com.sg>; 'Zambri' <zambri@motorway.com.sg>
Subject: LIABILITY STATUS - SBX8D - DOA: 21/4/18

Dear Veron
We refer to the above matter, may we check on the liability status?

Thank You

Best Regards,
Lynn Ahmad

Motor Claims Executive

Motorway Car Care Centre Pte Ltd
1094 Lower Delta Road

Motorway Building, Singapore 169205
DID : 6571 9635 | Fax : 6278 5531

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 5 June, 2018 12:18 PM

To: lynn@motorway.com.sg

Subject: RE: PENDING FINALIZE

Dear Lynn,
Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.
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1) SLJ 3398M-DOA: 8/1/18
2) SLB 8629G-DOA: 17/2/18
3) SBX 8D-DOA: 21/4/18

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 4 June 2018 5:19 PM

To: 'lynn@motorway.com.sg' <lynn@motorway.com.sg>
Subject: PENDING FINALIZE

Dear Lynn,
Kindly advise vehicle status.
If vehicle has been repaired, please finalize with us.

1) SLJ 3398M-DOA: 8/1/18
2) SLB 8629G-DOA: 17/2/18

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



