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MS @FirstCapital

& Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapore D4B580
Tel (65) 6222 311 Fax (55)6222 3547

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited (oReg Mo 1550001080 G457 Reg bo. M2-000LGT6-9

Clalms & Motor Unceswriting Dept: 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore 068877

Tel 55) 6507 3948 Fax [55)6507 3849
m.m!ﬂrst:anmi.rm.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

24-04-2018 Our Ref No.
23-04-2018 Claim Type.
SHD3179H Third Party Vehicle.

255 ALEXANDRA ROAD,SINGAPORE 159937
ANIKKA LA
65145481/ 65145481

DIRECT SETTLEMENT: SJE (EST. COR - $7,842.39)

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MA Fax No.

NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Fax MNo.

D18003213MFSH

Third Party

SLG2567P

63651949

68416315

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Ce : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

KAH MOTOR CO. SDN.

Attention.
BHD.
MNA TP Solicitor Fax Mo.
SERENE

IMPORTANT NOTE

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

MIL

MNA

Kindly subrmit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

atl INSLIRANCE GROUF




Catﬁerine Chona (LKK Auto)

From: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 27 April, 2018 11:17 AM

To: ‘assignments@Ikkauto.com’

Cc: Serene Ler

Subject: SURVEY ASSIGNMENT - SUPER URGENT OUR REF: D18/3213 -
SLG2567P vs SHD3179H DOA: 23/4/2018

Attachments: SAS2396219.pdf; 2643_001.pdf

Importance: High

Dear Sirs

Survey request for your handling.

Thanks and Regards,

SK Teo
Motor Claims Dept

M5 First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore OGBETT | DID : 6507 3848 | Fax No. : 6507 3849 |
AMemberol BRTT:AME INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA7):

Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data.

Please refer to www.msfirstcapital. com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.

Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

If you are not the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.

If you have recetved this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender immediately by
return e-mail.

From: Aini Binte Md Min

Sent: Friday, April 27, 2018 9:57 AM

To: Teo Swee Keong <TeoSweeKeong@misfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: FW: SLG2567P vs SHD3179H DOA: 23/4/2018 - CHECK LIABILITY

D18/3213/CTPL - Revised est
Thanks & Regards

Aini
Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Ltd | 36 Robinson Road, City House, #16-01 Singapore 068877 | TEL: 6307 3848
Fax: 6507 3849| Company Reg. No, 195000106C

Atember of BRI ] INSURANCE GROUP

Personal Data Protection Act 2012 ("PDPA"}:
Under the PDPA, there are various requirements that regulate the processing of your personal data,
Please refer to www.msfirstcapital.com.sg for details of PDPA Personal Data Collection Statement.




Confidentiality Notice; This e-mail is confidential. It may also be legally privileged.

If you are rot the addressee or to whom it is intended, you may not copy, forward, disclose or use any part of it.

If you have received this message in error, please delete the message and all copies from your system and notify the sender
immediately by return e-mail.

Erom: Anikka Lal [mailto:anikkalai@honda.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 27 April, 2018 9:53 AM

To: Motor_Claims <Motor Claims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>

Subject: RE: 5LG2567P vs SHD3179H DOA: 23/4/2018 - CHECK LIABILITY

Dear Sir / Madam,

Re-attached the revised estimate cost of repair for your kind perusal, pls ignore the previous copy.
Appreciated very much if your could expedite the case and advise the liability of direct settlement soonest.
Thank you.

Warmest Regards

Anikka Lai

kah Motor Co. Sdn Bhd

255 Alexandra Road

Singapore 159937

DID : 65145481

Email: anikkalai@honda.com.sg

From: Anikka Lai

Sent: Thursday, 26 April, 2018 4:57 PM

To: 'motor_claims@msfirstcapital.com.sg' <motor _claims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: FW: SLG2567P vs SHD3179H DOA: 23/4/2018 - CHECK LIABILITY

Dear Sir / Madam,
Yet to receive any news from your end. Your prompt action is much appreciated.
Warmest Regards

Anikka Lai

Kah Motor Co. Sdn Bhd

255 Alexandra Road

Singapore 159937

DID : 65145481

Email: anikkalai@honda.com.sg

From: Anikka Lai

Sent: Wednesday, 25 April, 2018 11:37 AM

To: 'motor_claims@msfirstcapital.com.sg' <motor claims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Subject: SLG2567P vs SHD3179H DOA: 23/4/2018 - CHECK LIABILITY

Dear Sir / Madam,



Attached pls find the GIA report and estimate cost of repair for your necessary action. Kindly advise the liability of
direct settlement.

Warmest Regards

Anikka Lai

Kah Motor Co. 5dn Bhd

255 Alexandra Road

Singapore 1599337

DID : 65145481

Email: anikkalai@honda.com.sg

From: Printer Service

Sent: Wednesday, 25 April, 2018 11:32 AM
To: Anikka Lai <anikkalai@honda.com.sg>
Subject: Attached Image

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the
individual or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and
exempt from disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this
communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately
notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you.



Janice Lee (LKKAuto)

#’

From: Anikka Lai <anikkalai@honda.com.sg>
Sent: Tuesday, July 31, 2018 7:50 PM

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto); SUR

Cc: assignments

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION - SLG2567P
Attachments: 2223_001 pdf

Dear all,

Attached pls find the revised pre-invoice for your necessary action. The finalise amount is 55704.06 and 6 working days.

*Note: Repair period does include Sunday and Public Holiday.

Please examine the above information carefully. If no discrepancy is reported within 7 days (exclude Sunday and Public
Holiday) from the date of this email, the information will be considered as correct. Thereafter, no adjustment will be
made.

Thank you
Warmest Regards

Anikka Lai

Kah Motor Co. Sdn Bhd

DID : 6514 5248 HP : 8288 6302
Email: anikkalai@honda.com.sg

From: Anikka Lai

Sent: Tuesday, 26 June, 2018 9:51 AM

To: 'Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)' <admin-d@lkkauto.com=; 'SUR" <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'assignments' <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: FINALIZATION - 5LG2567FP

Dear all,

Yet to receive any reply, kindly expedite it.
Thank you.

Warmest Regards

Anikka Lai

kah Motor Co. Sdn Bhd

255 Alexandra Road
Singapore 155937



DID : 6514 5481 HP: 8288 6302
Email: anikkalai@honda.com.sg

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 24 May, 2018 9:00 AM

To: Anikka Lai <anikkalai@honda.com.sg>; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: 'assignments’ <assignments@ikkauto.com=>

Subject: FW: FINALIZATION - SLG2567P

Dear Anikka,
Thank you for your email.
Dear Janice,

Kindly assist. Our ref: C5/FCI18007763/R1rb

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Anikka Lai [mailto:anikkalai@honda.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 23 May, 2018 8:45 PM

To: assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com=>
Subject: FINALIZATION - 5LG2567P

Dear Catherine,

We enclosed the total final repair costs for Veh no. SLG2567P, which survey by Mr. Rasul.

Vehicle No. 5LG2567P
Final Repair Costs (exclude GST) 55524.06
Repair Period* (Days) & days

*Note: Repair period does include Sunday and Public Holiday.
Please examine the above information carefully. If no discrepancy is reported within 7 days (exclude Sunday and Public
Holiday) from the date of this email, the information will be considered as correct. Thereafter, no adjustment will be

made.

In addition, | have attached photos of before paint, ‘?’ items and supplementary parts (if any) for your records.

With Regards



Warmest Regards

Anikka Lai

Kah Motor Co. Sdn Bhd

255 Alexandra Road

Singapore 159937

DID : 65145481

Email: anikkalai@honda.com.sg

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or
entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from
disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are
hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly
prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete
the mail. Thank you.

EF

Confidential Note: The information contained in this email is intended only for the use of the individual or
entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from
disclosure under applicable law. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are
hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly
prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete
the mail. Thank you.



U HONDA

KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. BHD.

(A Member of the Oriental Holdings Berhad)

Service and Body Repair

Tel: +65 6841 3838 Website: www. honda.com.sg
For 24-hours Roadside Assistance, Call 98203838

'QUOTATION

G5T Reg Mo.: M200050223
Company Ref Mo, SBOFG1380G

Customar - MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE Document No. + 5QT18001700 Page 1
36 ROBINSON ROAD Date - 24, Apr2018
#16-01 CITY HOUSE Gustomer No. . WZF002
SINGAPORE 068877 Svc Advisor - ANIKKA LAl SWEE KAM
Registration No . SLG2567P Engine No ; L15B71624819
Chassis No . MRHFC1860GT000086 Date | Time - 24 Apr2018 8:11:51 PM
Model . CIVIC 1.5 TURBO VTIS YM2016 Surveyor Name :
Orwner's Name « QUEK HUI NEE (GUO HUIND Survey Date ]
Ins Policy Mo. : Authorisation Date
Date of Accident  : 23/4/2018
0% GST Amount
Item Description Qty  UnitPrice_ Disc%  Amount Amount incld GST
TP DIRECT SETTLEMENT (JINO:
OWNER: QUEK HUI NEE
OWNER INSURER: LIBERTY
ACC DATE: 23/04/2018
SURVEYED BY:
DATE:
REF NO:
TP INSURER: MS FCL
TP VEH: SHD3179H
67510-TEA-TO0ZZ  PANELR RR DOOR 1 sos60 T /25 s2245] 3657 550.02
72930-TEA-TO1 GARNISH ASSYR.RR.DOOR SASH 1 1a60 M/ 25 10.95 0.77 172
727121-TEA-TO1 GARNISHR RR.DOOR QUARTER OUT 1 -9 g0l 25 7.42 052 7.04
72910-TEA-TO1 MOLDING ASSYR.RR DOOR 1 2450 L 28 18.37 129 19.66
72025-TBA-AD1 MOLDING ASSYR RR DOOR SASH 1 2830 2.7V 25 21.22 1.49 2271
04636-TEA-TODZZ  PANEL SETR.RR.OUTSIDE 1 691.000f 7~ 25 51825  36.28 554.53
04631-TEA-TO0ZZ  PANELR.SIDE SILL BYL - 488 m.ﬂﬂf)(zs 36607 25862 391.69
42700-TEA-T&1 DISKALUMINIUM WHEEL 1 4?2.303?/ 25 35460 2482 379.42
Sum ltem 181933 127.36 1.946.69
BOSUN SUNDRIES 1 WC’ niL 5000 350 53 50
BOJSE BODY JOINT SEALANT RR R FENDER 1 19000 Qo W o000 7.00 107.00
BOJSE BODY JOINT SEALANT FOR QUATER GLASS 1 19006 Lo WM 40000 7.00 107.00
BKDR22R iﬁl‘"ff‘é"f & TRANSFER ITEMS TO NEW RR R DR. ’ aparo sho GOl S50 e
BOMISC1 RESET & CALIBRATE SMART ENTRY SYSTEM (N) 1 16000, ' 16000 1120 171.20
BKRP02B EEED%'::EE:‘;E&%”HESNFLGDR PANEL, 1 5500153' IO osmo0 17500 267500
BPO4R ?EW PAINTING ON REPAIRED OR REPLACED AREAS. , m e om0 1000 214000
BML02l INSPECT RR LIGHTING MECHANISMS. PERFORM ; 1128 e e s

WATER

1&0.1}5}/\’._ n



H HONDA.

KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. BHD.
{A Member of the Oriental Holdings Berhad)
Service and Body Repair

Tel +55 6B41 3828

Website: www honda com.sg

For 24-hours Roadside Assislance, Call 982035838

QUOTATION

G5T Reg No.: M200050223
Company Ref. No.: S60FC1380G

Customer : MS FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE Document No. « SQT18001700 Page 2
36 ROBINSON ROAD Date + 24 Apr2018
#16-01 CITY HOUSE Customer No. - WZFDD2
SINGAPORE 06BETT Svec Advisor « ANIKKA LAl SWEE KAM
Registration No - BLG256TP Engine No - L1SB71624819
Chassis No : MRHFC1660GTO00086 Date | Time : 24, Apr2018 8:11:51 PM
Model « CWVIC 1.5 TURBO VTIS YM2016 Surveyor Name
Owner's Name - QUEK HUI NEE (GUQ HUINI Survey Date X
Ins Policy No. : Authorisation Date
Date of Accident 230472018
0% GST Amount
Item Description Qty  UnitPrice Disc% _ Amount Amount incld GST
REMOVE & INSTALL SPEAKER BOARD RR SEATS
BMI02D o 1 5506 NP0 56000 3920  599.20
BGSZR REFLACE RR. R QTR GLASS.(N) 1 5936 e 3-(_} 560.00 3020 550,20
Sum Labor  7010.00 490,70  7.500.70
BO-R-COOL-RRQ SUPPLY & INSTALL SOLAR FILM ON REAR QTR GLASS. 1 250 ua,% A 250.00 17.50 267.50
Sum Ext. Service 25000  17.50 267.50
l_.-l"_‘l
Survey By (&5%—- = LHJ 1@[“4’8
Date & Time E}‘r)..,l‘ut;’f (& IS Y 5 Total Amount  5,079.33 63556  9.714.89
Excess ) ' Total (Inclusive of GST) 43512 9,714,89
Status 7
Signature Z_ M

e —

Printed on 27/4/2018 9:47.57 AM
This i5 8 computer penerated imoice. Ko signalung & reguied

Pan prices are subjacied 1o change wilhout notice
Tha abowe eslimated cost of repair do not includa any unforeseen damages

GET Amount is calculated from mdivadus! lirs(s]



1) HONDA.

KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. BHD.
{A Member of the Oriental Holdings Berhad)

SERVICE PRE-INVOICE

G5T Reg Ne.: M200050223
Company Ref. Mo SG0FC1380G

470 Ubi Road 2 Singapore 4086851_ Tel: +565 6841 388D Fax: +85 6741 5022
265 Alexandra Road Singapers 1590937, Tek +65 6471 5458 Fax; +65 B471 5460

Customer: S?41_5242E ! QUEK HUI NEE Document No: SVO18025188
Chassis No: MRHFC1660G 000086 Printed By: ANIKKALAI
License No: SLG256TP Order Date: 2, May 2018
Mileage: 26320 Order Time: 4:24.19 PM
Engine No: L15B71624819 Service Advisor: ANIKKA LAl SWEE KAM
ITEM DESCRIPTION ary  UNIT DISCH% AMOUNT oeosr Amountiees
SUPPLEMENTARY PART
72825-TBA-AD1 MOLDING ASSYR.RR DOOR SASH 1 2830 25 2122 149 il S
72910.TEA-TOA MOLDING ASSYRRR.DOOR 1 2450 25 18,37 1.29 19 664 <~
71800-TEA-T01ZB GARNISH ASSYR.SIDE SILL 1 11440 25 8580 6.01 91 815w’
SUM PARTS: 125,39 B.79 13418
TOTAL SGD 12538 B.79 134.18
Total Payable (SGD) 134.18

GET Ampun is calculated fram individual inels)



) HONDA

KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. BHD.

{A Member of the Oriental Holdings Berhad)

370 Uni Road 3 Singapore 408651, Tel: +65 6641 3863 Fax +65 6741 5022

255 Alexandra Road Singapore 150037 Tal: +65 6471 5458 Fax: +65 6471 5460

SERVICE PRE-INVOICE

GST Reg No.: M200050223
Company Ref. No.. S60FC1380G

Customer: 574152428 / QUEK HUI NEE Decument Mo: SV018025189

Chassis No: MRHFC16860GTO00086 Printed By: ANIKKALAI

License No: SLG2587P Order Date: 2. May 2018

Mileage: 26320 Order Tima: 4:24:19 PM

Engine No: L15BT162481% Service Advisor: ANIKEA LAl SWEE KAM

ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY  UNT DISCH% AMOUNT upoptAMoumtifes

SUPPLEMENTARY LABOUR:

BO-WHEEL ALIGN X4 WHEEL ALIGNMENT X4 1 180.00 180.00 12,60 182,80

SUM EXT SERVICE: 180.00 12.60 192.60
TOTAL SGD 180,00 12.60 192.60

Total Payable (SGO) 182.60

GET Amour i caltulatad from Individual lino(s]



() HONDA
KAH MOTOR CO. SDN. BHD.

(& Member of the Qriental Holdings Berhad)
470 Ubi Road 3 Singapore 408651, Tel: +65 6841 3803 Fax +65 6741 5022
255 Almeandra Road Singapore 159937, Tel: +65 6471 5458 Fax +65 6471 5450

SERVICE PRE-INVOICE

GST Reg Mo M200050223
Cormpany Ref, No.: SE0FC1380G

Customer: WZFO02 | MS FIRST CAPITAL Document No: SVO18025188
Chassis No: MRHFC1660GT000088 Printed By: ANIKKALAI
License No: SLG2567P Order Date: 2. May 2018
Mileage: 26320 Order Time: 4:24:19 PM
Engine No: L15B71624819 Service Advisor: ANIKEA LAl SWEE KAM
™
ITEM DESCRIPTION ary  UNIT DISC% AMOUNT T Ak '“.EE;}
TP DIRECT SETTLEMENT (JING: |
OWNER: QLEK HUI NEE
OWNER INSURER: LIBERTY
ACC DATE: 2342018
SURVEYED BY:
DATE:
REF NO:
TP INSURER: MS FCL
TP VEH: SHD2178H
ET510-TEA-TOOZZ PANELR RR DOOR 1 686,60 25 52245 3657 559.02
T2930-TEA-TO1 GARMNISH ASSYR.RR.DOOR SASH 1 14.60 25 10.85 07T 1.72
T2T21-TEA-TO1 GARNISHR,RR,DOOR QUARTER OUT 1 9.90 25 742 0.52 794
04636-TEA-TOOZZ PAMEL SETR.RR.OUTSIDE 1 651.00 25 518.25 36.28 554 53
42700-TEA-TE1 DISKALUMINIUM WHEEL 1 472.80 25 354,60 24 .82 37942
72925-TBA-AD MOLDING ASSYR RR.DOOR SASH 1 28.30 < 25 21.22 1.48 271
72910-TEA-TO MOLDING ASSYR.RR DOOR 1 2450 S 25 18.37 1,28 19.66
T1800-TEA-TOMZB GARNISH ASSYR.SIDE SILL 1 11440 = 25 B5.80 601 91.81
SUM PARTS: 1,539.06 107.75 1,646.81
BOSUN 1 20,00 20,00 1.40 21.40
SUNDRIES
BOJSE 1 BO.0OD BO.OD 560 B5.60
BODY JOINT SEALANT RR R FENDER
BOJSE 1 80,00 £0.00 5680 B5.60
BODY JOINT SEALANT FOR QUATER
GLASS
BKDR22R 1 580.00 §60.00 39.20 583,20
REMOVE & TRANSFER ITEMS TO NEW
RR R DR, ADJUST
& ALIGN RE R DR.(MN}
BOMISCH 1 160.00 160.00 11.20 17120
RESET & CALIERATE SMART ENTRY
SYSTEM (N)
BKRPOZE 1 1,400.00 1,400.00 98.00 1,438,040
CUT OFF & REMEW RR FLOOR PANEL,
FENDERS STRAIGHTEN
ALIGN RR CHASSIS & RENEW DAMAGE
PARTS.
BPD4R 1 1,125.00 1,125.00 7875 1,203.75
SPRAY PAINTING ON REPAIRED OR
REPLACED AREAS.(4P)
BMmIOZD 1 280.00 260.00 19.60 29960
REMOVE & INSTALL SPEAKER BCARD
RR SEATS TRUNK
LININGE GARNISHES & ETC.{N)
BGSIR 1 280,00 280.00 19.80 299.60
REPLACE RR. R QTR GLASS.(N)
SUM LABOUR: 3,985.00 278.85 4,263.95
BO-WHEEL ALIGH X4 WHEEL ALIGNMENT X4 1 18000 < 18000 1280 182,60
SUM EXT SERVICE: 180.00 12.60 182.60
TOTAL SGD 5.704.08 399.30 6,103.36
Total Payable (SGD) 6,103.36



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: B256 3561 FAX: B256 4315
Reg No: 199607138R GST Reg. No, 19-0607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref © CSFCHB00TT63RArbn2
soroansoneor ooy o =e=o [N
Code : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD 3179H Veh. Inspected SLG 2567P
Policy No. Coverage (3) 000
Claim No. D18003213MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  SERENE Assign Date 27/04/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDA CIVIC 1.5 TURBO C.C 1498
Engine No. HIDDEMN Year of Reg. 2018
Chassis No. MRHFC1660GTO0008E Colour GREY
Odometer 26320 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Moedification SPORTS RIM
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/50 R17 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/50 R17 YOKOHAMA & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |215/50 R17 YOKOHAMA & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/50 R17 YOKOHAMA & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S REAR PORTICN.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date  23/04/2018 Inspection Date 02/05/2018
Survey held at KAH MOTOR CO SDN BERHAD
NO. 255 ALEXANDRA ROAD
SINGAPORE 158937
5a. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REFPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REFPAIR & Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo 19260T198R GST Reg. No 19-0607108-R Page Mo.:1of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLG 256TP
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | -SLTRBY) ;1’
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|PANELR RR DOOR (SN) BENT 522 45 522 45
1|GARNISH ASSYR RR DOOR SASH (SN) MECESSARY 10.95 10,85
1|GARNISHR RR DOOR QUARTER OUT (SM) MNECESSARY 7.42 742
1|MOLDING ASSYR RR DOOR (SN) SERVICEABLE 18.37 -
1|MOLDING ASSYR RR DDOR SASH (SN} SERVICEABLE 2122 -
1|PANEL SETR RR OUTSIDE (SN) BENT 518.25 518.25
1|PANELR SIDE SILL (SN} SERVICEABLE 366.07
1| DISKALUMINIUM WHEEL (SM) SCRATCHED 354 60 354 60
1|SUNDRIES (SN} HECESSARY 50.00 20.00
1|BODY JOINT SEALANT RR R FENDER (SN) NECESSARY 100.00 80.00
1|BODY JOINT SEALANT FOR QUATER GLASS (SN) NECESSARY 100,00 B0.00
1|MOLDING ASSYR RR DOOR SASH (SNIADDITIONAL) MECESSARY 2122 21.22
1|MOLDING ASSYR RR DOOR (SN){ADDITIONAL) MECESSARY 18.37 18.37
1|GARNISH ASSYR SIDE SILL (SN)(ADDITIONAL) SCRATCHED B5.80 85.80
219472 1.719.06
LABOUR
REMOVE & TRANSFER ITEMS TO NEW RR R DR ADJUST. B00.00 560.00
RESET & CALIBRATE SMART ENTRY SYSTEM. 160.00 160.00
CUT OFF & REMEW RR FLOOR 2,500.00 1,400.00
PANEL.,FENDERES STRAIGHTEM
SPRAY PAINTING ON REPAIRED OR REPLACED AREAS 2.000.00 1,125.00
(4P)
INSPECT RR LIGHTING MECHANISMS PERFORM NOT NECESSARY 180.00 -
WATER.
REMOVE & INSTALL SPEAKER BOARD RR SEATS 560.00 280.00
TRUNK.
REPLACE RR R QTR GLASS. 5&60.00 280.00
SUPPLY & INSTALL SOLAR FILM ON REAR QTR GLASS. |NOT NECESSARY 250.00 -
WHEEL ALIGNMENT X4 (ADDITIONAL}. 180.00 180.00
7,190.00 3 985.00
GRAND TOTAL 9,384.72 5,704.06

Report Ref No, CS/FCI18007763/R1rbn2
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| RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | 1 5,704.06)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18007763/R1rbn2
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MOHAMMED RASUL BIN MOHD YUNUS ADRIAN LING WAI PING

Automotive Assessor B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

BISCLAIMER OF LIARILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repart is mbde salely for the uss and banafit of the Clkent named on the frant page of this Report.

whatsowar, in contact or tort. |8 accepted bo any third party who may realy on the Bepod wholly of in part. Any third party acting or reglving on this
Reparl in whols or in part, does so at his or her cwn risk.



