Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
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From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Friday, 19 October 2018 2:34 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto); Admin A; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Cc: Chong Boon Sen; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Chee So Chow; KKLau; Alfred Toh

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Invalving SKU14U (O SNM18D02160C02/4) AND
SCG11X (TP LKK REF - CCB/CTI18007751/ua3) on 26/04/2018

Attachments: Email from TP (003).pdf

LKK REF - CC6/CTI18007751/ua3
CTI REF — SNM18D02160C02/4 (SKU14U)

Dear Thin Thin

You may proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $15,393.50.
We await your payment advice to enable Boon Sen to act accordingly.
Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: +65 63896183

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdepti@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh : iping.com

www.sqa.cntaiping.com
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ANNVERSARY
In Singapore vince 1938

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. Any unauthorized disclosure,
use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If vou are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the
sender immediately.

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, October 19, 2018 2:21 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept @sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)
eyivianlau@lkkauto.com=



Cc: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Hsiao Tong
(LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com=; Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>; KKLau <kklau@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKU14U (Ol SNM18D02160C02/4) AND SCG11X (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI18007751/ua3) on 26/04/2018

LKK REF - CC6/CTI118007751/ua3
CTI REF — SNM18D02160C02/4 (SKU14U)

Dear Mr Alfred,
We refer to the below matter,

Please be inform that we have offered to TP as per instruction. However, TP did not accept our offer and they propose $
100 /per day x 10 days as their client vehicle was 4.9 cc.

Please see the attached email from TP,

In view of the above, kindly let us have your further instruction.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Claims Dept of CTI <clai sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Friday, 19 October 2018 12:48 PM

To: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)
<vivianlau@|kkauto.com>

Cc: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Hsiao Tong
(LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Chee So Chow <sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com>; KKLau <kklau@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKU14U (Ol: SNM18D02160C02/4) AND SCG11X (TP : LKK REF -
CCB/CTI18007751/ua3) on 26/04/2018

LKK REF - CC6/CTI18007751/ua3
CTI REF - SNM18D02160C02/4 (SKU14U)

Dear Thin Thin
We refer to your email of even date pertaining to the above matter.

Please proceed to offer as follow:

Cost of Repairs 514,391.50

Loss of Use (10 days x $80.00) $ 800.00 & up to $100.00/day x 8 days
LTA Search fee s 2.00

Total 515,193.50

Best Regards



Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: +65 6389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sq.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh({@sg.cntaiping.com

www.sg.cnitaiping.com

ANNIVERSARY
ln Simpapare sinee 1938

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid except
where provided for in a written agreemeni between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure,
use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the
sender immediately.

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto) [mailto:thinthin@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Friday, October 19, 2018 12:16 PM

To: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Claims Dept of
CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com=; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKU14U (OI: SNM18D02160C02/4) AND SCG11X (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI18007751/ua3) on 26/04/2018

Your Ref: SNM18D02160C02/1
Our Ref: CC6/CTI18007751/Aua3n2 “Without Prejudice”

Dear Sir / Madam,

ACCIDENT ON 24/04/2018 INVOLVING VEHICLES SKU 14U AND 5CG 11X
We refer to the above matter.

0| collided to rear portion of TP vehicle.

According to GIA Barometer of Liability, our insured's liability is down. We did clarify with Ol the nature of the accident.
We had informed Ol about the NCD issue.

We seek your approval to offer to TP repairer, Modern Automotive Pte Ltd is as follows: -

ned Amount

Cost of Repair (W/GST) 31,503.92 14,391.50 |
3




Loss of Use ( 10 days x 5 180) 5 1,80000 |5 1,800.00
LTA Search Fee ] 200 |5 2.00
Total S 33,605.00 |5 16,193.50

Enclosed herewith the relevant supporting documents for your kind perusal.

For your approval please.

Best Regards,

Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 April 2018 8:25 PM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: Chong Boon Sen <boonsen.chong@sg.cntaiping.com>; Lucas Lee <|ucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
<thinthin@lkkauto.com=: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@Ilkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SKU14U (01 : CAll - TBA) AND SCG11X (TP : LKK REF -
CCH/CTI18007751/ua3) on 26/04/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case from M/s Modern Automotive Pte Ltd.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
TP GIA report

Please be informed that the estimated cost of repair is not ready yet.

We will revert to you on preliminary advice in due course.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Thin Thin and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2360.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

BLK 3023A UBI ROAD 1 #01 -61
SINGAPORE 408717

GST REG. NO : 200501102H
TEL : 6748 4422 / 6745 4422 FAX : 6747 6720

Email: chin@modernautomotive.com.sg

YOUR REF : SKU14U
OUR REF :SCG11X

Date 01.08.2018

The Claims Manager

China Taiping Insurance Co (s) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road #16-00

Spring Leaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Tel : 6222 2366

Fax: 86222 1033

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCG11X & SKU14U ON 26.04.2018
ALONG FARRER ROAD

We refer to the above matter.

We have been authorized by our client Mr Koh Chye Lee to make
claim against your insured vehicle Mo. SKU14U in respect of the above
accident for the following :

Repair Cost H o) § 14,391.50 (Incl GST)
Loss of use (10 days x $180) (o003 1,800.00 (8 Repair days, 1 Sun, 1 PH)
Search fee 3 2.00

Total: § 16,193.50 4 (¢ 12 '

Enclosed herewith a copy each of the supporting documents for your perusal.
Kindly process the above and remit the payment to us asap.

Yours faithfully

|
\\'-. F{f\' "u,‘

Modern Automotfﬁ@ Pte Ltd
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51 URIAVE L #01-25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62563361 FAX @ (0651 62564315

Our Ref: CC6/CTI18007751/Aual
03 MAY 2018

YEO LEE KIOW ANTHEA
14 SELETAR GREEN VIEW
SINGAPORE 805119

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKU 14U & SCG 11X ON 26/04/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,
W

THIN THIN HLAING

Case Handler

DID: 6841 2360

Fax: 6741 4108
Email: thinthin@lkkauto.com

c.e.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



LETTER OF AUTHORIZATION

Date: 9|4 1%

TO WHOM IT MAY CONCERN
Dear Sir,

RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE
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This letter is to authorize MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD at Block 3023A, Ubi Road 1,
#01-61, Singapore 408717 to resolve the above matter.

In respect of this authorization, MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD has my/our authority to
decide on my/our behalf whether to accept any offer of settlement from the third party
insurers. |/we also agreed that all payments include Loss of Use to make in favour of
MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD.

MODERN AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD is also authorized to sign all the required documents
include Discharge Voucher from the third party insurers on my/our behalf.

Yours FaitE_{uIIy

||||||||||||||||||||||||||||||||||||

kel u\\\( Lae SCIINN(

Name / NRIC



Policy Mo 3  EBMPCSNIDBERTT1604 Claim Mo o SHMISDOZI160C02/1
Claimant : KOH CHEYE LEE {30 CAILI)
Amount 43,50

ngapere Dollars Fifteen Thousand Three Hundred Ninety
reg and Cents Fifty Only
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I/We agree to accept the above mentioned amount to be paid to mej/us io full &
final settlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuriez / damages
sustained by mefus through an acoident involving

Claimant Vehicle Mo, ; SCE 11x
Insured Vehicle Ro. @ SEO 140
Date of Loss i Z6L0442018
Place of Accident i FARRER ROAD

IN COWSIDERATION of the payment made to mefus of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIFING INSURANCE (SINGAFORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agree .absolutely to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSUBRRNCE [(SINGABRORE) PTZ. LTD. and/or

Insured HName 1 YEQ LEE KIOW ANTHEA
Driver MName 1 ¥EQ LEE KIOW

from all claims, present or future in respect of all loss, injury or damage
sustained by mefus arising cut of the zsid accident.

I acknowledge that this payment is made without admission aof liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE] PTE. LTD.

(1) Gensral Damages 55 -
(2} Cost of Repair/Excess S5 14,391.50
(3] Loss of Use/Rental/ 5% 1,000.00
(4] EIAfPolice Reports/

Investigation Results/Search Fees 2] 2.00
{5) Medical Repcrts/Expenses &3 -
{8) Survey Fees/PF.T. Fees ] =
(7T} Cost including Disbursement 85 -

FPOTAT o o oy w0 wormoie e oo o5 @ s LA ea0
S

Claimant MName : HEOH CHYE 1EE XU CAILI) HRIC No : SH131034C

Signature : [- “:\\ T Date g Jq"ll lb] ilg




Invoice Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
GENERAL & Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Fhone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Oparating Huu_'rs: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref Mo: GR-18-063447
Date of Request: 26/04/2018 Your Ref Mo: Online Purchase

Modern Automotive Pte Lid
Blk 30234 Ubi Road 1
#01-61 & #01-58

Singapore 408717

Dear SirMadam,

Enguiry Date 26/04/2018

Enguiry By Chin So1 Shong

TP Vehicle No. SkU14U

Accident Date 26/04/2018

Enquiry Result

[TP Vehicle No.  |Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
!SKUHU China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Lid. 19/09/2017-18/09/2018 6389 6111
Thank You.

The images provided ta you are taken from the anginal reports forwarded to the cantre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever far any
loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reponts or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp_g... 26/4/2018
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GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffies Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURAN CE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours. Monday 1o Friday 8am to Spm
i A GST Registration No: M400017735
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE g

Our Ref No: GR-18-063447

Date of Reqguest: 26/04/2018 Your Ref No; Online Purchase

MModern Automaotive Ple Lid

Blk 3023A Ubi Road 1

#01-61 & #01-58

Singapore 408717

Dear SirfMadam,

Enguiry Date 26/04/2018

Enquiry By Chin Sei Shang

TF Vehicle No. SkEU14U

Accident Date 26/0472018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S5)

TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 013
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[*¥] GIRO [] Cash [ ] Chegue

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsasé& fuseaction=dsp_g... 26/4/2018




