Joz Irene (LKKAuto)

From: OMNG LI Ul <llong@lonpac.com=

Sent: Thursday, 30 August 2018 3:59 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); MT_Claim_SG; Admin A

Subject: RE: SKX1964E / Your vehicle : GBE4204C Cur Ref: 17/18/18/VC00/020566
Dear Joy

Please proceed.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:JoyIrene@lkkauto.com)

Sent: Thursday, 30 August, 2018 10:32 AM

To: ONG LI LI

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); MT_Claim_SG; Admin A

Subject: RE: SKX1964E / Your vehicle : GBE4204C Our Ref: 17/18/18/VC00/020566

Ref :17/18/18/VC00/020566

Dear Li Li,
This is a scenario where our insured hit parked TP vehicle.
Liability is not in our favour.

Summary to offer to repairer M/s VISION AUTOWORK PTE LTD is as follows:

TP CLAIMED OUR REVISED TO OFFER
1} Cost of Repairs + 7% GST $11,051.84 (est) 5 3,103.00
2) Loss of Rental { 2 days) $  260.00 S 200.00
3) LTA Search Fee 5 7.45 5 7.45
4)GIA Search Fee 5 29.00 5 29.00
TOTAL $11,348.29 $3,339.45

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.
For your approval.

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: Joy Irene [LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 20 June 2018 9:45 AM

To: 'ONG LI LI' <llong@lonpac.com>

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com=>; MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com=>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com=>
Subject: RE: SKX1964E (Pre-inspection) / Your vehicle : GBE4204C Our Ref: 17/18/18/vC00/020566

Dear Ms. Li Li,

Attached Preliminary Advice and estimate for your reference.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com |Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkanto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408033)

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]

Sent: Monday, 30 April, 2018 5:04 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; MT_Claim_5SG <mt _claim@Ilonpac.com>

Ce: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <Joylrene @lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong
(LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=>; MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>
Subject: RE: SKX1964E (Pre-inspection) / Your vehicle : GBE4204C Our Ref: 17/18/18/vC00/020566

Dear Mei Kwan
Attached is our Insured’s GIA report for your handling.

Regards,
Ong Li Li
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
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300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: ONG LI LI

Sent: Friday, 27 April, 2018 12:28 PM

To: 'Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)'; MT_Claim_SG

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: SKX1964E (Pre-inspection) / Your vehicle : GBE4204C Our Ref: 17/18/18/VC00/020566

Dear Mei Kwan

Our Insured has not reported the accident to us yet.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 27 April, 2018 12:15 PM

To: MT_Claim_5G

Cc: ONG LI LI; ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; GERALD POH WEE BIN; Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Hsiao
Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: SKX1964E (Pre-inspection) / Your vehicle : GBE4204C

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Yourref: 17/18/18/VC00/020566
LKK ref: CC4/LPC18007749/ja3

Dear Sir/ Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Joy and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2409,

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Repards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 oos5 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 April, 2018 4:58 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.comz>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Cc: 'MT_Claim_5G" <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkk .com

Subject: RE: SKX1964E (Pre-inspection) / Your vehicle : GBE4204C

Dear Mr Gerald,



Thank you for the assignment.

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone; 6741-8434 | email: gssignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]

Sent: Thursday, 26 April, 2018 4:44 PM

To: assignments@|kkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Vision Autowork <visionautowork@gmail.com>
Subject: FW: SKX1964E (Pre-inspection) / Your vehicle : GBE4204C

Our Ref : 17/18/18/VC00/020566

Dear Catherine,

Kindly proceed to conduct the pre-repair survey accordingly.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Vision Autowork [mailto:visionautowork@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 26 April, 2018 4:18 PM

To: MT_Claim_5SG; GERALD POH WEE BIN; ERIC WOO JUN KIAT
Subject: SKX1964E (Pre-inspection) / Your vehicle : GEE4204C

Dear person in charge,

Please refer to attach file and arrange for pre-inspection. . _
Hope we can do Direct Settle and please provide the surveyor firm or surveyor name list to conduct the joint pre-repair
survey as a single joint expert

** PLEASE ADVISE THE ABOVE CASE LIABILITY **

Thank You,
Yours Sincerely,

Michelle
HP : 9856 4815

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
#08-09Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore (415875)

Tel : 6341 6789

Fax : 83416778



Thank You
Yours faithfully,

Michelle
Hp: 9856 4815

R Kaki Bukit Avenue 4,
#08-09,Premier (@ Kaki Bukit,
Singapore 41875

Tel: 6341 6789

Fax: 6341 6778



VISION AUTOWORK PTE. LTD.

8 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4, #08-09, PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT, S'PORE 415875
Tel: 6341 6789 Fax: 6341 6778
Co. Reg, No. : 201500371E

Letter of Demand

Re : Accident involving my vehicle no. SKXIUbE and vehicle no.
(BEAIM4C on 25feq|cwie at _(1-4¢ HRS PM/AM along
Shewu PBewnkc HS (<) Fte 144, Stady fk'-rf‘m 8

We refer to the above matter.

Attached copies of the following for your kind perusal :

Vehicle Repair cost /Exeess $ B0 00
Vehicle Rental Fee for 2+ days @
$ 1L0.00 per day ¢ 26L0.00
Loss ofuse for  — days(@
$ — perday g _

i : i LTA search fees $ 1.4%
Others 34 frrty Fepurt $ 14.00

Total : s 5444, 45

Yours faithfully,

AEEY

ABBY
HP : 9856 4815
E-mail: visionautowork@gmail.com




VISION AUTOWORK PTE. LTD.
8 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4, #08-09, PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT, S'PORE 415875
Tel: 6341 6789 Fax: 6341 6778
Co. Reg. No. : 201500371E

Authorization To Act

1, Tay  Phey  hegk (“the third party claimant”) of
BLE 401 (hiw th.,,l, Kang PVvEnul » H#HUYG -20q Sincapore (040
(address), owner of T kX 19B4E (vehicle no.) hereby

authorize Visicn Autowore Pre. Ha.

(“the workshop™) to act for me with respect to my claim for repair
costs and/or rental and/or loss of use (“claim™) for my vehicle
no. Sk« \1b4E  that was damaged pursuant to the accident which
occurred on_2%|c41%0(% (date) along Shuwo Denko HD (5)

Ple L1D Stk Cacpnric (location)  involving
vehicle no/s GBE 4204 C
(“the accident™).

I further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim in a manner that
they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive payment further to
settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in favour of the workshop.

I further acknowledge that any settlement the workshop may reach on my behalf is on

a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis in so far as the
driver/owner/insurers of the other vehicle/s is concerned.

Dated this 2 b day of L4 (month) 20 1 (year)

L P 7{"{. \

Signed by “the third party claimant™ Signed by “the workshop™



LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIMNO : 17/18/18/VCO0/020566
DATE : I20CTOBER 2018

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We, MDM TAY PHAY GEOK confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner of GBE 4204C the sum of Singapore Dollars
Three Thousand Three Hundred Thirty Nine and Cents Forty Five only
($3,339.45) in full and final satisfaction, liquidation and discharge of property claim
competent to mefus upon the said Mfs LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect of
property claim sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter to become manifest,
arising either directly or indirectly from an accident to my/our vehicle. SKX 1964E
on 25 APRIL 2018 along SHOWA DENKO HD (S) PTE LTD STAFF CAR
PARK

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (YUN WEI F&B
MANAGEMENT PTE LTD/LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against all claims and
any claims whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the
said accident.

["'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/S VISION
AUTO WORK PTE. LTD.

I/'We hereby acknowledee that this paymenl is made on a withoul admission ol

liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
nhurﬁ.i :: recovery action,

/z_]L\

"'ilgndiu.rc of vehicle nwncr.-‘Ddlc

R EEEEEE R

Name of vehicle owner/Date

'MY' Hxﬂﬂﬂﬂﬂ‘n

of this Discharge

Voucher is only for my claim

for property dam
preiudil:iﬂl to any

age and not
other claims”



VISION AUTOWORK PTE.LTD.

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4,

#08-09 Premier @ Kaki Bukit,
Singapore 415875

Tel: 6341 6789

Fax . 6341 6778

ROC / GST REG NO.: 201500371E
Email : visionautowark@gmail.com

Bill To:

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
NO.100 BEACH ROAD

#19-00 SHAW TOWER
SINGAPORE 189702

INVOICE No T1 V16642
Date : 09.07.18

Vehicle Number : SKX1964E

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Carry out lump sum repair on accident vehicle corresponding to S 2,900.00
supply of spare parts, labour and spray painting charges
Sub Total| $ 2,900.00
Add GST 7%| $ 203.00
Total Amount | $ 3,103.00

PAYMENT BY CHEQUE SHOULD BE CROSSED AND MADE PAYABLE TO
'VISION AUTOWORK PTE.LTD.

PLEASE INDICATE THE INVOICE NO. ON THE REVERSE SIDE,

Issued By :

Co's stamp & Authorised Signature




WIN WIN RENT-A-CAR PTE LTD

Invoice
SKX1964E Invoice No
TAY PHAY GEOK Invoice Date
BLK 401 CHOA CHU KANG AVE 3 Due Date
#08-209 VHA No
S(680401) Referral [D
Description :
Rental for 2 Day/s @ $130 per Day
Vehicle No : SLG2840A
Vehicle Description ¢ HondaFit 1.3A
Rental Period : 02/05/2018 to  04/05/2018

Total Amount Payable

8 Kaki Bukit Ave 4 #08-04 Premier@Kaki Bukit Singapore 415875
Tel: 6315 8479 H/P: 9833 0807
LEM: 201505115E

: WPLINO0O1951
:4/5/2018
4572018

12400

V01

Amount

$260

$260



WIN WIN RENT-A-CAR PTE LTD
8 Kaii BuKit Ave 4 #06-04 Premier@Kaxi Bukit Singapore 415875 VHANo: 2400

Tel: 6315 8479 H/P; 9833 0807 Invoice No : |! 1"
UEN: 2015051 15E - VEHICLE RENTAL AGREEMENT Hirer's Vehicle No: - . )
HIRER'S PAHHW_L_&?_S{ puAy ligok Vehicle No: 5L ( 2 [ <o 1 Replace Veh NoLTkw 19047
Name: (as in 1/C) ':'I = ALY Mileage Out: [ S 7857 Milsage Out:
A SRR TR Make & Modet: 3 Auto / Manual
Addréss e AL O] € HIOA C FAAG i . FiT )
.-" L __ ST 2 © S i I BN =anr ] wuﬂtﬂ':ﬁ':"_j_"fr—'l'\‘—t’ E/,_I_,’F;'ﬂm J ot
[batiadanisaatdiot st HIRE / PERIOD EXPIRY Tme: 9% g =
) - NON-WAIVER EXCESS=% ~ =0 Jlr..
Occupation: DrivingBxpz ]
Singapore Driving Licence Mo | @mﬁﬁ L
lssueDeste::  Daeotsir: ' [ 317 Daily ) @8 | 7O perday FL6O | -
Tel: () (R} HP : Weakly a% per week
ADDITIONAL DRIVER'S PARTICULARS Manthiy a% per month
Mame; {asin |/C) __ ——— | Hou 8% e
Lir
MRIC { FIN MNa: : . - —p
Address (Res): Extansion @5
- § Dalivery/Collection Sarvice
Cecupation: Drriving Exp: |
| ST S 2 SUB-TOTAL $
Singapare Driving Licence Mo: = S e A
Issue Date: DateofBith: | PETROL LEVEL
. ’ ; - )
Tel: (O} (R):- WP lout| E |1/8 174 &ra]1/2]5/ a4 /8| F
VEHICLE GHECK LIST In | E |d/8]1/4/3/8 1/2/5/8 /4 |7/8| F
i Fueal
L
® % Traffic / Parking Fines
g 4
w
a @ TOTAL CHARGES $
0w
o
[
=
.
AR
G < @?‘ LA
n i v !
Z < Hirer's Signature |
L
MISSING / FAULTY ACCESSORIES / PARTS
REMARKS ;
Additional Driver's Signature

| have read and agree to the terms and condition on both sides of the agreement. If | have presented a chargefcredit card for payment. | agree that
all amounts payable under this agreement and for parking and traffic infringements may be billed to that account and my signature above will be
considerad to have besn made on the charge/credil card voucher, All information | have given WIN WIN RENT-A-CAR PTE LTD in connection
with this agreamant is true.

w

1. VEHICLE 18 STRICTLY PROHIBITED FOR "HIRE FOR REWARDS® USAGE SUCH AS UBER / GRABCAR / GRABSHARE ETC.

2. OHLY PERSON ABOVE 23 YEARS OF AGE WITH MORE THAN 2 YEARS DRIVING EXPERIENCE AUTHORISED.LICENSED AND SIGNING THIS AGREEMENT MAY DAIVE THE VEHICLE
4, ALL PARKING AND TRAFFIC VIOLATIONS ARE THE RESPONSIBILITY OF THE HIRER. AN ADMINISTRATIVE CHAAGE WILL BE LEVIED ONM ANY TRAFFIC VIOLATIONS REDNRECTED.
4, THE HIRER SHALL BE LIABLE FOR EXCESS CHARGES FOR ANY LATE RETURN AT THE RATE SHOWN PER HOUR CF PER DAY, INCLUSIVE OF CDW ANDVOR PA! WHERE APPLICABLE.
5. 1N CASE OF ACCIDENT, THE HIRER SHALL REPOAT TO RENTAL OFFICE IMMEDATELY. IF THERE 15 BODILY INJURIES. A POLICE REPOAT MUST BE MADE WITHIN 24 HOURS,

6. VEHICLE & STRICTLY FOA SINGASOSE LUSE DMLY, AND MAY NOT BE DRIVEN OUT OF SINGAPORE WITHOUT PRIOR CONSENT OF THE COMPANY WIN Wit RENT-A-CAR FTE LTD,

AETURAN OF VEHICLE. THE HIRER / DANER 1S AEQUIRED TO SIGN [N THE COLUMN * SIGNATURE OF HIRER / DAVER * FALING WHICH THE DAY AND TIME MEEATED BELOW SHALL DEEMED
T BE THE DAY ANC TIME THE VEHICLE 1S RETURNED TO Wik WIN BENT-A-CAR PTE LTD AND THE SAME SHALL BE ACCEPTED AS CONCLUSIE EVEDENGE OF THE SAME AND SHALL
NOT BE CHALLENGED OR QUESTIORED ON ANY ACCOUNT WHATSOEVER,

DATEIN | TIMEIN |MILEAGE | CHECKED BY REMARKS %‘s_f

|
I'r_I ";.l.'}- A e | e |
J'0 [ 9N [Aha g s | SIGNATURE OF HIRER/DRIVER




SaMdidNAR Rarmint
1

Lineh Traenspaoe Authar iy
lLasnd Trasspard Aulbaity
W Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575701
B5T Aegisirathon Mo, @ M4-DO0AS3HE-2
Prinl DalefMime : 28 Apr 2018 / 08:50.41
Receipl Date/Teme - 26 Apr 2018 / 08:59:41

Tax Invoice/Receipt
Receinl Mo, | [THE T00000- 16026000202
Previous Receipl Mo, |

5N em Description/ Amount GST Amount
Business Transaction Reference Before Amounl After GET
Mo, QAT (85) {23) 55
Rasull of Insurance Enquiry - GBE4204C
A ab 25 Apr 201804 7:40-00
Insarance Co: LONPAG INSURANCE BHD
1 isurance Enquiry - GREAZME

Enguiry Fee T.00 L 1] 749
201 B04 2508581 T T8

Sub-Tats 700 n4s T

Total Belore Rounding 700 oA 749

Roundng Diference 0,04

| Total Amount Payable T.45
Paid By

Credi Card:

oo 36 kst 4 1A%

Talad 745

Cash Charge 000

Tendered Amount 745

Excass Reluncable Amount ban

THANK ¥i0U AND HAVE A MICE DAYT

Please ensure that all payments to the Authority are good and premptly settied by the payment service
prowvider ! Tinancial instilulion, Clherwise, the iransaction and recelpl is considered vold and late fee

rmay apply.

RUDEYAL LA, GOV SOITENTIFSCIONCOMPEEEEH Y M BAL A LN I IUMN_IUSET S0 |



A GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
[ 'GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
]NSURANCE Phena: 485 8224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 DDA0
ASSOCIATION Oparating Hours: Monday to Friday S9am to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE Co! rregistration No:M400017735

TAX INVOICE
Our Ref No: GR-18-065085
Date of Request; 20/0472018 Your Ref No: WALK IN EDWIN
VISION AUTOWORK PTE LTD

8 KAKI BUKIT AVE 4,, #08-03 PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 415875

Dear SifMadam,

Your Vehicle No: SKX1954E

Date of Accident: 250472018

Place of Accident: SHOWA DENKO HD (S) P/L STAFF C/P

Involving Vehicle No:  GBE4204C

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (5§)

E-File Search Fee (Public) 14.02
GST Amount 0498
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 15.00

Thank You,

This is & computer generated document and requires no signature,

For GIARMC Official uze:
Date:
[ 1 GIRO [X] Cash [ ] Chegue




