Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 April, 2018 4:58 PM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN'; assignments

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG'; Admin A

Subject: RE: SKX1964E (Pre-inspection) / Your vehicle : GBE4204C
Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Categories: HMK

Dear Mr Gerald,
Thank you for the assignment.
Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]

Sent: Thursday, 26 April, 2018 4:44 PM

To: assignments@lkkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Vision Autowork <visionautowork@gmail.com>
Subject: FW: SKX1964E (Pre-inspection) / Your vehicle : GBE4204C

Our Ref : 17/18/18/vC00/020566

Dear Catherine,

Kindly proceed to conduct the pre-repair survey accordingly.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Vision Autowork [mailto:visionautowork@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 26 April, 2018 4:18 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG; GERALD POH WEE BIN; ERIC WOO JUN KIAT
Subject: SKX1964E (Pre-inspection) / Your vehicle : GBE4204C

Dear person in charge,

Please refer to attach file and arrange for pre-inspection.



Hope we can do Direct Settle and please provide the surveyor firm or surveyor name list to conduct the joint pre-repair
survey as a single joint expert

** PLEASE ADVISE THE ABOVE CASE LIABILITY **

Thank You.
Yours Sincerely,

Michelle
HP : 9856 4815

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4
#08-09Premier @ Kaki Bukit
Singapore (415875)

Tel : 6341 6789

Fax : 63416778

Thank You
Yours faithfully,

Michelle
Hp: 9856 4815

8 Kaki Bukit Avenue 4,
#08-09,Premier @ Kaki Bukit,
Singapore 41875

Tel: 6341 6789

Fax: 6341 6778



