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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 22 January 2020 1:54 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto); Wu Tzu Ying; Subramanian Kasi

Subject: RE: LOD FINAL SETTLEMENT : SBS6354R DOA : 17/04/18 - GBC1105K (EQ INS)

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

Dear Asher 
  
We accept your offer. 
Please issue us your DV soonest. 
  

  
                     
  
  
  

  
Thank You 

  

  
Best Regards 

Lynn Ahmad (Ms) 

Senior Executive, Claims 
 Office    +65 6248 0987 | Mobile   +65 9199 0025 
Email     bazlin.ahmad@towertransit.sg 
Working hours : Mon – Fri ~ 9am – 6pm 
Close on Sat, Sun & PH  

Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd 
21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depot, Singapore 648170 

Registration number 201419417K 

www.towertransit.sg 
  
  

  

  
  

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 22 January, 2020 12:30 PM 

To: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg> 

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Wu Tzu Ying <Wu.Zy@towertransit.sg>; Subramanian Kasi 

<Subramanian.kasi@towertransit.sg> 

Subject: RE: LOD FINAL SETTLEMENT : SBS6354R DOA : 17/04/18 - GBC1105K (EQ INS) 

  

 THIS EMAIL IS FROM AN EXTERNAL SOURCE – Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender/email. 
 If in doubt, please check with IT Support!   

  

1. Cost of Repair(w/GST) $ 1,181.08 

2. Loss of Use (2 days x $250) $    500.00 

3. LTA/GIA search fee $         2.00 

TOTAL $ 1,683.08 
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‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 

  SAVE AS TO COSTS 

  

Hi Sir, 

  

We refer to the above matter. 

  

We propose settlement as follows: - 

  

1. Cost of Repair(w/GST) $ 1,181.08 

2. Loss of Use (2 days x $250) $    500.00 

3. LTA/GIA search fee $         2.00 

TOTAL $ 1,683.08 

  

**Please assist to amend the LOD, the cost repair should be $1,181.08 instead of $1,781.08. 

  

Kindly let us have your acceptance. 

  

  

Thank You. 

  

Best Regards, 

Asher Sng | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
  

From: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg>  

Sent: Tuesday, 14 January 2020 5:22 PM 

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; SUR 

<sur@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>; Wu Tzu Ying <Wu.Zy@towertransit.sg>; Subramanian Kasi 

<Subramanian.kasi@towertransit.sg> 

Subject: LOD FINAL SETTLEMENT : SBS6354R DOA : 17/04/18 - GBC1105K (EQ INS) 

  

Dear LKK 
  
We refer to the above matter, please find attached for self explanatory.  
Appreciate if you could get your principal to expedite with an offer. 
  
Thank You 
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Best Regards 

Lynn Ahmad (Ms) 

Senior Executive, Claims 
 Office    +65 6248 0987 | Mobile   +65 9199 0025 
Email     bazlin.ahmad@towertransit.sg 
Working hours : Mon – Fri ~ 9am – 6pm 
Close on Sat, Sun & PH  

Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd 
21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depot, Singapore 648170 

Registration number 201419417K 

www.towertransit.sg 
  
  

  

  
  

From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Monday, 13 January, 2020 4:02 PM 

To: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg> 

Subject: RE: SBS6354R DOA : 17/04/18 after repair photos 

  

 THIS EMAIL IS FROM AN EXTERNAL SOURCE – Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender/email. 
 If in doubt, please check with IT Support!   

  

Hi Bazlin, 

  

Refer to attachment 

Finalised amount is $ 1103.81 / 2 days of repair 

Kindly confirm 

  
  

  

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  

From: Bazlin Ahmad [mailto:Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg]  

Sent: Friday, 10 January, 2020 5:54 PM 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: SBS6354R DOA : 17/04/18 after repair photos 
  

Hi Rasul 
  
As requested, please find attached after paint photos.  
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Thank You 

  

  
Best Regards 

Lynn Ahmad (Ms) 

Senior Executive, Claims 
 Office    +65 6248 0987 | Mobile   +65 9199 0025 
Email     bazlin.ahmad@towertransit.sg 
Working hours : Mon – Fri ~ 9am – 6pm 
Close on Sat, Sun & PH  

Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd 
21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depot, Singapore 648170 

Registration number 201419417K 

www.towertransit.sg 

 
  

  

  
  

From: Bazlin Ahmad  

Sent: Friday, 10 January, 2020 2:10 PM 

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: SBS 6354R DOA : 17/04/18 

  

Dear Rasul 
  
Please find attached estimate and photos. 
  
Thank You 

  
  
Best Regards 

Lynn Ahmad (Ms) 

Senior Executive, Claims 
 Office    +65 6248 0987 | Mobile   +65 9199 0025 
Email     bazlin.ahmad@towertransit.sg 
Working hours : Mon – Fri ~ 9am – 6pm 
Close on Sat, Sun & PH  

Tower Transit Singapore Pte Ltd 
21 Bulim Drive, Bulim Bus Depot, Singapore 648170 

Registration number 201419417K 

www.towertransit.sg 
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Thursday, 9 January, 2020 7:05 PM 

To: Bazlin Ahmad <Bazlin.Ahmad@towertransit.sg> 

Subject: SBS 6354R DOA : 17/04/18 

  

 THIS EMAIL IS FROM AN EXTERNAL SOURCE – Do not click links or open attachments unless you recognise the sender/email. 
 If in doubt, please check with IT Support!   

  

Hi Lynn, 

  

This case was under Sharifah, till to date no estimate given. 

Kindly check is there required estimate for this case? 

  
  

  

Best Regards, 

Rasul | Assessor 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

  
  

DISCLAIMER: This email and any attached files may be confidential, privileged and intended solely for the addressee. It may not be reviewed, acted 
upon, filed or communicated to or by any other person. If you have received this email in error please delete it and notify the sender immediately. If you 
do not wish to receive general email communications, or you wish to change/update your email details, please email grey@towertransit.co.uk to tell us. 
The views expressed in this email are not necessarily the views of Tower Transit  

  

DISCLAIMER: This email and any attached files may be confidential, privileged and intended solely for the addressee. It may not be reviewed, acted 
upon, filed or communicated to or by any other person. If you have received this email in error please delete it and notify the sender immediately. If you 
do not wish to receive general email communications, or you wish to change/update your email details, please email grey@towertransit.co.uk to tell us. 
The views expressed in this email are not necessarily the views of Tower Transit  
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