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Catherine Chcmg (LKK Autu! . B

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, 6 August, 2018 4:02 PM

To: "Claim Workflaw System'; sur@lkkauto.com

(o MAYCHUA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Subject: RE: REQUEST OF SURVEY REPORT-OUR REF:D18003266MFSH,ACCIDENT

INVOLVING SHA1220A AND SFI223A ON 24-04-2018

Dear Sir / Madam,
Flease be informed that according to the repairer, TP owner already convert to OD claim,
Kindly advise.

Fiest Regards,
Catherine Chong | Adiniin
I.LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Fhone: 6731-8434 | emull: assignmentsdlkkauto com | foc 6256-4315
Bk 51, Payn Ubi Industridl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, woz-25 | SlacBo3g)

From: Nivitha (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 6 August, 2018 8:38 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; sur@lkkauto.com

Ce: MAYCHUA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Subject: RE: REQUEST OF SURVEY REPORT-OUR REFD18003266MFSH;ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHA12204 AND
§F1223A ON 24-04-2018

Dear Sir/Mdm,
Thank you for the email.

Dear Shiay Chan,

Kindly assist.

FYNA Qur Ref : CS/FCI18007738/gb
FEST REGARDS

G Nivitha | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Miahi: 68411072 | email: assignments@ lkkauto.com | fax; 6256-4315
Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, so2-25 | S(408033)

from: Claim Workflow System [mailto:
Sent: Saturday, 4 August 2018 7.07 PM
To: ASEIENMEEEEI_.EE&U_TQ co M

Ce:C TORC IMSFIR MSFIRSTC
Subject: REQUEST OF SURVEY REFOR'T-DUR REF: DIBMBIEEMFSH ACCIDENT IN"U"IIJWING SHA1220A AND SFJ223A

ON 24-04-2018

Dear Sir,
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Dste

Acciden! Date
Insured Vehicia
Survey Locatlan
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.,

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
25-04-2018 Our Ref No. D18003286MFSH
24-04-2018 Ciaim Type. Third Party
SHA1220A Third Party Vehicle. SFJ223A

303 ALEXANDRA ROAD SIME DARBY PERFORMANGCE CENTRE
CAROCLINE

63180174/ 63190174 Fax No. 64794601

WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

NA Fax No. 68416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit 1o us the Tax Invoice together with letter of elaim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Ce : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

PEAFORMANCE
. NI
MOTORS LIMITED Yon. RL
MA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
MAY CHUA
IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey repon via CWS within 14 days far survey assignment and 7 days lor re-inspection.

This Is a computer generated letter, no signature required.

ERCEURRY . . o, [T




