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51 UBLAVE L, #01-25 PAYA UBT INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE $08933 TEL - (065) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: CMTD1801695/THE

Our Ref: CS/SMO18007736/Agb

The Motor Claims Department
Sompo Insurance

Attn: Grace

Dear Sirs/Mdm

Date: 28" June 2018

Without Prejudice

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO___SLW 9296R .

We thank you for the instruction on _26/04/2018.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the abovementioned vehicle

on 27/04/2018 at the premises of M/s

following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
“Check” Items Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Nett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
front n/s portion.

Comments/ Present Status:

Damages consistent.

Days of repair: 3 day.
We have not authorized repair.

Yours faithfully

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng, AMSOE, AMIRTE, AMSAE-A, M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser

PREMIUM CARZ and have the

: 5% 5.503.25

- S8 4.200.00 (Lump Sum)
1 5% -

1 5% -

: 5% -

:S$ -




Catherine Chunﬂ (LKK Auto)

From: Teo, Grace <grace teo@sompo.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 26 April, 2018 3:07 PM

To: Aunteng; admin-d@Ikkauto.com; assignments@Ikkauto.com

Cc: Choo, Thelma; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin

Subject: CMTD1801695/THE - SUV(LKK)/LIA/ YL5465A & SLW9296R ACC ON 17/04/2018
Attachments: SLW9256R report.pdf

Our Claim Reference: CMTD1801695/THE

Your Reference: SLW9296R

Hi Aun Teng,

We acknowledged receipt of your claim documents.

Please be informed that Thelma Choo the handler of this case,
We have appointed LKK AUTO to conduct the survey.

Aside to LKK AUTO,

Please make arrangement to conduct the survey for SLW9296R.

Aside to Thelma,

Please advise on the liability request from Premium Carz Services Pte Ltd.

Best Regards

Grace Teo

Claims Division

D: 6329 5170 | T: 6461 6555 | F: 6221 3147

a,  Innovation for Wellbeing AC f T
@ sovro e

Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd.
S0 Raffles Place, #05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower, Singapore 048623

Website: www sompo.com.sg | Facebook: www.facebook.com/SompaSG

Disclaimer: This e-mail, including attachments, is intended for the person(s) or company named and may contain confidential
and/or legally privileged information. Unauthorised disclosure, copying or use of this information may be unlawful and is prohibited.
If you are not the intended recipient, please delete this message.

Privacy Policy Notice: Sompo Insurance Singapore Pte. Ltd. may collect, use and disclose your personal data for the purposes
stated in our Privacy Paolicy. This may include disclosure to holding and associated companies, credit bureau, parties to whom

disclosure is permitted/required by laws, our third party service providers and agents (acting on our behalf). Please click here for
our Privacy Policy



Froi: Aunteng [mailto:aunteng@premiumcarz.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, April 26, 2018 2:03 PM

To: Claims - Motor Survey

Subject: Pre-repair survey! Accident involving SLW9296R. & YL5465A on 17/04/2018

Dear Officer-in-charge
We refer to the above matter.

Attached our client's accident report for you to create a third party file.
Your insured's vehicle is YL5465A.
Our client's vehicle is ready for survey.

A copy estimate will be ready and made available to surveyor upon site inspection at our workshop. Please
indicate whether you are sending your surveyor to our workshop.

In the meantime, please advise us on the liability.
Regards

Aun Teng

Tel: 6636 9100 Fax: 6636 9113

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6

#01-90 Autobay@Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

#

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 28 June 2018 1:42 PM

To: ‘Teo, Grace'; assignments; 'Choo, Thelma'

Cc: ‘Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'; SUR

Subject: RE: CMTD1801695/THE - SUV(LKK)/LIA/ YL5465A & SLW9296R ACC ON 17/04/2018
Attachments: CSSMO18007736Aqb.pdf

Dear Thelma,

Enclosed herewith preliminary advice of SLW 9296R.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 30 April 2018 3:08 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Choo, Thelma' <thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: CMTD1801695/THE - SUV(LKK)/LIA/ YL5465A & SLW9296R ACC ON 17/04/2018

Dear Thelma,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLW 9296R on 27/04/2018.

We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewse@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 April 2018 3:43 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Choo, Thelma' <thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; SUR

<sur@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: CMTD1801695/THE - SUVILKK)/LIA/ YL5465A & SLW9296R ACC ON 17/04/2018

Dear Grace,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 30 April 2018 3:08 PM

To: ‘Teo, Grace'; assignments

Cc: 'Choo, Thelma'’; "Ye, Yong Kang Melvin'; SUR

Subject: RE: CMTD1801695/THE - SUV(LKK)/LIA/ YL5465A & SLW9296R ACC ON 17/04/2018
Dear Thelma,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLW 9296R on 27/04/2018.
We are pending for estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Uhi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 April 2018 3:43 PM

To: 'Teo, Grace' <grace.teo@sompo.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: 'Choo, Thelma' <thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>; 'Ye, Yong Kang Melvin' <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>; SUR
<sur@lkkauto.com=>

Subject: RE: CMTD1801695/THE - SUV(LKK)/LIA/ YL5465A & SLW9296R ACC ON 17/04/2018

Dear Grace,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Teo, Grace [mailto:grace.teo@sompo.com.sg)

Sent: Thursday, 26 April, 2018 3:07 PM

To: Aunteng <aunteng@premiumcarz.com.sg>; admin-d@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com
Cc: Choo, Thelma <thelma.choo@sompo.com.sg>; Ye, Yong Kang Melvin <melvin.ye@sompo.com.sg>
Subject: CMTD1801695/THE - SUV(LKK)/LIA/ YL5465A & SLW9296R ACC ON 17/04/2018

Our Claim Reference: CMTD1801695/THE
Your Reference: SLW9296R

Hi Aun Teng,
We acknowledged receipt of your claim documents.

Please be informed that Thelma Choo the handler of this case.

1
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ai heroby consanl

1 ladgemant ot being made available

T. B of this report fo the insu
Alorpaarnd

ITErR:

ACCIDENT STATEMENT

Date OFf Report
Date Of Accident
Expct Location Of Aceident

Country/State of Loss

19/04/2018 14,24
1770472018 16:30
B0 ALPS AVE
SINGAPORE

DETAILS OF OWN VEHICLE

Yehicle Registration Mumber
Insured/Policyholder
Mame Of Registerad Cwner
Co Reg Mo

Email Address

Mobile Phone No

Allemative Phone No
Vehicle Particulars
Minulaciurer

hodel

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used al
time of accident

Ara you clalming under your own insurance palicy
for repair to your vehicla?

If Moy, Please state action to be [aken
Vehicle Category

Insurance Company

Name of Insurance Company
I'ype Of Coverage

Fleat Pohcy

Policy Number

Cover Note Number

Driver

Mame of Driver

Passport Na/F N

Miate 0 Birtn

Cecupation

Date Of Drivi.:'s-g Fass

Oriving Experience

Gender

Maobile Numbar

Fax Mumber

Contacl Mumber

EMail Address

SLWH236R

LEMS MODE PRIVATE LIMITED
2003013186

NOERMAIL

(LOCAL) +65-90906263
OFFICE-90906263

TOYOTA
ALPHARD

FRIVATE USE

MO

THIRD PARTY
COMMERCIAL VERICLE

NTUC INGOME INSURANCE CO-OPERATIVE LTD
COMPREHENSIVE

MO

50986818110

MARABAYASHI ETSURD
GE022036R

D4/10/11873

INDOOR

24111201

& YEARS AND 4 MONTHS
MALE

(LOGAL) +65-80906263

MOEMAIL

P 4 04 12



Address B0 ALPS AVENUE H05-03
Pasteode 408815

wWas drivar an employee of he Insured's Company NO

1 Mo, Relatianship of the Driver with the Insured COWHNER

Wahisle Ragistration Number of Driver's Lwn

Vehicke

neurance Company of Drivers Own YVehicle -

Goneral Information of tha Aceidant

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Weaather Conditions CLEAR
Hoad Surface DRY

Other Information

Was any forelgn vehicle invalved in this accident? NO
Mumter of vehicles involved in the accident

Was any bady Injured in ha Accident? NO

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by

ambulance? i
Wag any nther matarial or propery damaged? YES
| have '::e_en app'na:r_-ed by unknown personis) NET
colimifing/offaring accident claims assislance.
Humber of Passengers (Inclucing Driver) 1
Detalls of Police Action
Was the accident reporied Lo the police? NO
If Yes, Please state which Maolice Station
W as notice of intended Prosecution given? MO
if Yes,agalnst whom?y
Circumstances of Accident
REFER TO ATTACHED
Atftachment(s)
Are acoident photos available far attachment? YES
Was there any video captured by Car Camara? YES
VWas there any augdio recorded? M
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
vehicle Registration Number YL5465A
yehicle Make/Model'Colour
Details OF Properties
Yehicle Category COMMERCIAL VEHICLE
Mame of Driver LI SHOUFAMG
MRIC/Passport Numbar GGE41830F
Contact Number
Addrass
Pastcode

insurance Company Mame

Mature Of Damage

mao, Of Pagsenger (Inciuding Ciriver}

Faos 72 al 13
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dicelasn andfor process my s na datef personal Infarmetlan set out in thiz itorm}i and any ather persceal lndormatlon
provides by meur possessed by my insurer (collestively the “Personal infarmation®) and disclots and fransfer Lurh
smrsgnal informaton to sl inswret{sh whe Mave insusad vehiclels] invoheed in this scdident (al irgurars) who have meurad
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1 processing, hending andfor dealing with my einic ndluding the soilementof the isinis and any necessary
Investigations relating 10 the Caims;

i) inwestigating the accident ard/or my lains,
tii} carrying @ut snd/or denling with my ipstractinns of evponding to any enauines by me;

tiwh artrmunisterng my cianms (including the mailing of correspondence, statemients, nvoices, reporis or nofices to me,
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Premiuim Lar’/
Co. Reg. Mo 2014167200

1 Kak Bukit Ave 6 #01-90 Autobay@Kaki Bukit Singapare 41 reaa
Tel: 6536 9100 Fax ; B636 3113

Date ; 26/04/2018

T0: (* Sompo Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd Our Customer :
Vehicle No:

Model :

Singapore 048623 Manufacture Year :
Date of Accident :

Total Estimate Repair Days -

50 Raffles Place

tao Clua
#05-01/06 Singapore Land Tower Xiad LA

Lens Mode Private Limited
SLVW9296R

Toyota Alphard 2.55A CVT ABS
2015 o _
17/04/2018 AGH 20 00 oy ¥t
&

Total Pages: 1
Attn : Motor Claims Department
Fax: 62213147
Re: Repair Estimate For Third Party Claim against YL5465A
ST e e = 3 Remarks From
No. Item Descriptions Qty Unit Price Amount Surveyor
A. Spare Parts L
1 Front bumper (pei-—a 1 §1,950.00 51,95000| v /Y¢S
2 Front bumper clip  pa 10 55.00 550-88| 3 2
3 Front bumper side retainer LH =~ A=~ 1 5115.00 5115.00] -
4 Front bumper tow hook cover At »— 1 30.00] ~.
5 Front sensor LH AT 1 5381.00 S381.00] -,
] Front grille base w/chrome  geA 1 5R55.00 S855.00] .-
7 Front grille "Alphard” logo  pat 1 $178.00 §178.00 —
3 Fog lamp LH [ 7T 1 5280.00 5280.00| +
E] Fog lamp garnish w/chrome LH ] 1 8222.00 5222.00] +.
10 Headlamp LH g - 1 1515 | 2915 o0.00] — 3104
11 Headlamp garnish LH A 1 T 3| 50.00] —
12 Headlamp lower bracket RH A~ ™~ 1 $0.00(+
13 Support panel Mt 1 s0.00}x
14 Front fender LH Bt o 1 TEpEHT e 5
Fan Total $4,031.00
ey Less 25% $1,007.75
sl Sub-total 1 3,023.25
A Spare Parts (S/Nett)
1 Cooclant Al poe | 1 J_ 580.00 SSD_;DEI x
Sub-Total 2 SR0.00
Total for Parts 33,103.25
B. Labour
1 To check wiring and re-focus headlamp. soQ.ea| 3o
Panel beating charges to remove and replace, to cut and weld, to :
- $1,00000| 32>
nock and reshape damaged parts & areas.
3 Spray painting all affected parts & areas. $800-60| 250
4 0 spray anti-rust undercoat. 560.00] & e
__%, cenazeckt tha Gllogann: Total Labour $2,400.00
e Tr priy painfing
. n resurvey Total Repair Cost $5,503.25
-: 18 party ey i repudice” basis —ff'_.'f-'. [+ $2 i 2195
iamantary damis] mest be resurveyed and ¢ :
' islul.;-r apnroval from Insurance Company L/ ':_ 4 | l_ln_'_
Achnowledged by Repairer
Signaturne:



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 198607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

50 RAFFLES PLACE

SOMPO INSURANCE SINGAPORE FL

Ref . CS/SMO18007736/Agbn2

[IERIT

|Inspection Date

#05-01/06 Date: 02-07-2018
SINGAPORE LAND TOWERSINGAPORE 048623
Code: SMO
3k Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. YL 54654 Veh. Inspected SLW 9296R
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. CMTD1B01895/THE Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From GRACE TEO Assign Date 26/04/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTAALPHARD c.c 2493
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2015
Chassis No. AGH300007044 Colour WHITE
Odometer 75073 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOooD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |235/50 R18 MICHELIN 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre 235/50 R18 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |235/50R18 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |235/50 R18 MICHELIN & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE WEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT N/S PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  17/04/2018 27/04/2018

PREMIUM CARZ SERVICES PTELTD

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE B
#01-80 AUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
SINGAPORE 417883

Survey held at

Sa. Remarks

A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.

B}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

3 Working Days
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Sl BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 2
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLW 9296R
Qty Description of Parts Condition WE;ﬂrkn::?pB(;} Durﬁ:{gj}usted
REPLACE ART
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 1,950.00 1,852.00
10|FRONT BUMPER CLIP @$5.00 NECESSARY 50.00 30.00
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LH NECESSARY 115.00 115.00
1|FRONT BUMPER TOW HOOK COVER (NPA) NOT NECESSARY ]
1|FRONT SENSOR LH NOT NECESSARY 381.00 -
1|FRONT GRILLE BASE W/CHROME cuT 855.00 855.00
1|FRONT GRILLE "ALPHARD" LOGO NECESSARY 178.00 178.00
1|FOG LAMP LH NOT NECESSARY 280.00 -
1|FOG LAMP GARNISH W/CHROME LH NOT NECESSARY 222 .00 :
1|HEADLAMP LH CRACKED 3,518.00 3,104.00
1|HEADLAMP GARNISH LH CuT 71.00 71.00
1|HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET RH (NPA) NOT NECESSARY - :
1|SUPFPORT PANEL (NPA) NOT NECESSARY - -
1|FRONT FENDER LH (NPA) NOT NECESSARY - :
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,805.00 -1,553.00
5,715.00 4,659.00
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|COOLANT (SN) NOT NECESSARY 80.00 .
80.00 -
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING AND RE-FOCUS HEADLAMP. 90.00 30.00
PANEL BEATING CHARGES TO REMOVE AND 1,000.00 300.00
REPLACE,TO CUT AND WELD,TO KNOGK AND RESHAPE
DAMAGED PARTS & AREAS.
SPRAY PAINTING ALL AFFECTED PARTS & AREAS 800.00 250.00
TO SPRAY ANTI-RUST UNDERCOAT. NOT NECESSARY 60.00 ;
TO PROGRAM HEADLAMP LH, NOT NECESSARY 450.00 i
2,400.00 580.00
GRAND TOTAL 8,195.00 5,239.00

Report Ref No. CS/SMO 180077 36/Aqbn2
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4,200.00

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/SMO18007736/Agbn2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng, AMSOE,AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser




