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Calculation for LTA Rebate

Calculation for Valuation:
Average MV

Mihs

(a) COE Period:_ o i:? = _ Mths
As At
(b) Balance Month:

Mihs

Calculation for Repossessed vehicle:
Yes/ MNo

Parallel Import vel_u_b_le Yes/No

High demand vehicle:

& &R 8D | €8

More than 10yrs oid: Yes/No | -
i Resie SOE: QP % by MV for Repossessed vehicle =
i {a)
Engine Capacity: High/tow | - %
(a) -fb)__ = 2= = yrs Europe / Asia Car l s $
Register Before/After MAY 2002 Car Candition: Good/F airfPoor/Burnt | - $
“"] PARF = (OMV)_ X K No. of transfer : ' |- %
TA Total Rebate Amount: (d)+(e) Other deduction b B
Salvage V alue{‘ TA Rebate - 5% Forced Sales Value derived = § o
Date/ Time Action / Instruction Additional Information:




Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Pearllyn Kang <pearllyn_kang@sg.msig-asia.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 27 February 2018 11:12 AM

To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Cc: Jocelyn Ng

Subject: FW: MV - SJV7862Z - DOA: 08/02/2018 - MSIG Ref: 549259
Attachments: enquireRebateByPublicBefo.pdf

Hi Shiau Chan,

Please help to advise on the MV urgently.
Thanks!

Best Regards,

Pearllyn Kang (Ms)

Assistant Executive, Claims Services (Motor)
D: +65 6594 2588 | F: +65 6225 7402 | pearllyn_kang@sg.msig-asia.com
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MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220

9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg

A Member of Biktor:Ul INSURANCE GROUP

From: Pearllyn Kang

Sent: Wednesday, 14 February, 2018 4:24 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Subject: MV - SIV7862Z - DOA: 08/02/2018 - MSIG Ref: 549259

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Please help to advise on the market value of the above mentioned vehicle.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Pearllyn Kang (Ms)

Assistant Executive, Claims Services (Motor)
D: +65 6594 2588 | F: +65 6225 7402 | pearllyn_kang@sg.msig-asia.com
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MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220

9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg % g
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\RF/COE Rebate Enquiry

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

" Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Véhicle to be Exported:
Infended De-registration Date:
Véhiclé Make: “

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturiﬁg Year:

| Engine No.:
Chassis No.:
Maximu.n’.t. Power Output:
Open Mérket Value:
Origin;i.R-égistration D;fé:
First R.eégisf-r‘ation Date:
Transfél; C.;ount:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details

PARF Eligibility:
PAREF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:

Intended COE Rebate Details

Singapore NRIC

89552

SIV7862Z

No

09 Feb 2018

B.M.W.

HEADLAMP

Black

2009
A4OOI459N4682OBE
wBANT120bOCX30101
115.0 kW (154 bhp)

$41,925.00

09 Feb 2010

09 Feb 2010
0

$41,925.00

Yes

08 Feb 2020

$23,058.00

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTI...
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5201 AUTO ABS AIRBAG 2WD XENON

09/02/2018



RF/COE Rebate Enquiry

COE E.xpiry. Da;ce:
COE Category:

COE Period(Years):
QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

08 Feb 2020
B - Car(1601cc & above)

10

$22,400.00

$4,477.00

$27,535.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 09 Feb 2018

Page 2 of 2
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