Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Irene Tan <irene_tan@sg.msig-asia.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 11 September 2018 3:10 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto); Christine Yow

Cc: SUR; Jasmine Lok Kheng Kwei

Subject: RE: MSIG TP SLJ7069L/ SIM4861T DOA;24/03/2018

Dear Christine,
Your email shall be routed to Jasmine who is temporary helping until Lionel’s replacement arrives.
Aside to Jasmine, please attend to email below.l

Best Regards

Irene Tan
Senior Executive, Claims Services (Motor)
Direct line +65 6594 2541 | Direct fax +65 6225 7402 | irene_tan@sg.msig-asia.com

Insurer Claims

M S I G Team of the Year
2016
MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd 16 Raffles Quay, #24-01 Hong Leong Building, Singapore 048581 | T: +65 6220

9644 | F: +65 6225 6371 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg AN .

AMember of METANRE (NSURANCE GROUP

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) [mailto:veronchen@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 11 September, 2018 2:59 PM

To: Christine Yow <christine.yow@wearnes.com>

Cc: Lionel Tan <lionel_tan@sg.msig-asia.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: MSIG TP SLJ7069L/ SIM4861T DOA;24/03/2018

Dear Christine,

Please refer to MSIG for offer. Their ref: 555046

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Christine Yow <christine.yow@wearnes.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 11 September 2018 2:33 PM
To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>




Cc: Lionel Tan <lionel tan@sg.msig-asia.com>
Subject: RE: MSIG TP SLI7069L/ SIM4861T DOA;24/03/2018

Hi,
Kindly revert with an offer soonest. Thank you.

Best Regards,
Christine Yow

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159935

D (65) 6430 4899
WEARNES

www.wearnesauto.com  christine.yow@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: Christine Yow

Sent: Wednesday, 20 June, 2018 10:09 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@|kkauto.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Lionel Tan <lionel tan@sg.msig-asia.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: MSIG TP SLI7069L/ SIM4861T DOA;24/03/2018

Hi,
Sorry miss out the rental invoice.

Best Regards,
Christine Yow

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd
249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159935

D (65) 6430 4899
WEARNES

www.wearnesauto.com  christine.yow@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 7 June, 2018 3:14 PM

To: Christine Yow <christine.yow@wearnes.com>; Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@|kkauto.com>
Cc: Lionel Tan <lionel tan@sg.msig-asia.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: MSIG TP SLI7069L/ SIM4861T DOA;24/03/2018

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for your email.

Please note that: -



LKK ref

Officer in charge

CS/MSG18007683/R1vbn2

Veron

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Christine Yow [mailto:christine.yow@wearnes.com]

Sent: Thursday, 7 June 2018 2:49 PM
To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Lionel Tan <lionel tan@sg.msig-asia.com>

Subject: MSIG TP SLI7069L/ SIM4861T DOA;24/03/2018

Dear OIC,

Original copy of the attach will be mail out for your next process.

Best Regards,
Christine Yow

W 4

WEARNES

Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd

249 Alexandra Road Singapore 159935

D (65) 6430 4899

www.wearnesauto.com  christine.yow@wearnes.com

This email, including any attachment, is confidential and may also be privileged.
If you have received it in error, please notify us immediately by reply email and then delete this message from your system.
Please do not copy it or use it for any purpose, or disclose its contents or any attachment to any other person. Thank you.

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE

This e-mail (including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential. The sending of this e-mail to any
person other than the intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that attaches to it. If you are not the intended
recipient, please notify the sender immediately, delete the email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents.



