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1 Vdl 74 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

— g 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industnial Park, Smgapore 408933
‘.-—-A‘_. TEL 6258 3581 FAX: 8256 4315

Reg Mo 169607168R GST Reg. No. 16-9607168-R

Affiliated to Fedaration Internationale Oes Experts En Automaobile

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref CC4/EQI1B007688/Khal
o A MR
W17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date - 26-D4-2018
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code - EQI
% Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBH 1958P Veh. Inspected SJZ 5255T
Policy No. DMCPHQ18-001451 Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. DM18HO00B48-1G Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 26/04/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Modal c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer - Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
I
5, Genaral Information
Accident Date  02/04/2018 |Inspection Date 25/04/2018

Survey heid at LIM TAN MOTOR FTE LTD

BLK 176 SIN MING DRIVE
#03-08 SIN MING AUTOCARE
SINGAPORE 575721

5a. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,
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LIM TAN ©

ESTIMATE TO REPAIR SURVEYOR NAME |
DATE OF SURVEY Arg U1
VEHICLE NO. : SJZ52557 TIME OF SURVEY
MAKE : MERCEDES BENZ
MODEL : C 180 CGl DATE : 23-Apr-18
YEAR : 2010 DATE OF ACCIDENT  : 2-Apr-18
CHASSIS NO : WDD2040492A405978 THIRD PARTY REF ; GBH1958P | EQ INSURANCE
Qty Parts Description/ Labour Type Unit Price I Nett Item Amt Amount
Ew:f ”
1 pc Front Bumper Nett 2 ¢ £ 552000
1 pc N/S Front Bumper Retainer Nett A ey Sl $ €74 19.00
1 pc N/S Headlamp Nett 4 $  670.00
1 pc N/S Front Fender Nett 7§ 430.00
< 1,939.00
Less 10% ] 193.90
$ 1,745.10
Goef
To putty & spray painting. 1 600.00
2
To check front wiring and focus L4 g & 30.00
headlights ¢
e 4
Labour Charges. $ 450.00
ey As7bhersh ”
4 /.@,’. £7
?aé:, 7
A ftanty
not
the Repaiter of ihe faflowing y
'*- Bk rm afre- Moy Dai H_-q
« 10 display lamaomd narg aurnghemavey
= Parmy priceh ure sibsect b2 corfembiion
TG-RA/- TOTAL m i $ 2,825.10
b Sycemeryary o T e
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Catherine Chnna SLI{I{ Auto)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 24 April, 2018 5:14 PM

To: assignments

Subject: FW: Third Party Claim Survey Request - SJZ5255T  Your Insured : GBH1958P

D.0.A : 02/04/2018 (DM18HO00849-)G)

Best Regards,

Ll
Shu Pel| Admin % 5 fl?t ﬂ\ﬁ
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 1\5,‘}\5“‘{'] N YO
Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: ghupei®Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 PR

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408233)

From: Joel Goh [mailto:joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 24 April 2018 5:12 PM

To: richard <richard@Itm.sg>

Ce: mandy@Itm.sg; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Third Party Claim Survey Request - SJZ5255T Your Insured : GBH1958P D.0.A :02/04/2018
(DM18HO00845-G)

Without Prejudice

Dear Richard

We will appoint LKK to survey your client’s vehicle,

Liability Is unclear for this accident as our insured was turning right and your client’s vehicle was overtaking from
right.

Dear LKK

Kindly assist to attend to the following PRS.

Best Regards,
loel Goh
Executive | Claims

egnsurance

L—‘f...,.'".- G—C_urm
EQ Insurance Company Limited
5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6221 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190
Www eqinsurance.com.sg

W\ A Member of Crysuate o——



Priviieged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t

From: richard Ito: ri

Sent: Monday, April 23, 2018 4:55 PM

To: Joel Goh

Ce:

Subject: RE: Third Party Claim Survey Request - SJZ5255T Your Insured : GBH1958P D.0.A : 02/04/2018
(DM18HO00849-1G)

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Our ref : LTPO42018/038 (SJZ5255T)
Your ref : DM18HO00849-1G
Dear loel,

Thank you for your email.

We select LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct the survey to our client’s vehicle
We shall appreciate if you could advise on liability too.

Thank you and regards,

Riskard fip

Claims Executive
Lim Tan Motor Pte Lid

www, LTM.sg
+65 6452 0893 (Office)

+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile)
+65 8484 5418 (Mobile)

Like us in Facebook!!

www.facebook.com/LTMsg
www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore
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From: Joel Goh [mailto:joel.goh@edqinsurance.com.sg]
Sent: Monday, 23 April 2018 3:44 PM

To: richard@Itm sg
Subject: RE: Third Party Claim Survey Request - SJZ5255T Your Insured : GBH1958P D.O.A - 02/04/2018
(DM18HO00B49-1G)

Without Prejudice

Dear Sirs

Kindly email all PRS request to egiprs@eqinsurance.com.sg

We shall be appointing our surveyor to attend to the pre-repair survey of your client’s vehicle.

Below is a list of motor surveyors in our panel. Please revert within 2 working days if you agree or have any
objections to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors. If we do not hear from you, you are deemed to have
agreed to the appointment of any of the motor surveyors listed by us. Alternatively, please specify one or more of
our proposed motor surveyors to the said assignment.

1) AJAX Inspection Services Pte Ltd 2) Automobile Inspection Services Pte Ltd

Tel: 6255 0B08
Fax: 6849 9155
Contact person : loey/loseh

Tel: 6286 0155
Fax: 6284 1539
Contact Person: Sophia

3) LBS Automotive Appraisal Pte Ltd
L.B.S. Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Tel: 6281 6690 / 62832866

Fax: 6281 8748

Contact Person: Amy/ Grace

4)  Priority Services

Tel: 62934822

Fax: 62963283

Contact Person: Sharon Kho

5) RT Appraisal Pte Ltd
Tel: 67486076

Fax: 67480361

Contact Person: Ricky Teng

6) LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 6256-3561
Fax; 6741-4108




7)  Kelvin Automotive Appraising Services 8) Automotive Appraiser & Surveying Services
Tel: 81825263 Tel: 96623655

Fax: 67461148 Fax: 67655662

Contact Person: Kelvin Contact Person; Mr Chee

9) JP Knights Pte Ltd

Tel: 63450068

Fax: 63445328

Contact Person: Edna Lee

If you object to all the motor surveyors as proposed by us, please provide a list of at least 10 motor surveyors whom
you consider as suitable to appoint for our consideration. We shall revert to you within 2 working days.

Meanwhile, we reserve our rights on Post-Repair Inspection, kindly contact us or our appointed surveyor before you
return your client's vehicle to him/her.

Best Regards,

loel Goh
Executive | Claims

eq"nsuronce

L'Luhq-ﬁ"-f::ﬂtr

EQ Insurance Company Limited

3 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190
www.eginsurance.com.sg

b
‘.‘A Wember of Cityatate @———-‘

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify tl

From: richard i
Sent: Monday, April 23, 2018 12:43 PM
To: Marketing

Cc:

mandy@itm.sg
Subject: Third Party Claim Survey Request - SJ25255T Your Insured : GBH1958P D.0.A : 02/04/2018
Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJU DICE
Our ref : LTPD42018/038 (SJZ 5255 T)
Good Afternoon Sir / Madam,

We are assisting our mutual client the vehicle owner of $J25255T to submit a claim against your insured, GBH1958pP
which we understand that you are insurer at the material time of the accident.

We now enclosed the following documents for your easy reference :

4



* Repair Estimate
*  Our mutual client GIA repart

Please let us have a list of your external surveyor for us to choose.

Thank you and regards,

Riskard fiop

Claims Executive
Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd

www. LTM.sg
+65 6452 0893 (Office)

+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile)
+65 8484 5418 (Mobile)

Like us in Facebook!!
face TM
fa com/LTM.Performance. r
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Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 27 April, 2018 11:26 AM

To: 'Joel Goh'

Cc Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Subject: RE: Third Party Claim Survey Request - SJZ5255T Your Insured : GBH1958P
D.OA : 02/04/2018 (DM1BHOO00B49-)G)

Attachments: LKK SURVEY PHOTO,pdf. TP ESTIMATE - MARKED pdf; Preliminary Advice.pdf

Categories: HMK

EQI rel: DM1BHOD0DB49-]G
LKK REF: CC4/EQI18007666 /Kha3

Dear Joel,

We refer to the above matter,
Enclosed revert of vehicle: S]2 5255T
Date of survey: 25.04.2018

We have not authorized repairs.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice
- Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Please take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou.

Hest Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auoto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | emall: MeiKwan@lkkauto com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubs Industral Park, Ubi Avenuve 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 24 April, 2018 5:20 PM

To: 'Joel Goh' <joel goh@eqinsurance.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Third Party Claim Survey Request - SJZ5255T Your Insured : GBH1958P D.O.A : 02/04/2018
(DM18HO00849-1G)

Dear Joel,
Thank you for the assignment

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer arrange survey on 25.04.2018.



W\ A Member of Cay state

P

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient. please notify the

From: richard [mailto:richard@|tm.sq]
Sent: Monday, April 23, 2018 4:55 PM
To: Joal Goh
Cc: mandy@itm.sg
Subject: RE: Third Party Claim Survey Request - SJZ5255T Your Insured : GBH1958P D.O.A : 02/04/2018
{DM18HO0D849-)G)
Importance: High
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Our ref : LTPD42018/038 (5125255 T)
Your ref I DM18HO00D849-1G
Dear Joel,

Thank you for your email,

We select LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd to conduct the survey to our cllent’s vehicle.
We shall appreciate if you could advise on liability too.

Thank you and regards,

Bl kard f‘fsy

Claims Executive
Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd

www. LTM.sg

+65 6452 0893 (Office)
+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile)
+65 8484 5418 (Mobile)

Like us in Facebook!!

www.facebook.com/LTMsg
f . LTM.Performance.Si



7)  Kelvin Automotive Appraising Services 8) Automaotive Appraiser & Surveying Services
Tel: 81825263 Tel: 96623655

Fax: 67461148 Fax: 67655662

Contact Person: Kelvin Contact Person: Mr Chee

9) JP Knights Pte Ltd

Tel: 63450068

Fax: 63445328

Contact Person: Edna Lee

if you object to all the motor surveyars as proposed by us, please provide a list of at least 10 motor surveyors whom
you consider as suitable to appoint for our consideration, We shall revert to you within 2 working days.

Meanwhile, we reserve our rights on Post-Repair Inspection, kindly contact us or our appointed surveyor before you
return your client's vehicle to him/her.

Best Regards,

Joel Gah

Executive | Claims

eqnsuronce

e PR "" R

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complax Singapors DBE3110
did 65 65006772 | tel 685 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 419(

WWW. eQIinsurance. Com.osg

..‘Ammlm ol Ty atate Q

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the

From: richard [mailto:richard@itm.sq]

Sent: Monday, April 23, 2018 12:43 PM

To: Marketing

Cc: mandy@itm.sg

Subject: Third Party Claim Survey Request - SIZ5255T Your Insured : GBH1958P D.O.A : 02/04/2018
Importance: High

W PREJUDICE
Our ref ; LTPO42018/038 (SIZ 5255 T)
Good Afternoon Sir / Madam,

We are assisting our mutual client the vehicle owner of SJ25255T to submit a claim against your insured, GBH1958P
which we understand that you are insurer at the matenial time of the accident.

We now enclosed the following documents for your easy reference :
5



F LTI e

Ada mam m Pl Company Registration No. 199607 198R

1 UBLAVE 180228 PAYA URFINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 4089353 TEL D 1065) 62563561 FAN @ (065 62504315

Your reft DM I1BHOO0849-1G
Owr ref: CC4/EQII 2007666/Khal Date: 26.04.2018

The Motor Claims Department

M/s EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO. SJZ 5255T
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on 25.04.2018
at the premises of M/s Lim Tan Motor Pre Ltd - Sin Ming and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : 58 2,825.10
Revised Esimate Amoumnt : 5% 2.565.10
"Check” ltems Amount : 5% -
Total (Including Check Items) : 58 2.565.10
Market Value : 5% -
LTA Reimbursement Value ' 5% -
Nett Value : 5% -

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the o
N/S Front Portion

Comments/Present Status;
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 4.0 days

Yours faithfully,

KENNETH KONG
Licensed Appraiser



LT LIM TAN
14 MAY 2018

Date: Your Ref: CC4/EQI18007666/Khal
Qur ref: LTPO42018/038 (SJZ 5255 T)

{ WITHOUT PREJUDICE )

Attention To:  MrVic (Fram LKK Auto Consullants Ple Lid)
Insurance Company : EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

+ Dear SirfMdm,
IN THE MATTER OF ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJZ6256T & GEH1858P ON 02.04.2018
We refer to the above matter.

We are instructed and autherised by our client 1o quantify, to act and negollate settiement
In refated lo the above road iraffic accident that was caused by your Insured,

All supparting documents are enclosed herewith:-

[ = ] Authorization To et [ x ] Original Tax Involce no. INV33802
[ ] oOriginal Rental Recelpt and Agresment [ 2 ] GIA search recelpt
[ ] Letter Of Discharge [ 1

Survey was done by Insurance instruction and was surveyed by Mr Kenneth
on 25-Apr-18

As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle was damaged and has been put fo loss and
Expenses, particulars of which are as follows:-

1] Cost of repair (inclusive of 7% G5T) 5 2,193.50
2] LossoluUse 5 280.00
3] GIA Search Repor Fees 5 28.00

$ 502.50

Please acknowledge receipt of this letter within 14 days. If you agreeable to the above, please forward
your payment. Payment to be issued directly to LIM TAN MOTOR PTE LTD within 4 weeks. Should thora

Your faithfully
Mandy Lim

Email: mandy@lim.sq

Lim Tan Moter P2 Lid
Ble 178 Sin Ming Diive #02-08 Sin Ming Aitscare Singapore ST5721
Tob 6584520883 Fan A5-B45881 277 Weabsile www. LTM.sg
Co Rag No 1B830727TD GST Risj Mo M2-001B088.0
Thia gocumaent mist nat be reproduced, in whole o 10 nar_ of disciosed 15 thrd party or parties withoul the pricr wolten corsen: af Lim Tan
Maolor Fre Lio
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- .
Bdm BA & Pg Lid

1 UBLAVE 1, 801-25 PAYA UBIINDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 4085933 TEL : (063) 62563561 FAN 1 1065) 62564315

Our Ref: CC4/EQIIB007666/Kha3
8" May 2018

AVENTURINE ENGINEERING PTE LTD
43 Pava Lebar Crescent,
Singapore 536099,

Attn: Mr Desmond
Dear SirfMadam,

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBH 1958F AND SJZ 5255T ALONG
JUNCTION OF JALAN WANGI AND MULBERRY AVENUE ON 02.04.2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for EQ INSURANCE COMPANY
LIMITED to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Pursuant to the above said accident wherein you and/or your authorized driver had amongst
other information given us your version of how the accident had occurred, we as the
appointed agent of vour insurers shall proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with
third party claimant.

If you have evidence/information to proof that we should not settle the third party claim,
kindly let us have them in writing within the next 10 days by 21/05/2018, afier we shall
proceed with negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis and any
settlement should not bind any claims whatsoever by vow'your driver against the other
party's insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim
and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if vou have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

#

Poh Kin, Chong
Case Handler

DID: 6841 2132
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh(@lkkauto.com

C.C EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LIMITED
{Mortor Claims Dept)



To Whom It May Concern

AUTHORIZATION TOACT

I/'We, HU HUIXIN ('the third party Claimant’) of 22 CHEMPAKA AVENUE

SINGAPORE 349635 (Address) owner of SJZS5255T (vehicle number) hereby
authorize LIM TAN MOTOR PTE LTD ("the workshop') to act for me with respect to

my/our claim for repair costs and/or rental and/or Loss of use ('claim’) for my/our
vehicle number SJZS2SST that was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred

on 02-Apr-18 (date) along MULBERRY AVE JUNCTION JALAN WANGI (locate on)
involving vehicle number GBH1958P (the accident').

I/We further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim
in a manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive
payment further to settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in

favour of the workshop.

Dated this _ 15" _ (day) of April (month) 2018 (year)

s

/

Signed By ' the third party claimant ' Signed By ' the workshop® &



LI/ Vo

Braneh

{Warrarty snd Prerformunce) Bl 9 Sector C #01-38M0/42
Sin Ming Industrial Fstate, Singapore 575644

Tel: +65 6452 2135 Fax: +63 6452 2159

Bik 17 Secior A #01-65
Sin Ming Industrisl Estate, Singapore 573675

LIM TAN MOTOR PTE LTD
HWEREEBRLAFTRRLA

Regnlraten Na (WIGTTID

Cempanyy
OFT Ragmtrgtmn hia 8301 #0800

Main OMice | Workshap

Bik 176 Sin Ming Drive #03-09/10/06
Sin Ming Autocare Singrpore 575721

Tel: +65 6452 0893 (24Hny)
Fax: +65 6458 9127
Email: aales@LTM 5g

WWW.LTM.SG
HU HUIXIN TAX INVOICE
22 CHEMPAKA AVE
SINGAPORE 349635 NO + TNV33902
) DATE 10-05-2018
ATTN : MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT MILEAGE :
TEL & W.ONO, : SO34619 TERMS  : CASH
FAX CARNO, : SJZ5255Z
AJCNO.  : 30HO241 MAKE + MERCEDES BENZ PAGE 1
MODEL @ CI80
DESCRIPTION QTyY UPRICE DIS AMOUNT
I TOLUMP SUM REPAIR AS RECOMMENDED BY SURVEYOR 1 UNIT 2,050.00
SINGAPORE DOLLARS : TWO THOUSAMD ONE HUMDRED NINETY THREE AND FIFTY CEMTS DMLY
REMARKS: DATE OF ACCIDENT: 02 04 2018 TOTAL QTY: 1o | SUBTOTAL 2.050.00
REF: DM18HO00849-1G e
DISCOUNT 0,00
TOTAL’ 2,050,00
GST 7% 143.50
NET 2,193.50
Deposit 0.00
- Balance 2,193.50
AUTHORISED SIGNATURE(SY”  CUSTOMER NAME / SIGNATURE / DATE

I/We confirm that 1/'We Incurred the repair costs herein and will observe my/our Agreement with the repairer. 'We
declare the repair for the above vehicle have been completed to my/our satisfaction



Invoice Page | of |

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

6 Raffies Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
INSURANCE Frone -55 6224 0010 Fax +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm
£ GST Registration No; M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTR

TAX INVOICE

QOur Ref No: GR-1B-050087
Data of Request: 04/04/2018 Your Ref No: SJZ5255T

Lim Tan Motor Pte Lid

Blk 178 Sin Ming Drive #03-0010
Sin Ming Auto Care

Singapore 575721

Dear SirMadam,

Date of Accident: 02/04/2018
Vehicle No: GBH1858P
Place of Accident:  JUMCTION OF JALAN WANGI AND MULBERRY AVE

\With referance to your application for the accidant repari. we have attached the following accident reports as requesled:
DOCUMENTS |ACCIDENT LOCATION PER DOC (5%) |QTY |AMOUNT (S5)
GBH16858P JUNCTION OF JALAN WANGI AND MULBERRY AVE 14.00(1 13.08
GST Amount 0.82
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 14.00

The images provided to you are taken from the original reparts forwarded o the centre by the members of the General
Insurance Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no
liability whatsoaver lor any loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

Thank You.
This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRO [] Cash [ ] Cheque

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp_ge... 4/4/2018
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GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phaone: +85 6224 0010 Fax +65 6224 0030
Dperating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to Spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE G Reaistration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE
Our Ref No: GR-18-040424
Date of Reguest: 03/04/2018 Your Rel No: SJZ5255T
Lim Tan Motor Pte Lid
Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive #03-09M10
Sin Ming Auto Care
Singapore 575721
Dear SirMadam,
Your Search Criteria:
Date of Accident: 02/04/2018
Place of Accident: MULBERRY AVE JUNC OF JLN WANGI
Cliant Vehicle No:  SJZ5265T
DESCRIFTION AMOUNT (5%)
E-Flle Search Fee (Public) 14.02
GST Amount 0.98
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 15.00

Thank You

This is 8 computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official usa:
Date:
[%] GIRO [] Cash [ | Cheque

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp_ge... 3/4/2018



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Monday, 4 March, 2019 4:28 PM

To: Mandy

Ce: Admin A; richard; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Pending Offer / Status - Your Ref: SJZ 5255T_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES

GBH 1958P AND SJZ 52557 ON 02/04/2018 LKK REF : CC4/EQI1B007666/Kha3

Without Prejudice
Dear Mandy,
We refer to the below email.

Please be informed that our principal had further reviewed the matter and based on the available information and
evidence provided, our principal is in the view that our Insured Driver is not liable of this accident.

Qur Insured reported that he was within its lane when making a turn and that your client reported that he was
overtaking him when the accident happened.

As such, we have our principal’s instruction and we are unable to look into your client’s claim.

Thank you.

Best Regards.
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LEK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Indostrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

LEK 55 con the carth Print oty when necessary

This &-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the Intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended reciplent is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you befieve that you received this e-mall in error, please do not
read this a-mall or any attached items. Please delste the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sander thal you have deleted the e-mail. all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you

From: Mandy [mailto:mandy@Itm.sg]

Sent: Monday, 11 February, 2019 2:42 PM

To: joel.goh@eqginsurance.com.sg

Ce: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A; richard

Subject: RE: Pending Offer / Status - Your Ref: SJZ 5255T_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBH 1958P AND 5JZ
5255T ON 02/04/2018 LKK REF : CC4/EQI18007666/Kka3

Importance: High

w PREJUDICE (Save As To 5 URGENT

Dear Joel,



Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eginsurance.comsg>

Sent: Monday, 11 February, 2019 5:45 PM

To: Vic (LKKAUto)

Ce: Admin A

Subject: RE: Pending Offer / Status - Your Ref: SJZ 5255T_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES

GBH 1958P AND SJZ 5255T ON 02/04/2018 LKK REF : CC4/EQI18007666/Kka3
(DM18HO00849-)G)

Dear Vic
Please proceed to reject third party claim based on BOLA 33.
Best Regards,

Joel Goh
Executive | Claims

ec'insuronce

M G Trendhe

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Apad #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110

did 65 6500 6772 | tel 65 6223 9423 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190

WWW 20 INSUrance.com.sg <

Jﬁawum *—

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t!

From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com]
Sent: Monday, February 11, 2019 3:37 PM

To: Joel Goh

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Pending Offer / Status - Your Ref: SJZ 5255T_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBH 1958P AND SJZ
5255T ON 02/04/2018 LKK REF : CC4/EQI18007666/Kka3 (DM1BHO00849-1G)

Dear Joel,
We refer to your below emall.
| apologize as the email | am preparing is still in my draft folder and | overlooked to send the email previously.

Anyway, with regards to this matter, we had spoken to the Insured Driver where he insisted that he is not at fault for
this matter. Insured Driver however, does not have any evidence to support his claim.

we are of the view that our Insured Driver may not be liable of the accident. Our Insured Driver reported that he was
driving along the lane and was making a turn when hit by TP vehicle that was overtaking and was travelling against
the flow to also turn at the junction. TP repairer informed that they do not have any evidence to support their client,

In view of the above, please advise if we can proceed to offer a 50/50 settlement in view of conflicting versions or to
deny their claim since TP was overtaking Insured vehicle as report.



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh®lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrinl Park. Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

¥y AP
LKK = Save the Earth- Print only when pecessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distnibution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you belleve that you received this e-mall in eror, please do nol
read this e-mail or any atiached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender thal you have deleted the e-mail, all altachmenis and any copies thereof. Thank you

From: Joel Goh [mailto:joel.goh@eqinsurance.com.sg)

Sent: Monday, 11 February, 2019 3:05 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: RE: Pending Offer / Status - Your Ref: SJZ 5255T_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBH 1958P AND 512
5255T ON 02/04/2018 LKK REF : CC4/EQI18007666/Kka3 (DM1BHO00B49-IG)

Dear Vic
Please advise when was the emall sent.
Best Regards,

Joel Goh
Executive | Claims

ecinsuronce

Mo G Trandds

EQ Insurance Company Limited

5 Maxwell Road #17-00 Tower Block MND Complex Singapore 069110
did 65 65006772 | tel 65 6223 9433 ext 772 | fax 65 6223 4190
www.eqinaurance.cnm 5B

<
W\ A Member of Cityrtate o

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify t!

From: Mandy [mailto:mandy@itm.sq]
Sent: Monday, February 11, 2019 2:42 PM
To: Joe| Goh

Cc: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com; ‘Admin A’; richard

Subject: RE: Pending Offer / Status - Your Ref; SJZ 5255T_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES GBH 1958P AND SJZ
5255T ON 02/04/2018 LKK REF : CC4/EQI18007666/Kka3

Importance: High



y L7 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

-
51';‘—!
TEL. 6358 3581 FAX 6258 4315

&1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933

Reg. No: 1996807T18BR GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R

Afflliated to Federation internationale Des Experts En Automaobila

EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD Ref : CCA/EQI1B007E66/Khalqg2
ot o |IRRIATI
#17-00 TOWER BLOCK Date:. 05-03-2019
MND COMPLEXSINGAPORE 069110
Code: EQI
1 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. GBH 1958P Veh. Inspected SJZ 52557
Policy No. DMCPHQ18-001451 Coverage () 0.00
Claim No. DM1BHODDB48-JG Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From JOEL Assign Date 24/04/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model MERCEDES BENZ C 180(A) |ec.c 1788
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2010
Chassis No. WDDZ2040452A405978 Colour METALLIC SILVER
Odometer 88502 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Madification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/45 R17 CONTINENTAL & mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/45R17 CONTINENTAL & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |225/45R17 CONTINENTAL & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |225/M45R17 CONTINENTAL & mm
4 Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date 02/04/2018 Inspection Date 25/04/2018
Survey held at LIM TAN MOTOR PTE LTD
BLK 176 SIN MING DRIVE
#03-09 SIN MING AUTOCARE
SINGAPORE 575721
5a. Remarks.
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR; 4 Working Days




il BB B

174 74

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL 6258 3561 FAXM 6258 4315

Reg No; 198607 188R GST Reg. No, 19-9607198-R Page No.-1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJZ 5255T
Description of Parts Condition | EStimate By
Oty i Workshop (§)) ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER (N) DISTORTED / 820.00 820.00
BUCKLED
1|N/S FRONT BUMPER RETAINER (N} CRACKED 18.00 18.00
1|N/S HEADLAMP (N) MTG CRACKED / 670.00 670.00
cuT
1|NS FRONT FENDER (N} TORN 430.00 430.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT -193.90 -183.90
1.745.10 1,745.10
LABOUR
TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING. B00.00 40000
TO CHECK FRONT WIRING AND FOCUS HEADLIGHTS 30,00 20.00
LABOUR CHARGES. 450.00 400.00
1,080.00 820.00
GRAND TOTAL 282510 2,565.10
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 1 . 2,050.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CC4/EQI18007666/Kha3q2

Y 494

KONG SENG CHEONG

Licensed Appraiser

DHSCLAMER OF LIABILTTY TD THIRD FPANTIES: - Thevs Hepoerl is mate soisry for (he use and benefia of e Clieni namsa on ine froni page of inis Repart




