Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 21 June 2019 10:13 AM
To: kenneth ding; 'Michelle’
Cc: 'Carlor Chan'; 'Kelly Ding'; 'Ding Ding Auto’; 'Sales Ding Auto’; ‘Alex’; 'You jingfeng'; 'Dd
hashim'; duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg; ACCOUNTS@DINGAUTO.SG
Subject: RE: BILLING FOR SLL715R TP CLAIMS AGAINST FBD5955S ON 23/4/2018
Attachments: Ol SKETCH PLAN.pdf; SKETCH PLAN.pdf
‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS
Hi Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.
ACCIDENT INVOLVING FBD 59558 (Ol) & SLL 715R (TP) & SDK 72L (OTHER) ON 23/04/2018

We attached here with a copy of our insured’s accident statement and our insured police investigation result for your
easy reference.

Our principal has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client make a lane change
to the left and collided into our insured in which collided into other party.

We are of the opinion that liability is not in your client’s favor.

Under such a circumstances, we regret to inform you that we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable
to look into your client’s claim.
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Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108




Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: kenneth ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 15 June 2019 12:02 PM

To: 'kenneth ding' <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; 'Michelle'
<accounts@dingauto.sg>

Cc: 'Carlor Chan' <carlor.chan@dingauto.sg>; 'Kelly Ding' <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'Ding Ding Auto'
<ding@dingauto.sg>; 'Sales Ding Auto' <sales@dingauto.sg>; 'Alex' <admin@dingauto.sg>; 'You jingfeng'
<jingfeng@dingauto.sg>; 'Dd hashim' <dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>; duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg;
ACCOUNTS@DINGAUTO.SG

Subject: RE: BILLING FOR SLL715R TP CLAIMS AGAINST FBD5955S ON 23/4/2018

Dear Asher,

Good day to you.

We would like to check and follow up if there is any offer for this case.
Thank you and we look forward to hear from you soon.

Best Regards,
Kenneth Ding
HP: 92313123
Fax: 6452 0614

From: kenneth ding [mailto:kenneth.ding@dingauto.sq]

Sent: Thursday, May 16, 2019 1:24 PM

To: 'kenneth ding'; 'Asher Sng (LKKAuto)'; 'Michelle'

Cc: 'Carlor Chan'; 'Kelly Ding'; 'Ding Ding Auto'; 'Sales Ding Auto'; 'Alex'; 'You jingfeng'; 'Dd hashim';
duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg; ACCOUNTS@DINGAUTO.SG

Subject: RE: BILLING FOR SLL715R TP CLAIMS AGAINST FBD5955S ON 23/4/2018

Dear Asher,

Good day to you.

We would like to follow up if there is any offer for this case.
Thank you and we look forward to hear from you soon.

Best Regards,
Kenneth Ding
HP: 92313123
Fax: 6452 0614

From: kenneth ding [mailto:Kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, March 6, 2019 11:47 AM

To: 'Asher Sng (LKKAuto)'; 'Michelle'

Cc: 'Carlor Chan'; 'Kelly Ding'; 'Ding Ding Auto'; 'Sales Ding Auto'; 'Alex’; 'You jingfeng'; 'Dd hashim';
'duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg'

Subject: RE: BILLING FOR SLL715R TP CLAIMS AGAINST FBD5955S ON 23/4/2018

Dear Asher,



Thank you for your reply.
Please let me know if you receive it.
Thank you so much.

Best Regards,
Kenneth Ding
HP: 92313123
Fax: 6452 0614

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, March 6, 2019 11:33 AM

To: kenneth ding; 'Michelle'

Cc: 'Carlor Chan'; 'Kelly Ding'; 'Ding Ding Auto'; 'Sales Ding Auto'; 'Alex'; 'You jingfeng'; 'Dd hashim';
duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg

Subject: RE: BILLING FOR SLL715R TP CLAIMS AGAINST FBD5955S ON 23/4/2018

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Kenneth,

We refer to the email below.

We yet to received any PIR till date.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: kenneth ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 5 March 2019 10:40 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>; 'Michelle' <accounts@dingauto.sg>

Cc: 'Carlor Chan' <carlor.chan@dingauto.sg>; 'Kelly Ding' <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'Ding Ding Auto'
<ding@dingauto.sg>; 'Sales Ding Auto' <sales@dingauto.sg>; 'Alex' <admin@dingauto.sg>; 'You jingfeng'
<jingfeng@dingauto.sg>; 'Dd hashim' <dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>; duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg

Subject: RE: BILLING FOR SLL715R TP CLAIMS AGAINST FBD5955S ON 23/4/2018

Dear Asher,

Good day to you.



We would like to follow up on the offer for this case if your have receive the PIR.
Kindly help to check and get back to us.
Thank you so much.

Best Regards,
Kenneth Ding
HP: 92313123
Fax: 6452 0614

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, December 31, 2018 11:44 AM

To: Michelle

Cc: Kenneth Ding; 'Carlor Chan'; 'Kelly Ding'; 'Ding Ding Auto'; 'Sales Ding Auto'; 'Alex’; 'You jingfeng'; 'Dd hashim’;
duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg

Subject: RE: BILLING FOR SLL715R TP CLAIMS AGAINST FBD5955S ON 23/4/2018

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Michelle,
We refer to the email below.
Our principal request a copy of the PIR from your client in order for us to offer.

Please get a copy of the PIR from your client as there are too many vehicle involved.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(40893)
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& HAPPY NEW YEAR

From: Michelle <accounts@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Monday, 31 December 2018 11:16 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'Carlor Chan' <carlor.chan@dingauto.sg>; 'Kelly Ding'
<kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'Ding Ding Auto' <ding@dingauto.sg>; 'Sales Ding Auto' <sales@dingauto.sg>; 'Alex'
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<admin@dingauto.sg>; 'You jingfeng' <jingfeng@dingauto.sg>; 'Dd hashim' <dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>;
duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg
Subject: Re: BILLING FOR SLL715R TP CLAIMS AGAINST FBD5955S ON 23/4/2018

Dear Asher,

Good day to you and hope this email serve you well.

We would like to check and follow up on the status and offer for this case as we have not hear from you.
Kindly please provide us your offer or status for us to close this case on our end.

We sincerely look forward to receive your offer for our claims.

Thank you so much.

Yours sincerely
Michelle Fang
92394128

Ding Auto Pte Ltd

On 8/10/2018 12:35 PM, Asher Sng (LKKAuto) wrote:
Without Prejudice

Hi Kenneth,

We refer to the email below.

Our principal request a copy of the PIR from your client in order for us to offer.
Please get a copy of the PIR from your client as there are too many vehicle involved.
Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Monday, 8 October 2018 11:40 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; 'Michelle' <accounts@dingauto.sg>; 'Carlor Chan'
<carlor.chan@dingauto.sg>

Cc: 'Kelly Ding' <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'Ding Ding Auto' <ding@dingauto.sg>; 'Sales Ding Auto'
<sales@dingauto.sg>; 'Alex' <admin@dingauto.sg>; 'You jingfeng' <jingfeng@dingauto.sg>; 'Dd hashim'




<dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>; duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg
Subject: RE: BILLING FOR SLL715R TP CLAIMS AGAINST FBD5955S ON 23/4/2018

Dear Asher,
Good day to you and hope this email serve you well.

We would like to follow up if there is any offer from your side for this case as we have not receive the
PIR from our driver yet.

Thank you and we look forward to hear from you soon.

Best Regards,
Kenneth Ding
HP: 92313123
Fax: 6452 0614

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, August 27, 2018 1:06 PM

To: Kenneth Ding; 'Michelle'; 'Carlor Chan'

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'; 'Ding Ding Auto'; 'Sales Ding Auto'; 'Alex'; 'You jingfeng'; 'Dd hashim';
duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg

Subject: RE: BILLING FOR SLL715R TP CLAIMS AGAINST FBD5955S ON 23/4/2018

Without Prejudice

Hi Kenneth,

We refer to the email below.

Please request a copy of the PIR from your client in order for us to complete the claim.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Saturday, 25 August 2018 2:01 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com>; 'Michelle' <accounts@dingauto.sg>; 'Carlor Chan'
<carlor.chan@dingauto.sg>

Cc: 'Kelly Ding' <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'Ding Ding Auto' <ding@dingauto.sg>; 'Sales Ding Auto'
<sales@dingauto.sg>; 'Alex' <admin@dingauto.sg>; 'You jingfeng' <jingfeng@dingauto.sg>; 'Dd hashim'
<dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>; duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg

Subject: RE: BILLING FOR SLL715R TP CLAIMS AGAINST FBD5955S ON 23/4/2018

Dear Asher,



Good day to you and hope this email serve you well.

We would like to check and follow up on the status and offer for this case as we have not hear from
you.

Kindly please provide us your offer or status for us to close this case on our end.
We sincerely look forward to receive your offer for our claims.
Thank you so much.

Best Regards,
Kenneth Ding
HP: 92313123
Fax: 6452 0614

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, August 7, 2018 8:42 AM

To: Kenneth Ding; 'Michelle'

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'; 'Ding Ding Auto'; 'Sales Ding Auto'; 'Alex'; 'You jingfeng'; 'Dd hashim';
duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg

Subject: RE: BILLING FOR SLL715R TP CLAIMS AGAINST FBD5955S ON 23/4/2018

Without Prejudice

Hi Kenneth,

We refer to the email below.

We yet to receive any PIR.

Please request a copy of the PIR from your client in order for us to complete the claim.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>

Sent: Monday, 6 August 2018 4:57 PM

To: 'Kenneth Ding' <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>;
'Michelle' <accounts@dingauto.sg>

Cc: 'Kelly Ding' <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'Ding Ding Auto' <ding@dingauto.sg>; 'Sales Ding Auto'
<sales@dingauto.sg>; 'Alex' <admin@dingauto.sg>; 'You jingfeng' <jingfeng@dingauto.sg>; 'Dd hashim'
<dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>; duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg

Subject: RE: BILLING FOR SLL715R TP CLAIMS AGAINST FBD5955S ON 23/4/2018

Dear Asher,



Just to check and follow up with you, any PIR from your insurer as we have not receive it from our
insurer.

Thank you and please provide us with an offer if any feedback from your insurer.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Kenneth Ding
HP: 92313123
Fax: 6452 0614

From: Kenneth Ding [mailto:kenneth.ding@dingauto.sq]

Sent: Monday, June 18, 2018 11:22 AM

To: 'Asher Sng (LKKAuto)'; 'Michelle'

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'; 'Ding Ding Auto'; 'Sales Ding Auto'; 'Alex'; 'You jingfeng'; 'Dd hashim';
'duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg'

Subject: RE: BILLING FOR SLL715R TP CLAIMS AGAINST FBD5955S ON 23/4/2018

Dear Asher,

Noted with thanks.

We will forward the PIR to you if there is any news from our insured as well.
Kindly help to inform us as well if any from your side.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Kenneth Ding

HP: 92313123
Fax: 6452 0614

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, June 18, 2018 9:27 AM

To: Kenneth Ding; 'Michelle'

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'; 'Ding Ding Auto'; 'Sales Ding Auto'; 'Alex’; 'You jingfeng'; 'Dd hashim’;
duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg

Subject: RE: BILLING FOR SLL715R TP CLAIMS AGAINST FBD5955S ON 23/4/2018

Without Prejudice

Hi Kenneth,

We refer to the email below.

We yet to receive any PIR.

Please request a copy of the PIR from your client in order for us to complete the claim.

Thank You.



Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Kenneth Ding [mailto:kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg]

Sent: Saturday, 16 June 2018 12:46 PM

To: 'Kenneth Ding' <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ikkauto.com>;
'Michelle' <accounts@dingauto.sg>

Cc: 'Kelly Ding' <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'Ding Ding Auto' <ding@dingauto.sg>; 'Sales Ding Auto'
<sales@dingauto.sg>; 'Alex' <admin@dingauto.sg>; 'You jingfeng' <jingfeng@dingauto.sg>; 'Dd hashim'
<dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>; duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg

Subject: RE: BILLING FOR SLL715R TP CLAIMS AGAINST FBD5955S ON 23/4/2018

Dear Asher,

Good afternoon to you.

Just to check and follow up on the status of this claims.
Any result for the PIR?

Thank you so much.

Best Regards,
Kenneth Ding
HP: 92313123
Fax: 6452 0614

From: Kenneth Ding [mailto:kenneth.ding@dingauto.sq]

Sent: Friday, June 8, 2018 10:33 AM

To: 'Asher Sng (LKKAuto)'; 'Michelle'

Cc: 'Kelly Ding'; 'Ding Ding Auto'; 'Sales Ding Auto'; 'Alex’; 'You jingfeng'; 'Dd hashim';
'duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg'

Subject: RE: BILLING FOR SLL715R TP CLAIMS AGAINST FBD5955S ON 23/4/2018

Dear Asher,
Ok sure, please let us know once there is any result for this case.
Thank you so much.

Best Regards,
Kenneth Ding
HP: 92313123
Fax: 6452 0614

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, June 7, 2018 12:37 PM
To: Kenneth Ding; 'Michelle'




Cc: 'Kelly Ding'; 'Ding Ding Auto'; 'Sales Ding Auto'; 'Alex’; 'You jingfeng'; 'Dd hashim';
duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg
Subject: RE: BILLING FOR SLL715R TP CLAIMS AGAINST FBD5955S ON 23/4/2018

Without Prejudice

Hi Kenneth,

We refer to the email below.

As per our previous tele-conversation.

We need the PIR in order to review the case as the liability is unclear.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Kenneth Ding [mailto:kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg]

Sent: Thursday, 7 June 2018 12:35 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>; 'Michelle' <accounts@dingauto.sg>

Cc: 'Kelly Ding' <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>; 'Ding Ding Auto' <ding@dingauto.sg>; 'Sales Ding Auto'
<sales@dingauto.sg>; 'Alex' <admin@dingauto.sg>; 'You jingfeng' <jingfeng@dingauto.sg>; 'Dd hashim'
<dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>; duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg

Subject: RE: BILLING FOR SLL715R TP CLAIMS AGAINST FBD5955S ON 23/4/2018

Dear Asher,

There is no video for this accident.

Please advice Michelle on case status as we wish to close the case as soon as possible.
Thank you so much.

Best Regards,

Kenneth Ding

HP: 92313123
Fax: 6452 0614

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:AsherSng@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, June 6, 2018 2:55 PM

To: Michelle

Cc: Kenneth Ding; Kelly Ding; Ding Ding Auto; Sales Ding Auto; Alex; You jingfeng; Dd hashim;
duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg

Subject: RE: BILLING FOR SLL715R TP CLAIMS AGAINST FBD5955S ON 23/4/2018

Without Prejudice
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Hi Michelle,
We refer to the email below.

Please refer to the enclosed email from Kenneth, the liability is unclear for this case we are still pending
evidence from your client.

Thank You.

Best Regards,
Asher Sng | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

phone: 6841-6051 | email: ashersng@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Michelle [mailto:accounts@dingauto.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 6 June 2018 2:45 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Kenneth Ding <kenneth.ding@dingauto.sg>; Kelly Ding <kelly.ding@dingauto.sg>; Ding Ding Auto
<ding@dingauto.sg>; Sales Ding Auto <sales@dingauto.sg>; Alex <admin@dingauto.sg>; You jingfeng
<jingfeng@dingauto.sg>; Dd hashim <dd.hashim@dingauto.sg>; duan.hongbo@dingauto.sg

Subject: Re: BILLING FOR SLL715R TP CLAIMS AGAINST FBD5955S ON 23/4/2018

Dear Asher,

Any update on the states for this case ?
Kindly revert back with an offer as soon as possible.

Thank you so much

Yours sincerely

Michelle Fang

92394128

Ding Auto Pte Ltd

On 23/5/2018 9:33 AM, Michelle wrote:

Morning Asher,

Please view attached file for the hiring agreement.
Kindly revert back with an offer as soon as possible.

Thank you so much

Yours sincerely
Michelle Fang
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92394128
Ding Auto Pte Ltd

On 22/5/2018 5:08 PM, Michelle wrote:

Dear Asher,
Please see attached supporting document to claims against your insured .

We have completed the repair, driver has collected the vehicle and your surveyor
has finalize the repair at $5400 — total 7 days repair job.

We would like to claim for our insured as per following :

Total Number of days : 12 (Due to weekend)
Repair Cost : $5400 + 7% = $5778

Loss of Use : $120 x 12 = $1440

Loss of Income : $36.25 x 12 = $435

LTA Search Fee : $1.87 + 7% = S2

Kindly revert back with an offer so that we can close the case as soon as
possible.

Yours Sincerely,
Michelle Fang
92394128

Ding Auto Pte Ltd

Yours Sincerely,
Michelle Fang

92394128

Ding Auto Pte Ltd

Ding Automotive Pte Ltd

Yours Sincerely,
Michelle Fang

92394128

Ding Auto Pte Ltd

Ding Automotive Pte Ltd

Virus-free. www.avast.com

Yours Sincerely,
Michelle Fang
92394128

NOTE !!!
All mailed letter & cheque payment is to be mailed to our main office address
BLOCK 10 #01-20
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SINGAPORE 575645

SEC C
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