Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuUtD)

Sent: Wednesday, 18 July, 2018 327 PM

To: Jjason@fastechauto.com.sg

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Nancy Lam

Subject: Your Ref; SLD 7643K_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SCA 12185 AND 51D 7643K
ON 24/04/2018

Attachments: VIDEQ.MP4

Your Ref: SLD 7643K Without Prejudice

Our Ref: CCB/CTI18007629/Uha3

Dear Jason,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SCA 12185 AND SLD 7643K ON 24,/04/2018
We refer to the subject matter,

Please be informed that our principal is in the view that our Insured is not liable of this accident as it shows that our
Insured was travelling within its lane across the junction when the accident happened, A copy of our Insured's video
footage was attached for your reference.

As such, we have our principal’s instruction and we are unable to look further into your claim.

We will now close this matter.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Lud

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)
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Save the Earth- Frint only when necéssary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged malerial, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prehibited, and may be a viclation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in emor, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sendar that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any coples thereof. Thank you.



Vic (LKKAuto)
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From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 18 July, 2018 2:53 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto); Admin A; valerie@layauto.com

Cc: Elaine Cheong; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow; KKLau; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong
(LKKAUto)

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SCA12185 (01 ; CTI - SNM18D02131C02)
AND SLD7643K (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18007629/Uha3) on 24/04/2018

Attachments: leeSZ SNM1BD0O2131C02-SCA12185-
LKKDirectSettlementAccidentLtr CLCR95.086.pdf; MNA118054460-SCA12185.PDF;
VIDEQ.mp4

LKK REF - CC6/CTI18007629/Uha3
CTI REF —5NM18D02131C02/8 (SCA1218S)

Dear Vic

We refer to your emails pertaining to the above matter.
Please proceed to reject the third party property claim based on Insured’s video footage.

Aside to Valerie of M/s Lay Auto Pte Ltd, please assist to check with mutual client (Mr Tan Seng Kee) on his claim
against SLD7643K. (Successful OR rejected)

Aside to Elaine, please assist to keep track on the matter.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd,

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909
DID: +65 6389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sqg.cntaiping.com

www.sg.cntaiping.com
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Disclaimer ;

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid except
where provided for in a written agreement between yvou and China Taiping lnsurance (Singapore) Pre. Ltd. Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, iy prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message,
please notify the sender immediarely,



From: Vic (LEKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, July 18, 2018 11:12 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vic (LKKAuto)
<vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Irene Tay <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SCA12185 (01 : CTI - SNM18D02131C02) AND SLD7643K (TP : LKK
REF - CCB/CTI18007629/Uha3) on 24/04/2018

CTI REF - SNM18D02131C02
LKK REF — CC6/CTI18007629/Uha3

Dear Irene,

We refer further to the below email and to our telephone conversation previously.

We had spoken to the Insured Mr Tan where he disputed on the liability and insisted that the TP driver was at fault.

As such, we had requested for a copy of his video footage to support his version of the accident. Please find attached
copy of the footage for your reference.

Based on the footage, we are of the view that Insured vehicle was within its lane while crossing the junction when hit
by TP vehicle.

In view of the above, we intend to reject the TP claim.
For your approval and/or further instruction please.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Ple Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law, If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender thal you have deleted the e-mail, all altachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 27 April, 2018 4:49 PM

To: Vic [LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SCA12185 (Ol : CTI - SNM18D02131C02) AND SLD7643K (TP : LKK
REF - CCE/CTI18007629/Uhal) on 24/04/2018

To check availahility of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.
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Thank vou,

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Lid

Phone: 6366 ooss5 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Lucas Lee [mailto:lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com)

Sent: Friday, 27 April, 2018 4:20 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@|kkauto.com>

Subject: RE; Direct Settlerment - Accident Involving SCA12185 (01 : CTI- SNM18D02131C02) AND S5LD7643K (TP : LKK
REF - CC6/CTI18007629/Uha3) on 24/04/2018

Dear Sirs,
Kindly refer to the above attachment.

Case Handler: Irene Tay

Lucas Lee

Claims Department (Motor)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 078908
Direct (65) 63849 6181

Fax (B5)6222 7175

Email; lucas lee@sg.cnfaiping.com

Website: www sg.cntaiping.com
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Disclaimer :

This message is confidential: ity contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Led except
where provided for in g written agreemrent between vou and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Ltd. Any wnauthorized
disclosure, wse or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If vou are not the intended recipient of the message,
please motify the sender immediately

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 27 April, 2018 11:03 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Irene Tay; Lucas Lee; Vic (LKKAuto); Bevan Lim (LKK Auto); Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SCA1218S (Ol : CTI - TBA) AND SLD7643K (TP : LKK REF -
CCB/CTI18007629/Uha3) on 24/04/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Drear 5ir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case.

Woe had inspected TP vehicle 5LD 7643K at M/s Fastech Auto Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
: TP GIA report
- Photographs of TF vehicle in its damaged condition

Please note that the estimated cost of repair is not ready yet.

We will revert to you on preliminary advice in due course,
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6366 o055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)
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