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- A Crmsii irants

R BA B Pie Lid Company Regiatration Mo, 19360T198R
S1UBEAYE 1, #12-25 PAYA UBE INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 ‘TEL @ (063) 62363561 FAX 63} B25A4731 5
Your ref: D18003179MF5H

Qur ref: CS/FCI18007619/5vh Date: 27/4/18

The Motor Claims Department
M/s First Capital Insurance Limited

Dear SirfMadam

Without Prejudice

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. _SLR 8218A

We thank for your instruction on

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

vehicle on 25/4/2018 at the premises of M/s

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
"Check" ltems Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Nett Value

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the

front n/s portion and n/s front portion.

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithtully,

YEANG WAI KEEN
Automolive Assessor

WORLD AUTO PTE LTD

: §523,501.04

1 5517,192.64

: §$3,390.00

(5%

1 5%

1 5%
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MS‘ FifSlCapital M5 First Capital Insurance Limited cofes No. 1950001050 05T Reg 1. M2-0001675.9

& Raffles Quay 421-00 Singapore D48580
Tel: (65) 222 2311 Fax (55) 6222 3547

Claima. & Hater Undereriting Cept 36 Robinson Aoad #16-01 City House Singapere 058877
Tel [65) 6507 3848 Fax: (B5) 6507 3849
wiahwi. mafirstoapital. com.sg

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Date 23-04-2018 Our Ref No. D18003179MFSH
Accident Date 21-04-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHC1470J Third Party Vehicle. SLRE218A
Survey Location NO.1, KRANJI LOOP
Contact Person, DAMNIEL
Contact No. 63621778/ 0 Fax No. 64557576
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:
Appointed

ppoin LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person MNA Fax No. 68416315
Contact Number, NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report,

THIRD FARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop WORLD AUTO PTELTD Attention. NIL
Cc : TP Solicitor MNA TP Solicitor Fax No. MNA
Officer Incharge MAY CHUA

IMPORTANT NOTE
Kindly submit the survey repor via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated letter, na signature required.




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 27 April 2018 12:21 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’

Cc: MAYCHUA@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18003179MFSH/1, SLR B218A
Attachments: SLR 8218A PREL! ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLR 8218A
Date of survey: 25/4/2018
Number of days:10 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 25 April 2018 10:10 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’ <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: MAYCHUA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18003179MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8444 | email: assipnments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{g08933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg)

Sent: Wednesday, 25 April, 2018 9:17 AM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@ LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; MAYCHUA@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18003179MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,



Admin Team

" Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited

Tel : 6507 3848
Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

#

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 2 July 2018 2:52 PM
To: 'tgttan@worldauto.com.sg’
Cc: SUR

Subject: RE: PENDING FINALIZE

Dear Sophia.

Noted with thanks.

Final invoice and all supporting documents sent over to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email ;sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: tgttan@worldauto.com.sg [mailto:tgttan@worldauto.com Sg]
Sent: Monday, 2 July 2018 2:45 PM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: PENDING FINALIZE

HiVeron
Finalised COR @ 517192.64 and 10 days of repairs.

Rdgs
Sophia Tan
World Auto Pte Ltd (Kranji)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Friday, 29 June 2018 3:50 PM

To: tgttan@worldauto.com.sg
Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: PENDING FINALIZE

Dear Sophia,
WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Finalize amount $17,192.64 before GST @ 10 working days

Kindly confirmed.

Best Regards,



Veron Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 25 June 2018 5:34 PM
To: tettan@worldauto.com.sg
Subject: PENDING FINALIZE

Dear Sophia,

Kindly advise vehicle status.

If vehicle has been repaired, please forward us resurvey photos for finalize.

1) SLR 8218A-DOA: 21/4/2018
2) SLE 9188P-DOA: 14/5/2018

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)
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CASH SALE/WORK ORDER

Wik o 2 R
SPEEDWAY RECOVERY SERVICE

No: C 22424

Reg N: 52977287 Singapore Post Centre Post Office P.O. Box 201 Singapore 314007 & t% ﬁf / ,J' é;
Tel: 6841 0080 Date:.
’~ ‘1/ /{ [] Jump Start
N ) J [ ] Tyre Replacement
Name/Company : L""'”“ \ [{ P - [HaeerdtitBreakdown
7 ] Multi/Basement
Vehicie No. C(,f?\ g ) _,Ig ﬂ__MDdEl /f?{rﬁ/p" ! DWith Load/Cargo Box
,} [] King Dally
’-/ /? /}’ (‘J i 4 [ ] Transport Charge
From . el! ] Low Body Kit
[] Door Opening Service
To / /C‘I"T & ] ﬂ LL - J[ [] Crane Up/Winch Out

[] Collect Doc/Key
[] Repo Payment

I:, Trips

(L0 L) [T e s el

Remarks

Time:

MOTE: Vehicle is towad &t owner's risk. The Gunmnu ameplamnmnﬁbllly for damages o ather misdemeancis to your vehicle whilsl h-lrlqtcmd.

24 HRS TOWING SERVICE
\({ 6841 0080 MW
a ' Heeewed 1_.r

— c www.speedwayrecovery.com
Tow Truc Email: speedwaytowing@gmail.com




WORLD AUTO PTE LTD

47 Jalan Pemimpin #01-02/03

Halcyon 2, S'pore 577200

Tel No. : 6451 3933 Fax No. : 6455 7576
E-Mail : worldaut@singnet.com.sg

Website : www.worldauto.com.sqg
Tax Reg. No. : 200006765-H Buss. Reg. No, : 200006765H

Page 1/3

FIRST CAPITAL INSSURANCE LIMITED Estimate : ES201856
80 ROBINSON RD #09-02/03
068898 Date : 24/04/2018
Vehicle Num. : SLR 8218A (LCR)
Attention : Motor Claim Department CITI ahe_:!Mndel ; HONDA SHUTTLE HYBRID
assis/Eng# :

Contact : 6222 2311 Fax Mo. : 6222 3547 Accident Date : 21/04/2018

Claim Mo. :

Reference :

Policy No. :
SN Quantity  Particular Unit Price  Amount 5%

LIST ITEMS :

1. 1 FRONT BUMPER bk 1,100.00 -+
2. 1 FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT ' 485.80- 1"
3. 1 FRONT BUMPER UNDERDUST COVER . 175.00 - ietoe
4. 2 FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER - % 78.00 166,001
5. 1 FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE 122,00
6. 1 FRONT FENDER LH VLT 48990 "'
7. A1 FRONT FENDER BRACKET LH 80.00" "
- FRONT FENDER UNDER DUST COVER LH 192.00 -
a. 1 FRONT FENDER HYBRID EMBLEM LH - ™ "¢ 8860 "'
10. 1 FRONT WHEELHOUSE INNER PANELLH - = - 198.00 * | v
1. 1 FRONT WHEELHOUSE OUTER PANELLH - © 7 7 Sehen 215.00°
12. 1 FRONT WHEELHOUSE EXTENSION INNER PANEL LH N 85.00- 7~
13. 1 FRONT WHEELHOUSE EXTENSION OUTER PANEL LH = 95.00- -
14. 1 FRONT GRILLE BASE KE 248.00. 0
15. 1 FRONT GRILLE CHROME MOULDING A3 e 228.00 1"
16. 1 FRDHTGRKLELDWERCHROMEMDULNNG 198.00 .-
17. 1 FRDNTGR&LECEHTRELDCKBR&CKET * 118.00 ¥ vr
18. 2 HEADLAMP ASSY RHILH 7 I w 780.00 1,560:00 ¢
19. 2 HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET " °°F T 64.00 128,00 "
20, 1 SIDE MIRROR LH A 420.00 * ="
21. 1 SIDE MIRROR COVER -LH % 60.80 ~
22, 1 ENGINE CROSSMEMBER SUBFRAME 980.00
23. 1 ENGINE CROSSMEMBER SUBFRAME BRACKETLH ' ‘mﬂﬂﬂ~|
24. 1 FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER -LH ' 450,00 |
25 1 FRONT LOWER ARM -LH ' 268.00 ¢ 'l
26. 1 FRONT KNUCKLE - LH 326.007 |
27. 1 FRONT WHEEL HUBLH 220.00
28. 1 FRONT WHEEL BEARING - LH 190,00+
29, 1 FRONT STABILIZER LINK LH 188.007 |
o 1 FRONT STABILIZER BAR : 360,00~ -
. 1 AUDIBLE SENSOR * o 180.00 "+
32. 1 DASHBOARD .~ n: ¢ 2,152.00 /1 it
33. 1 DRIVER AIRBAG ./ /e e d 2,380.00./ ) ; .
34. 1 FRONT PASSENGER AIRBAG L 2,.480.00~

CONTINUE / ...



WORLD AUTO PTE LTD

47 Jalan Pemimpin #01-02/03

Halcyon 2, S'pore 577200

Tel No. : 6451 3933 Fax No. : 6455 7576
E-Mail : worldaut@singnet.com.sg
Website : www.worldauto.com.sg

Page 2/3

Tax Reg. No. : 200006765-H Buss. Reg. No. : 200006765H
FIRST CAPITAL INSSURANCE LIMITED Estimate : ES201856
B0 ROBINSON RD #09-02/03
068898 Date ; 24/04/2018
Vehicle Num. : SLR 8218A (LCR)
- . Make/Model : HONDA SHUTTLE HYBRID
Attention : Motor Claim Department Chassis/Eng# :
Contact ; 5222 2311 Fax No. : 6222 3547 Accident Date : 21/04/2018
Claim No. :
Reference :
Policy No. :
SIN  Quantity Particular Unit Price  Amount S$
35. 1 STEERING AIRBAG SLIPRING = = ° '5 f“" 648.00 "
6. 1 STEERING ANGLE SENSOR 310.00 "
ar. 2 FRONT AIRBAG IMPACT SENSOR s 185.00 370.00.n ¢
iz 1 FRONT SEATBELT RH L 1,298.00 0
3e. 1 FRONT SEATBELT BUCKLERH ~ 328.00 « v
40. 1 FRONT SEATBELT LH S L 1,298.00- 7"
4. 1 FRONT SEATBELT BUCKLERH 328.00°]
42. 1 STEERING TIERODLH 90.00" |
43, 1 STEERING TIE RODEND LH ' 120.00"
44, 1 AIRBAG CONTROL MODULE + his = W 1,580.005¢
List TotalS$ : 23,126.30
20.00% Discount 5% : 4.625.26
18,501.04
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS :
1. 1 FRONT BUMPER CLIP i 3000 ¢
2. 1 FRONT BUMPER UNDERDUST COVER CLIPS 30:00 -
a. 1 FRONT FENDER UNDER DUST COVER CLIPS 30.00 « M
a 1 WHEELRIM 150.00% | .
5. 1 TYRE ' 180.00 «
6. TOWING CHARGE - 60.00 -
Special Nett Total S§ : 480.00
LABOUR : _
WIRINGS CHECK AND RECTIFY WHERE NECESSARY 4 180.00
REMOVE ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS IN ORDER TO FACILITATE e 1,600.00
REPAIRS INCLUDING PANEL BEAT, CUT/WELD, STRAIGHTEN
CHASSIS WHERE NECESSARY AND REPLACE ABOVE PARTS
UNDERCARRIAGE REPAIRS INCLUDING REPLACING ABOVE L 380.00

UNDERCARRIAGE PARTS

CONTINUE / ...



WORLD AUTO PTE LTD

47 Jalan Pemimpin #01-02/03
Halcyon 2, S'pore 577200

Tel No. : 6451 3933 Fax No. : 6455 7576

E-Mail : worldaut@singnet.com.sg
Website : www.worldauto.com.sg

Page 3/3

Tax Reg. No. : 200006765-H Buss. Reg. No. : 200006765H
FIRST CAPITAL INSSURANCE LIMITED Estimate : ES201856
80 ROBINSON RD #09-02/02
068898 Date : 24/04/2018
Vehicle Num, : SLR 8218A (LCR)
N Make/Model : HONDA SHUTTLE HYBRID
Attention : Motor Claim Department Chassis/Eng# :
Contact : 6222 2311 Fax No. : 6222 3547 Accident Date : 21/04/2018
Claim No. :
Reference :
Policy No. :
SIN  Quantity Particular Unit Price  Amount 5%
REMOVE AND REPLACE SRS SYSTEM COMPONENTS INCLUDING 20 480.00
DASHBOARD, SEATBELTS, ETC
PERFORM WHOLE VEHICLE DIAGNOSTIC CHECK INCLUDING 280,00
RESETTING SRS SYSTEM AND CLEARING FAULT CODES DUE TO
COLLISION
i“UTT“rr AND SPRAY PAINT ALL AFFECTED AREAS B 1,600.00
(INNER/OUTER, PEARL WHITE)
Labour Total 5% : 4,520.00
Y e
| { { 5=
Cxkaains LKK Auto Consultants hence nofify
J the Repairer of the following:
oAl = I|||’_J | « T renunnsy DifoRpaie: spray pasling
» To displey demaged parie) durng Msurvey
[ oty s «» Parts pricas are subject 1o confirmalion
' ’ » Third party survey is on 8 “Wilhout Prejudics” basis
g isa | L P » No iegal modification|s) i3 aiowsd
» Supplementary Bem{s) musi be meurvyed and
2 el Ve is sublect o finel approval from Insurance Company
$ oo i Achnowiedges by Fepoirer
&\\ o Signaturs
O ARV =B .
f}t 4 b § EF J Dt
E. & O.E. Total S§ : 23,501.04

for WORLD AUTO PTE LTD

=S=E========



' V4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

-l 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6266 3561 FAX: G256 4315
Reg. No: 189607198R GS5T Reg. No. 19-0607108-R
Affillated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile
FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref CS/FCI18007819Mvbn2
:?aﬁcﬂﬁgﬁ? EC?L?;EDSINGAPORE 068877 O DRERROe Nlmmnllmmuln
Code : FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHC 1470J Veh. Inspected SLR 8218A
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D180031TIMFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From MAY CHUA Assign Date 25/04/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HOMNDA SHUTTLE c.c 1496
Engine No. HIDDEM Year of Reqg. 2017
Chassis No. GPT1046138 Colour WHITE
Odometer 31177 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front T',rrg 185/60 R15 PIRELLI 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre 185/80 R15 PIRELLI & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |185/60R15 YOKOHAMA B mm
L/H Rear Tyre 18580 R15 ¥ OROHAMA & mim
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT N/S AND N/S FRONT PORTION,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  21/04/2018 |Inspection Date 25/04/2018
Survey held at NO 1 KRANJI LooP
Repairer WORLD AUTO PTE LTD
5a. Remarks
ADAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
BITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

|ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 10 Working Days




'Vl /4
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Lbi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 62336 4315

Reg. Mo: 199507108R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9807198-R Page Mo 1 of 3
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLR 8218A
Estimate Qur Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | =8 mmpfgn “i}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS

1|FRONT BUMPER CRACKED 1,100.00 1,100.00
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT DENTED 485 BO 48580
1|FRONT BUMPER UNDERDUST COVER DEFORMED 175.00 175.00
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER @378.00 MISSING 156.00 156.00
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER GRILLE cuT 122.00 122.00
1|FRONT FENDER LH DENTED 489 420 485 80
1|FRONT FENDER BRACKET LH NOT MECESSARY 60.00 -
1|FRONT FENDER UNDER DUST COVER LH DEFORMED 182.00 192.00
1|FRONT FENDER HYBRID EMEBLEM LH NECESSARY BR.60 BB B0
1|FRONT WHEELHOUSE INMER. PAMNEL LH NOT NECESSARY 198.00 -
1|FRONT WHEELHOUSE DUTER PANEL LH MOT NECESSARY 21500 -
1|FRONT WHEELHOUSE EXTEMNSION INNER PAMEL LH DEFORMED 85.00 B5.00
1|FRONT WHEELHOUSE EXTENSION OUTER PANEL LH DEFORMED 95,00 95.00
1|FRONT GRILLE BASE CRACKED 248.00 24800
1|FRONT GRILLE CHROME MOULDING MNECESSARY 228.00 22800
1|FRONT GRILLE LOWER CHROME MOULDING MECESSARY 198.00 198.00
1|FRONT GRILLE CENTRE LOCK BRACKET NOT NECESSARY 118.00 -
2I|HEADLAMP ASSY RHALH @%780.00 NS SCRATCHED ¢ 1,560.00 TBO.00

/S NOT

WECESSARY
2{HEADLAMP LOWER BRACKET @$64.00 NIS CRACKED / O/S 128.00 54,00

NOT NECESSARY
1|SIDE MIRROR LH MOT NECESSARY 420.00 -
1|SIDE MIRROR COVER-LH TO REPAIR SEE &50.00 -

LABOUR
1|ENGINE CROSSMEMBER SUBFRAME NOT MECESSARY Qe0.00 -
1|ENGINE CROSSMEMBER SUBFRAME BRACKET LH WNOT NECESSARY 160.00 -
1|FRONT SHOCK ABSORBER-LH WOT NECESSARY 450 00 -
1|FRONT LOWER ARM-LH NOT NECESSARY 268.00 -
1|FRONT KNUCKLE-LH MNOT NECESSARY 326.00 -
1|FRONT WHEEL HUB LH NOT NECESSARY 220,00 -
1|FRONT WHEEL BEARING-LH NOT NECESSARY 190.00 -

Report Ref No, CS/FC118007619/Vvbn2




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

A1 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Singapaore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. Mo. 10-8607158-R Page No.:2 of 3
T Estimate Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | =8 mm‘gﬁ &
1|FRONT STABILIZER LINK LH NOT NECESSARY 188.00 “
1|FRONT STAEBILIZER BAR NOT NECESSARY 360.00 *
1[AUDIBLE SENSOR CRACKED 180.00 180.00
1|DASHBOARD MNECESSARY 2,152 00 2.152.00
1|DRIVER AIRBAG ACTIVATED 2,380.00 2,380.00
1|FRONT PASSENGER AIRBAG ACTIWATED 2,480.00 2,480.00
1|STEERING AIRBAG SLIP RING MECESSARY G48.00 548.00
1|STEERING ANGLE SENSOR NECESSARY 310.00 310.00
2|FRONT AIRBAG IMPACT SENSOR @E185.00 MECESSARY 370.00 370.00
1|FRONT SEATBELT RH JAMMED 1,298.00 1,298.00
1|FRONT SEATBELT BUCKLE RH NOT NECESSARY 328.00 -
1|FRONT SEATBELT LH JAMMED 1,298.00 1,298.00
1|FRONT SEATBELT BUCKLE RH NOT NECESSARY 328.00 -
1|STEERING TIE ROD LH NOT NECESSARY 90.00 -
1|STEERING TIE ROD END LH NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
1|AIRBAG CONTROL MODULE NECESSARY 1,580.00 1,580.00
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -4 626,26 -3,440.66
18,501.04 13,762.64
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|FRONT BUMPER CLIP (SN} NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|FRONT BUMPER UNDERDUST COVER CLIPS (&N) NMECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|FRONT FENDER UNDER DUST COVER CLIPS (SN) NECESSARY 30.00 30.00
1|WHEEL RIM (SN) NOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
1|TYRE {SN) NOT NECESSARY 180.00 -
420.00 80.00
LABOUR
TOWING CHARGE 60.00 60.00
WIRING CHECK AND RECTIFY WHERE NECESSARY 180.00 30.00
REMOVE ACCIDENT DAMAGED PARTS IN ORDER TO 1,600.00 1,250.00
FACILITATE REPAIRS INCLUDING PANEL
BEAT CUT/WELD,STRAIGHTEN CHASSIS WHERE
MECESSARY AND REPLACE ABOVE PARTS.INCLUSIVE
OF THE REPAIR OF SIDE MIRRCR COVER-LH.
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R G5T Reg. No. 18-8607196-R Page No..3 of 3
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
Qty pti ond Workshop (5))  ($)
UMDERCARRIAGE REFAIRS INCLUDING REPLACING 380.00 250.00
ABOVE UNDERGARRIAGE PARTS,
REMOVE AND REPLACE SRS SYSTEM COMPONENTS 480.00 300.00
INCLUDING DASHEOARD. SEATBELTS ETC
PERFORM WHOLE VEHICLE DIAGNOSTIC CHECK 280.00 250.00
INCLUDING RESETTING SRS SYSTEM AND CLEARING
FAULT CODES DUE TO COLLISION,
PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINT ALL AFFECTED AREAS 1,600.00 1.200.00
{INMER/OUTER PEARL WHITE)
4,580.00 3,340.00
GRAND TOTAL 23,501.04 17,192.64
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | 17,192.64]
Report Ref No. CS/FC118007618/\vbn2
L&‘ZM ™
SATHYA SAI KATHIRRASEN HO LEONG CHUAN
Asst, Automotive Assessor Automotive Assessor

DISCLAMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Repart is made solely for the use snd banafit of tha Client named on the front paga of this Report.




