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* MS@FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurnnce Limited (o b b LO00CII0EC BT fing M = DODIBIS0
& Ratfies Quay ¥71-00 Singapone D48580
Tel [B5) 6227 311 Far (65) 6222 3547

Chwimns & Pt Ut iting Dot 36 Robinon Soed £16-01 City Howse Sngencre 058677
Tet (65) 6507 3848 Fax (B5) 6507 1845
vl mafiritoanital com 5@

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location

Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person
Contact Number,

Oftficer Incharge

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
24-04-2018 Our Ref No. D18003224MFSH
20-04-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHD3068U Third Party Vehicle. SLL7269R

280 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK ES #01-17 HARVEST @ WOODLANDS
YEN
86606722/ 93882885 Fax No. 63397475

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTELTD
NA Fax No. 68416315
NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop ELITE AUTOMOTIVE RTE Attention. NIL
LTD

Cc : TP Solicitor NA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey repart via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required,

A Mpmpae

- o [T




L

Veron Chen (LKKAuto) i fe

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 27 April 2018 12:44 PM

To: ‘Claim Workflow System'’

Cc EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18003224MFSH/1, SLL T265R
Attachments: SLL 7269R PREL| ADVISED pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLL 7269R
Date of survey: 25/4/2018
Number of days:3 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 25 April 2018 1:41 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18003224MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto com | fax: Gas6-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mallto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]
Sent: Wednesday, 25 April, 2018 12:59 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Ce: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL. COM.SG; EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL COM.5G
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18003224MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,



Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.
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Company Registration Mo 1398071948

T] UMIAVE 1, M228 PAYA LT INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPMIRE 408953 TEL ¢ 51 a1563561 FAN § (165 62564005

Your ref: D1BO03224MFSH
Our ref: CS/FCII8007599/5vh
The Motor Claims Department

M/s First Capital Insurance Limited

Dear Sir™Madam

Date: 27/4/18

Without Prejudice

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO, _SLL 7269R

We thank for your imstruction on

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on

vehicle on 25/4/2018  at the premises of M/s

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount
Revised Estimate Amount
"Check” llems Amount
Market Value

LTA Reimbursement Value
Nett Valoe

Description of Damage:
The vehicle sustained damages at the
rear portion

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours fuithfully,

YEANG WAI KEEN
Aunlomolive Assessor

ELITE AUTOMOTIVE PTELTD

- §87,597.85

: 551,088.27

: 5§1,768.93

(5%

: 8%

(5%




-Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner 1D Type

Oyt 1D

Vehicle Details

Vehicle Nos

Vehicle 1o be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year;

Engine Mo

Chassis New;

Maximum Power Output:
Dpen Market Value:

DOriginal Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Efigibility Expiry Date
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category

COE Period(Years):

QP Pai;

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

The information contalned herein is correct as al 26 Apr 2018

Singapore NRIC
SE701

SLLT249R

No

26 Apr 2018

TOYOTA

LEXUS IS250 AUTO STD FL
Grey

200%

AGRO5S58630

JTHBK 242505098254
153.0 kW (205 bhp)
$37.37400

26 Feb 2009

26 Feb 2009

2

$37.374.00

Yes
25 Feb 2019
$18.687.00

25 Feb 2019

8 - Car [1601cc & above)
10

$689.00

$57.00

$18.744.00

OK
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& CONNECTING CAR BUYERS & SELLERS.

s 12250

Used Car Companson

Campanng J verees

Ll Al

fach o semrch resin

Instatment
Registration Date
Hanulaciured
Mileage
Tranamission
Engine Cap

Road Tax

Curty Welght

No. of Ownars
Type of Vehicle
Categaoty

Avallability

PriceRange T

Lenud [S250 Lusury

We'll handle your loans, insurance & other paperwork for FREE

¥

[ Deprecistion ¥ | [z00w "

33 800

£ 648

1 1-Fety Y000

il

171 438 km

Autn

2,500 o

B 1,800 pyr

153.0 uW (205 bhe)
| &35 kg

Possifud 151 VE JOSRHP, & Speed Auts
Padcdin Shifis, Crasa Controed, Traction
Contrnl, Keyiass Entry/Start Bution

Rerwerne Camara, Al Round Parking
Sansors, HID Head Lamps, Rear Binoe
Mars Lsvien Systerms, Full Electncs
Mesnory Losther Sedts.

lmmaculste Cor, Exceilenily Maintained
By Fusay Owner, Oirigival Pearl White
Lumury Frahues, High OMY Valee OF
$1.697, Ci Like News, Dont Mis Must
Wi

570

41 697
$4L 89T
116, 10 fye
| L ary
FARF Ca

Lezus 15250 Lusury

§L15)

1 2-Mpr- 2008

0%

§1.000 um

At

4,300 ex

#1800 fyr

153,00 kW (305 bhp]
1,525 g

L3 Ve Engira, J058hp, § Speed Auto
Transmizson With Packds Shift, Keyles
Entry/Push Start Bution, Crume Comtrol,
Traction Control, ABS, Airtags

Foorns Rima, Electric Seats Wikh Alrgon
antintm? Laather Seatt., Multi Function
Steering, Beverse SenEe.

Super Low Milnage, Showroom
Condbon, 1 Mari®s Warranly From Our
In House Warkshop. Bank Loan In
House Loan Avsilabie. Trode [n
Wernme

85,7
117,304
$17.3ra
16 150 fyr
1

Lunury

FARF Cav, Low Mileage Car

Lexus 15250

— FTOLDETE LT T

w_ua-le v

wroces . For@m

$31L800

2,144
I3-kpe-2009

2008

106,000 km

fastn

2,500 2

1,800 fyr

153.0 kW (105 bha)
1,635 kg

50 V& Enging, J058hg, & Spoed Auts
Tramsmassion With Poddie Shift, Keyless
Enbry/Push Start Buttom, Cruise Conirod,
Trachon Control ABS_ SRE Arbags

Sporta uma, Elecing Seati With Ainrcon
wnbilated Leatter Seacs, Mult Funchon
Snering, lverse Sanmsors

Lip To B0%: Loan And Balioon Scheme
Availatile, Well Mastsin By Dwnis,
Cirhginal Puintwork Since Day 1, Mast
Reliabie Lusury Sedan, Wegular
Serdcmg. No Repair Neaded, Responaive
And Loww Maintainence, Inaecton Dons,
M Mew Baftne, Door Step Yewing
Avadatsie_ Call Now To Make Your
Appoirtrment!

£5,.700
137,174
137374
FI4T00 fyr
1

Luury

PARF Car, Premaam Ad Cx

Lexus 15250

WE#EGUICEs

| NO IMAGE AV

Liwe swrch bite s BD e
i Conpey



Address X verderson Road #07-28 1 Buit Bated Crescert WCEGA Plam 15 Commonwsalth Lane Lot (/05,08 -

#02-13114
iffice Mumber . A70080 BATSTIR? -
Contact Persan Arfrews Quis Richard | Jeft vy Cran | Mantthews Phus -
Contact Number :""““_‘““‘"“ i e e ] » B

Home  Mew Cars  Used Cars | Sell My Car | Directory  Products  Insurance | Articie | Forum | Resources

aCarMaet |y e numbes pre o claisileds for parsilel import cars, Toyote, Honds, Missan, Mitmdishd & BMW, There ame plenty of cars for saie. sven for COE tary, DPC oy, vang, truchs, mybmg
CAre, Spests cars o cabionwagoms. Yoo can aluo ey from s cor suction, look op car loars, ow mileege cary, car brands, carpark ries R car inkanance. We hine new Gar dealens comgnsing
paralial imparters. suthonsed car dealens, and used car dealers on cur site. Find niew car price Ests, mow car launches and new car promotiond, and aisc moloring agvice, car reviews & Car news
o the Steat rrodeis. Visht our partnes sites for joh operings: for Singapare ot real estate properties for sale. mover, ar performance parts, car decussion, Rm discusson, coemrrercinl vebicle
lexeng & COF results.

Follow sgCarMart.com

About Us | Caresrs | Contact Us | Stermap  Tarms of Service | Privacy Palicy | Personal Data Protection Staterment
©2004-2018 sgCarMart. Al rights reserved.



SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT
IMPORTANT NOTICE

{ PisgsSewport cormacily the datpis of the aoeigen) o spesd UD he Claend DIGCEds

2. Thm Form must be completed by the Policyholder andior the Autharised Drive
F be completed he Policyholder andior the thoriged D r

idea must be &8 Wruthiul and accurate as possibke. Any wilful merepresemanon of Wilhoidng
digte podicy abiliy

4. The iswe and acceptance of this Form by insurance companies is nol & admission af policy lability on fie par of the ingwEancs i

&. Any file reporting may be referred fo the Police for investigation

; g rapart will be Torsarded by i rers ol the GLA Records Management Centre eatas|is! era A intion of Sinopore (G141
srenningand inel copses of ihis repor will for @ fe2, be made svailable wpon applcation by ine

¥ By ihe bosment of his repor 10 e meutems. you hiefeby Consenl D the arohiving of this repon & e cenbie gnd & pea 0f e repor SEirg mads evailak

nioresa e

Dale OFf Report 21/04/2018 1308

Date Of Accident 20/04/2018 17:15

Exact Locanon Of Accident 4LONG TPE

sountrngSiate ol Loss SINGAPORE

Vahicle Registration Number SLLT2E68R
Insured/Policyholder

Name Of Registered Owner TAN KAH HENG (CHEN JIAXING
MNRIC N ST215870

Email Addrass KH@YARGO.COM

Mobile Phone M LOCAL | +65.03848900
Alternative Phone N OFFICE 83848008

Vehicle Particulars

Manu facture rOYOTA

Maode| LEXUS 15250 AUTO STD FL

Exacl Purpose far which vehicle was being used al
lime of accidenl

Are you Claiming unider Your own nsurance

ML)
[ FST reDEir 1O wour JERChE
If Mo, Please stale sction 10 be laken THIRD PARTY
Jaemhcle _,.7!..1’."-;'-'“! PRIVATE CAR

Insurance Company
Name of Insurance Company AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD

ype Of Coverage COMFREHENSIVE

Flsel Policy NO

Pabcy Numiber GADSS589

Cover Note Number

Driver

Name ol Driver TAN KAH HENG (CHEN JIAXING)
MNEIC No S7215870)

Dae Of Birth 09/05197

Oeccupatior INDOOR

Crate Of Driving Pass 304111883
Driving Expenience 24 YEARS AND 4 MONTHS
Gender MALE

Maobile Numbser [LOCAL) +65-93848009
Fax Mumber
Contact Numbier

EMail Address KHE Y AHOC, COM



Address BLK 25 TELOK BLANGAH CRESCENT #24-79
Pobtcode 0a0025s

Was driver an employee of the Insured's Company NO

if No, Relationship of the Drver with the Insured OWMNER

vehicle Registration Number of Driver's Own -
Vehicle

insurance Company of Driver's Own Vehicle

General Information of the Accident

Type Of Accident COLLISION - HEAD TO REAR
Weather Conditions DRIZZING

Road Surface WET

Other Information

Was any foreign vehicle involved in this accident? NO
NMumber of vehicles involved in the accident
Was any body injured in the Accident? NO

Was any injured conveyed to hospital by
ambulance?

Was any other material or property damaged| YES
| have bean approached by unknown person(si NGO
soliciting/offering accident claims assistance
Numbear of Passengers (Including Driver -
Fassenger NAME AMA BARKOVA
GENDER FEMALE
Details of Police Action
Was the accident reporied o the police? NO
Il Yes.Piease siale which Police Stalion
Was nalice of intendsd Prosecution given? NO
If Yes against whom?
Circumstances of Accident
PLEASE REFRE TO THE ATTACHMENT
Attachment(s)
Are accident photos avallable for attachment? YES
Was there any video caplured by Car Camera? NO
Was there any audio recorded? NO
DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1
Vehicle Registration Number SHD30&AU
Venicle Make/Model/Colour
Details Of Properies
Vehicle Calegory TAXI
Mame of Driver NEQ CHWEE CHUA
NRIC/Passpar Mumber S0188738D
Contaci Number
Address
Poslcode

nsurance Company Nama
Nature Of Damage

MNa, Of Passenger (Including Driver)

i'u-qu 2 ol M



IMPORTANY NOTICE
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DESCRIBE CIRCUMSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT

SKITCH PLAN

DESCRIBE CIRCUNSTANCES OF THE ACCIDENT
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ELITE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
280 Woodlands Industrial Park ES, #01-17.

Harvest (@ Woodlands Singapore 757322
Tel: 6339 7378 Fax: 6339 7475

Vehicle Number : SLL 7269R

Vehicle Model : TOYOTA LEXUS 1S250 AUTO STD FL

Chassis Number : JTHBK262505098256

Estimated Repair Cosi

SIN Parts Description Qty
I BOOT LID OUTER GARNISH = 1 125537 R
2 BOOT LID OUTER GARNISH CLIPS « #F< 10 S 58.00- 5¢ Ve
3 BOOT LID "LEXUS" EMBLEM + Vi« |8 67.68 /e
4 BOOT LID"IS 250" EMBLEM - M« . 56,8/
5  BOOT LID'L" EMBLEM + & 18 80).50 /1
f BOOTLID LOCK » | 8 498,10 % W
7 REAR END PANEL 1 5 663.10 &
8 REARBUMPER & (I 734.66 R
9  REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT Iset S 486.60 /o7
10 REAR BUMPER SPONGE ' - 207.87 Jeur
11 REAR BUMPER TOW COVER X 2 8 68.14 x }m-
12 TAIL-LAMP X 25 1021.36
13 BOOT LID TRIM COVER CLIPS v “ ™ IS 5800 %4 Jute
14 BOOT WEATHERSTRIP X . 192.10 % w¥
15 REAR PANEL TRIM COVER | S 342.10 v calser
16 REAR PANEL TRIM COVER CLIPS 0§ 58.00 e
5 585046
Discount Less 25% S 1462.61
List Prices Total 5 4.187.85
S/N Special Nett ltems: Oty
| REAR HE?\'!—ERﬂL SENSORS (ORIGINALY 7 2 S 450,00  SC
2 REAR REVERSE SENSORS HOLDER 1 I
3 b
Special Nett Total $ 450.00
Spare Part's Total Price S 4837.85

Page 1 0f 2



ELITE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

280 Woodlands Industrial Park E5, #01-17,

Harvest (@ Woodlands Singapore 757322

Tel; 6339 7378 Fax: 6339 7475
Vehicle Number : SLL 7269R

Vehicle Model : TOYOTA LEXUS IS250 AUTO STD FL

Chassis Number : JTHBK262505098256

(2 k)

S/IN Labour Descriptions Charges
| Labour charges to remove & install rear end attachments & § 1060,00
fittings to enable reapirs: to cut & weld where necessary to Lo
straighten & repair boot lid and both rear fender ends; to replace
damaged parts as listed above
2 To spray painting on: boot lid, boot lid outer garnish, rear bumper, 8 l?ﬁq‘_ﬂ{l
rear end panel and both rear fenders A
3 Todrill holes and replace reverse sensors & test function S B0y,
4 To check electrical wirings & rear lights function S S0 e
5 To check, reset & remove fault codes after accident repairs s 20000 X
6 Toremove & install boot compartment components, trimmings & S 100:00
fittings to enable repairs -0
7 Toremove & install trim cover & fittings to enable repairs § 5000
Labour Total §  2760.00
1350 . 3 5
Parts & Labour Total §  7597.85
— 5% N & 2350 & L dars
e o ’____.__________._.-—-—P'..-"_"'_—-'_':_- --___—':_.-—'_'-_'——'—:-'-":;" J
b 19, 8% "
-4 Be [ 2 e ,g._
4 20 Sebnsiag LXK Auto Congultants hence nolify
|t tha Repairer of the lollowng:
— ¢4, 93 25 (41 « To remsrvey beloraiafier tory Serdng
2t « To dmpety Semaned pONIS) vy resUrvey
e - Ly Som Repe o Prars pNCSS W THEC! K confemason
i. s Third party survey @ 01 3 “Wihout Prasssce” bees
_ (-1"‘“{ Lt M e :'hmll@' -mi:m—wmu
Yulm " s subiect ko Bnel approwsd IFom IsuUrsnce Compeny
’ Ltrowieiped ty Regers
= ?LJ‘:. ﬁ% U fr‘._ | Sgnakry
L
Qoo LA
\%{6 StheSnnn ‘-ﬁfﬁ."'] (i illlbf-"-' Vo SRR
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by ELITE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD
F— 280 Woodlands Industrial Park ES5. #01-17.

Harvest @ Woodlands Singapore 757322

Tel: 6339 7378 Fax: 6339 7475

Vehicle Number : SLL 7269R
Vehicle Model : TOYOTA LEXUS 15250 AUTO STD FL

Chassis Number : JTHBK262505098256 Estimated Repair Cost
N Parts Description Qty
1 BOOT LID OUTER GARNISH < | 5 1255.37 €
2 BOOT LID OUTER GARNISH CLIPS ¥ MEC 0 S 58.09- 39V
3 BOOT LID "LEXUS" EMBLEM v Mi< 18 67.68 /
4  BOOT LID IS 250" EMBLEM +/ MEC . 3 56.18
5 BOOT LID'L" EMBLEM v PB& 3 80.50 v
6 BOOTLIDLOCK % | S 408.10 % win
7 REARENDPANEL 7 K 111 T - 663.10 &
§ REARBUMPER B v @ I $ 734.66 / TH
9 REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT ©° X V 4 Iset S 486.60 « DT
[0 REAR BUMPER SPONGE 7 v (Me 1 = 207.87 v crx
Il REAR BUMPER TOW COVER X 2 5 68.14 # }m,
12 TAIL-LAMP X g % 102136 ®
I3 BOOT LID TRIM COVER CLIPS v/ NEC [V 4800 3o/ nit
14 BOOT WEATHERSTRIP X F 8 192,10 % ww
15 REAR PANEL TRIM COVER 7/ Dilea, 1S 342,10 Loederm
|6 REAR PANEL TRIM COVERCLIPS 7 vipe, TN 58.90 » MEC
i 8 5850.46
Discount Less 25% § 1462.601
List Prices Total 3 4,387.85
{
SIN Special Nett lems: Oty
| REAR REVERSE SENSORS (ORIGINAL) 2 VMG 2 S 450,00 v/ OM&
2 REARREVERSE SENSORS HOLDER 1 ¥ 2§
3 S
Special Nett Total 5 450,00
Spare Part's Total Price $ 4837.85
5 kmf'n
i R VoK )y - £ 13140
I] Rear Buw-ftf pﬂ:"ﬂﬁtv I-"P”' ‘ CRK

ey,

) Tol I Liwer Baadet  (vpss) - $0140 v
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ELITE AUTOMOTIVE PTE LTD

280 Woodlands Industrial Park E5, #01-17,

Harvest (@ Woodlands Singapore 757322

Tel: 6339 7378 Fax: 6339 7475
Vehicle Number : SLL 7269R

Vehicle Model : TOYOTA LEXUS 1S250 AUTO STD FL

Chassis Number : JTHBK262505098256

v’

SN Labour Descriptions Charges
| Labour charges to remove & install rear end attachments & s 106000
fittings to enable reapirs; to cut & weld where necessary to Yoo
straighten & repair boot lid and both rear fender ends; 1o replace
damaged parts as listed above
2 To spray pminting on: boot lid, boot lid outer gamish. rear bumper,  § 1368000
rear end panel and both rear fenders 400
3 Todrill holes and replace reverse sensors & test funetion S 0 3y
4 To check electrical wirings & rear lights function §  50ap e
5 To check, reset & remove faull codes after aceident repairs S 20000 £
6 Toremove & install boot compartment components, trimmings &  §  100:Q0
fittings to enable repairs } W
7 Toremove & install trim cover & fittings 1o enable repairs S 500
21293, 49 Labour Total § 2760.00
e th Parts & Labour Total S 759785 A856.85
|F30-12 L'g;ﬂ_:,gogg’_‘ 3da ¢
+ 510 = GerRemed
4+ 890 ’
TN 3 S
212012 R o -
56 Sclention, LK Auto Congllanis hence notly
i = the Repairer of the following:
—_— x5 [4f s - o renrey bekiahe sy pOrerg
;qﬂ,E-CJQE» W S e -:.mw“—-
- Y . proms we conbemason
e il " :n--._--.ﬂ-w—
- O Mede Lae * M Bapal moxSficasion(s) s slowsd
Minon « Suppiameraary must be rosurvrred 100
T'Lﬂh. -.ﬂ--m__—ﬂ-ﬂ'
Arowedpd by Mapers!
Plore Moo, ot | oo
Date:
rk-}..; '5{: n-"
ﬁ-“'l‘\‘hl'm ..f"l-q) ﬁ.\kk"‘l-u‘l!‘.- Lk, »
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. Veron Chen {LKl{Auta!

From: Veran Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 2 July 2018 9:00 AM

To: 'Elite AM', Sathya Sai (LKK Auto); SUR
Subject: RE: SLL 7269R Finalisation

Dear Christy,

Final invoice and all supporting documents sent over to First Capital Ins Ltd.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | emall sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Elite AM [mailto:eliteamclaim@gmail.com)
Sent: Friday, 29 June 2018 6:14 PM

To: Sathya Sai (LKK Auto) <SathyaSal@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@Ilkkauto.com=
Subject: Re: SLL 7269R Finalisation

Hi Veran,

We accept the offer. Thanks!

Regards,
Christy
On Thu, Jun 28, 2018 at 4:37 PM, Sathya Sai (LKK Auto) <SathyaSai@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Good Day,

Sorry for the amendment but this is the finalised amount after giving the lump sum 20% discount. It Is at 52500 @
3 days. Please refer to attachment for finalisation.
Sl L



Thank you

Best Regards,

Sathya Sal | Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 9807 2012 | Email: SathyaSai@ikkaute com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Sathya Sai (LKK Auto)

Sent: Thursday, 28 June, 2018 3:34 PM
To: 'Elite AM'

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SLL 7269R Finalisation

Good Day,

The revised finalised amount is at 53100 @ 3 days. Please refer to attachment.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Sathya 5ai | Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 9807 2012 | Emall: SathyaSal@|kkauto com | fax: 62564315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



From: Sathya Sal (LKK Auto)

. Sent: Thursday, 28 June, 2018 3:03 PM
To: 'Elite AM'

Cc: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: SLL 7269R Finalisation

Good Day,

Please refer to attachment for revised finalisation which is placed at Lump Sum of 52900 @ 3 days.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Sathya Sal | Assistant Automotive Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 9R07 2012 | Email: SathyaSaiflkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, H02-25 | S{408933)

From: Elite AM [mailto:eliteamclaim@gmall.com]
Sent: Thursday, 28 June, 2018 2:41 PM

To: Sathya Sai (LKK Auto)

Subject: Re: SLL 7269R Finalisation

Hi Sathya,

Kindly refer to attached and still got 2 supplementary item. Thanks!



Regards,

Christy

On Thu, Jun 28, 2018 at 2:09 PM, Sathya Sai (LKK Auto) <SathyaSai@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Good Day,

Please refer to attachment for finalisation for vehicle bearing SLL 7269R. Finalised amount is at $2350 @ 3 days.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Sathya Sal | Assistant Automotive Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants

Phone: 9807 2012 | Emall: SathyaSal@|kkauto com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408533)
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

£1 Uil Ave 1 801-25 Paya Ubl industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 8258 3561 FAX: 6256 4215
Reg. Mo 199807104R GST Reg. No 18-9807108-R

AMfillated to Federation Internationala Dea Experts En Automoblie

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref CS/FCI18007589/vbe2

36 ROBINSON ROAD Date - 05-07-2018

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877

[IWIHAFIN

Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD 3088U Veh. Inspected SLL 7268R
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0,00
Claim No. D18003224MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From  EILEEN LEE Assign Date 25/0412018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA LEXUS I1S250 c.c 2500
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2009
Chassis No. JTHEK262505098256 Colour BLACHK
Odometer 236478 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General FAIR
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |225/45Z R17 HANKOOK B mm
L/H Front Tyre |225/45Z R17 HANKOOK & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |245/45Z R17 HANKOOK & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |245/45Z R17 HANKOOK 6 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR PORTION
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
5. General Information
Accident Date 20/04/2018 Inspection Date 25/D4/2018
Survey held at ELITE AUTOMOTIVE
280 WOODDLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK ES #01-17 HARVESTEWOODLANDS
SINGAPORE 757322
Sa. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS,
C}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.

5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR 3 Working Days




LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ut Industral Park, Singapore 408833

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4115

Reg. No: 188607T188R GST Reg No. 19-BE0T168-R

ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLL 7269R

FPage No-1 of 2

aty Description of Parts Condition ! W‘(‘,T‘"
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|BOOT LID OUTER GARMISH TO REPAIR SEE 125537
LABOUR
10|BOCT LID OUTER GARNISH CLIPS NECESSARY 58,90 30.00
1|BOOT LID "LEXUS" EMBLEM NECESSARY 67 68 67 68
1|BOOT LID "IS 250" EMBLEM NECESSARY 5818 55 18
1|B0OOT LID "L" EMBLEM NECESSARY BO.50 B0.60
1|800T LID LOCK NOT NECESSARY 4088.10
1|REAR END PAMEL TO REPAIR SEE B63.10
LABOUR
1|REAR BUMPER TORN 734 .66 734 66
1|SET REAR BUMPER REINFORCEMENT DENTED 488 80 4B6 60
1|REAR BUMPER SPONGE CRACKED 207.87 207.87
2 |REAR BUMPER TOW COVER NOT NECESSARY 68 14 -
2| TAIL-LAMP NOT NECESSARY 1.021 38
10|BOOT LID TRIM COVER CLIPS NECESSARY 58 80 30,00
1|1BOOT WEATHERSTRIP NOT MECESSARY 182 10 -
1|REAR PANEL TRIM COVER DEFORMED 34210 34210
10|REAR PANEL TRIM COVER CLIPS NECESSARY 5880 58 90
2|REAR BUMPER RETAINER CRACKED 137 .40 137.40
2| TAIL LAMP LOWER BRACKET CRACKED 121,60 121.60
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,827.37 -588.37
4 582 09 1,765 12
SPECIAL NETT [TEMS
2|REAR REVERSE SENSORS (ORIGINAL) (SN) } DAMAGED 45000 450,00
2|REAR REVERSE SENSORS HOLDER (SN) ) =
450,00 450.00

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18007599/Wvba2




y L5 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

el B 51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Pays Ubi Industnial Park, Singapare 408833
- TEL: B256 1581 FAX: B256 4115
Reg No: 18960T168R GST Reg No 199607 188-R Page Mo, .2 of 2
Qty Description of Parts Condition
LABOUR
LABOUR CHARGES TO REMOVE & INSTALL REAR END 1.000.00 400,00

ATTACHMENTS & FITTINGS TO ENABLE REPAIRS, TO
CUT & WELD WHERE NECESSARY TO STRAIGHTEN &
REPAIR BOOT LID AND BOTH REAR FEMDER ENDS; TO
REPLACE DAMAGED PARTS AS LISTED ABOVE
INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF BOOT LID OUTER
GARNISH AND REAR END PANEL

TO SPRAY PAINTING ON: BOOT LID, BOOT LID OUTER 1,300.00 400.00
GARNISH, REAR BUMPER, REAR END PANEL AND BOTH
REAR FENDERS.

TO DRILL HOLES AND REPLACE REVERSE SENSORS & 60, .00 30.00
TEST FUNCTION
TO CHECK ELECTRICAL WIRINGS & REAR LIGHTS 50.00 30,00
FUNCTION
TO CHECK, RESET & REMOVE FALULT CODES AFTER NOT NECESSARY 200.00 -
ACCIDENT REPAIRS.
TO REMOVE & INSTALL BOOT COMPARTMENT 100.00 30.00
COMPONENTS. TRIMMINGS & FITTINGS TO ENABLE
REPAIRS. |
TO REMOVE & INSTALL TRIM COVER & FITTINGS TO 50.00 -
ENABLE REPAIRS |

2.780.00 B890.00
GRAND TOTAL 7.792.09 310512
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18007588/Vvbe2
MARKET VALUE: $25 000,00{EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $18,744.00=NETT VALUE: §6,256.00

o b

SATHYA SAI KATHIRRASEN HO LEONG CHUAN
Asst. Automotive Assassor Automotive Assessar
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