Hsiao TnnE (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 21 December 2018 12:45 PM

To: 'Jin Hao Tan’

Subject: RE: [EXT] Direct Settlement - Accident Invelving SIW9857X (Ol :DAI - 76440) AND

SFR992X (TP : LKK REF - CC6/DAI18007589/Apa3) on 22/04/2018

Without Prejudice
Hi,

We refer to the above matter.
Case has been setfled at $4,642.00(all-in) with Third Party repairer,

We will proceed to close file and submit all the relevant documents to your good office(via email) soonest.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Fhone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkayto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jin Hao Tan <jinhao.tan@directasia.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 November 2018 9:51 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: [EXT] Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIW9857X (Ol :DAI - 76440) AND SFR992X (TP : LKK REF -
CCE!DAIISDG?SBSMPEE} on 22/04/2018

Hi Hsiao Tong,
Please proceed.

Best Regards,

Tan Jin Hao / claims speciatist
Direct: +65 6603 3665

DirectAsia Insurance
Customer Service: +65 6665 5555
Office: 20 Anson Road, #08-01, S{079912)

www. directasia.com
000000

**Qur Service Centre at South Bridge Rood haos clased.
Pis call our Customer Service hotline for appeintment or assistonce,

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: This email land any attachment] is intended cnly for the attention of the addressae and may contaln e gally privileged and/ar

anfidential infarmation. its unautharzed use duclosure, storage or copy Ng is mot permitted, IF you are not the intended recip BNk pledase permananthy o




the ariginal, destroy all copies and intorm the sender by return email. Thank you, An e-maif reply 1o this address ma

Iness practices. Direct Asia Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd [Company Reg: 20082261106

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, & November, 2018 11:07 AM

To: Jin Hao Tan

Subject: RE: [EXT] Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIWS857X (OI :DAI - 76440) AND SFR992X (TP * LKK REF
- CC6/DAI1B007589/Apa3) on 22/04/2018

Without Prejudice
Hi Jin Hao,
We refer to the above matter,

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer, KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE LTD at 54,642.00{all-in). The
breakdown is as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/G5T) $ 4,280.00
2, Loss of Use (6days x $60.00) $ 360,00
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee % 2.00

TOTAL $4,642.00

Enclosed herewith the supporting document for your perusal.

For your approval please.

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto,com | fax: 6741-4108
EBlk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Jin Hao Tan <jinhao.tan@directasia.com>
Sent: Wednesday, 31 October 2018 4:01 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: [EXT] Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIWSB57X (Ol :DAI - 76440) AND SFR992X (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/DAI18007589/Apa3) on 22/04/2018

Hi Hsiao Tong,

Any update of direct settlement for this case.
Thank you,

Best Regards,

Tan Jin Hao / ciaims Specialist
Direct: +5 6603 3665

DirectAsia Insurance
Customer Service: +65 6665 5555



Office: 20 Anson Road, #08-01, ${079912)
www.directasia.com

oosoeD

**Our Service Centre at South Bridge Road has closed.
Pls coll our Customer Service hotline for appointment or assistance.
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From: Elyn Pan

Sent: Thursday, 26 April, 2018 3:38 PM

To: Motor Claims; Meikwan@lkka m

Cc: Derrick Quok; Kenneth Lim; Aaron Wang

Subject: RE: [EXT] Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIW9857X (OI :DAI - TBA) AND SFR992X (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/DAI18007589/Apa3) on 22/04/2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVE AS TO COSTS

Hi Mei Kwan
We refer to the above matter.

We are agreeable to a DIRECT SETTLEMENT in this matter.

If you have any further enquiries, please do not hesitate to contact me.

Best regards,
Elyn Pan / Claims Specialist
Direct: +65 603 3605

DirectAsia Insurance

Customer Service: +65 G665 5555
Retail: 88 South Bridge Road, 5(058716)
www.directasia.com

006000

CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE: Thus email {and any attach mant 115 intendad anly for the attention of the addresses and may contain legally priviles

aally ad andfar
confidential infarmation. Its unauthorised use, disclosure, storags or copying s not permitted. If youare not the intended recipient, p [ anently delape
the original, destroy all copies and infarm the sender by return email. Thank yvou. An e-mall re phy to this address may be subject to inter: cption ar manitoring for

cperational reasons or for lawiul business practices. Direct Asia Insurance (Sings pore) Ple Ltd {Company Reg: 2008226116)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 26 April, 2018 1:26 PM

To: Motor Claims; Claim

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Subject: [EXT] Direct Settlement - Accident Involving SIWS857X (Ol :DAI - TBA) AND SFR992X (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/DAI18007589/Apa3) on 22/04/2018



WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

We had inspected the vehicle SFR992X at M/s Kang Car Repairers Pte Ltd - Kaki Bukit and the repairer would
like to do direct settlement with Direct Asia Insurance.

Enclosed herewith a copy of TP's GIA report for your perusal.

Please be informed that estimate is not ready yet.

Please kindly advice liability soonest.

Meanwhile, kindly provide us the claim reference for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197,
To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto,.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE: This message is intended only for the attention of the addressee and may contain legally
privileged and/or confidential information. its unauthorised use, disclosure, storage or copying is not permitted, If
you are not the intended recipient, please permanently delete the original, destroy all copies and inform the sender.




m i‘t g\@- ¥ f%ﬁ%% /\cﬁ {879 ]
 KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE LTD

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #02-06 AUTOBAY @KAK| BUKIT SINGAPORE 417883

TEL: 67477636, 67473005 FAX: 67485071 Email: kangcar@singnet.com.sg
Co. Reg. No. 201300201N GST Reg. Mo, 201300201M

Our Ref : KCR0O42018992DAl
Your Ref : SJWOBSTX

Date - =5 SEP 2088 WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Direct Asia Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
C/O LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1

#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Pk

Singapore 408933

Attention : Moter Claim Department

Dear Sirs,

Accident involving SFR992X and SJW9857X on 22.04.2018 along Tampines St 81.

We refer to the above accident. On our record showed that you are the insurer of motor
vehicle SJWOBSTX.

We are instructed that the accident was caused by your insured's negligent driving and/or
management of his vehicle. As a result of the accident, our client’s vehicle was damaged and
our client has been put to loss and expense.

On behalf of and as authorized by Mr Yusof Bin Abu Kassim, the owner of motor-vehicle no
SFR992X, we submit his claim to you:

Cost of repairs (Inclusive of 7% GST) $4,280.00
Loss of use (B days (5 days +1PRI)x $80.00) $ 480.00
GlA search fee $ 2.00

$4,762.00

Enclosed herewith are copies of the following documents in support of our client's claim:
1) Tax invoice no: KCR-INV1800482
2) GIA report and certificate of insurance of SFR992X
3) GIA search fee and invoice

We hope to receive your early reply soon.

Thank you.
Yours fai:'?/y,
. //""
KANG Z R 5{_EPR:I‘RF{$[ LTD

.............................................



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

Your Ref. gjwogs57Xx

Direct Asia Insurance (S)Pte Ltd
20 Anson Rd

#08=01

Singapore 079912

Dear Sirs,

Accident involving_ SFR992X and SJWO9B57X
on 22.04.18 at Tampines St 81.

I/'We am/are the owner/s of vehicle number SFR992X.

IWe had ir_'tstructed KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE LTD to make a claim on my/four
behalf against your company in respect of the abovementioned matter.

IMWVe hereby authorize you to issue the settlement cheque in favour of my/our
wo_rkshop. KANG CAS REPAIRERS PTE LTD in full and final settlement of my/our
clan:'g fgtr my/our repair cost and loss of use/rental charges, in respect of the above
accident.

Yours faithfully,

Yusof Bin Abu Kassim

KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE. LTD.

..............

LW

ng Chin Watt

PN P s m A

Witnessed by; ¥

W



This Discharga Vioucher applies stricly for Clamant's
claim fo-posspsalmrr propery damages only does
nat constitute a hul dscharge for any olher daims or
further claims whatsoswer presenl or kitura fhat may
mareias! anging direcily of indirecTy Inom mhis accident.

This seiement terms hamsn is wilhoul an admission
of kabiity on tha par of B clamant and e settiemant

RELEASE VOUCHER s shou b iad st v sy i st
(Direct Asia Express Third Party Claim)

“Well, KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have

reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of Direct Asia Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd LKK
AUTO N TANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
854.280.00 (Repair Costs), 58360.00 (Loss of Rental/lJse), 552.00 (Disbursement) for vehicle no.
SFR 992X was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 22/04/2018 (date) along
TAMPINES ST 81 (location) involving vehicles no/s. SIW 9857X.

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 23/04/2018 (date) at ““the workshop™.

Well confirm that we/T are/am authorized by the owner YUSOF BIN ABU KASSIM (“the third party
claimant™) of vehicle no. SFR 992X to make the claim as set oul in the above paragraph and we/l
have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose

herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant™,

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify Direct Asia Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd for all
damages, loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant™ after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs andfor rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage
to SFR 992X (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without

prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have exclusive
jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.
15 DEC 2018
Dated this day) of {month) 20___ (year)
KANG CAL REPAIRERS F';l E. LTD.

*

Signed by appointed surveyor Signeyi
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" KANG CAR REPAIRERS PTE LTD

1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 #02-06 AUTOBAY @KAKI BUKIT SINGAPORE 417883
TEL: 67477636, 67473005 FAX: 67485071 Email: kangcar@singnet.com.sg
Co. Reg. No. 201300201N GST Reg. Mo. 201300201N

M/S: DIRECT ASIA INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE LTD

§8 SOUTH BRIDGE ROAD

SINGAPORE 05871

TEL: 65322888

]

ATTN: Motor Claim Department

Your Ref No: SIWO9E5TX
Claim Type: Third Party
Accident Date:  22/04/2018
TP Veh Reg No: SIW9B57X

Description

Final No: KCR-INYI1800452

Claim No: EST1800109

Date: 20 Aug 2018

Policy No: 5069751627-03

Veh Reg No: SFRY992X

Make/Model: HYUNDAI HD
AVANTE |.6A

Chassis No: KMHDU41BROUG79810

Engine No: G4rFCIUS95919

Reg. Date: | 1/02/2009

Tax Invoice to Vehicle No :SFRY92X

| Quaniity | List Price

53

As recommended by surveyor o proceed repair at total cost/lumpsum cost

Add GST @ 7%
Total Amount payahle

TOTAL: SINGAPORE DOLLAR FOUR THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED EIGHTY ONLY

E.& 0. E

For Kang Car Repaivers I’le Lid

/
7%

AUTHORISED SIGNATURE

PAGE:)
Amount

5%

5% 4,000.00
280.00

53 4,280.00



Invoice Page 1 of 2

—A GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
R RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
. GENERAL \NAG
& INSURANCE 5v2ortisss st
0 ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm
GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MAMAGEMENT CENTRE

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-060752
Date of Request: 23/04/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Kang Car Repairers Ple Ltd
Mo 1 Kaki Bukit Ave &
#02-06 AutoBay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883

Dear SirfMadam,

Enguiry Date 2370472018

Enquiry By ‘Yee Mei Cheng

TP Wehicle No SJWOBETX

Accident Date 22/04/2018

Enguiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer ]Parind of Ingurance Insurer Tel. No.
SJWE85TX Direct Asia insuyance {Singapore) Pte Ltd fZE.fE}MEHB-EEFUZIEUiQ 65322888
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the ariginal reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no respansibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any
loss or damage arising aut of or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp_g... 23/4/2018



[nvoice Pape 2 of 2

= s GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
it & & GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
i fges B U -00, Singapar
B B INSURANCE Fror s 6524 0310 fand 20 30 2030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration Ne: M400017735

TAX INVOICE
Qur Ref No: GR-18-0680752
Date of Request: 23/0472018 Your Ref No: QOnline Purchase
Kang Car Repairers Ple Ltd
Me 1 Kaki Bukit Ave 8
#02-06 AutoBay@Kaki Bukit
Singapore 417883
Dear SirMdadam,
Enquiry Date 23042018
Enguiry By Yee Mei Cheng
TP Vehicle No. SJW985TX
Accident Date 220452018
DESCRIPTION ' | AMOUNT (S$)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00/
Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRO[]Cash[] Cheque

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=d sp_g... 23/4/2018



