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Bl BE = Pte Lid Company Registration No. 199607198R
S1UREAVE L #02-25 PAYA UBLHINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAIM IRE 408933 TEL: (065 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315
Your ref: D18002918MFSH
Our ref: CS/FCI18007576/Uvb DATE: 8/5/2018
The Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

M/s FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir'Madam
INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. SLN 4268G
We thank for vour instruction on 24/4/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
vehicle on 25/4/2018  at the premises of M/s QUAN DE MOTOR TRADING
and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : §$1,080.00
Revised Estimate Amount : S$650.00
"Check" Items Amount :S%

Market Value : 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value : S%

Nett Value :S$

nearside
Description of Damage:

. —_—
The vehicle sustained damages at the e , ( ] 31'
o/s front portion o — "I:L":Jj

g

offside

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

MARCUS CHUA
Licensed Appraiser



Ms @ FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited  CoHeg o 1950001080 GST Reg ko, ME.0OO1676-9
6 Raffles Quay #21-00 Singapare DABSED
Tel (65) 6222 2311 Fax (65) 6222 3547

Claims B Moter Usderwritiog Cegt: 35 Robinson Road #16-01 City House Singapore DBBATT
Tel: (65) 6507 3848 Faw (B5) 6307 3849
wiwwimisfirstcapital.com.sg

Date

Accident Date
Insured Vehicle
Survey Location

Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor

Contact Person

Contact Number.

17-04-2018

13-04-2018

SHCB528G

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

Our Ref No. D1B002918MFSH

Claim Type. Third Party

Third Party Vehicle. SLN4268G

1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE & #01-87 AUTOBAY

MS JENNIFER
0/ 96709191

Fax No. O

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: WE ADMIT LIABILITY QUANTUM TO BE AGREED:

LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MNA
MA

Fax No. 68416315

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

QUAN DE MOTOR

TRADING
MA

EILEEN LEE

Attention. NIL

TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.
This is a computer generated letler, no signature required.

i SRR INTURANCE GROUS




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

;—

From: Veron Chen (LKKAUtD)

Sent: Tuesday, 8 May 2018 11:11 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow Systemn’

Cc: 'EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG'; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002918MFSH/1, SLN 4268G
Attachments: SLN 4268G PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle SLN 4268G
Date of survey: 25/4/2018
Number of days:2 days

Best Regards,
Veran Chen | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 April 2018 11:23 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: EILEENLEE @MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002918MFSH/1, SLN 4268G

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLN 4268G on 25/4/2018 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 24 April 2018 5:25 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002918MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,



Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6250-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408033)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailtu:cwsmntnrclaims@msﬁrstcapital.mm.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 24 April, 2018 5:15 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMDTDRCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.CDM.SG; EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002918MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS5 within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6307 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 April 2018 11:23 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’

Ce: EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002918MFSH/1, SLN 4268G

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle SLN 4268G on 25/4/2018 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 24 April 2018 5:25 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@|kkauto.com>
Cc: EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSM ENT - D18002918MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstca pital.com.sg]

Sent; Tuesday, 24 April, 2018 5:15 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @LKKAUTO.COM

Ce: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; EILEEMLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002918MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,



Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.
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Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owner ID Type:

Owner ID:

Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.:

Vehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine No.:

Chassis No.:

Maximum Power Output:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transfer Count:

Actual ARF Paid:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expiry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Years):

QP Paid:

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount:

PARFIMNF Rehata Fnoing

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle

Company
5161E

SLN4268C

No

08 May 2018

B.MW.

5251 XL

Brown

2008
74114330N52B25AF
WBANU52040CZ89324
160.0 kW (214 bhp)
$51,551.00

23 Feb 2009

23 Feb 2009

3

$51,551.00 ¢ 170

Yes

22 Feb 2019
$25,775.00

22 Feb 2019

B - Car (1601cc & above)
10

$4,889.00

$387.00

$26,162.00

The information contained herein is correct as at 08 May 2018

OK

https:itvrl.ita.gov.sgitaivrifaction/enquireRebate ByPublicBetoreDeraginput P UNC TION_ID=F0304009T1 "M
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LIPS | L MO W) - Kk Bl Your NCD will be affected due to late reporting
SUBMITTED BY: IAEME LEONG SUM PHENG Actusal a-Fliling Submiasion Date & Time: 20/04/2018 12:25

SINGAPORE ACCIDENT STATEMENT

IMPORTANT NOTICE

1, Plaaga rpon comracily the detalla of the acclaent 1o 90esd up the ClelmS procass.

. Tris Form must be complaled Sy the Pofigyholger aodfor the Aulhorised Drer,

3, infgrmation provided must be se lrutidul snd accurate es posslbio. Any wiltul risreprasantaiion o wihalding of masarial facts may aliow inaurance companies io
repudiale polcy abilily.

4, Trm ssus and acceplance of his Forre by Insurencs comganias bs nol an admisalon of policy labllily on tha parl of tha Inguranca Companias.

5 Any felas reporting may be referrad to the Polica lor investigation.

. This rapor will be forwardsd by (he insurers of Ihe GuA Records Menagemen Centre astablished by the Gensral insurance Associzllon of Singapors (G1A) fo
archiving and that coplas of this raport will, for & fas, be mate available upon application by interesled parbes.

7. By the bodgament of (his rEr 1o e Insuners, you hersby consant Lo the srghiving of inde report al the canire and to coplas of the repon being mada avalable
florasad

Date Of Rapar 16/04/2018 12:01
Date Of Accldent 13/04/2018 21:10
Exacl Location Of Accident CARPARK AT BLK 304 CHOA CHU KANG AVE 4

Couniry/State of Loas SINGAPORE

Vehicle Registration Numbar SLN426B0C

! e e TR

Name Of Reglstered Cwnear EAZI CAR LEASING & MARKETING FTELTD

Co Reg Mo 20071518E
Email Addrass NOEMAIL
Moblle Phone Mo (LOCAL) +65-96709191

Altarnative Phane No OFFICE-56840781

AR

".i_r.: g
Manufaciurar B
Model 5251-2.5 (A)

Exact Purpose for which vehicle was being used al
time of accident

Are you claiming under your own Insurance policy -
far rapair to your vahicla?

If Mo, Please state aclion o be laken THIRD PARTY

Yehlcle Calagory PRIVATE HIRE

RS B R S s R
mMame of Insurance Company EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD
Type Of Coveraga THIRD PARTY FIRE AND/OR THEFT
Flaal Pofley YES

Folicy Numbar
Cover Note Number

B e S R PR R

Mame of Drivar LEE ZH| HAD

MNRIC No S8519763)

Date Of Birth 25/06/1985

Ccoupation QUTDOOR

Dale OF Driving Pass 16/12/2009

Criving Experence A YEARS AND 3 MONTHS
Gendor MALE

tabile Mumber (LOCAL) +6590628361
Fax Number

Contact Numbear OFFICE-BEE40TE
EMall Address NOEMAIL

Paga 10i 13
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Address BLK 890A CHOA CHU KANG CRESCENT #15-104
Pnstc.:m:: 881680

Was driver an employea of the Insured's Company YES

If Mo, Ralationship of the Driver with the Insured

\Vehicle Registraticn Number of Driver's Own -
Yahicle =

Insurance Company af Driver's Own Vehicle -

N G TR AR ; R R T
;-b?“ig ‘rflu{ it *fl'rmr.\"n?‘??ﬁ?’girrzﬁ"ﬁ'\‘f ! F

fype OF nmaen:' COLLIDED INTO PARKED VEHICLE

Weainer Conditions CLEAR

Road Surface - DRY

‘Gt intrmatioN 5 i o i )

Was any forelgn vehlcle involved in Lhis icadant'}' WO

Mumber of vehlcles Invalved in tha accident 2

Was any body injured in the Accident? NO

Was any Injured conveyed to hospital by NO 7 *}
ambulance?

WWas any other material aor proparty damaged? ¥YES

| have bean approached by unknown pErs0nNeE)
sollcitingioffering accident claims asslstance,

Mumber of Pasaengers {Im::ludmg Drwer}
Detalls ot Police Adtion ../’ bl
Was tha accidant reparted to the noih:a'?

If Yas,Please siale which Pollce Slation
Was notice of inlendsed Prosecution given? HO
If Yas,against whom?

‘Clroumstances of Accldent - . ’ RS
REFER TO THE ATTACHED HEPDRT
Attachment(s) e B OSSR R Pl g
Ara acc-danl pnutns wallabm four !ttﬂchman!? YES
‘Was thera any videg caplured by Car CamermaT YES
Was there any audig recorded? MO i

DETAILS OF OTHER VEHICLE PROPERTY 1

Vehicle Raglstration Mumber SHCA528G
Vahicha MakeModelCalour COMFORT Taxl
Details Of Propertias
Vehicle Catagory TAXI
Mama of Driver AMBAN BIN TAHIR
MRIC/Passport Mumbar
ontact Number 91196974
Addrass
Pozlcode

Insurance Company Name
Mature Of Damage
Mo, Of Passanger (Including Dirlvesr)

Page 2 of 13
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QUAN DE MOTOR TRADING
1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6, #01-67
AUTOBAY, SINGAPORE 417883
HP: 96709191 FAX: 66840767

First Capital Insurance Limited Bl My Marau, f RA;-.-:# A )
6 Raffles Quay

Singapore 048580

Attn: Motor Claims Department

Date: 23 April 2018
Accid 13 18 involving vehicles SLN C & SHCB528G

at carpark of Blk 304 Cho u Kang Avenue 4
mate cost of re to veh LN42 MW 525i

) Labour Charges:
To check wiring AN § 30.00 0{
Labour for panel beating S 400.00 > OO
To putty and spray painting L 650.00 JZLL"D
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX.: 6256 4315
Reg Mo 199607198R GST Reg. No. 15-8607 198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877

Ref : CS/FCI18007576/Uvbe?
owe: ossavs | [N
Code: FCI2

1.

Policy Particulars ;- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. SHC 8528G Veh. Inspected SLN 4268C
Policy No. Coverage (%) 0.00
Claim No. D18002918MFSH Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From EILEEN Assign Date 241042018
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model BMW 5251 XL (A) c.c 2497
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2009
Chassis No. WBANUS2040CZE89324 Colour GOLD
Odometer 185276 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[245/45R17 NEXEN 7 mm
L/H Front Tyre |245/45R17 NEXEM 7 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |245/45R17 WEST LAKE 7mm
L/H Rear Tyre [245/45R17 WEST LAKE 7 mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE O/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  13/04/2018 Inspection Date 25/04/2018
Survey held at QUAN DE MOTOR TRADING
BLK 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE &
#01-67 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AIDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT.
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON AWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
C)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

2 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SLN 4268C

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) $)
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING WOT NECESSARY 30.00 =
LABOUR FOR PANEL BEATING. 400.00 200.00
TO PUTTY AND SPRAY PAINTING. 650.00 450.00
1,080.00 650.00
GRAND TOTAL 1,080.00 650.00
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | §50.00]

Report Ref No. CS/FCI180075768/Uvbe2
MARKET VALUE: $35,000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $26,162.00=NETT VALUE: $8,838.00

CHUA KANG SENG

Licensed Appraiser

DISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely for the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Repor.

b libility of responsibillty whatsaever, in contact or tor, s accepted to any third party whe may reply 90 the Repert whelly or in par, Any third pamy acting or replying on this
Beport, In whole or in part, does 50 3t his or her own sk,



