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Catherine Chung (LKK Auto)

E—
From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 22 January, 2019 6:39 PM
To: 'Claim Workflow System’; assignments
e EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOMSG
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18003070MFSH/1

Dear Sir/ Madam,

Please be informed that we are unable to conduct the inspection after some attempts to inform the workshap to
present the vehicle.

This case has been pending for a long time due to the uravailability of the owner, therefore we decided to
semporarily close this case.

Kindly advise us if there is ahy arrangement made and will be glad to re-open the case actordingly.

dest Regards,

ntherine Chong | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Mg 6741-8434 | vroail: gssignnwnts@Elkkauli cidm | o 6256-3415
#lk 51, Payn Ubi Industrial Park, Ubd Aveniie 1, #oe-25 | Si408933)

from: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 24 April, 2018 9:17 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Ce: EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18003070MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assighment,

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone; 67918434 | emall: assignmenis@Elkkautosom | fox: 6a56-4315
Bk 51, Pava Uhi Industrinl Parl, Obl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{4o8933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital cont.sg)
Sent: Manday, 23 April, 2018 5:35 PM
To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKALTO.COM
NSMOTORCLAL M CAPITAL.COM.SG; EILEENLEE@MSHRASTCAPITAL.COMSG
Subject: PAI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18003070MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.

Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.
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MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 20-04-2018 Our Ref No. D18003070MESH
Accident Date 14-04-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Vehicle SHA3488P Third Party Vehicle. SHD488G
Survey Lacation NO. 2 ANG MO KIO STREET 63
Contact Person. CANDY KONG
Contact No. B2B76GEBED Fax No. 82571330
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE: LIABILITY UNCLEAR:
ADPSinted LKK AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD
Surveyor
Contact Person NA Fax No. 634168315
Contact Number, MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc : Workshop

Cc : TP Soligitor

Officer incharge

TRANS-CAB AUTO
SERVICES PTELTD

NA

EILEEN LEE

Attention, NIL

TP Solicitor Fax No, NA

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submit the survey report via CWS within 14 days lor survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspettion,
This is a computer Bsherated |elter, no signaturs reguired.
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