LOT:
-

Priority : NORMAL / URGENT

Reference No : i ly V14 GEMV claim No. INOPS: Yes/No DOA:
From (Person) - ey of awh Ref:
Date/Time - Zil!l hi MV:3$

" TYPE:M.Car/ M. Cycle/Bus / Van / Lor

ry/ Taxi/ Prime Mover / Truck / Trailer or

Vehicle No : g_&qng _ D.0.A/As A G]whg_
Make & Model - Crvoen €3 NEW CAR PRICE:$
Registration Date _‘é{qi S0l MV:$ 3ek- 33K, Quote by MNapess
COE Expiry Date: . 35k 3051 FS:$ Date owlulye
LTA Total Rebate Amount:  (PARF) + (COE) = SVE
Calculation for LTA Rebats: ) Calculation for Valuation:
{a) COE Period:\x 12 = Mths " JAverage MV $
As At ' '
———— *.v : . . .
- = Mths Calculation_for Repossessed vehlele:
il - = Mths  |High demand vehicle:... Yes / No - 8
. .jb) Balance Months : Parallel Import.vehidl :;Yes/No, 1-8
More thian T0yrs 6 Y&5/No | - §
x (2] . MV forRepossessed vehicls . 1= §
(a) T sl
U E,r;glne Capac:ty 4 - &
- . —12=___<__ yi§ :|Europe / Asia Car - - , - $
Regiﬁ‘ter Before/After MAY 2002 ' ~--4Car Condition: Goed/Falr/Pobr/Bumt - 3
(e} PARF = (OMV) X X = Nd.of transfer:.." . - $
LTA Totdi Rebate Amount. (d)+(2) Other deduction ﬁ'."- , ~ - $
‘Salvage Value(LTA Rebate - 5%):, Forced-Sales Valts derived - = 3
"'Dat:é{Time A.c.ﬁbn/ Instruction .- . ~.{Additional Information:
e T T
-\——\
‘-\_—
. :




4/20/2018 PARFI/C.OF Rehate Fnanirvy

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle Dow 2 ‘5\'*\\8-
Vehicle Owner Particulars R o |
Owner IDType: ) o o Singapore ngrlcr ) (\ Wb \
Owner ID: 71078 T
Vehicle Details
Vehicle No.: B 7 SKB498G
Vehicle to be Exported: No

- IntVeVndedWDe-registratiron Date; N k A ) 20'Apr 201,8; }
Vehicle Make: ' ~ CITROEN
Vehicle Model: ' C3 1.6 VTI BVA ABS D/AB 2WD 5DR
Primary Colour: ) ' Blue ’
Manufacturing Year: ' ' 2010
Engine No.: - 10FHCK0923992
Chassis No.: - VF7SC5FS9AA643374
Maximum Power Output: 88.0kW (118 bhp)

~ OpenMarket Value: 7 $15,415.00
Original Registration Date: 26 Apr 2011
>First Registration Date: 26 Apr2011
Transfer Count: 1
Actual ARF Paid: ' $15.415.00 ¢ 707
Intended PARF Rebate Details
'PARF Eligibility: ' Yes
PAREF Eligibility Expiry Date: ] 25Apr 2021
PARF Rebate Amount: N $10,019.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 25 Apr 2021
COE Category: A - Car {1600cc & below)
* COE Period(Years): 10

QP Paid: ' $44,000.00 ]
COE Rebate Amount: ' - $13,261.00

. Total Rebate Amount: V $23,280.00

The inrfoi‘mat}c;n contained herein is correct z;s at 20 Apr 2018 ‘ 7 3 o ‘} }

—
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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

ﬂ

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 24 April 2018 8:12 AM

To: ‘clarali@fwd.com’; SUR

Subject: RE: Request for Market Value - Vehicle Number: SKB498G  Our Ref:

1201800004654 DOA: 15/04/2018

Dear Clara,

The market value for SKB 498G is $30K-$33K (Est) as at April 2018.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: clara.li@fwd.com [mailto:clara.li@fwd.com]

Sent: Monday, 23 April 2018 2:42 PM

Subject: Request for Market Value - Vehicle Number: SKB498G Our Ref: 1201800004654 DOA: 15/04/2018
Dear Sirs,

Please advise the market value of the above vehicle as at date of accident 15/04/2018.

Attached a copy of LTA rebate for your reference.

Appreciate if you could revert to us soonest possible.

Thank you.

Kind Regards

Clara Li
Senior Executive, Claims

FWD Singapore Pte. Ltd.
6 Temasek Boulevard, #18-01 Suntec Tower Four, Singapore 038986

T (65)6727 5722
E clara.li@fwd.com
W fwd.com.sg

insurance




Limited time offer!

ATTENTION:

The email and any attachments transmitted with it are private and confidential and intended solely for the use of
the individual or entity to whom they are addressed. If you have received this email in error, please notify the
sender immediately and delete this email and any attachments from your system. You should not use, disclose, copy
or store this email and any attachments.

Messages and attachments are scanned for all viruses known. However, you are advised that you open any
attachments at your own risk. If this message contains password-protected attachments, the files have NOT been
scanned for viruses by our mail domain. Please always scan for viruses before opening any attachments.



