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Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 30 April 2018 9:01 AM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: 17/18/18/VP05/020557      3rd party direct settlement for SKT8674S/ & your insured 

SDQ2868M /DOA:18/04/2018/Est $ ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18007456/ub3 

Attachments: insd report.pdf

 
Dear Shu Pei, 

 
We attached a copy of insured’s GIA report for your attention. 

 
Kindly proceed to obtain the video footage as our insured 
cannot recalled having involved in the said accident.  

 
 

 
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
 

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]  
Sent: Monday, 23 April, 2018 5:35 PM 
To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; GERALD POH WEE BIN; ONG LI LI 
Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) 
Subject: RE: 17/18/18/VP05/020557 3rd party direct settlement for SKT8674S/ & your insured SDQ2868M 
/DOA:18/04/2018/Est $ ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18007456/ub3  

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE                                                                                

 

Dear Sir / Madam, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

This is a TP direct settlement case. 

 

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action. 

 

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Thin Thin and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2360. 

 

Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Shu Pei| Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Monday, 23 April 2018 11:40 AM 

To: 'ERIC WOO JUN KIAT' <ericwoo@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: 17/18/18/VP05/020557 3rd party direct settlement for SKT8674S/ & your insured SDQ2868M 

/DOA:18/04/2018/Est $ 

 

Dear Eric, 

 

Thank you for the assignment. 

 

Please be informed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange. 
 

Best Regards, 

Catherine Chong | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT [mailto:ericwoo@lonpac.com]  

Sent: Monday, 23 April, 2018 11:11 AM 

To: assignments@lkkauto.com 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; shng@kahmotor.onmicrosoft.com 

Subject: FW: 17/18/18/VP05/020557 3rd party direct settlement for SKT8674S/ & your insured SDQ2868M 

/DOA:18/04/2018/Est $ 

 

Dear Catherine / Nivitha, 
 

Kindly refer to our attachment.        
 
Please proceed to conduct a survey of the vehicle SKT 8674S on without Prejudice Basis. 

                                                                                                                                         
We look forward to receiving your report soon. 

 
Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 
Eric Woo 

Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767 

 

From: Ng Sin Hai [mailto:shng@kahmotor.onmicrosoft.com]  
Sent: Friday, 20 April, 2018 7:49 PM 
To: MT_Claim_SG 
Subject: RE: 3rd party direct settlement for SKT8674S/ & your insured SDQ2868M /DOA:18/04/2018/Est $ 

 

Dear MotorClaims,  
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Please refer to the attached pdf, we are assisting our insured vehicle SKT8674S to file a 3rd party claim against your 

insured vehicle SDQ2868M.  

 

Kindly assist and expedite to check the claim liability soonest and to request for direct settlement. 

 

 

Thank you and have a nice day, 

 

Warmest Regards, 

 

Ng Sin Hai 

Kah Motor Co. Sdn. Bhd  
(A member of Oriental Holdings Berhad) 

Body Repair & Paint Centre  

255 Alexandra Road  

Singapore 159937 

DID: 6471 5419  

HP: 9072 1769 

E-mail: shng@honda.com.sg 

 
Right-click or tap and hold here to download pictures. To help protect your privacy, Outlook prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.
http://www.honda.com.sg/email_footer/typeR_email_footer.jpg

 
CONFIDENTIAL NOTE: The Information contained in the e-mail is intended only for the use of the individual 

or entity named above and may contain information that is privileged, confidential and exempt from disclosure 

under applicable low. If the reader of this message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any 

dissemination, distribution or copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this 

message in error, please immediately notify the sender and delete the mail. Thank you for your collaboration. 


