Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 7 May, 2018 8:47 AM

To: Ai Ning Wee

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: CC4/AIG18007423/Khb3

Dear Ai Ning,

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted.

However, we do not have the finalized claim amount at the moment and we would suggest that you lodge an
insurance accident report to any AlG authorized reporting centre or thru AlG website for online reporting.
https://www.aig.com.sg/accident-reporting

Meanwhile, we will follow up on the matter and will get back to you once we have the finalized claim amount for
your further action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1,
#02-25 | S(408933) Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or
distribution by an unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received
this e-mail in error, please do not read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all
attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments
and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Ai Ning Wee [mailto:weeaining@icloud.com]
Sent: Saturday, 5 May, 2018 9:43 AM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: CC4/AIG18007423/Khb3

Dear sir

| refer to your letter of 25 Apr 2018 - Accident involving ET 9028Y and EF 9933H on 15.4.2018 at Church of St Francis
Xavier basement carpark.

| would like to privately settle the case. It was my oversight.
Please assist in my private settlement with the driver of EF9933H.

Best regards
Ai Ning

Sent from my iPhone



