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2y THIRD PARTY REF : SJH 5266 D1 AKG
“tidption/ Labwous Type Unit Price Matt Item Amt Amaunt

‘4:' 4 B98.50 M~
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ESTIMATE TO REPAIR ‘?"@'J SURVEYOR NAME @t
DATE OF SURVEY M. J7. 10|98
VEHICLE NO. : SJS5664H TIME OF SURVEY 0. 156m
MAKE :BMW
MODEL 1 318]1 20L AT ABS D/IAIRBG 2WD 4DR DATE : 12-Jun-18
YEAR : 2009 DATE OF ACCIDENT  : 29-Mar-18
CHASSIS NO : WBAPFT2030A143227 THIRD PARTY REF 1SJRS266 D/ AIG
Qty | Parts Description/ Labour Type Unit Price MNett Item Ami Amaount
1pc Front Bumper /f,, 3 #98.50 [~
1 pc 0/S Front Fender $ /2648.35 |A
1pc 0/S Front Bumper Retainer s 30.057] =
1 pc 0/S Front Headlamp P $ 1,108.65/}=
1 pc O/S Front Sport Rim b - 701.20 X
$ 3,386.75
1 pe 0/S Front Tyre S.Nett s 380.00 4
To putty & spray painting. g‘fn’f 4  S00.00
To check wheel alignment. $Ta 60.00 (X
Labour Charges. % 450.00
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i ) > Back to OneMotoring

Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
Owmer 1D Type:

Orwner 10

Vehicle Details

Wehicle No.:

Viehicle to be Exported:
Intended De-registration Date:
Vehicle Make:

Vehicle Model:

Primary Colour:
Manufacturing Year:

Engine Mo

Chassis Mo

M aximiem Power Outpul:
Open Market Value:

Original Registration Date:
First Registration Date:
Transter Count:

Actual ARF Pald:

Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility:

PARF Eligibility Expdry Date:
PARF Rebate Amount:
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date:

COE Category:

COE Period(Yesrs):

QP Paid;

COE Rebate Amount:

Total Rebate Amount

The information contained herein Is correct as at 05 Jul 2018

Singapore NRIC
2981

SIS56&64H

No

05 Jul 2018

BMW,

3181 200 A/T ABS DVAIRBAG 2WD 4DR
Black

200%
B3T1I517MN46B20BZ
WBAPFT20304A143227
100.0 kW (134 bhp)
£35.178.00

25 Aug 2009

25 Aug 2009

1

£35,178.00

Yes
24 Aug 2019
$19.347.00

24 Aug 2019
8- Car (1601cc & above)
10

$16.290.00

$1.847.00

$21.194.00

OK



Vic !LI{I{Autn!

From: Vic (LKKAuUto)

Sent: Wednesday, 26 September, 2018 5:07 PM

To: richard

Cc: Admin A; mandy@Itm.sg; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Pending Offer / Status - ACCIDENT INVOLVING MOTOR VEHICLES NO
SJR5266D AND 5JS5664H ON 29 MARCH 2018 - REMINDER *** LKK REF:
CC4/AIG1B007419/Khb3

Attachments: DV.pdf

Without Prejudice
Dear Richard,
We refer further to our below email,

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without admission of liability to our Insured’s part, we confirm acceptance of
your offer of $2,677.50 (all in).

Kindly chop and sign the attached DV and forward to us a copy for payment processing.

The above amount is to be made payable to LIM TAN MOTOR PTE LTD.
Thank you.

“Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the obove offer are made on o without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability an our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settiement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any ather related matters.

Best Regards,
Vic Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpehi@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

yEES
SesSRE® = Sgve the Earth Frint only when necessary

This &-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended reciplent is prohibited, and may be a violation of law, If you believe that you received this e-mail In error, please do nol
read this e-mail or any attached items Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, Including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any coples thereof. Thank you.

From: richard [mailto:richard@ltm.sgl

Sent: Wednesday, 26 September, 2018 4:21 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Ce: Admin A; mandy@Itm.sg

Subject: RE: Pending Offer / Status - ACCIDENT INVOLVING MOTOR VEHICLES NO SJR5266D AND 5J55664H ON 29



b

From: richard <richard@ltm.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 27 September, 2018 3:17 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Ce: Admin A: mandy@|tm.sg

Subject: RE: Pending Offer / Status - ACCIDENT INVOLVING MOTOR VEHICLES NO
SJRS266D AND SJS5664H ON 29 MARCH 2018 - REMINDER *** LKK REF:
CC4/AIG1B007419/Khb3

Attachments: SIGNED DV pdf

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Our ref : LTPO72018/063 (SIS 5664 H)
Dear Vic,

In reference to your email dated 26™ September 2018, we now hereby enclosed the duly signed DV for your
necessary action,

We look forward receiving the settlement cheque soonest.

Thank you and regards,

Claims Executive
Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd

www, LTM.sg
+65 6452 0893 (Office)
+b65 6458 9127 (Facsimile)
+65 8484 5418 (Maobile)

Like us in Facebook!!
www.facebook.com/LTMsg

W ; ; L e
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From: Vic (LKKAuto) [mailto:vicalpeh@Ilkkauto.com)

Sent: Wednesday, 26 September 2018 5:07 PM

To: richard <richard @ltm.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; mandy@Itm.sg; Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Pending Offer / Status - ACCIDENT INVOLVING MOTOR VEHICLES NO 5JR5266D AND S155664H ON 29
MARCH 2018 - REMINDER *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG18007419/Khb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Richard,
We refer further to our below email.

Purely for an amicable settlement on a without admission of liability to our Insured's part, we confirm acceptance of
your offer of $2,677.50 (all in).

Kindly chop and sign the attached DV and forward to us a copy for payment processing.

The above amount is to be made payable to LIM TAN MOTOR PTE LTD.

Thank you.

“Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the obove offer are made on o without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liebility on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also nat be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is mode solely to resalve this matter anly. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this affer
in any ather related matters.



Best Regards,
Vie Alpeh | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Y ICIE e
Sl S =~ Sgve the Farth- Print only when recessary-

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distnbution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mall in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any coples thereof, and inform the
sender thal you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you

From: richard |mailto:richard@/tm.sg)

Sent: Wednesday, 26 September, 2018 4;:21 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Ce: Admin A; mandy@Iitm.sg

Subject: RE: Pending Offer / Status - ACCIDENT INVOLVING MOTOR VEHICLES NO SIR5266D AND SI155664H ON 29
MARCH 2018 - REMINDER *** LKK REF: CC4/AIG18007419/hb3

Importance: High

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Our ref . LTPO72018/063 (SIS 5664 H)
Dear Vic,

in reference to the above mentioned claim and our emalls to you dated 31" July and 12' September 2018, please let
us have an update status to the above claim.

Thank you and regards,

Riskard Figp

Claims Executive
Lim Tan Mator Pte Ltd

www. LTM.sg

+65 6452 0893 (Office)
+65 6458 9127 (Facsimile)
+65 8484 5418 (Mobile)

Like us in Facebook!!

www.facebook.com/LTMsg
www.facebook.com/LTM.Performance.Singapore



SINGAPORE boapperanagy
POLICE FORCE duadiscgori M

Tl +85 6547 DOOO

Fix +65 G0AT 4085
vy DOl (pov. S0

Our Ref : TP/IP/22387/2018
Date : 7 June 2018

Tay Ming Hui, Mollie
Blk 688 Jurong West Central 1
#13-215

Singapore 640689

Dear Sir / Madam,

TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJR5266D AND SJS5664H ALONG JURONG WEST
CENTRAL 1 ON 19/03/2018 AT ABOUT 1820 HRS

| refer to the above accident.
2. Please be informed that we have completed our investigations which revealed that the
driver of SJR5266D had committed the offence of Careless Driving under Rule 29 of the
Road Traffic Rules. Action has been initiated against the driver for the said offence.

3. If you have any clarification, you may contact the Investigation Officer, SSS Leslie Tan
at office number: 6547 6144.

4.  Thankyou.

Yours faithfully,

HEAD INVESTIGATION
TRAFFIC POLICE
SINGAPORE POLICE FORCE

This Is a computer-generated letter. No signature is required.

A FORCE FOR THE NATION
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Date: 31 JUL 201 Your Ref: CC4/AIG18007419/hb3
Our ref: LTPOT2018/063 (55 5664 H)
Attention To : Mir Vic Alpeh [From LEKK Anto Coisuitants Ple |id)

Insurance Company : AIG Asia Pacilic Insurance Ple Lid

Dear ShrMdm,
IN THE MATTER OF ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJS5664H & SJRE2068D ON 26.03.2018

We refer 10 the above matter.

We are instrucled and autharised by our cllent to quantify, o act and negalinte setiiament
In related to the above road traffic accident thal was caused by your insured.

All supporting documents are enclosed herewith:-

[ = ] Authorization To Act [ = ] Original Tax involcs no. INVIEZ9E
[ ] oviginal Rental Receipt and Agreement [ ® ] Police investigation Resull
[ ] Letter Of Discharge [ 1

Survey was done by Insurance instruction and was surveyed by Mr Kenneth
on -Jul-18

As a result of the accident, our client's vehicle was damaged and has been put to loss and
Expenses. particulars ol which are as lollows: -

1] Cost of repair (iInclusive of 7% GST) $ 2,407.50
2] Loss of Use ($90.00 x 3 Days| s 270.00
Total $ IEETT.EH

Please acknowledge receipt of this letter within 14 days. If you agregable to the above, please lorward
your payment. Payment to be lssued ullmutlyI to LIM TAN MOTOR PTE LTD within 4 weoks. M

be any injury related to this matter, any settlement agreed |
clalm.
Your faithfully
Mandy Lim
Email: mandy@lim sg
BT b ST | Tid
e r e Chepwn S0 Sy Wing Aufoca WA

Tel 65-B4520803 | ox £ 6304 | ebrul miTMln

|I‘._-: g[S SF ST | By ey RECRCNY | EROSE

T e t el il b depeodices owihoke o LTI i ey il

Y OF ks eallend e prey el ¥ ol Leme Tam
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S1URLAVE 1, 801:25 PAYA UBLINDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065) 62363561 FAX : (D65) 62564315

28 JUNE 2018

LEE KONG HAM @ LEE AH SO0
114 YUNNAN CRESCENT
SINGAPORE 638325

Dear Sir/Madam,

OUR REF : CC4/AIG18007419/hb3

YOUR REF : SJR 5266D

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJR 5266D AND SJS 5664H ALONG BLOCK 692 JURONG
WEST CENTRAL 1 MSCP ON 29.03.2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third

party claim against your policy.

We have received a claim from Body Repairer/Workshop acting on behalf of the owner of
SJS 5664H against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report, accident scenario and available evidence at hand, it was
reported that your vehicle had collided to the Third-Party vehicle SJS 5664H. As such,
liability may not be on your favour,

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD) may be affected as a result of the
claim against your policy

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according
to the rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your
policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your
own cost and defense, please reply to us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the
following to vicalpeh@lkkauto.com within 10 days from the date of this letter_if not

provided at AIG's reporting centre. The list below is not all inclusive and further
document may be required:

+ Police report, Police Investigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence
and status (if any)
Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)
Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)
Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (If any)



!' UU Aufo

- ow - Cansuitants
Ads BA B Fio Lid

£ UBI AVE 1, #11-25 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 488933 TEL 1 1065) 62363561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Video footage of accident (if any)

Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)

If you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third
Party(s), you are to keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the
status of the claim

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with
any of the Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or
settliement without AlG’s prior knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AIG of their rights to repudiate any
claim because of any breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised
driver may have committed.

In the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AIG shall keep
you informed of the final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6256 3561 or email us
at vicalpeh@lkkauto com.

Please quote the claim reference when you contact us that we can assist you more
effectively.

Yours sincerely,

f

/

Vic Alpeh

Cage Handler

DID: 6841 2096

FAX: 6741 4108

Emall vicalpeh@I|kkauto com

c.C. AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Fle Lid
(Mator Claims Dept)



To Whom It May Concern

AUTHORIZATION TOACT

I'We, TA » HUL MOLLIE (ZHENG GHUL, MOLLIE) ("the third party
Claimant’) of BLK 689 JURONG WEST CENTRAL 1 #13-215 SINGAPORE 640689
(Address) owner of SIS56641H (vehicle number) hereby authorize LIM TAN MOTOR
PTE LTD ('the workshop') to act for me with respect to my/our claim for repair costs
and/or rental and/or Loss of use ('claim’) for my/our vehicle number SJSS6641 that
was damaged pursuani to the accident which occurred on 29-Mar-18 (date) along BLK
692A JURONG WEST CENTRAL 1 MSCP DECK 2A LOT NO. 113 (locate on)

involving vehicle number SJRS266D (the accident’),

I/'We further authorize the workshop to settle my above mentioned claim
in a manner that they deem fit and the workshop is further authorized to receive
payment further to settlement of my claim with payment cheque/s being made in
favour of the workshop.

Dated this 6™ (day) of July (month) 2018 (year)

| .
i ,\.'H“ S\
|\I"( =0\ )]

._"_.-.

=

k=] o

Signed By " the third party claimant ' Signed By ' the workshop'



RELEASE VO

c-E i laim

“We/l, LIM TAN MOTOR PTE LTD (“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have reached an
agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK AUTQO
CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for $$2,407.50
(Repair Cost), $$270.00 (Loss of Restal/Use), 88 -- (Disbursement), for vehicle no. §]8 5664H that
was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred on 29/03/2018 (date) along 692A JURONG

WEST CENTRAL 1 MSCP (location) involving vehicle no/s SJ& 5226D. This is pursuant to the
inspection conducted on 09/07/2018 (date) at “the workshop™.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner TAY MING HUI MOLLIE (“the third party
claimant™) of vehicle no. §J8 5664H make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l have
full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/l deem fit. We/l enclose herein
the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/l will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party claimant”
after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and expenses
suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to SIS.
F664H (vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant™ pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a without
prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have
exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this __27th __ (day) of __September _ (month) 2018 (year)

Signed by appointed surveyor Signed by “the workshop" (with chop)
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Sin Ming Autocere Simgapore S75721
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Fax. +63 64589127
Finnil snlesaill TM sg
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AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTELTD
T8 SHENTON WAY
#07-16 AIG BUILDING

TAX INVOICE

siea
SINGAPORE 079120 B e
T DATE X7-07-
ATTN - MR VIC ALPEH MILEAGE i
TEL WONOD. @ SO36015 TERMS CoD
FAX CAR NO. @ SIS566410
ACND, : 30A0007 MAKE ! BMW PAGE .
e B MODEL  : 3201
DESCRIPTION Qry UPRICE  DIS  AMOUNT
I TOLUMP SUM REPAIR AS RECOMMENDED BY SURVEYOR I UNIT 2.250.00 235000
SINCAINIRE IO LARS  TWE THRSANEY FO0R HIUNDREED SEVEN ANID FITY UCENTSONLY
RIMARKS Ny A MavMig 1Al 1y E ]
AL REF  SIRA2660 = . i SUBTOTAL 2.250.00
KK MEF  COMALG I BO0TS 1903 IMSCOLNT (.00
] /-:m TOTAL 2,250.00
s/ " GST 7% 157.50
| 4 '\;}rr ) EN | — — —
3 = | /| NET 2,407.50
,____1‘______;' ] - \ [hm“ .00
AUTHORISED SIGNATURE(S)Z CUSTOMER NAME / SIGNATURE | DATE Louance 2.407.50

'We confirm that 1/'We incurred the repair costs herein and will observe my/our Agreement with the repairer, 1'We

declare the repair for the above vehicle huve been completed to my/our satisfaction
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...CLAIM SUBFOLDER...(Pending for Survey Report)

Fastlane

CLATHM SURFOLDER TRACKING o . R
Case | Notfied [Ft Submited | Ad) Assigned Ad) Rpt Ad) Submitted | ins Authed Status
I I
23 Apr 2018 |33 Apr 2018 $$2,250.00 | $$2,250.00 R for ey
Haln Egtit Rag ks Edit Esnmares | | view spr |

| [Created by adjuster]

LEE KONG MAM © LEE AH S00, 1D -
TAY MING HUT MOLLIE,  D: 584120812

SISS664H | Date of Loss; |23/0%/2018 18:00 - 59

f

: | TP / B4092614495G |m,f_":'" 210014691 1-08000 (Third Party Cnly)

| Policy Ne [
| (Claimant) 10635103

l — Ewcess: | ==

Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd (HQ) Blk 176 Sin Ming Drive 202-08/10, Sin Ming Auto Care, 575721 Sin Ming - Tel: 6452 0893

AlG Asla Pacific Insuranca Ple. Ltd. (Express) - Tel: 65-6419-3000 .. [Handled by Kesaval, Jachyn-M ]

laclyn-M. Kesavaliaig.com

Aviva Ltd (HQ) - Tel: (65) GE2T 9966

LEK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) - Tel: 62563561 ... [Handled by KEMMETH KOMG) ... [Final Rpt dus 03/05/2018]

ASSOCIATED MAIL RECEIVED View All | Compose Cass Mail |
« AIG SG(24/04/2018): NO Ol GIA REPORT

ALL ASSOCIATED TASKS™ view All | Search Tasks | Creste tew Tasx | complee |

Due Date Priority Type  Task Group Subject  Handler Assigned By Completed On Created On Done?
I Mo results.

https://singapore.merimen. com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=dsp_... 4/10/2018
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Claim Documents

*S]S5664H (B4092614495G)
[SIRS5266D]
™
TAY MING HUTI MOLLIE
Mar 29 2018 6:20PM
[LEE KONG HAM @ LEE AH 500])
Lim Tan Motor Pte Litd

Page | of 2

Upiodd Documents 1 Uplnad Photos I Cormposs N Lotter I Upird Viden I Upioad Audio I m
Letters/Correspondences [1oerpage V]| B4 |
to | Finalized On LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HG)  Thumbnail | Print
1 [(Draft) Third Party Express Settlemant - Paymant Breakdown 0 o |
Photos/Images [persoe  ~]| &
(No  Relsbel/Recrder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) [ Thumbnall | Print
1 (310718 08:27 | Odemeter Reading 1] i Load 3G | BA
2 |3407/1805:27 | Chassis Number 0  wwowrs | 4
3 3507/1809:27 | Genersl View B D wairs | A
4 |31/07/18 09:27 Ganeral View D wadws | &A
5 3UNWIE09:27 | General View 0| aaws | A
6 3/07/1809:27 | General View - O wuws | A
7 |31/07/18 09:27 Goneral View D | adrrc | A
8 3107/1809:37 | Ganeral View B O | e | A
9 3Y0NIE09IT | Genersl View D | waarwe | A
10 | 31/07/18 09:27 General View _g_ Load G | BA
113007180927 | General View B © | weirs | A
12 3107/1809:27 | General View 0 wdws | A
(13 31/07/1809:20 | General View O | ers | &
(14 31/07/1809:30 | Reinspection Phote 0 | teadwc | A
15 3/07/180930  Reinspection Photo o O wrs | &
16 Ehrn?usﬂzm Reinspection Photo q Load PG | ;ﬂ
17 31/07/1809:30 | Reinspection Photo @ | tadws | A
18 31/07/1809:30 | Reinspection Photo 0 | wadaws | A
Documentation 1perpage ] A
o | Relsbel/Reorder | LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (HQ) Thumbnail | Print
1 23/04/18 1435 EMAIL FROM AIG DD 23042018 @ | Load roF |
2 [23/04/18 14:39 | TP GIA REPORT __s_ Load PDF
3 35/04/18 11:21  Non reporting letter - Load POF
4 12/06/18 11:55 | OI DRIVING LICENCE STATUS @ | earmr
5 | 12j08/18 1156 | PIR - AGAINST O1 = Load FOF |
& |38/08/18 1607  LETTERTD O1 § Losd POF |
7 |03/07/1816:29 | EMAIL FROM AIG Loed POF 4
8 10/07/18 17:21 | TP ESTIMATE- MARKED Load POF |
4 04/10/1809:55  WORKSHOP INVOICE @) | Loao POF |
|10 f,mnwmna:sa | AUTHORISATION TO ACT FORM o B g Load PDF |
11 [D4/10/1B 09:55 | Release Voucher Load POF |
(o |Finalized On AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. (5G) Thumbmall | Print|
1 1B/05/1810:39 | ©1 GIA REPORT - @ | Load por |

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 4/10/2018
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Documents Checklist

Ilowmml:ﬁmm

“eset | save | print |
iTl'lurl are na document Ehlc;Hltl :ol-mquf:d_

Our Checkiist = LKK Auto Consultants Ps Lid )

Shaw Remarks To: | Handling Insurer
fote: Ramarks srw orivens eniess you whos if 0 oher paries

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRdoc&fuseaction=dsp_doc... 4/10/2018
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NOTE: TO BE COMPLETED BY SURVEYOR TEAM

THIRD PARTY EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

(PAYMENT BEREAKDOWN)
|"|“'hiﬂ-ll No: SJR52660 (Insd veh) Modael: MW 3181 2.0 L [A)
SJS5664H (TP veh)
| Date of Accident: |29/03/2018
Global Sum Settlement | | [ ] Yes | X1 No
Repair Estimate 5 5111.12
Final Repair Cosl :§ 2.407.50
Loss of Use % 270,00 3,00 days at $80.00 per day
Rental {if any) - 0.00 days
LTA [ GIA Search Fea '3 0.00
Others: '3 0.00
:5
Final Settlemant Sum - 287750

Is Third Party Workshop GIA Registered? [ ] YES [X ] NO (Kindlyindicale
palow)

A) For Non GIA Registered Workshop: Agresd Liability 100 (&)
BOLA Applicable: Yes! No BOLA Scenario Na:
B) For GIA Registered Workshop: o

BOLA Liability (%) Assessed Liability (*): [%)
* Assessed Liability to be fited only for chain coillisions and for cases where BOLA does not apply.
Remarks

Payment Instruction: Payee's Breakdown

1) |Lim Tan Motor Pte Ltd - 2,677.50
2) :$
04 Oct
JOANNE LEE KHANG MIN 2018
LKK Auto Consdiltants Pte Ltd Date

Pleasa attach all the supporting documents to the form.
(Final Repair Bill; Rental Involce; Release Voucher; Authorisation to Act; Survey Report; Medical
Report/ Bill {if any)

https:/singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=SVCdoc& fuseaction=dsp_doclt... 4/10/2018
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd ice aeg ne 1essor1eas
51 Ubl Ave 1 #01-25, Paya Ubi Indusirial Park

Singapore 408933
Tel 6256-35681 Fax: 6844-8805 Email: suri@lkkaulo.com;assignments@lkkauto.com

VEHICLE DAMAGE INSPECTION REPORT

Qur File No: CC4/AIG18007419/KHB302

Date: 04/10/2018
REFERENCE
Handling Insurer: AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid. Policy No: 2100146911-08000
Gialmant Vehicle < jsseeat Insured Vehicle No : SJR5266D
Data of Loss: 29/03/2018 Nature of Claim! ™ Claim No: 8408281448506
RIF I IF1 F
Reg No S5J55664H
Make & Model, BMW 3181, 20 L (A) Engine No: B3711517N4BB20BZ
Reg. Date 25/08/20008 (Man, Year: 2009) Chassis No: WBAPF72030A143227
Colour: Metallic Black Odometer: 98045 km
Engine Capacity 1885 cc
Market Value/New Car Price: N/A
Sum Insured (SS$) Market Value/New Car Price
I F TH F
General Condition: Steering (Serviceable): Yes Footbrake (Serviceable): Yes
Handbrake (Senviceable) Yes Engine Modification: No  Pre-accident Condition:
CONDITION OF TYRES
Front Tyre Size: 205/55 R16 Rear Tyre Size 205/55 R16
Front Left Side: Pirelll 4 mm Rear Left Side: Pirelll 3 mm
Front Right Side; Pirelll 4 mm Rear Right Side: Pirelll 3 mm
Tha above walues represent ihe mmaring fyre freads depth
COST OF CLAIMS B Repairer's  Adjuster's Difference  Diff %
Parts 3. 766.75 2,037.20 1,729.55 4592
Miscellaneous Items 0.00 0.00 0.00
Labour 1.010.00 770.00 240.00 2376
Paintwork Labour 0.00 0.00 0.00
Towing 0.00 0.00 0.00
Calculated Gross Total (55) 4. TT6.TS 2,807.20 1,969.55 41.23
Approved Total (Overridden) (S5) 2,250.00
(5%) 4, 776.75 2,250.00 252675 52.90
+ GST 7.00/7.00% (S%5) 334.37 157.50 176.87 52.90
Nett Amount (5§) 5111.12 2,407.50 2,703.62 52.90
+ Loss of Use {3.0 x 5390.00/day) (S§) 270.00
Nett Liability (S5) 2,677.50
INSPECTION
Date of Assignment: 2304/2018
Date Inspected: 09/072018 Inspected At: Lim Tan Motor Pte Lid (HQ)
Blk 178 Sin Ming Drive #03-08/10, Sin
Ming Auto Care
Singapore 575721

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 4/10/2018
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Estimated Period of Repair: 3.0 days

Adjuster: KENNETH KONG Manager: VIC ALPEH

NOTE: This report represants our indings ar (e fmo and place of inspecrion stama hersn. Such inspechion hos been carmd ouf fo e best of our
inowladge and ability but any ather fabiity under any other circumstances (s heraby erpressly secluded.

https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster&fuseaction=gen_... 4/10/2018



Adjuster Report

REPAIR DETAILS

Recommended Parts

Page 3 of 4

No. Qty PartNo. Particulars Condition Repairer's Amount
1 1 *FRONT BUMPER Bucklad 898.50F *BO8.50F
2 1 *0i'S FRONT FENDER Repair 648 35F "
3 1 *0/S FRONT FENDER RETAINER Cracked 30.05F *30.05F
a 1 *0/S FRONT HEADLAMP Mig Cracked 1,108 65F *1,108 65F
5 1 *0/S FRONT SPORT RIM Serviceable T01.20F "=
6 1 *0/S FRONT TYRE Sarviceable 3JB0.ODFS ~Fs
F=Franchiae part S=Spchatl
Total Parts (S8) 3,766.75 203720
Report was unsubmitied during this print-out. |
https://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 4/10/2018
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Recommended Miscellaneous ltems

There are no new miscellaneous tems selected.

Recommended Labour

No Particulars Lab.Type Repairer's Amount
Labour ltems

1 TO PUTTY & SPRAY PAINTING New 500.00 450.00
2 TO CHECK WHEEL ALIGNMENT Mew 60.00 0.00
3 LABOUR CHARGES New 450.00 320,00

Gross Labour Cost [S§) 1,010.00 T7T0.00
Report was unsubmitied dunng this print-out
< END OF ESTIMATES >

https:/singapore.mermmen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRadjuster& fuseaction=gen_... 4/10/2018



