Catherine Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Joel Goh <joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 2 May, 2018 8:49 AM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto); 'assignments'

Subject: RE: Pre-repair Inspection for SJV3462X. Your Insured Vehicle no : SLP1947K(EQ)

(DM18HO01030-JG)

Dear Catherine
Our reference is DM18H0O01030-JG
Best Regards,

Joel Goh
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EQ Insurance Company Limited

did tel fax

Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this message. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the .

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, May 2, 2018 8:44 AM

To: Francis Ng; 'assignments’

Cc: Joel Goh

Subject: RE: Pre-repair Inspection for SJV3462X. Your Insured Vehicle no : SLP1947K(EQ)

Dear Francis,

Kindly provide us the claim number.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 20 April, 2018 3:16 PM

To: 'Francis Ng' <francis.ng@eginsurance.com.sg>; 'assignments' <assignments@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: 'Joel Goh' <joel.goh@eginsurance.com.sg>

Subject: RE: Pre-repair Inspection for SJV3462X. Your Insured Vehicle no : SLP1947K(EQ)



