Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 5 December, 2018 5:20 PM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020546 Accident involving SJL7140B & SDV7798Y

at junction of Hampshire Rd along Keng Lee Road on 14/4/18****| KK
REF:CC4/LPC18007285/M1wb3

Dear Vivian
Please proceed.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 5 December, 2018 10:35 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020546 Accident involving SIL7140B & SDV7798Y at junction of Hampshire Rd
along Keng Lee Road on 14/4/18****| KK REF:CC4/LPC18007285/M1wb3

Your ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020546
LKK ref: :CC4/LPC18007285/M1wb3

Hi Gerald
We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 26 April 2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

This is a head-to-rear collision.. BOLA 27 Liability is 100%

Summary to offer to third party repairer, Comfortdelgro Engineering Pte Ltd - Braddell. is as follows: -

Claimed Revised Amount
Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $8,839.87 $ 6660.30
2. Loss of RENTAL ($ 117.70 x 5days) $ 588.50 $ 535.00(5days x $107.00 )
3.GIA SEACH $ 2.00 $ 2.00
4. Medical Fee $ 143.35 $ 143.35
Total | $9,573.72 $ 7.340.65

**06 days recommendation for repair
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval.




Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 April, 2018 6:53 PM

To: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>; GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@l|onpac.com>; 'ERIC WOO JUN KIAT'
<ericwoo@Ilonpac.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)
<vivianlau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020546 Accident involving SJL7140B & SDV7798Y at junction of Hampshire Rd
along Keng Lee Road on 14/4/18**** KK REF:CC4/LPC18007285/M1wb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
We had inspected TP vehicle SDV 7798Y at M/s Comfortdelgro Engineering Pte Ltd - Braddell.
Enclosed for your perusal is:
- Estimated cost of repair

- Preliminary advice

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]

Sent: Thursday, 19 April 2018 4:19 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@I|kkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)
<vivianlau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020546 Accident involving SIL7140B & SDV7798Y at junction of Hampshire Rd
along Keng Lee Road on 14/4/18****| KK REF:CC4/LPC18007285/M1wb3

Hi Shu Peij



Attached is our Insured’s GIA report.
Eric

In future, please provide our Insured’s GIA report (when available) to LKK at the time of
assignment.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 19 April, 2018 3:08 PM

To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; GERALD POH WEE BIN; ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020546 Accident involving SIL7140B & SDV7798Y at junction of Hampshire Rd
along Keng Lee Road on 14/4/18****| KK REF:CC4/LPC18007285/M1wb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Our case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 8625.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 19 April 2018 9:22 AM

To: 'ERIC WOO JUN KIAT' <ericwoo@Ilonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020546 Accident involving SJL7140B & SDV7798Y at junction of Hampshire Rd
along Keng Lee Road on 14/4/18

Dear Eric,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT [mailto:ericwoo@lonpac.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 18 April, 2018 5:16 PM

To: assignments@Ilkkauto.com

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Subject: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020546 Accident involving SJL7140B & SDV7798Y at junction of Hampshire Rd
along Keng Lee Road on 14/4/18

Dear Catherine / Nivitha,
Kindly refer to our attachment.

Please proceed to conduct a survey of the vehicle SDV 7798Y on without Prejudice Basis.

We look forward to receiving your report soon.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Eric Woo

Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767



