Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

H

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc
Subject:

Dear Vivian
Please proceed.

Regards,
Ong Li Li

OMNG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>

Wednesday, 5 December, 2018 5:20 PM

Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); GERALD POH WEE BIN

MT_Claim_SG; Admin A

RE: Our Ref 17/18/18/VP05/020546 Accident involving SJL71408 & SDV7T798Y
at junction of Hampshire Rd along Keng Lee Road on 1A/4/18% %+ (K

REF-CC4/LPC18007285/M1wb3

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
200 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) [mailto:vivianlau@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 5 December, 2018 10:35 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN
Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Admin A

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/ 18/VP05/020546 Accident involving SIL7140B & SDV7798Y at junction of Hampshire Rd
along Keng Lee Road on 14/4/18****LKK REF:CC4/LPC18007285/M1wb3

your ref: 171818/ VP05/020546

LLKK ref: :CC4/LPC18007285/M1wh3

[ Gerald
We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good
i*rincipal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

office on 26 April 2018 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our

I'his is a head-to-rear collision.. BOLA 27 Liability is 100%

Summary to ofler to third party repairer, Comfortdelgro Engineering Pte Ltd - Braddell. is as follows: -

Claimed Revised Amount
Amount
|. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $8.839.87 § 6660.30
7 Loss of RENTAL (5 117.70 x 5days) % 588.50 $ 535.00(5days x $107.00 )
3.GIA SEACH 3 2.00 §F 2.00
| 4. Medical Fee $ 14335 $ 14335
Total | §9,573.72 $ 7.340.65

#*() days recommendation for repair

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The ahove is for vour approval.




Thank you

[fest Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email; Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Bk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: 5hu Pei (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 26 April, 2018 6:53 PM

To: ONG LI Ll <llong@lonpac.com>; GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; 'ERIC WOO JUN KIAT'
<gricwoo{@lonpac.com>

Ce: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)
<yivianlau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020546 Accident involving SIL71408B & SDV7798Y at junction of Hampshire Rd
along Keng Lee Road on 14/4/18****LKK REF:CC4/LPC18007285/M1wb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

We had inspected TP vehicle SDV 7798Y at M/s Comfortdelgro Engineering Pte Ltd - Braddell.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | emall: shupsi@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Glk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408333)

From: ONG LI LI [mailto:llong@lonpac.com]

Sent: Thursday, 19 April 2018 4:19 PM

To: Shu Pej (LKKAuto) < i@lkkauto.com=

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

<yivianlau@lkkauto.com:=>
Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020546 Accident involving SIL7140B & 5DV7798Y at junction of Hampshire Rd
along Keng Lee Road on 14/4/18%***LKK REF:CC4/LPC18007285/M1wb3

Hi Shu Pei



Attached is our Insured’s GIA report.

Eric

In future, please provide our Insured’s GIA report (when available) to LKK at the time of
assignment.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@ikkauto.com]
Sent: Thursday, 19 April, 2018 3:08 PM

To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; GERALD POH WEE BIN; ONG LI LI

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020546 Accident involving SIL7140B & SDV7798Y at junction of Hampshire Rd
zlong Keng Lee Road on 14/4/18****LKK REF:CC4/LPC18007285/M1wb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.
T'his is a TP direct settlement case.

Kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Our case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 8625.
Thank you.

Rest Regards,
Shu Pai| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6266-0055 | email: shupei@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Ok 51, Paya Ubi industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408333)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 19 April 2018 9:22 AM

To: 'ERIC WOO JUN KIAT' <ericwoo@lonpac.com>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>

Ce: 'MT_Claim_SG' <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@Ilkkauto.com>

subject: RE: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020546 Accident involving SIL7140B & SDV7798Y at junction of Hampshire Rd
along Keng Lee Road on 14/4/18

Dear Eric,

hank you for the assignment.

BRost Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin



1 KK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
['lione: 6741-8434 | email: agsignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
[k 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

Erom: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT [mailto:ericwoo@lonpac.com]
Sent: Wednesday, 18 April, 2018 516 PM

To: assignments@!kkautn.mm
Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@lonpac.com=>

Subject: Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP0D5/020546 Accident involving 5IL7140B & SDV7798Y at junction of Hampshire Rd
along Keng Lee Road on 14/4/18

Dear Catherine / Nivitha,
Kindly refer to our attachment.

Please proceed to conduct a survey of the vehicle SDV 7798Y on without Prejudice Basis.

We look forward to receiving your report soon.

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Eric Woo
Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6279 9253 | Fax: (65) 6296 3767



BIE/SDVT798Y/20160414/05-CL ) -
02/11/2018 /"; — % o

st Vo L LN
M/s Lonpac Insurance Berhad i EAN CAHLE . /j

300 Beach Read

§17-04/07, The Concourse

Singapare 199555

Attn: Motor Claims Department WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sics

ACCIDENT ON 14/04/2018 INVOLVING SOV7798Y & SJLI1408
ALONG JUNCTION OF HAMPSHIRE ROAD ALONG KENG LEE ROAD

We are the authorised repair workshop for the owner of vehicle, SDVTI30Y, which was involved
in the captioned accident with your insured's vehicle. The vehicle owner has requested and

authorised us to assist him/her in presenting his claim against the party responsible for
the damage to the vehicle.

ns the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured, SJLT140B, we are subnitting
thesa claims for your consideration on behalf of the pwner/driver/claimant.

1. Cost of Repairs 6, 660,30
2. 5.0 days Car Rental & $117.7 388,50
3. 4.0 days loss of Use & 560 320.00
4. Surveyor Fee 2
5, LIA Fee =
€. TP{GIA Fes 2.00
7. Medical 1335
. Others -

[E&0E}  7,714.15

Hie enclose the following documents to support the claims: -

| - Repair/Excess Bill [} Insurance Certificate
[ | Surveyor Report |~ Power of Attorney

[ ] Coloured Photographs [ #] Car Rental Bill

-] GIR/Police Report(s) | -1 Medical Bill

|~ | GIR/TP Search [ ] Witness Btatement

[ ] Others:

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our client's claim
as soon as possible,

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without
prejudice to any personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/driver/claimant.

Yours faithfully

Cecilia Lee

CDGE Claims Department

3% Loyang Drive S(508363]

DID: 6214 8354  FAK: 6214 1843  Email: cecilialeefsparkcarcare.com

COMFORIDELGRO




COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

A mamber of COMROR

POWER OF ATTORNEY

ACCIDENT INVOLVING (Owner's Vehicle No.) ; and (Third F‘artyf'ﬁ‘u’ehi:ma No.)
oo B DA o JUMIY  caleng : = tiesra FiLY ()
Policy Nos: =

BY THIS POWER OF ATTORNEY, "IWe, _ _ —  ———————— _ *NRIC/Passport
Mo. _ I ; 14T dAddress)® o S Ay A A =

_ . = R L L

incorporate in Singapore and having its registered office at (Address)” __

~ owner of Vehicle Registered No. SOVIT 74

~___ hereby irrevocably appoint ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd (CDGE), a

o COompany incorporated in Singapore and having its registered office at .

its agents or any person authorized by CDGE to be *my/our Attomey and in “myfour name(s) and on *mylour behalf

to do all or any of the following:

1. To submit, resolve and make any claim(s) (including the commencement of legal proceedings) which *liwe may
have against the other *party/parties to the Accident and under tige insurance *policy/policies taken up by such
*party/parties or altematively under Insurance Palicy No. WU "}_0 " taken up by "melus in respect

of the cost of repairs, loss of use and at all other costs and expenses, elc. suffered by “mefus arising from the
Accident (loss and damage).

2 Forthe purpose of such claim(s) as aforesaid, to appoint solicitors on “mylour behalf as * mylour Attomey shall in his absolute
discretion, deem fit.

3. To collect payment(s) due in respect of any such claim(s) for the loss and damage, such payment to be made
by way of cheque in favor of ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd , CDGE and to give a valid receipt and discharge
therefor.

4, For any of the purposes aforesaid. to execute, sign, seal and deliver all documents whatsoever in relation thereto.
=
;. Generally do all such acts as it shall deem necessary for the purpose of settling such claim(s) and

6. To agree to any settlement at the absolute discretion of CDGE.

“|/\We hereby declare that all acts, instruments and documents done by virtue of this Power of Attorney on “my/our
behalf by the Attorney, its agents or any person authorized bg CDGE in that behalf shall be as good valid and effectual
to all intents and wrpnses whatsoever as if the same had been done or executed by *me/fus in *mylour own proper

erson(s) and *I/We hereby ratify and confirm, all acts, instruments and documents done or executed by virtue of
he authority and powers hereby conferred.

“|/We hereby further declare that the powers and authority hereby conferred shall remain irrevocable.

“I/We further confirm that the acceptance by CDGE of the setlement amount in respect of such constitute the full discharge
of my/our claim(s) in respect of such loss and damage.

“IN WITNESS WHEREOF. *I/'We have hereunto to set *myfour hand and seal this day of the month of

__ Year Two Thousand -———(20—)

Signed, Sealed & Delivered By

Customers Name:
NRIC No.;
Co's rubber Stamp

Aedmbn ne ammeAaRrinto Inenranca



| 1]
“

" LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO : 17/18/18/YPOS/020546
DATE : 17 December 2018

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

UWe. ONG MUN HO confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD and/or owner of SIL 71408 the sum of Singapore Dollar Seven Thousand Three
Hundred Forty Only ($ 7,340.00) in full and final satisfaction, liquidation and
discharge of all property losses competent 10 mefus upon the said M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses sustained by me/us whether
now or hercalter 1o become manifest, arising cither direetly or indirectly from an

accident involving SIL 7140B & SDV 7798Y on 14 April 2018 along BUGIS

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnily (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD/CHEW CHENG HAI / CHERRY CHRISTINA CHWEW YIMEI) against
all claims and any claims whatsoever  made by any person/persons on our behalt n
respect of the said accident.

UWe further authorize you to pay the above scttlement sum directly to
COMFORTDELGRO ENGINEERING PTE LTD

I/We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of

liability basis and wighout prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
!

Signature of vehicle owner/Date

@ﬁ& Mun Hﬂ

T A

Nuame of vehicle owner /Date



ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid

Corpovate Ol Car Care Cantras A — - YT
A s C I/ ANENE )

L i
ol

| COMPANY REG. NO- 199506048
TAX INVOICE GST REG. NO. 88321817

010042 VEHCLE NO INVOICE NO, /DATE
SDVT798Y 91404970 31.10.2018
LONPAC TNSURANCE BERHAD
THE CONCOURSE MAKE JOB NO.
, TOYOTA 305147590
300 BEACH ROAD #17-04/07
; : A MODEL ODOMETER READING
SINGAPORE 85G 199555 ALTIS N —
CONTACT NO: 62507388 PRS- 505
CHASSTS CODR
17RX404363

Description : OD — ATG W/REC (LONPAC)

"4/No Part No. Oty Unit Price Net
Description
(11 20=5101]1 1 BAC ; . O i i
CABOUE CHARGES 0 4;110:00 50 AL
02 1979 1 BC 40,00  SGD 40.00
REAR NUMBKR PLATE WITH CASING
03 1979 1 pC 812,66  SGD 812, 66
REAR BUMPER
04 1979 1 PC 58,74  SGD 58.74
REAR BUMPER SIDE RETATNER TH
05 1979 1 PC 58.74  SGD 58.74
REAR BUMPER SIDE RETATNER RH
06 1979 1 PC 51.18  8GD 51.18
REAR BUMPER UPPER RETATNER LH
o7 1979 1 PC 51.18 aGD 51,18
REAR BUMPER UPPER RETATNER RH
—05 19749 1 PC 32.48 86D 372.48

REAR BUMPER BRACKET IH

Cheeaus eshould be crossed and made pavable to "ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd®

ZomfortDelGro Enginecring Pre Lid
L member of COMFORIEN Lao

ACCOUNT No.

INVOICE No. AMOUNT

Jead Office:

M5 Braddell Road
Ik CExt | Level 2
singapore 579701

8010042 91404970 6.660.30

St Finance Department |
Lindly nota that no receipt shall be issued unless requesied, llL_

ZUSTOMER'S COPY




ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Ltd

Corporate Office Car Care Cantra
i 16l Fir 10% Bradclel Fond

8010042

LONPAC INSURANCE BERHAD
THE CONCOURSE

J00 BEACH ROAD #17-04/07
STNGAPORE SG 1909555

S/No  Part No,

Descrintion
09 1979

REAE BUMPER RRACKET RH
10 1979

RERE BUMPER REINFORCEMENT
11 1979

TATLLAMP LH
| 1979

TATLLAMF EH
13 1979

BOOTLID
14 1979

BOOTLID LOCK
15 1979

BOOTLID EMBLEM [L0x30
16 1979

. BOOTLIN EMBLEM COROLLA

1.7 1379

ROOTLID FMBLEM ALLTTS
18 19749

BOOTLIN CHROME MOULDING
19 1979

BOOTLID LAMF TH
20 1974

REAR END} PANEIL
21 1979

REAR END PANEI. TOP GARNISH

nnfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid
nember of COMPORIDELLRD

g Offteomis should ba crossad and mads pavakle o900

5 Braddell Road

K CExat 1 Level 2

1gapore 57970

tin: Fimance Departiment

wdly note that no receipt shall be issued unless requested,

JSTOMER'S COPY

CIF /R0 NE

fewrt Dl |

COMPANY REG. NO: 199506048W

TAX INVOICE GST REG. NO. Ne=OBZ21817-
VEHCLE NO TNVOICE NO. /DATE
Spu7798Y 91404970 31.10,2018
MAKE JOB WO,
TOYOTA 305142530
MODEL ODOMETER READING
ALTIS —
DATE OF EEG
CHASSTS CODE
17R¥404363
oty Unit Price Net
1 PC 32.48 BGD 32.48
1 PC 252,37 SGD 20d.37
1 PC 276,23 b 1)) 276,23
1L PC 276,23 56D 276.23
1 PC 530,13 5GD 530.13
1 PC 261.96 SGD Zbl, 96
1PC 44 .07 26D 44 .07
1l PC 43,93 SGD 43.93
1 PC 32.56 SGD 32.56
1 PC 232,94 86D 232.94
1 PC 146,70 3GD 146,70
1 FC 254 .96 86D 254,96
1 PG 212.14 S6G0 212.14

ACCOUNT No. >4 INVOICE No. AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No




ComfortDelGro rmjmwnm Pte Lt

Llu lI I!}ll.I ar Cara Contras

COMPANY REG NO: 1 ﬁﬂ48ﬂ

TAX INVOICE GST REG. NO. Ni:8821817.
80100472 VEHCLE WO INVOICE NOQ, /DATE
SIV7798Y 91404970 31.10.2018
LONPAC TNSURANCE BRRHAD
THE CONCOURSE "Thg‘FﬂTﬁ Jggﬁm'ﬂq[}
300 BERCH ROAD #17-04/07 -
SINGAPORE SG 199555 nﬁ‘?%-[' 0 e o
DATE OF REG
CHASSIS CODE
17R¥X404363
3/No  Part No, Oty Unit Price Net
Descriotion
22 1979 3 PC 6.54 SGD 19.62
EEAR END PANEL TOP GARNISH CLIPS
23 1974 1 PC 350,00 3G0 350,00
REVEREE SENSOR
24 1979 1 PC 9.68 SGD 9,
TAILLAMP CLIP TH o
25 1979 1 PC 9.68 2GD 9.68
TAILLAMP CLTF RH
26 1979 4 PC 5,98 5GD 23.92
REAR BUMFER CLIPS
Items total 6.224,.58
Add GST @ T1.000 % 435,72
Invoice amount 6,660, 30
Issued hv : SIEWHWA 31.10,2018 15:03:08

- hepair tyvpe ¢ CRSO/52/50
anmn’r Tvyee/Term: /Credit 30 davs

miortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid
Tembeck HomiaRitEceg ACCOUNT No. s INVOICE No. AMOUNT BANK/CHQ No.

ad Offtheaue should be crossad and made navabls to
i Braddell Road

(O Ext | Level 2

Eapaore 379701

n: Finance Department ‘ J

|
diy note that no receipt shall be issuad unless requasted. b - A s A
STOMER'S COPY




GST REG No.: M2-0044678-0

COMFORIDELGRO
RENTACAR

ComfortDelGro Rent-A-Car Pte Ltd
2045 Braddedl Road Singapaore 579701
Malnline +55 G352 0688

Facsimile +G5 GBGS 1818

WWW, G rEMaGar.Lom. 50

TAX INVOICE
Company Ragisiration Mo . 1981057 75H
Invoice No.: R0209024TD
Account No. CRI0003409 RA Ref No. : CR-18-140308
Hirer's Mame Mr Ong Mun Ho c/o COGE Braddell Invoice Date © 26-April-2018
Wame 2 (SAP)
Address 205 Braddell Rg
Driver Name  © Mr Ong Mun Ho c/io COGE Braddell
Country Singapore Postal 579701
Mame 2 (SAP)
Afteantion Ms Brenda
Vah Regn Ma. SKT1631L Paymant : Bill Company
WA MO, 111 3854
hiodal Type MAZDA T 1.5 A
Stan Dale 21-Apr-2018 10:30
End Data 26-Apr-2018 15:15
Druralion 5 day({s)
Mileage In 42
Mileage Chut 0928
Repi Mileage ]
iption Amount (SGD)
Car Rental $550.00
Sub Total : §550.00
Add GST 7.00% % $38.50
Total Invoice Amount : §588.50
Ramarks

Original Car No.: SDV7TT98Y

IMPORTANT

1. Please quote the Involce No. when making payment,

2. Payment should be made payable to ComfortDelGra Rent-A-Car Pt Ltd,

Bank Code
Branch Code

1 T214
;001

Bank Account Na. - DB18385005

Bank Mame

: Citibank MN.A. Singapore

3. Payment advice to @ accounts@cdgrentacar.com.sg

This is compuwler genorated fnvoice, no signatue (s required.

COMFORIDELCRC

Sales Person ;

Prepared by :

Operations

Daominic Pung Chi Hui

26-Apr-2018




Tnvoice 15:55:54 PM Page 1 0i 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone; #65 6224 0010 Fax; +65 6224 0030
Dperating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to 5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref Ma. GR-18-057054
Date of Request 16/04/2018 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

ComfortDelGro Engineering Pte Lid
205 Braddell Road
Singapore 579701

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 16/04/2018

Enguiry By Kristy Tay Siew Hwa

TP Vehicle Mo. SJLT140B

Accident Date 14/04/2018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle Mo. ||In5urer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. MNo.
SJL7140B |Lonpac Insurance Bnd 10/12/2017-09/12/2018 +65 62507388
Thank You

The images provided o you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no respansibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any

loss or damage arising out af or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

oo Fnfeahav=MTReas& fuseaction=dsp_... 16/04/2018



Invoice

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Our Ref Mo GR-18-057054
Date of Request: 16/04/2018

ComfortDelGra Engineering Ple Ltd
205 Braddell Road

15:55:54 PM

Page 2 ot 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to 5pm
GST Registration No; M40001 1735

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Singapore 578701
Dear SirfMadam,
Enquiry Date 16/04/2018
Enquiry By Kristy Tay Siew Hwa
TP Vehicle No. SJLT140B
Accident Date 14/04/2018
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S%) N
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
ﬁota.l Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You.
This is a computer generated document and reguires no signature.
For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[ GIRO[]Cash[] Cheque
e e lnlmimelindey cfm?fusebox=MT1 Rsas&fuseaction=dsp_... 16/04/2018



e 1= — Wo, 47 Jalan Tan Tock Seng, Singapore 208433
|2 |! an | DCLL bﬁilg “Tel. 62566011 (Main Line], 63577000 (Central Appaintment Room), 65114338 (Biling Enguines)

HOSPITAL Fax. 62569234 Reg Mo, 199»0[!3?3_31'1 B -
T e e o s ety e e e e T ")
TAX INVOICE
TO:
MDM. MAK MAE LING MRAN/NRIC - g1772111!
BLK 23 #07-11 CASE NO + 1218435639.J-00001
JALAN RAJA LIDANG VISIT DATE +14.04.2018 17:39
SINGAPORE - 320216 LOCATION : TCEMD
INVOICE DATE +14.04.2018
TYPE OF SUPPLY CASH/CREDIT
GST REG NO - M2-0094564-6
PATIENT NAME : MAK MAE LING PLEASE PAY UPON RECEIPT OF THIS INVOICE
SERVICE AMOUNT
(S)

ED Service Facility 240.00
== Elbow, Left 43.31
An, Cervical Spine, AP & Lateral 75.94
Total Charges 359.25
Government Subsidy 239.25-
Total Amount Payable 120.00
PAYMENT:

MAK MAE LING ( VISA - 14.04.2018 , RECEIPT # T01 1560455 ) 120.00
TOTAL DUE AFTER PAYMENT 0.00
DUE FROM:

MAK MAE LING 0.00
FOR INFOBRMATION
Total amount payable after GST is 5128.40.

™| GST for this bill at 7% is $8.40 which is absorbed by the Government.
'.ﬁmgmwrxau!;mr: ﬁ.l&ﬂ.’ﬁ?\'_ MEHSHIELD LIFE CLAIN DETARLS OHLIKE: & 1AAD4E01 B10:5
Lisiir 10 mypogl oniing SEnicos with your SingPass & il cpl.0ou. 50 and procesd io My Statemenk Seelion B = MadsaveMediShild Lifisf e

Inbeprabed Shoead Plan Crgms and Resmburzemants. For mora \nformation, pease visd g fwww cpl.goe.sg = FAD == Healihcam A Member of the
Promss relar i backpaga for rembusement infomalion for Eplopecs and frigurars] Mational Healthcars Gri



Tan Tock beng
|§, __noseiTAL

e e Gty Fund aglively helps restdy pabierts

@ST REG Ho @ M2-0D094564-6
817721111

Mak MAE LING

ALy 23 #07-11 JALAN RAJA UDANG
SINGAPORE 329216

R¥x HO:EF-1654460 on 14/04/2018

Lecount: 1218435633000001
PRESCRIBED IT =
Subsidised: Standard 1 (B1)

PLREACETAMOL 450MG, ORPHEMADRINE 3I5MG TRE
subtotal far 51

Government Subsidy

payeble for 51 after Zovermmant Subaidy

R:-“-EP-JEEJHEJ. on 14/04/2016

Account: 1218435639J00001

PRESCRIBED ITEM(S)

Subsidised: Standard 1 (81}

FRMOTIDINE ZOMG ThE

subtotal for 51

Government Subsidy

Payable for 51 after Government Subsidy

gthers: Fon-formulary (KF)
ETORICOXIBE S0ME ThRB {ARCONIA)
subtotal for NF

Payable for HF

TOTAL AMOUNT
Rounding Adjustment
PAYMENT: Visa

OUTSTANDING AMOUNT
-

Teral GST for this bill ac 7% is $1.05 =14

Mo, 11 Jalzn Tan Tack Seng, Singapore SUB433
Tal- 6256 6011 (Main Ling), 6357 7000 (Central
B Fax: 6256 9234 Reg Mo, 199003883N

Appaintment Room), 55711 4338 (Billing Enquiries)

TAX INVOICE

ORIGINAL
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TAX INVOICE :

DATE
Councer

Cashiay

Patient/Order

Qry

40 TRBE

Patient/Ordecr

Qey

14 ThB

7 ThB

which 51.05 ig absorbed by the Government.

MEDICATIONS AND HEALTH PRODUCTS PURCHASED ARE MOT REFUNDABLE OR EXCHANGERBLE.

VIEW YOUR MEDISAYE AHDIOR EDESHIELD LIFE GLAIN DETRILS OHLINE:

Legin 1o rycps onling sorvices wih your SingPass &l e e cpl goe 5g and Brocagd o Wy Statament o> Section B »w MedsavatdediShisid Lils?
Intagratad Shisad Plan Ciaime and Reimoursaments. Far moms infarmation, pleass vt bt zplagyeg == FACH > Heakncare.

{Plaass rafer o becimags T redmbeirsamenl iromaahion far Emplapers andd inzurerl

v
]
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EP, EP CASHIER

TOTEnse

Type/Fin.Cl: AE/AE/HA
Gross ayable
54.00 £0.00
54.00

-%4 .00

50.00

Type/Fin.Cl: AE/AR/HA
Gross Payable
41.40 $0.00
§1.40

-51.40

$0.00
514 .98 £14.98
£14.98

514 .98
820.3% 514 .98

-§0.03

514,95

§0.00



