KUM CHEW MOTOR WORKSHOP

160, Sin Ming Drive #05-08
Sin Ming Autocity, Singapore 575722,
TEL: 6453 6256, 64563715 FAX: 64557754
Email:kumchew]@singnet.com.sg

Date :05/07/2019

AIG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE LTD

78, SHENTON WAY #07-16

SINGAPORE 079120.

Dear Sir/Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SLS 9995 C & SCU 44 C ON 15/04/2018.

We act for Mr Lee Cher Kia the owner of motor vehicle SL.S 9995 C
which was involved in the above accident.

Our client has suffered loss and damage as a result of your agent and/or servant/your
insured’s negligence in the driving of motor vehicle No. SCU 44 C.

We quantify our client’s claim as follows;-

Cost of Repair (inclusive of GST)  :$7,329.50

Loss of Use (10 days x $100} : $1,000.00

The following supporting documents are enclosed herewith:-

1. Copy of Tax Invoice from Kum Chew Motor Workshop;

Thank you!

Yours faithful




Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 27 May 2019 3:30 PM

To: Muhammad Suhaimi; IMAD.NASR@BBENERGY.COM
Subject: RE: Accident Report for SCU44C.

Our Ref: CC4/AIG18007195/M1ea3

27 MAY 2019

BB ENERGY ASIA PTE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SCU 44C AND SLS 9995C ON 15/04/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you
and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will therefore proceed to negotiate
for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and settlement, please contact us
within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for commercial vehicles)
upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed
utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Asher

Case Handler

DID: 6841 6051

FAX: 6741 4108

Email: Ashersng@lkkauto.com

C:C AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dept)

From: Muhammad Suhaimi <bobbyyankee69 @gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, 24 May 2019 4:58 PM



LETTER OF AUTHORITY & INDEMENITY

Kum Chew Motor Workshop
160, Sin Ming Drive #05-08
Sin Ming Autocity
Singapore 575722,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLENO, S5 §795¢ snp Scec 4% C

AT ZPNE 2ins AR BASEWENT 2° CPRIPIE ON_ /574 /20,8

/ IFT L ¢
I/We, the owner of vehicle no SLS ?//I

repairs to the said vehicle.

_hereby instruct and authorize you to commence

You are further authorized to appeint solicitors on my/our behalf and give the solicitors full instructions
as if the appointment is made and instructions are given by me/us with respect to the conduct of my/our

claim against the third party driver and/or his insurers including if necessary, to commence legal
proceedings in court in my/our name against the third party.

You have my/our full authority to instruct my/our solicitors to negotiate a settlement with the third party
and/or his insurers on such terms as you deem fit.

Upon resolving my/our claim, you are authorized to agree with my/our soliciters on amount of their
professional costs and disbursements for action for me/us and to receive payment of the balance of the
settlement sum on my/our behalf directly into your account. In the event that my/our claim or legal suit is
not successiul or is dismissed for whatever reason, I/'We understand and agree that I/'We shall be personally
liable to bear the legal costs of the third party as well as the professional costs and disbursements of my/our
solicitors notwithstanding that my/our solicitors were appointed by you on my/our behalf,

In the event that I/'We am/are required to attend at my/our solicitor’s office

or to attend Court in connection with my/our claim, I/'We shall render full
co-operation.

In the event that my/our claim against the third party and/or his insurers is not successful
or can not be proceeded with and/or if any Judgment or settlement is not honored or
satisfied by the third party, I/We agree and undertake to pay the full amount of your repair
bill and survey fees and any other expenses reasonably incurred on my/our behalf or to pay
you the difference in amount, as the case may be.

I/We undertake to inform you in the event the third party’s insurance company
communicates with me/us directly by telephone or in writing and I/'We further undertake
not to accept any monies or offer of settlement from the third party’s insurers without first
communication with you.

C‘!! {—?’/M/{-} :

I/'We irrevocably authorize Mr. 5EC707 7’ Cifint of the Repairers to sign all discharge voucher/
Indemnity forms and all necessary documents in connection with and arising out of the claim.

Dated this / Z AFPRIL 20 é:z

day of

Name Zﬂ: CHA7 (= £/

I/C No 87/ ] 7(@7(:/-

Address ?y{_"( Lf'(", 6%/5./‘\/' /JKYQJD 7 05~-2//
SINGHPIRE  2/00 %%



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Express Third Party Claim)

“We/l, KUM_CHEW MOTOR WORKSHOP(“the workshop™) hereby confirm that we/l have
reached an agreement with the appointed surveyor of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd LKK
AUTO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD (name of surveyor) with respect to the amount claimed for
$$8.000.00(Global Sum) for vehicle no. SLS9995C that was damaged pursuant to the accident
which occurred on 15/04/2018(date) along TANGLIN MALL BASEMENT 2 involving vehicle
no/s SCU44C.

This is pursuant to the inspection conducted on 18/04/2018 (date) at “the workshop”.

We/l confirm that we/l are/am authorized by the owner LEE _CHER KIA(the third party
claimant™) of vehicle no. SLS9995C make the claim as set out in the above paragraph and we/l
have full authority to settle the matter on his/her behalf in a manner that we/I deem fit. We/l enclose
herein the letter of authority given by “the third party claimant”.

We/l further confirm that we/I will indemnify AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd for all damages,
loss and/or expense that they will or have already incurred in the event that “the third party
claimant™ after the above said agreement lodges a further claim against the former for any loss and
expenses suffered pertaining to costs of repairs and/or rental and/or loss of use pursuant to the
damage to SLS9995C(vehicle no.) as a result of the accident.

We/l confirm that the agreement reached above is in full and final settlement of any claim of “the
third party claimant” pursuant to the accident and that further this settlement is reached on a
without prejudice and without admission of liability basis.

This agreement is subject to the application of Singapore law and the Singapore Courts have

exclusive jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

Dated this > (day) of NOV (month) 20_19 __ (year)

mcE

&
N ——

inted surveyor Signed by “the workéflop“ (with chop)




KUM CHEW MOTOR WORKSHOP

160, SIN MING DRIVE #05-08 .
SIN MING AUTOCITY, SIN
Tel No. : 64536256/645637.
E-Mail : kumchew1@

1 Buss. Reg. No. : 52865130K

AlG AS CIFIGING Tax Invoice : TP001854

Date : 01/07/2019
Vehicle Num. : SLS 9995 C
ment Make/Model : MERCEDES BENZ E350-2009
Chassis/Engi# : WDD2120572A031010/27298331244805
8 Fax No. : 64153723/68357416 Accident Date : 15/04/2018
Claim No. :
Reference : KC/TP9895/1804-05
Policy No. :

Attention ; Motor Claim_
Contact : 64193000

Amount S$

LUMP SUM REPAIR 6,850.00

SingDollars : Seven Thousand Three Hundred Twenty-Nine & Cents Fifty Only

KUM CHEW MOTQR WORKSHOP
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