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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 22 April 2021 3:07 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: FW: THIRD PARTY SURVEY - SJP5630X  *** CC4/LPC18007188/M1eb3q2 [External 

Confidential]

Attachments: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: THIRD PARTY SURVEY - SJP5630X [External Confidential] 

LKK REF : CC4/LPC18007188/M1eb3

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Lonpac External - Confidential 
Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020551 
 
Dear Asher, 
 
We have no objections to the repair cost claimed but for loss of use, 
we proposed $1,920.00 ( 12 days x $160). 
 
 
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 
We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 21 April 2021 8:44 am 

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 

<chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: THIRD PARTY SURVEY - SJP5630X [External Confidential] *** CC4/LPC18007188/M1eb3q2 

 
Dear Gerald, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

For your approval please. 

 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
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Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 21 April, 2021 8:19 AM 

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: THIRD PARTY SURVEY - SJP5630X [External Confidential] 

 

Hi Gerald, 

 

Thank you for your email. 

 

The case is handled by Asher. 

 

Hi Asher, 

 

Kindly assist. CC4/LPC18007188/M1eb3q2 

 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108 

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 

S(408933) 

 

 

 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 21 April 2021 8:02 AM 

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject: THIRD PARTY SURVEY - SJP5630X [External Confidential] 

 

Lonpac External - Confidential 
 
Our Ref: 17/18/18/VP05/020551 
Your Ref: CC4/LPc18007/M1wb3 
 
Dear Hsiao Tong 
 
Please assist to forward the email to the case handler for an update. 
 
 
Best Regards 
Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 
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We are committed to acting professionally, fairly and with integrity. We do not condone bribery, fraud or corrupt 
practices. 
 
Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only. 

 


