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We claim on behalf of SMRT BUSES LTD, owner of the vehicle registration number SMB1343P. Your client's negligent 

driving has caused the above accident. As a result, my client has suffered the following losses,  

 

Cost of Repair $ 2050 

Loss of Use  $825  

LTA search fee $7 

Total $ 2882 

 

We enclose the following documents,  

• Repair Invoice 

• GIA report 

• LTA Search 

• Accident Scene Photos  

• Survey Report and Damaged Bus Photos to be furnished by LKK (AXA’s own appointed surveyor).  

 

We look forward to your confirmation to settle our claims within 15 days from the date of this email. Payment by 

cheque shall be crossed and made payable to SMRT BUSES LTD.  

 

 

Audrey Woo | DID : 6556 3521 | FAX : 6368 7421 | Email : audrey@smrt.com.sg | Claims Department | SMRT BUSES 

LTD | 6 Ang Mo Kio Street 62 Singapore 569140 
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21 NOVEMBER 2018

NEO CHIN SENG
21 TAN KIM CHENG ROAD
#10-23
SINGAPORE 266621

Dear Sir/Madam,

OUR REF : CG4/ASM18007145/Swa3
YOUR REF : SBA3897E
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SBA 3897E AND SMB 1343P ALONG LUTHERAN ROAD ON
11.04.2018

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster
appointed by your motor insurer, AXA lnsurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third-party claim
against your policy.

We have received a claim from M/s SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD acting on
behalf of the owner of SMB 1343P against your motor insurance policy.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, it was reported that your vehicle had
collided to the Third Party vehicle SMB 1343P. As such, liability may not be on your
favour.

Please be informed that your No Claim Discount (NCD - if applicable) may be affected as
a result of the claim against your policy.

We shall proceed to deal with the claim(s) subject to the merits of the case and according
to the rights afforded under the policy. Should you not be seeking the protection of your
policy and seek to take conduct of third party claim(s) arising from this incident, at your
own cost and defence, please reply to us within 7 davs from the date of this letter.

Your full co-operation in the handling of the claim is required and kindly submit the
following to vicalpeh@lkkauto.com within 7 davs from ihe date of this letter_ll_g!
provided at AXA's reportinq centre. The list below is not all inclusive and further
document may be required:

. Police report, Police lnvestigation result, appeal against the Traffic Police offence
and status (if any)

. Driver's driving license or foreign driving license (if any)

. Coloured photographs of accident scene (if any)
o Coloured photographs of damage to all vehicles involved (lf any)
. Video footage of accident (if any)
. Statement and/or police report from independent witness(es) (if any)
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. lf you or your passenger(s) are filing a claim against any of the involved Third
Party(s), you are to keep us informed of your legal representative(s) and the
status of the claim

To protect your interest(s) in the handling of this claim, please do not discuss liability with
any of the Third Party(s) and/or their legal representatives, or make any compromise or
settlement without AXA's prior knowledge and consent.

This letter should not be regarded as a waiver by AXA of their rights to repudiate any
claim because of any breach of policy terms and conditions you and/or your authorised
driver may have committed.

ln the event of receiving and handling of any third party injury claim(s), AXA shall keep
you informed of the final indemnity upon conclusion of the matter(s).

lf you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us at 6256 3561 or email us
at vicalpeh@lkkauto. com 

"

Please quote the claim reference when
effectively.

you contact us that we can assist you more

Yours sincerely,

DID:6841 8625
FAX:6741 4108
Email: vivianlau@lkkauto.com

c.c. AXA lnsurance Pte Ltd (AXA)
(Motor Claims Dept)
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Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 27 January 2021 3:42 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: FW: New message for service request 40319, vehicle number SMB1343P

1/27/21 3:26 PM              *** pls proceed. Tks - HO Winnie 

 

Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>  

Sent: Wednesday, 27 January, 2021 3:28 PM 

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Fw: New message for service request 40319, vehicle number SMB1343P 

 

 

 

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email.  Submission of 

claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 

 

Best Regards, 

Summer Lee | Admin 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com  | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 

1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

 

From: winnie.ho@axa.com.sg <winnie.ho@axa.com.sg> 

Sent: Wednesday, 27 January 2021 3:27 PM 

To: Admin-D (LKKAuto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: New message for service request 40319, vehicle number SMB1343P  

  

AXA Insurance has sent you a message for claim number S8M00DQP. 

Please click here https://vp.smartclaims.axa.com.sg/claim-portal/ to view the message in Vendor Portal. 

 

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by  

AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any  

unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is  

prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify  

the sender immediately. 


