Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Carmen Lim <carmen@esteemperf.com.sg>
Sent: Thursday, 4 July 2019 9:15 AM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: coleen kwok; jenny chong

Subject: Re: LOD - SLN4133H (TP - AXA)
Attachments: image002.png

Dear Cecilia,

We have never provided the rental invoice before and the driver no longer with Grab rental , Grab Rental
cannot access the invoice because the rental payment automatic deduct on their credit wallet.

Kindly advise.

Thank you

Freundliche GriiBe / Best Regards

Carmen Lim
Accident Claim Executive | Operation Division
Esteem Performance Pte Ltd

M: 8799 0066
P: 6484 1221
E: carmen@esteemperf.com.sg

5033 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 2 #01-259
(Head Office)

385 Sin Ming Drive Vicom Inspection Centre
(Showroom)

www.esteemperformance.com

On Wed, Jul 3, 2019 at 6:47 PM Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Dear Carmen,

| have rental agreement already. However | need rental invoice as well.
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Thanks

Best Regards,

Cecilia Chong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: CeciliaChong @lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Carmen Lim [mailto:carmen@esteemperf.com.sg]

Sent: Wednesday, 3 July 2019 6:40 PM

To: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: coleen kwok <coleen21@esteemperf.com.sg>; jenny chong <jenny@esteemperf.com.sg>
Subject: Re: LOD - SLN4133H (TP - AXA)

Dear Cecilia,

Pls refer as attached.

Thank you

Freundliche GriiBe / Best Regards

Carmen Lim

Accident Claim Executive | Operation Division

Esteem Performance Pte Ltd



