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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 195607T198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD

3 ANSON ROAD #16-00

Ref CCE/CTIB007140/Apal

|

SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909 ool ot
Code: CTI
2 Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. PA 28772 Veh. Inspected SJWEB451C
Policy No. DMBISN1850821701 Coverage (%) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18D02015C02 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 17/04/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
Odometer : Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3 Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mim
L/H Front Tyre mm
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  14/04/2018 |Inspection Date 16/04/2018
Survey held at HUA MENG SPRAY FAINTING WHKSP
1 KAK]I BUKIT AVE 6
#01-61 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks

AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.

BJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,




HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP

1, Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, Blk C #01-61 / 01-34, Singapore 417883

Autobay @ Kaki Bukit
Tel: 6747 8064, 6746 5519 / 9666 9680 Fax: 6743 4896
ESTIMATE
RADIAH BINTE OSMAN “0 [ e Date :07.06.2018
BLK 128 MARSILING RISE Vehicle no SIW 6451 C
#09-168 Make/Model :HONDA FIT
5730128 Accident date :14.04.2018
No Description Qty Amount (S5)
List Items
1 Bonnet hinges @ 533.60 o 2 5 67.2
2 Bonnet lock e - 1 $ 9514
3 Bonent lock bracket 1 5 55.24
4 Bonnet H sticker 1 s 35 7
5 Front grille prf F 1 S 715
6 Front grille HONDA emblem ™ 1 5 229-
7 Front bumper Mt 1 $ 5032
8 Fornt bumper side holder @ $30.00 2 $ 60 .~
9 Front bumper reinforcement 241 1 T =
10 Front bumper lower lip  #1 #* 1 S 685 4
11 Front head lamp @ $552.10 2 & 11042«
12 Front bumper fog lamp @ $277.90 77 2 5 5558 ~
13 Front head lamp lower bracket 2 $ 55— oF
14 Front support panel % < 1 S 3859~°
15 Air con condenser ' 1 S 7044~
S 4000.9
Less 20% Disc S 800.18
Total S 3200.72
Special Nett [termns N[
1 Bonnet s i 1 $ _1100 T°
2 Front grille rim  ¢ace! 12! 1 $ -850~ 490
3 Front LH head lamp rim  #* 1 $ 55— 4€
Total 5 2105
Labour Cost
1 Remove & reisntall air con fill in gas S 450X
2 Remove, replace & repair consistent to the accident - S5 3500 ; 0
3 Respray painting {00 $ 1109 4F
4 Tuff kote 5 100 -~
= Total $ 2850
[ Grand Total $ 815572
:I 7 Al
Faki



Hsiao Tung (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 14 July 2018 4:51 PM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI'

Cc: 'Irene Tay'; Admin &

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PA2977Z (O : CAl - SNM18D02015C02)
and SIWBASTC (TP : LKK REF - CCE/CTITB007140/Apa3) on 14.04.2018

Attachments: TP ESTIMATE.pdf; Preliminary Advice - SIW 6451C pdf: LKK Survey Photos pdf

Dear Sirs/Madam,
We refer lo the above matter.

Enclosed for your perusal is: -

- Estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice
- - Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Thank yvou.

Best Resards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Bik 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1. #02-25 | ${408933)

From: Lucas Lee [mailto:lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com]
Sent: Friday, 27 April, 2018 3:58 PM
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuta) <Meikwan@Ikkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PA2977Z (01 : CAl - SNM18D02015C02) and SIW6451C (TP : LKK
REF - CCR/CTI18007140/Apa3) on 14.04.2018

Dear Sirs,
Kindly refer to the above attachment.

Case Handler: Irene Tay

Lucas Lee

Claims Depariment (Motor)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd,

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapaore 079909
Direct (65) 6389 6181

Fax (65)6222 7175

Email’ lucas lee@sg.cntaiping.com

Website www.sg.cntaiping.com




In Serpuaparr pouce 1915

Disclaimer

This message is confidential; ity contents dy not constitnte a conmmitment By China Taiping Insurance (Simgapove) Ple. Lid eveep
where provided for in a written agreement between vou and Ching Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pie Lid Any wnauthorized
disclosure, wve or dissemination, either in winde or particd, Iy prohibited [ vou are nor the intended recipient af the inessage,
nlcawe weklfv the sender immediatel

From: Mei Kwan [LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 24 April, 2018 1:22 PM

o: Claims Dept of CTI
Cc: Irene Tay; Lucas Lee; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); loy Irene (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A; Claims Dept of
CTl
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PA2977Z (01 CAl - TBA) and SJW6E451C (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI18007140/Apa3) on 14.04.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/ Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case.

We had inspected TP vehicle 5)W 6451C at M/s Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop - Kaki Bukit.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
-~ - TP GIA report

Please be informed that the estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.

We will revert to you on preliminary advice in due course.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured's GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Bik 51, Pava Ubt Industral Park, Ubi Avenuie 1, #02-25 | S{4089353)



This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com




Ao
Consultants
Pte Lid

ST UBLAVE 1, #02-25 PAYA URTHINDUSTRIAL PARK. SINGAPORE 408933 TE]

Yourref:  SNMI18D02015C02
Our ref: CCO/CTII800T140/Apa3

The Motor Claims Department
M/S China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd

Dear Sir'Madam
PRELIMINARY ADVICE OF VEHICLE NO.

4\ e refer to the above matter.

Company Registration Mo, 199607 1098R

S H25A3501 FAXN - 165 625R435

Date: 14.07.2018

SJIW 6451C

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
16.04.2018 at the premises of M/s HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WKSP

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount 155 8.155.72

Revised Estimate Amount : S% 3.278.04

"Check" Items Amount 1 5% .

Market Value : 8% -

LTA Reimbursement Value 1 5% -

Nett Value : S$ -

rearsios
Description of Damage: rei ﬁ_ T P L
#'he vehicle sustained damages at the = e *'____‘L'

FRONT PORTION oftsce

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent
Estimated normal period for repairs: 04  days

Yours faithfully,

ADRIAN LING
Licensed Appraiser
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CHINA TAIPING CHIMA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.
1 Andon Rosd #16-00 Spengleal Tower Singapons (TER0S
Vel 6380 @111 Fa: 6227 1033

Wbisfn: wew SQ ORI, 0O
Co Reg Mo 20CR0ESB4E

Our Reference: SNM18D02015/C02/1
Date : 27 APRIL 2018 via Ordinary & Registered Mail

HUP HOE COACH SERVICE
BLK 148 WOODLANDS ST 13
#11-839

SINGAPORE 730148

Dear Sir/ Madam
ACCIDENT INVOLVING PA2977Z AND SJWE451C ON 14 APRIL 2018
ALONG MARSILING RISE(BLK 131 OSCP)

We refer to the abovementioned accident.

Please be advised that the third party vehicle, SJW6451C | is filing a third party property
claim against your vehicle.

We have appointed LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd, to administer the said claim on our behalf
and they will contact you for more information about the accident,

Kindly render your assistance and co-operation accordingly.

Yours truly,

Claims Department

(This is a computer generated letter and no signature is required.)

CC : LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Attn : HSIAD TONG

Ref : CCB/CTI8007140/APAS
Contact No © 67423157

via Email | HSIAOTONGELKKAUTO.COM

CC ; Agent - (ANOSB0A) - ODDS & EVEN

FOULKKDS-2013



Ba2Me ' OME.MOTORING - Vocational Licences

x
~MOTORING

Your Fast Trock To Complele Matisning ahoutlls Comt

INFORMATION & GUIDELINES  ON-THE-ROADS  MOTORING BUZZ  HAPPENINGS AUTOSHOF  LODG IN

THE BIG STORY wdate youn My Transpor, S il ] i, 155 and Qoogle Play

Heme | LTAeS ¢ OQnling Engquiries ¢/ Enquire Vecational Licence Status

ENQUIR OCATIONAL LICENCE STATUS

Enquiry E-+  ce for Vocational Licence Holders

Welcome to LTA Enguiry E-Service far Vocational Licence Halders

This e-service alk ‘ational Licence (VL) holders and other interested partes to chack on the status of a VL. To use
this enguiry Tean I will nead to enter boath the NRIC/ Foreign Identification Sumber [FIN) and the date of Birth of
the WL holder

You can enguire on e status of all fypes of VL as listed below
YL DL

= Private Hire Car Drivers Yocational Licence
& Taxi Driver's Vacational Licence

= Dmnibus Drivers Vocational Licenca

v General Bus Driver's Yocational Licence

& Bus Attendant's Vocatonal Licence

» Trishaw Rider's Yocational Licence

*MNRIC No/FIN S704044 1] (0.8 512345674, F12345678)
* Date of Birth 25 1 - | ¥8T0 [Format: DD-MM-YYYY)
Fields markad * are required.

STATUS OF VOCATIONAL LICENCE

The informnation contained herein is correcl a8 at 03-May-2018
Name SOH KEE GLAN
Licence Number SP0404411

Date of Birth 25:Nov-1970

TYPE OF VOCATIONAL LICENCE

VL Type Status Expiry Date

General Bus Driver's alid 22:10-2020
Vorational Licence

Bus Attendant’s Vacational Walid 220-2020
Licence

| WANT TO ...

drive buy sell maintain participate
hitps-iwww, cnemotaning. com. sg/contentionemaotor ng.'am’I|a_e_c-erv'n:as.-'onuna_enquirias.h.-ncationalvlioenoes.html 112



Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 28 September 2018 454 PM

To: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Cc: Irene Tay, Admin A

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PAZ9TT7Z (Ol : CAl - SNM18D02015C02)
and SJW6451C (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI118007140/Apa3) on 14.04.2018

Attachments: LKKInspection.pdf; LKKAdjustment] pdf; LKK Survey Photos.pdf; LKK Resurvey

Photos.pdf; TP LOD_SJW 6451C.pdf

Hi All,
Kindly ignore my mandate below as the total amount is less than $3.000.00.

We will proceed to settle the matter with third party and close file in due course.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Uln Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{40B8933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 15 September 2018 9:13 AM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI" <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: 'Irene Tay' <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com=; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PA29772 (Ol : CAl - SNM18D02015C02) and SIWE451C (TP : LKK
REF - CC6/CTI118007140/Apa3) on 14.04.2018

Your Ref: SNM18D02015C02
LKE Ref: CC&/CTIN8007140/Apa3s2

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING PA 2977L(0Il) & 5JW 6451C(TP) ON 14/04/2018

We refer to the above matter.

The accident occurred when our insured driver reversed and hit onto third party vehicle. Liability is not in our

driver’s favour,

We had informed Ol about third party claim. Ol agreed to settle at best and aware NCD issue.

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer " HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WORKSHOP" as follows: -
Amount Amount Revised

Claimed
1. Cost of Repair $B.,15572 $ 2,600.00

1



2. Loss of Rental [3days x $120.00) $ 340.00 $  300.00 (3days x $100.00)
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee 3 7.49 $ 7.49

Total §$8,523.21 $2,907.4%

**04days recommendation for repair.
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference,

The above Is for your approval.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(4080:31)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 14 July 2018 4:51 PM

To: 'Claims Dept of CTI' <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: 'Irene Tay' <irene.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PA2977Z (01 : CAl - SNM18D02015C02) and SJWE451C (TP : LKK
REF - CCR/CTI18007140/Apa3) on 14.04.2018

Cear Sirs/Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed for your perusal is: -

- Estimoted cost of repair
— Preliminary advice
- Photographs of TP vehicle in its damaged condition

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewhti@kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408033)

From: Lucas Lee [mailto:lucas.lee@sg cntaiping.com]
Sent: Friday, 27 April, 2018 3:58 PM

To: Mei Kwan [LKKAuto) <Meikwan@|kkauto.com>




Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PA2977Z (01 : CAl - SNM18D02015C02) and SJW6451C (TP : LKK
REF - CC6/CTI118007140/Apa3) on 14.04.2018

Dear Sirs,
Kindly refer to the above attachment.

Case Handler: Irene Tay

Lucas Lee

Claims Department (Motar)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079908
Direct (65) 6389 6181

Fax (65)6222 7175

Email: lucas.leef@sqg.cntaiping.com

Website: www sg cntaiping.com

%

AN =ARY
In Simpapare sinee | 958

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitee a commitment by China Taiping Inswrance (Singapore) Pre. Lid. excepi
where provided for in a written agreement between you and Ching Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Ltd. Any unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whale or partial, is prohibited If vou are not the intended recipient of the message.
please notify the sender fmmediarely.

From: Mei Kwan [LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan @lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 24 April, 2018 1:22 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Irene Tay; Lucas Lee; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Asher Sng (LKKAuto); Admin A; Claims Dept of
CTl

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving PA2977Z (01 CAl - TBA) and 5JW6451C (TP : LKK REF -
CCe/CT118007140/Apa3) on 14.04.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir/ Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case.

We had inspected TP vehicle S]W 6451C at M/s Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop - Kaki Bukit.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GIA report



Please be informed that the estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.

We will revert to you on preliminary advice in due course.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank vou.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.svmanteccloud.com




Hsiao Tung (LKKAuto)

From: Hua Meng <huameng@live.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 28 September 2018 5.00 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJW 6451 C & PA 2977 Z ON 14.04.2018

Dear HsiaoTong

Please let us have your DV asap.

Thanks & Regards
June

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com:

Sent: Friday, September 28, 2018 4:53:59 PM

To: Hua Meng

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJW 6451 C & PA 2977 Z ON 14.04.2018

Without Prejudice
Hi June,
We refer to the above matier,

We propose setflement at a global sum of $2,900.00(all-in).
Please confirm acceplance,

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 3(408933)

From: Hua Meng <huameng@Ilive.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 28 September 2018 4:40 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJW 6451 C & PA 2977 2 ON 14.04.2018
Importance: High



Dear HsiaoTong

We refer the LOD we sent dated 01.08.2018.
We have no receive any reverts .Thus ,sorry to inform you we have to pass the matter to lawyer.

Thanks & Regards
June

From: Hua Meng <huameng@Ilive.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, August 1, 2018 4:28:35 PM

To: Hsiao Tong

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJW 6451 C & PA 2977 Z ON 14.04.2018

Dear HsiaoTong

We refer above mentioned accident.

We would like to inform that we have finalized with your surveyor.
Kindly revert your offer.

Your prompt reply will be appreciated by us,

We enclose relevant documents for your attention.

Thanks & regards,

June

Hua Meng Spray Painting Workshop
1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6, Blk C

#01-61 Autobay @ Kaki Bukit
5417883

Tel: 6746 5519

Fax: 6743 4896
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AN

SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909 Bag:  O9-10-2000
Code: CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. PA 20772 Veh. Inspected 5JWB451C
Policy No. DMBISN1650821701 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM18002015C02 Excess (§) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 16/04/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model HONDAFIT c.c 1338
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2008
Chassis No.  GE61052338 B oIO0r WHITE
Odometer 145494 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |[195/55R15 BRIDGESTOMNE 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |195/55R15 BRIDGESTONE 6 mm
R/H Rear Tyre [195/55R15 BRIDGESTONE 6 mm
L/H Rear Tyre 195/66R15 BRIDGESTONE & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  14/04/2018 Inspection Date 16/04/2018
Survey held at HUA MENG SPRAY PAINTING WKESP
1 KAKI BUKIT AVE &
#01-61 AUTOBAY
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AYTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS,
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERICD FOR REPAIR:

4 Working Days
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ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SJW 6451C
Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition Workshop ($)) ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
2|BONNET HINGES @ $33.80 NOT NECESSARY 67.20
1|BONNET LOCK NOT NECESSARY 95.10 -
1|BONNET LOCK BRACKET NOT NECESSARY 55.20 -
1|BONNET H STICKER NECESSARY 35.00 35.00
1|FRONT GRILLE NOT NECESSARY 75.00 -
1|FRONT GRILLE HOMDA EMEBLEM NOT NECESSARY 22 .80 -
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 503.20 803.20
2|FRONT BUMPER SIDE HOLDER @ 330.00 NECESSARY 60.00 &0.00
1|FRONT BUMPER REINFORCEMENT BENT 213.50 213.50
1|FRONT BUMPER LOWER LIP NOT NECESSARY 68.50 -
Z2|FRONT HEAD LAMP @ $552.10 NIS CRACKED 1,104 .20 5562.10
2|FRONT BUMPER FOG LAMP @ $277.90 NOT NECESSARY 555,80 -
2|FRONT HEAD LAMP LOWER BRACKET N/S CRACKED 55.00 27.50
1|FRONT SUPPORT PAMEL TO REPAIR SEE 385.90 -
LABOUR
1|AIR CON CONDENSER NOT NECESSARY 704 .40 -
LESS 20% DISCOUNT -800.18 -278.26
3,200.72 1,113.04
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|BONNET (SN) CRACKED 1,100.00 900.00
1|[FRONT GRILLE RIM (SN} CRACKED 850.00 500.00
1|FRONT LH HEAD LAMP RIM [SN) NECESSARY 155.00 65.00
2,105.00 1,465.00
LABOUR
REMOVE & REINSTALL AIR CON FILL IN GAS. MOT NECESSARY 150.00 -
REMOVE, REPLACE & REPAIR CONSISTENT TO THE 1,500.00 450,00
ACCIDENT. INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF FRONT
SUPPORT PAMEL.
RESPRAY PAINTING. 1,100.00 250.00
TUFF KOTE. NOT NECESSARY 100.00
2,850.00 700.00

Report Ref No. CC&/CTI18007140/Apads2
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GRAND TOTAL B,155.72 3,278.04

RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS 2,600.00
(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CCEB/CTI18007140/Apads2

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng AMSOE AMIRTE AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser




