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Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Yong Sin Peter Ng <yong.sin.peter.ng@outlook.com>

Sent: Sunday, 20 May, 2018 11:28 AM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Cc: Paramchand, Varsha; Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJF 7334R AND SH 6848PON 15/04/2018  ALONG 

MANDAI RD

Attachments: IMG-20180519-WA0008.jpg; IMG-20180519-WA0001.jpg; IMG-20180519-

WA0002.jpg; IMG-20180519-WA0003.jpg; IMG-20180519-WA0004.jpg

 

Dear Vivian and Varsha 

 

First of all , Thanks for your help. 

 

On Saturday morning ( 19 May 2018 ) , I have sent my wife vehicle to  

AIG reporting centre ( Cycle & Carriage Body & Paint Centre in Pandan Gardens ) to report the accident. 

The AIG reporting centre say that they will send the report with photos showing the damage on my wife 

vehicle to you on Monday ( 21 May 2018 ). 

 

I have also taken some photos during the accident to provide evidence that his Taxi was crossing over to 

the second lane and you can see from the photos his Taxi is very close to the back of other cars which is in 

front of his Taxi after the accident. 

The first photo show the damage on the taxi no. SH 6848P and this first photo was immediately taken by 

us after the Taxi have hit against the  right hand side of the back of my wife vehicle. 

 

 

Best Regards 

 

Peter Ng 

 

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 

Sent: Friday, May 18, 2018 3:02 PM 

To: yong.sin.peter.ng@outlook.com 

Cc: Paramchand, Varsha; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) 

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJF 7334R AND SH 6848PON 15/04/2018 ALONG MANDAI RD  

  
Dear Sirs, 

  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJF 7334R AND SH 6848P ( 10:45Hrs) ON 15/04/2018  ALONG MANDAI RD 
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We, LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd has been appointed to act on the behalf of your insurer, AIG Asia Pacific Insurance 

Pte Ltd to settle a THIRD PARTY claim against you for an accident which happened on the above-mentioned date and 

location. 

                

Our record shows that to date, you/your driver have not reported the accident to us. We would appreciate it if you could 

urgently file a report at any of AIG reporting centre. You may refer to your Certificate of Insurance for the list of the 

reporting centre.. 

  

To enable us to look into the matter immediately, please let us hear from you within fourteen (14) days from date of 

this letter (by 07/05/2018).  

  

Please be reminded that in accordance with the terms and conditions under your policy, failure of compliance, our 

principal M/s AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd reserves the right to repudiate liability.  

  

If you need further assistance or clarifications, please contact the undersigned. 

Yours faithfully, 
  
  

Thank you 

Best Regards, 

Vivian Lau| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

  

  

  

 

  

  


