Shawn Chua

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com>
Monday, 14 May, 2018 11:00 AM

Shawn Chua; Rasul (LKKAuto)

SUR

RE: SLA3535G Finalized Claim

Dear Shawn,

Confirmed $5,518.64 before GST @ 6 working days.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | $(408933)

From: Shawn Chua [mailto:shawnchua@tanchong.com]
Sent: Saturday, 12 May 2018 8:15 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: SLA3535G Finalized Claim

Good morning.

Attached is SLA3535G finalized claim.

Kindly reply so that | can close the case soon.
Thank you very much for your time & assistance.
Regards,

Shawn Chua

Service Executive

TC AutoClinic Pte Ltd
25 Leng Kee Road
Singapore 159097
DID: +65 67038515
HP: +65 96450023
Fax: +65 64795019



