Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 13 February 2018 5:59 PM

To: Mohamedrasheed, Rashidah; Denise Tay (LKKAuto); SUR
Subject: RE: OD / SGD696M / 7900170904SG-001 Date of accident 7/1/18

Dear Rashidah,

The MV of SGD 696M is $80K-$85K(est) as at Jan’18.

Best Regards,

Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mohamedrasheed, Rashidah [mailto:Rashidah.Mohamedrasheed@aig.com]

Sent: Friday, 9 February 2018 2:22 PM

To: Denise Tay (LKKAuto) <denisetay@lkkauto.com>; SUR <sur@Ikkauto.com>; rogassociates@gmail.com; Alvin Yit
<alvinyit@fta.com.sg>

Subject: OD / SGD696M / 7900170904SG-001 Date of accident 7/1/18

Dear Sirs,

Please advice market value.

Thank you

Rashidah Rasheed

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
78 Shenton Way, #08-16, Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1767 | Fax +(65) 6835 7416

Rashidah.Mohamedrasheed@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg
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which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no
responsibility is accepted by AlG for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



