Asher 5n9 (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CT| <claimsdept@sq.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 21 November 2018 11:53 AM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuUto);, Admin A

Ce: Catherine Thia; Chee So Chow; Alfred Toh; Hsiac Tong (LKKAuto); KKLau

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: CTI REF: SNM18D01990C02/9/LKKDS & YR REF:
SLATTT6B (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18006994/Umb3 ) on 14.04.2018

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Flagged

LKK REF - CC6/CTI18006994/Umb3
CTl REF — SNM18D01990C02/9 (GZ9159Y)

Dear Asher

We refer to your email pertaining to the above matter.

You may proceed to resolve the property damage claim at 58,559.50.
We await your payment advice to enable Catherine to act accordingly.

Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 072909

DID: +65 6389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sq.cntaiping.com
alfred toh@sqg.cntaiping.com
www.sg.cntaiping.com

ANNIVERSARY
I Singapere siwee 1938

Disclaimer

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid excepr
where provided for in a written agreement herween you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid. Amy unauthorized disclosure
use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the
sender immediateh



From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto:Ashersng@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, November 21, 2018 11:40 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Cc: Adeline Chng <adeline.chng@sg.cntaiping.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee So Chow
<sochow.chee@sg.cntaiping.com=>

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: CTI REF: SNM18D01990C02/9/LKKDS & YR REF: SLA77768 (TP : LKK REF -
CC6/CTI18006994/Umb3 ) on 14.04.2018

Your ref : SNM18D01990C02/9/LKKDS
Our ref ; CC6/CTI18006994/Ueb3n2

Dear Sirs,

The accident occurred when our insured rear ended third party vehicle. We are of the opinion that BOLA scenario 27 is
applicable for this matter. Liability is not in our insured’s favour.

We did clarify with insured the nature of the accident and he's aware that NCD (if any) would be affected.

We seek your approval to offer repairer " FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD" at 58,559.50 (all-in).

The summary is as follows: -

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repairs (with G5T) $19,788.26 S 7,757.50
2. Loss of Rental (5days x $180) S 900.00 S 800.00 (5days x $160)
3. LTA Search Fee 5 2.00 5 2.00
Total $ 20,690.26 $ 8,559.50

Enclosed here with all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval please.

Thank You.

Best Regards,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Aute Consultants Pte Lid

phone; 841-4051 | emall; gshesna@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl industrial Park, Ubl Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Lucas Lee <|ucas.lee(@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Friday, 27 April 2018 5:19 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM18D01990C02,/9/LKKDS & YR REF: SLA7776B (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18006994/Umb3 ) on
14.04.2018

Dear Shu Pei,

The above attachment is our Ol report.



Lucas Lee
Claims Department {Motor)

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte, Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079303
Direct (65) 6389 6181

Fax (B65)6222 7175

Email: lucas.lee@ .
Website. www.sg.cntaipi

ANNIVERSARY
fn Singapore unee 1935

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid. except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pre. Lid Any unguthorized disciosure
use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notifv the
sender immediately.

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 25 April, 2018 10:25 AM

To: Angle Foo; Claims Dept of CT|

Cc: Lucas Lee; Sharon Han; Bevan Lim (LKK Auto); Admin A; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: OUR REF: SNM18D01990C02/9/LKKDS & YR REF: SLA7776B (TP : LKK REF - CChR/CTI18006994/Umb3 ) on
14.04.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly advice whether insured has reported. If so, kindly let us have a copy of insured's accident report for our
necessary action.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupel@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



From: Angie Foo [mailto:angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 18 April 2018 2:32 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) <shupei@lkkauto.com>; Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept{@sg.cntaiping.com=

Cc; Lucas Lee <lucas.lee@sg.cntaiping.com>; Sharon Han <sharon.han@sg.cntaiping.com>; Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)
<bevanlim@Ikkauto.com=>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@I|kkauto.com>; Hsiao

Subject: OUR REF: SNM18D01990C02/9/LKKDS & YR REF: SLA7776B (TP : LKK REF - CC6/CTI18006994/Umb3 ) on
14.04.2018

Dear Shu Pei,
We refer to your email of 17 April 2018.
We attached a copy of Non-Reporting Letter for your necessary action.

Kindly take note, the claim handler on this case is Adeline Chng 6382 6155 and do not email to me for offer or mandate.

Thank you.

Regards,

Angie Foo

Executive

Motor Division

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road #16-00

Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079809
Co.Reg.No.200208384E

DID: 6388 6186

Fax: 6224 7478 /6224 7175

Email: angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com
Email; claimsdept@sqg.cntaiping.com
Website: www sqg.cntaiping com

Disclaimer:

This message is confideniial its confents do not constitute & commitment by China Taping Insurance (Singapare) Ple. Lid except whare provided for in & wntfen
agreemeant between you and Ching Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid Any unauthonzed disclosure, use or dissemination, elther in whole or partial, is
prohibited, If you are not the intended recipient of the massage, please notify the sender immedialaly,

From: Shu Pei (LKKAuto) [mailto:shupei@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 17 April, 2018 6:01 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Lucas Lee; Sharon Han; Bevan Lim (LKK Auto); Admin A

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GZ9159Y (Ol : CAl - TBA) and SLAT776B (TP : LKK REF -
CCe/CTI18006994/Umb3 ) on 14.04.2018

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.



This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SLA 7776B at M/s Fastech Auto Pte Ltd.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GIA report

Please be informed that estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice is not ready yet.

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Bevan and he can be contacted at DID: 6749 4274.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pel| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupel@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://'www. svmanteccloud.com




FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Date : 02.052018

China Taiping Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road

#16-00 Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Atn: Motor Claims Department

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE: SLA 77768 { GZ9159Y ON  14.04.2018
We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no:  SLA 7776B | which was involved
in the captioned accident with your insured vehicle no: GZ 9159Y . The vehicle owner has requested and

authorized us to assist him in presenting his/her claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are submitting these claims for
vour consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

1) Cost of Repair (inclusive of GST) 5 7.757.50
2} Rental g 900.00
3} GIA Search Result b 2.00

5 8,659.50

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:

a) Final Repair Invoice e) Vehicle Registration Log Card
b) I/C & Driving License f) Letter of Authorisation, etc...
¢) GIA Report/ GIA Search Result g) Car Rental Invoice / Agreement

d) Insurance Certificate

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our customer’s claims
as soon as possible,

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to
any personal injury elaim (if any) of the owner/claimant.

Thank you. i o
Yours faithfully, :?_,,»
b 'II I".
Jason Tang (jason(@ fastechauto.com.sg)
FASTECH AUTO PTE L;D

¢ Warply o Tl Limg



sl Consuffants
= Pte Ltd

{ U Auto
Y

51 UBIAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBT INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065 62563501 FAX : (065) 67414108

Our Ref: CC6/CTI18006994/Umb3

07 MAY 2018

BROADWAY CONTRACTS & SERVICES
803 KING GEORGE'S AVENUE

#01-236

SINGAPORE 200803

Dear Sir/Madam.,

ACCIDENT GZ9159Y AND SLA 77768 ON 14/04/2018

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under
the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Bevan Lim
Case Handler
DID: 6749 4274
FAX: 6741 4108

Email: bevanlim(@lkkauto.com

c.c.  China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Lid
(Motor Claims Dept)



DATE 14.04.2018

TO : China Taiping Insurance Sinoapore Pte Lid
RE + ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO. SLA 77768 and
GZ 9159y ONLY

ALONG sLIP RD>CLEMENTI AVE 4

ON 14.04 2018

I/'We,  TANZEH CHIAH
of (NRIC No./ROC No.) S72465658

of _ BLK 536 BUKIT BATOK ST 52 #09-653 5-650536 o

owner of vehicle no. SLA 77768 in consideration of M/s FASTECH AUTO
PTE LTD repairing my/our vehicle sia 77788 at my/our instruction and hereby
authorise M/s FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD to demand claim settlement whatever

amount settled/payable by the Insurance Company and/or third party or to commence legal

proceedings, if necessary, under my name, for the cost of repairs, car rental and/or loss of use,

etc. and to their appointing solicitor to act for me/us in respect of the said accident/claim and
all claimed and/or settled shall belong to them absolutely.

[/We further agree and undertake to indemnify them against the above-mentioned claim cost
which may arisen therewith.

Signature of Owner :  ——

mwz?—i,)a_wm ?_{{; @ /h.:l h

Name of Owner :




MOTOR CLAIMS DISCHARGE VOUCHER

PFolicy No : DMCVEN1667611701 Claim Mo : SHMIBDO19%0CO2/2/LEEDS
Claimant : TAN ZEH CHIAH

Amount : 558,559, 50

DOLLARS EIGHT THOUSAND FIVE HUNDRED FIFTY NINE AND CENTS
FIFTY ONLY.

1/We agree to accept the above mentioned amount to be paid to mefus in full &
final settlement of all elaims, costs & disborsements for injuries [/ damages
sustained by mefus through an accident involving

Claimant Vehicle Ho. : SLA T7TTE6B

Insured Vehicle Mo. @ GZ 3158Y

Date of Loss : 1470472018

Place of Accident : SLIF ED = CLEMENII AVE 04

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to mefus of the aforementioned sum by
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agres absolutely -to
discharge CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE} PTE. LTD. and/or

Insured Hame : BRODDWAY COWTRACTS & SERVICES
Driver Hame 1 CHAM WAI MING EDMUND

from all claims, present orf future in respect of all lese, injury or damage
sustained by mefus arising out of the said accident.

I acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on the
part of CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

{1) Genéral Damagas 85
[2) Cost of Repair/Execss 25 7, 157 .50
[3) Loss of Hae/Rental Baesing 58 BO0.00
{4) GIA/Police Baports/
Invest igation Results/Sesarch Feas 55 2500
[5) Medical Reports/Expenses S8
(6} Survey Feea/Towing Fes/Disbursement 5%
(7} Cost including Disbursement 85
TOTEL & av w wn a0 cromswwon oo N w5 BP 8,559.50

e e

Claimant MName-: TAN EZEH CHIRH NRIC Mo : 572465658

L oC(/w [

Signature

Fom

imjuries cl
Fuarther, the setikeme

Evideate 10 pre

sthject mpbier ko fhis scten




TAX INVOICE

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-48 Autobay

Singapore 417883

Tel No: 67452063 / 67467158 Fax No: 67458520
Tax Reg No: 200006262D

Tax Invoice  :20245
China Taiping Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd
3 Anson Road Date :02.05.2018
#16-00 Springleaf Tower Vehicle No  :SLA 7776B
Singapore 079909 Make/Model HONDA ACCORD
Chassis/Eng#
Accident Date :14.04.2018
Claim No (0418- 20245
Attn: Motor Claims Department Reference
Policy No
Amount
To proceed on lump sum repair 58 7,250.00
E. &0O.E. Total : S§ 7,250.00
GST@7% : SS 507.50
Amount Due . 5% 7.757.50

|

)

FASTECH AUTO PTE LTD
All Invoices are subjected to G%T

Fragusnd b Maly Cr $ioh Cmg



DYNAMIC CAR RENTAL

1 Kaki Bukit Ave 6 #01-46 Autobay

Singapore 417883
Tel No: 6741 7244 / 6746 5405 Fax No:67458520

Co. Reg No: 52928467K
To: TAN ZEH CHIAH Invoice : DCR-2018-04-08

Date : 19.04.2018
Agreement No 20456

Ref : LOD
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT
Rental charges for vehicle 5JQ3601M { 0418-20245 ) £ 900.00
Rental Period from  14.04.2018 to 19.04.2018
E. & O.E. Total § 900.00
Hayly Lee Pokl Lewg

for Dynamic Car Rental



Dynamic Car Rental

1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6, #01-46/48/50 AUTOBAY, SINGAPORE 417883.

TEL: (+65) 6741 7244, 6746 5405 FAX: (+65) 6745 8520, 6746 5786
Co. Reg. No. 52928467K

RENTAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS No. 2 q 45 b
MNari = A . ;
N Ta U Zobe Glrta el wwevooee: N [ (T4
o I
R [N M| oese | remol | € [ (12|34 | F
HM ] | 4
| IN 7? 1/6
— KM - r.
our wa 3 \
= ar TIME USED -
DRIVEN
) Al
NAMED DRIVER ggk m M
D E ) | DATE GF EXPIRY PLACE OF ISSUE Hours | @ss
FABSPORT NO | DATE GOF ISSUE PLACE OF ISSUE E Bive | mat /‘?D N % . V.U
M 0D NAMED DAIVER T wesks | oss '
" DHIVING LICENCE NG | DATE OF EXPIRY FLACE OF ISSUE | MONTHS | @88
| FASSPORT NO DATE OF I55UE PLACE OF ISSUE BY INITIALLING, RENTER | suB.TOTAL
| AGHEES TO PAY ADD FEE
- FOR COLLISION DAMAGES
IMPORTANT NOTES: WAIVER (C.D.wW.)
Thim wohicie i3 licencad o esiry 04 passengors only
Rl will b ghosn Tor vehicie relemn sy TOTAL RENTAL
Fr-ralund will Be ghvan lor parind latt i wibicls
Hires i liakiln 12 pay (st S4000 undss suclan | & 1) n ary accident plim tase of opmimgn whie damagad vahicks
b it = ; e ' DELIVERY FEE
Hirot b linble-10 pay il padiing Tes and raffic summeonssa
Vaheodi reditrt duming office howr only COLLECTION FEE
Mo Sarvice on-Puniic Holitay ang Suraay x
EXCESS: B
“See | - Lzl (0 5pone Only :5E02000 SEH a i :EH WEE :EH ol
"Bec | - Lisest in S'pare Only SG2000
“Baa |+ Usod Outaide S'pore Only SE04000 | =
“Soo ||+ Lsod Owtwicn 5'pare Only ‘SGE04000
i e R B RS |
Wiecreen Excesn Qutside 5ponm; BG020 FOR PEASONAL ACCI DENT
ADDITIOMAL CONDITIONS: INSLIRANCE (P.ALY
" Geagraphical areas; Singapore & Wast Malaysia
* Dvivar must be; |
A | ) 18 yeary old and abova;
by hiding & walid relmvant cass of driving Sosise x
* Aaditional Cwn Damage: Excess o 551,000 s applicable for eny namadiunamed drvars who: PER DAY PER WEEK PEA MONTH
) nge 229 5 poars o, 5 5 g
bk e 56 1070 yoars od;
£ wilh diving sxpariances of 1 year fo less than 2 years i Singapars on he. relevant classes of dfving
Ve _ PREPAYMENT TOTAL CHARGE
= Addtignal &l Glaims excoss of S52.000 ik applicatde far ary ramailEnamed drlisrs who II
) b 1l pears okd o 2 years ohd andiar
bl 1T Yaan ofd and abova nndior VHELH WRROSHT
CY Wilh griving exparionts of less fan 1 year on 1w falevant tiasses of drivirg cense
CASH
" Linon refutnng the replacemanl vehicle, you rmust enstine thas all expeneive-end importart &ems-1o be §
rameited awiy from this replacemnent vikichs, Wal will nat be reaporaiie for any reporing ot guch losses.
; ' ' HECEIPT NO. NETT CHARGE
" Hirer = fiabin o pay first$4000 under section | & 1Fin sy actidurl plus oes of eammg woile damage vihicle
I& undeir regair.
Hirer is responsibde for Additional $4.000.00 Excess AMOUNT DUE / REFUND
tothe THIAD PARTY DAMAGE !/ INJURY ciaims.

| HAVE READ THE TERMS AND CONDITIDNS ON BOTH SIDES
CF THIS RENTAL AGREEMENT AND AGHEE THEREQE

SIGNEDBY THE PARTIES HERETD LI THE iy T e i Y I Lt T L e

) X

DYNAMIC CAR RENTAL RENTER'S/DRIVER'S SIGNATURE




Invoice Page 1 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
mm RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
|N5URANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to Spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GET Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-18-056409
Date of Reguest: 14/04/2018 Your Ref Mo: Online Purchase

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48

AutoBay@Kaki Bukit

Singapore 417883

Dear SirMadam,

Enquiry Date 14/04/2018

Enquiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan

TP Vehicle Mo. GZ9159Y

Accident Date 14/04/2018

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No.  |Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. Mo,
GZo159Y China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Lid. 130201 7-1210/2018 6389 6111
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurance
Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoever for any
loss or damage arising oul of or in conneaction with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature,

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfim?fusebox=MTRsas& fuseaction=dsp ... 14-Apr-18



Invoice

GENERAL
INSURANCE
ASSOCIATION

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Our Ref No: GR-18-056408
Date of Raquest: 14/04/2018

Kim Chwee Auto Pte Ltd
1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6 #01-48
AutoBay@Kaki Bukit

Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 D030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to 5pm
G3T Registration No: M4D0017735

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Singapore 417883

Dear SirfMadam,

Enguiry Date 14/04/2018

Enguiry By Tang Kok Wee, Allan

TP Vehicle Mo, GZ29159Y

Accident Date 14/04/2018

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (3%)

TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMGC Official use:
Date:
[*] GIRO [ ] Cash [ ] Cheque

https://singapore. merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp ... 14-Apr-18



