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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 189607188R. GST Reg. No. 18-8607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobila

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

36 ROBINSON ROAD

#16-01 CITY HOUSESINGAPORE 068877

Ref : CS/FCIHBO0E914/AvD

Date :  14-04-2018

RO

Code: FCI2
1. Poliey Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD 6718H Veh. Inspected GY 4945H
Policy No. Coverage (§) 0.00
Claim No. D18001717MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From CWS (EILEEN LEE) Assign Date 13/04/2018
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model c.c 0
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg.
Chassis No. Colour
QOdometer . Steering
Brakes Modification
General
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre mm
L/H Front Tyre mim
R/H Rear Tyre mm
L/H Rear Tyre mm
4, Description of Damages
5. General Information
Accident Date  26/02/2018 [Inspection Date 16/04/2018
Survey held at Y1 HENG MOTOR WORKSHOP
BLK 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6
#02-18
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AYTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TQ YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.




l' 'I' I' Auto
- 2w . Consulfants
- e Lid Company Registration No 19060T198R

1 UBTAVE 1 #02-25 PAYA URI INDUSTRIAL PAKRK. SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (065 62363561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your refs D18001717TMESH
Our ref: CS/FCIRN06914/Avb Date : 24/4/2018

The Motor Claims Department
M/s FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD

Dear Sir/Madam,

INITIAL INSPECTION REPORT OF VEHICLE NO. GY 4945H

We thank you for your instruction on 13/4/2018

Please be informed that we had conducted the inspection of the above mentioned vehicle on
16/4/2018  at the premises of M/s ¥1 HENG MOTOR WORKSHOP

and have the following to report:-

Workshop Estimate Amount : §$5,490.35

Revised Estimate Amount - §$2.250.00 (LUMP SUM)
"Check" Ttems Amount : 8%

Markel Value 1 5%

LTA Reimbursement Value : 8%

Nett Value 1 5%

Description of Damage:

The vehicle sustained damages at the
n/s poniton

Comments/Present Status:
Damages Consistent

Yours faithfully,

ADRLAN LING WAI PING
B.Eng, AMSOE, AMIATE AMSAE-AMMATAI
Licensed Appraiser



MS@FirstCapital

M5 First Capital Insurance Limited (creg ho 155000100
B Rafiles Quay #21-00 Singapare 048580
Tek {B5] 6242 2311 Fax: |65} 6222 3547

Claims & Motor Undenwliing Dept 36 Rotensan Roed R1E-O1 City Bouse Sowapoe DEBAT
Tet [R5} 6507 A48 Fax (R5) 6507 3849
wianw msfirstcapital com.sg

Date

Accident Date

Insured Vehicle

Survey Location
Contact Person.
Contact No.

Survey Type

Appointed
Surveyor
Contact Person

Contact Number.

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT

28-02-2018 Our Ref No. D1BOO1717MFSH
26-02-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
SHDE718H Third Party Vehicle. GY4945H

BLK 1 KAKI BUKIT AVENUE & #02-19
WAN PING

65090052/ 0 Fax No. 0

WITHOUT PREJUDICE: NO EST. PROVIDED *

LKK AUTCO CONSULTANTS PTE LTD

MA, Fax No. 68416315
MNA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use {based on

NIMA Benchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc: Workshop

Cc : TP Solicitor

Officer Incharge

¥l HENG MOTOR
WORKSHOP

VISION LAW LLC

Attention. MIL

TP Solicitor Fax No. NA

EILEEN LEE

IMPORTANT NOTE

Kindly submil the survey repart via CWS within 14 days tor survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection

This is a computer generated letter, no signature required.




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 24 April 2018 4:50 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System’

Cc 'EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG' SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18001717MFSH/1, GY 4945H
Attachments: GY 4945H PRELI ADVISED.pdf

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enclosed preliminary revised of vehicle GY 4945H
Date of survey: 16/4/2018
Number of days:4 days

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256 4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 17 April 2018 8:11 AM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>
Cc: EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com=>
Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18001717M FSH/1, GY 4945H

Dear Sir/Madam,
Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle GY 4945H on 16/4/2018 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 5256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 14 April 2018 12:29 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstca pital.com.sg>; assighments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>
Cc: EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18001717MFSH/1

» DearSir/ Madam,



Thank you for the assighment.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotorclaims@ msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 13 April, 2018 6:02 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMDTDRCMIMS@MSFIRSTEAF’ITHL.CDM.SG; FILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.5G
subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18001717MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuta)

Sent: Tuesday, 17 April 2018 8:11 AM

To: ‘Claim Workflow System’

Ce: EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG; SUR

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18001717MF5H/1, GY 4945H
Dear Sir/Madam,

Please be informed that we have inspected the vehicle GY 4945H on 16/4/2018 .

We are pending estimate from repairer.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Fhaone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 14 April 2018 12:29 PM

To: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; assignments <assignments@lkkauto.com>
Cc: EILEENLEE@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; SUR <suri@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18001717MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claim Workflow System [mailto:cwsmotarclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 13 April, 2018 6:02 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS @LKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS @MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; EILEENLEE@ MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18001717MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.
Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.

Best Regards,



Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited

Tel ; 6507 3848
Fax : 6507 3849

PS: This is a system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.



4/24/2018 Used Dyna Car & Used Cars & Vehicles Singapore - sgCarMart

sGCARMART.COM Login  Sign up

Hew Cars (EEY: f Sell My Car Directory Products Insurance Articles Farum Resources

g i sl AnbdsanT
CONNECTING CAR BUYERS & SELLERS. LR CONNECT
~ We'll handle your loans, insurance & other pape__rvﬁ_‘ ork for FREE. w

g

Lewus IS Turks 152001 Executive

Post an Advertisement
Sall it yoursel Advertise it at just

$58 until it's SOLD!

Past an A Adwertiser Lo ‘Ways of Suiling
| Browse by Category
67 vehicles [y dvanced 5o o
Model Price Deprecigtion  _  Feg Dl _ EngCap Misage Wen Type
Search Selection  Dyna Arry Any = 1“:':"".’] Any By By Available
Toyota Dyna 150 {COE till 518,800 £9, 710 fyr Da-Hay-2005 1,986 cC - Trudk Available
03/2020)
Fuel Type: Dlesal
§ Chwner Cnly, Previcus Owner Rotired, Super Good Original Condition, Mo Need Repalr, Cheapest In Town, Prioe Negatiable, High Loan Win Loresist
Interess Rate Avaikaba, High Trade In, Call Now! [ e an
ABNWIN Bug P Lid

Postod: 29-040-2018  Tagss 2005 Tayola Dyna, Towota Dyne, Tepoda, Dyna, Used Topola

Toyota Dyna 150 (COE tll 421,800 59,530 fyr 08-Jul-2005 2,586 cc = Truck Available
072020}

Fuel Type: Diesel

Chaapest [n Tewn! Tip Top Condition, Well Maintained, New Road Tax, High Loan Avadlabie, Trade 1n Welcome, Price Negotlable And Call Us For oy

Viewing Cr Test Orive Now!

ABWIN Bus Fre Lid
Prmled D3-&pr-20t8  Tege 2005 Toyota Dyna, Toyota Dyrd, Toyot, Dyma, Used Tayaits

Toyota Dyna 150 (COE till $20,800 55,180 fyr 30=Jul-2005 2,586 cc - Truck Availahke
07 F 2020}

Fugl Type: Desel

2 Owiners 10 Fest Lorry, Cheapest Dyna In The Market, Super Low Interest Rate Awailable, 0% Down Payment Can Be Aranged, Call s For &

Discussion Mow!

Postod 0d-Spr-20i8 Tags: 2005 Toyots Dyna, Toyotn Dyne, Toyats, Dyna, Used Toyota
Teyota Dyna 150 (COE ull 524,800 510,830 fyr Q-Aung-2005 2,966 oc - Truck Available
D& 2020)

Fuel Type: Diesel
Please Call In Advance Before Viewing. Thanks,

Paston; 11-Mae-2010 - Tags: 005 Toyotn Dyna, Toyoka Dyna, Toyota, Dyna, Used Toynta
Car Buying Car Selling Car Ownership
r 1 ¥ Duy Tyres Crdine
Car Aftermarket 0 The Move Lifestyle ¥ Labest Spperian Offers from Tynepac!
Toyota Dyna 150 {COE till $20,800 £3,430 fyr 12-0ct-2005 2,986 cc - Trudk Bvailable
10/ 2024)
Fuel Type: Diesal
1 Careful Cwner, Regular Sarvicing, Just Pass Inspection, Tip Top Condition, 100% Loan At 4 %, Trade In Welcome. L ori ot cuvae |
Pegied: (9-Aar-301E  Tags: 2006 Toyata Dyna, Tayota Dyaa, Toyota, Dyna, Used Teyola
Toyota Dyna 150 (COE il 418,800 57,350 Jyr 14-Mow-2005 1,986 cc 167,000 km Truck Available
1172020}

Fual Type: Dieset
Extitle To ETS, | Owner Cheapest In Town, New Paint Work fnd Leather Seat, No Need Repairs, Regular Servicing Done, Good Condition And Wed
Maintenarce, Price Kegotiable, High Loan With Lowest Interes..,

Pusteq! (G-Apr-2018  Tags: 7005 Toyota Dyna, Toyoks Dyna, Toyota, Dyna, Lsed Toyota

Toyota Dyna 150 (COE till %213,800 £3,710 fyr 16-Jan-2004 2,986 cc = Truck Available

Chim e

http:/fwwaw sgcarmart. comiu sad_c:afs.fliﬁhng.php?BRSR:—EU&MOIJ:D;.rna&RPG:E&AUL=2&\JEH=D&RGD=‘: 0&0RD=RGD_ASC 113



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry Page 1 of 1
Enquire PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle
Vehicle Owner Particulars
QOwner 1D Type: Company
Owner ID: 5428H
Wehicle Details
Wehicle MNo.: GY4945H
Wehicle to be Exported: Yes
Intended De-registration Date: 13 Apr 2018
Vehicle Make: TOYOTA
Vehicle Model: DYNA 150D
Primary Colour: Blue
Manufacturing Year: 2005
Engine Mo.: GL55B82537
Chassis Mo.: JTFUF34Y003010471
Maximum Power Output: -
Open Market Value: $23,670.00
Original Registration Date: 28 Apr 2005
First Registration Date: 28 Apr 2005
Transfer Count: 2
Actual ARF Paid: £1.185,00
Intended PARF Rebate Details
PARF Eligibility: Mo
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: -
PARF Rebate Amount: $0.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
COE Expiry Date: 27 Apr 2020
COE Category: C - Goods Vehicle & Bus
COE Period(Years): 5
POP Paid: $27,653.00
COE Rebate Amount: $11.276.00
Total Rebate Amount: £11,276.00
Message
Please note that all future COE renewals for this vehicle can only be for a 5-year period, subject to the statutory lifespan {if applicable} of the
vehicle,
The infarmation contained herein is correct as at 13 Apr 2018
- OK

https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/enquireRebate ByPublicBefore DeregInput?FUNCTION_ID=F030... 4/13/2018



Y1 HENG MOTOR WORKSHOP

BLK 1, KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 6
#02-19 SINGAPORE 417883
TEL: 4 5090052 FAX: 6 7479402

13-04-18

OUR REF NO. GY 4945H

SING HUAT MING ELETRONICS PTELTD
NO 15, DEFU AVE 1
SINGAPORE 539538

ESTIMATE BILL FOR VEHICLE NO. GY 4945H
MODEL : TOYOTA DYNA 150D

- Page 1 of 1

3.478.35

182.00

1,830.00

5,490.35
—_—

LIST ITEM _ _
1) SIDE GATE (LH)  (JRaxCs! 1,837.00 =
2) SIDE GATE HINGE PIN (LH) 7 [7rées> 5PCS@ $/184.00 920,00~
3) SIDE GATE LOWER PANEL (LH) et 98700
4) SIDE GATE LOWER PANEL HOOK (LH) 4PCS@$40.20° 1" 16080
|

5) REAR WHEEL FRONT MUDGUARD (LH) £ 422.00"
6) REAR WHEEL REAR MUDGUARD (LH) 1% 311.00

24 )\ 4,637.80

s LESS DISCOUNT - 25% 1,159.45
SPECIAL NETTITEM
1) REARTYRE nHE 182.00
LABOUR CHARGE
1) TO CHECK WIRING SYSTEM 5000
2) TO APPLY UNDER SEALING ON AFFECTED AREAS 120.00

J’ 25
3) TO REMOVE AND REFIX SIDE GATE STEEL GUARD 220.00~
4) TO CONDUCT 4 WHEEL ALIGNMENT 120.00
5) TO REPLACE NEW PARTS,CUT WELD,KNOCK AND ETC 660-00
§) TO RESPRAY ON AFFECTED AREAS 660.00-
— EER GRAND TOTAL
' D0
E ToH '
i i



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: B256 4215
Reg. Mo: 188607198R GST Reg. No. 19-0607188-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Exparts En Automobile

FIRST CAPITAL INSURANCE LTD Ref CSIFCI1B006914/Avbn2
41601 CITv HOUSESINGAPORE 068577 Date 26-04-2018 ”"MW'"I“W“
Code: FCI2
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SHD &6718H Veh. Inspected GY 4845H
Policy No. Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. D18001717MFSH Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From EILEEN LEE Assign Date 13/04/2018
2, Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTADYNA c.C 2988
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2005
Chassis No. JTFUF34Y003010471 Colour BLUE
Odometer 498856 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification NIL
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [185R14C MICHELIN 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |185R14C MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |155R12C MICHELIN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |155R12C MICHELIN & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5. General Information
Accident Date _ 26/02/2018 |inspection Date 16/04/2018
Survey held at Y1 HENG MOTOR WORKSHOP
BLK 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE &
#02-19
SINGAPORE 417883
5a. Remarks
AJDAMAGES CONSISTENT TO ACCIDENT REPORT,
B)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED OM AWITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
CJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair 3

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

4 Working Days




Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 16-9607106-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. GY 4945H

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapare 4080533
TEL: 8256 3561 FAX: B256 4315

Page Mo.:1 of 1

: Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Qty Description of Parts Condition | £ mmp%} A{‘f}
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|SIDE GATE (LH) DENTED 1,837.00 1,485.10
5|5IDE GATE HINGE PIN (LH) @$184.00 BENT (2 PCS ONLY) 920,00 122.80
1|SIDE GATE LOWER PANEL (LH) DENTED 9B7.00 650.00
A|SIDE GATE LOWER PANEL HOOK (LH) @$40.20 BENT (2 PCS ONLY) 160.80 B80.40
1|REAR WHEEL FRONT MUDGUARD (LH) DENTED 422.00 23310
1|REAR WHEEL REAR MUDGUARD (LH) TO REPAIR SEE 311.00 -
LABOUR
LESS 25% DISCOUNT -1,159.45 -542 B85
347835 1,928.55
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|REAR TYRE (SN) NOT NECESSARY 182.00
182.00 -
LABOUR
TO CHECK WIRING SYSTEM. 50.00 30.00
TO APPLY UNDER SEALING ON AFFECTED AREAS. MOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
TC REMOWVE AND REFIX SIDE GATE STEEL GUARD, 220.00 100.00
TO CONDUCT 4 WHEEL ALIGNMENT. NOT NECESSARY 120.00 -
TO REPLACE NEW PARTS,CUT WELD,KNDCK AND GE0.00 400.00
ETC.INCLUSIVE OF THE REPAIR OF REAR WHEEL REAR
MUDGUARD (LH).
TO RESPRAY ON AFFECTED AREAS. 650,00 400.00
1.830.00 930.00
GRAND TOTAL 5,480.35 2,858.55
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REPAIRS : 2,250.00

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Report Ref No. CS/FCI18006914/Avbn
MARKET VALUE: $17.000.00 (EST)-LTA REIMBURSEMENT VALUE: $11,276.00=NETT VALUE: $5,724.00

ADRIAN LING WAI PING

B.Eng,AMSOE,AMIRTE,AMSAE-A M.MATAI

Licensed Appraiser




