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Summer Lee (LKK Auto)

From: Summer Lee (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, 20 November, 2019 2:58 PM

To: ‘Claim Workflow System’; 'ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM'
Cc ‘KARENTAN@MSFIRSTCAPITALCOM.SG": 'SUR'

Subject: RE: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002842MFSH/L

Dear Sir/Mdm,

Pleaseé be informed that we are unable to conduct the inspection for SKG 3768G after some attempts to inform the
workshop to present the vehicle.

This case has been pending for a long time due to the unavailability of the owner, therefore we decided to
temporarily close this case.

Kindiy advise us if there is any arrangement made and will be glad to re-open the case accordingly.

Best Regards,

Shinu Chan on behalf of Summer Lee | Admin

LER Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Plaone: 6741-843 | email: geslenments@lkkaptocom | fax: bagh-4545
Bik 51, Pava 1Thi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #6225 | (408033

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Saturday, 14 April, 2018 12:21 FM

Tao: 'Claim Workflow System' <cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital.com.sg>; ASSIGNMENTS@LKKAUTO.COM
Cc: KARENTAN@MSFIRSTCAPITAL.COM.SG; 'SUR' <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE; SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002B42MFSH/1

Dear Sir / Madam,
Thank you for the assignment.
Pliease be inforrmed that vehicle currently not in the workshop, repairer will arrange.

Best Regards,

Catherine Chong | Admin

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Paone 6741-8434 | email: pesienments@lkkaulocom, | bae 6256-9315
Bk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S(40893)

From: Claim Workflow System [mallto.cwsmotorclaims@msfirstcapital com.sg)

Sent: Friday, 13 April, 2018 6:49 PM

To: ASSIGNMENTS@ELKKAUTO.COM

Cc: CWSMOTORCLAIMS@MSFIRSTCAPITAL COM.SG; KARENTAN@MSFIRSTCARITAL COM.SG
Subject: PRI: SURVEY ASSESSMENT - D18002842MFSH/1

Dear Sir/Mdm,

We refer to the above reference.
Please find attached the necessary documents for survey.

Kindly submit your report via CWS within the next 14 days.
1




est Regards,

Admin Team

Claim Workflow System

Motor Claims Department

MS First Capital Insurance Limited
Tel : 6507 3848

Fax : 6507 3849

I’S: This is 2 system generated mail. Please do not reply to this mail.
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MS @ FirstCapital

MOTOR SURVEY ASSIGNMENT
Date 11-04-2018 Our Ref No. D18002842MFSH
Accident Date 07-04-2018 Claim Type. Third Party
Insured Viehicle SHCaBosP Third Party Vehicle. SKG3768G

Survey Location 1 KAKI BUKIT AVE 6 BLK D #02-15/16/17/1BAUTOBAY @ KAKI BUKIT
Contact Person. FEIYING

Contact No. 87476106/ 0 Fax No. 67442368
Survey Type WITHOUT PREJUDICE:

Apytiey LKK AUTO GONSULTANTS PTE LTD

Surveyor

Contact Parson MNa Fax No. BB8418315
Contact Number, NA

FOR DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Please submit to us the Tax Invoice together with letter of claim for Rental OR Loss of use (based on
NIMA Banchmark rates) together with your survey report.

THIRD PARTY SURVEY REQUEST

Cc: Wnrlf_.!hup SME MOTOR PTELTD Attention. MNIL
Cc : TP Solicitor MA TP Solicitor Fax No. NA
Officer Incharge KARENT
IMPORTANT NOTE
Kindly submit the survey repor via CWS wilhin 14 days for survey assignment and 7 days for re-inspection.

This Is acomputer generatad loller, no signaturs required.

BY . R




Shiau Chan !I.KI{Autu)

From: ying@smemaotor.comsg

Sent: Wednesday, 20 November 2019 11:22 AM

Tao: Shiau Chan (LXKAuto)

Subject: Re: TP VEHICLE SKG 3768G (DOA: 07/04/2018)

ki Shiau Chan,

Closed file at our side without repair, vehicle scrapped.

thanks & regards

YING

From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, November 14, 2018 2:24 PM
To: Ying

Subject: TP VEHICLE SKG 3768G (DOA: 07/04/2018)
Dear Ying,

Kindly assist the above vehicle still claim against MS First Capital Insurance.

Best Regards.

sthiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler

LKEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

hone: 6256-a561 | email: slewse@kkavto.com | five 6256-4315
Bk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #o2-25 | S{408933)



