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Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Claims@BoonAuto <cs.boonauto@gmail.com>

Sent: Saturday, 14 March 2020 8:00 AM

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Cc: SUR

Subject: Re: YP 2228S-DOA: 12/4/2018

Attachments: FBILLDVLOA_YP2228S.pdf

Dear Veron,  
 

We are pleased to enclose final bill and satisfaction discharge voucher for your record, 

kindly let us has your full settlement cheque. 
 

Thank you for your instruction in this matter and for the opportunity to be of service to you. 
 
Best Regards & Thanks, 

Raphael  
 

Boon Automobile Service  

General servicing & repair, Panel beating, welding,spray painting 

Accident Insurance claim , Buy/Sell & Used cars.  

Tel: 6482 0801(24hrs)/ Whatsapp: 8448 1782 

Email us at cs.boonauto@gmail.com 

 

 

On Fri, Dec 21, 2018 at 10:28 AM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Raphael, 

  

Noted with thanks. 

  

We did not received the after paint photos,please re-forward to us. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 
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Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Boon Auto CS <cs.boonauto@gmail.com>  

Sent: Friday, 21 December 2018 2:22 AM 

To: Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: YP 2228S-DOA: 12/4/2018 

  

Dear Veron,  

  

We accepted your offer Lump Sum $3800 @ 7 working days. The painted pictures(pdf) were enclosed in 
earlier emails.  

  

Thanks & Regards,  

Raphael Lim   

Boon Automobile Service  

General servicing & repair, Panel beating, welding,spray painting 

Accident Insurance claim , Buy/Sell & Used cars.  

Tel: 6482 0801(24hrs)/ Whatsapp: 9738 0801 

Email us at cs.boonauto@gmail.com 

  

  

On Fri, Nov 30, 2018 at 3:41 PM Veron Chen (LKKAuto) <veronchen@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

Dear Sir, 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Offer Lump Sum $3800 @ 7 working days. 

  

Kindly check and confirm. 
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Please forward us after paint photos. 

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Wednesday, 24 October 2018 10:21 AM 

To: 'CS.Boonauto@gmail.com' <CS.Boonauto@gmail.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: FW: YP2228S-DOA: 12/4/2018 

  

Dear Sir, 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Offer Lump Sum $3600 @ 7 working days. 

  

Kindly check and confirm. 

  

Please forward us after paint photos. 

  

  

Best Regards, 
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Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 28 August 2018 10:51 AM 

To: 'CS.Boonauto@gmail.com' <CS.Boonauto@gmail.com> 

Cc: SUR <sur@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: YP 2228S-DOA: 12/4/2018 

  

Dear Sir, 

  

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

  

Offer Lump Sum $3600 @ 7 working days. 

  

Kindly check and confirm. 

  

Please forward us after paint photos. 

  

  

  

Best Regards, 

Veron Chen | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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