LOT: -
e e
Reference Ng -

(V\\ VAL (oo SSEI‘&YQIm No.
Kelvqna o

From (Person) -

Priority | NORMAL / URGENT

IN OPS: Yes/No DOA:
@i Ref:

Date/Time

—c

" TYPE: M.Car

Vehicle No:  * 9¢x @3T8R .04/ 4s Af

MV:§

/' M. Cycle / Bus / Van / Lorry / Taxi/ Prime Mover / Truck / Trailer or

sl

Make & Mogel: Volve <eo NEW CAR PRICE:S
Registration Date: {62201\ MV:$ sg¥-~63k Quate by Maveus
COE Expiry Date: | 1513501 FS:$ Date B(u-‘ls
LTA Total Rebate Amount: (PARF) + (COE) = SV:§ '
Calculation for LTA Febats: - Caiculation for Valuation:
{a} COE Period: X12= Mths - {Average MV ' $
AS At . ' v : )
- = Mths  |Calculation for Repossessed vehicle:
. - = Mths  |High demand vehicie... Yes/No |- §
@ Balance Months : Parallel xmport v"e"m'c"r -8
‘ : - 3%
1= §
--JEngine Capacity nghlLow - &
B J|Europe / Asia- Car e S | Log
Reglster Before/ﬁfter MAV 2002 ' -~ {Gar Condition: GGdd/F exr/Poo /Bumt - $
(). PARF = (OMv) X X = No.oftransfer:. =~ -3
LTA Totdi Rebate Amount: (d)+(2) Other deduction :‘_"_ A -3
‘Salvage Value(LTA Rebate - 5%):. Forced-SalesValie derived = . = §
' 'Daté{ Time .4 Action/ Instruction ... . Addi’dona! Information:
M L ‘J’, : '4';_-‘ B TelT
\
\.—-__
‘\—




Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

From: Veron Chen (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 13 April 2018 4:38 PM

To: 'Ngian, Kelvyna'; SUR

Subject: RE: Market value - SFX 8278 R DOA: 25.1.18

Dear Kelvyna,

The market value for SFX 8278R is $58K-$63K (Est) as at Jan 2018.

Best Regards,

Veron Chen | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email :sur@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Admin-D (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 13 April 2018 2:25 PM
To: 'Ngian, Kelvyna' <Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>
Cc: assignments <assignments@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: FW: Market value - SFX 8278 R DOA: 25.1.18

Dear Kelvyna,

Thank you for your email.
Dear Veron,

Kindly assist.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Ngian, Kelvyna [mailto:Kelvyna.Ngian@sg.gaig.com]
Sent: Friday, 13 April, 2018 1:59 PM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ilkkauto.com>
Subject: Market value - SFX 8278 R DOA: 25.1.18

Hi team

Please assist to advise Market value at 25.1.18

Thdnks & Best Regards,

L]

[
<



Kelvyna Ngian

GREA
m&gﬁ Claims Division | 3 Temasek Avenue #16-01 Centennial Tower Singapore 039190

Moody's  Standard & Poor’s

A1 (Good) A (Strong)
Koot w15, 2005 Atenad Maeeti 2. 2015

For more information on our financial ratings, visit GAIG.com/FinancialStrength.

The content of this e-mail message and any attachments are confidential and may be legally privileged, intended solely for the addressee. If you are not the intended
recipient, be advised that any use, dissemination, distribution, or copying of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you receive this message in error, please notify the sender
immediately by reply email and destroy the message and its attachments.



PARF/COE Rebate Enquiry Page 1 of 1

e
Enqu1re PARF/COE Rebate for Registered Vehicle o M 35[ ll 12
Veh|cle0wner Particulars ) o )
T e GRAZ)
OwnerID 1958C
. VehicleDetails m
‘ Veh;cléNo T SFX8278R
Vehlcleto be Exported e No i
Intended De-regustratlon Date ' f ] 7 i S -i}lApr2018 ]
Vehicle Make: A 7 - vowo S
VehideModel: e " '5802.0T AT ABS D/AB 2WD 4DR TURBO
anary Colour o R Grey
Manufacturmg Year T 2010
' Engine No. e B4204T64000780 ]
ChaSSIsNo o R N 7YV1AS445331138682 T
Maximum Power Output: ' S T 1490kW (199bhp) i
Open MarketValue N '$41 91300
7 Ongmal ReglstratlonDate D 1{>‘Mar2011 i
i Flrst Reglstrat|on Date: e 16[\Aar2011 )
Transfer Cou nt: - 2
‘Actual ARF Paid: $41,913.00
Intended PARF Rebate Details W qi%
%,VPARFEthb“Ity ” e e e ;
PARF Eligibility Expiry Date: S 15 Mar 2021
PARF Rebate Amount: ' ' $25,147.00
Intended COE Rebate Details
 COEExpiryDate: ) T 15Mar2021
COECategory S - OpenCategory T
] COE Perlod(YearS) e M‘lO i
QP Paid: ' - " $58890.00 §
" COE RebateAmount A $15,589.00 -
Total Rebate Amount: T $40,736.00

The information contamed herem is correct as at 13 Apr 2018
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https://vrl.lta.gov.sg/ lta/eraction/enquireRebateByPublicBeforeDeregInput?FUNCTION_ID=F030. . 4/13/2018



